Department of Public Works and Highways Capiz 1st DEO Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2024 (APP Non-CSE)

Estimated Budget (PhP)
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=== = [ . Schedule for Each Procurement Activity
Is ;:::y an - S | Remarks
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ . (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Pr:c;:i?m:nt Procurement Posting of Os:r?ir:'szlfogiijs Notice of Award Cs?n:;zd Fu:f ds Total MOOE Cco of Program/
(Yes/l:l‘;-) IB/RET perng gning ‘ ‘ Activity/ Project)
I— _ - A - .
CIVIL WORKS
24GD0001 - Construction of Flood DPWH, Capiz Construction of
P0O0820154vs | ugation Structure - Construction of | 1st DEO, Yes Competitive Nov.24-30, | poo 44,2023 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 20,000,000.00 20,000,060.00 |Flood Mitigation
Talasa Pump CIS River Control, Construction Bidding 2023 Structure
Panay, Capiz Section |
24GD0002 - Construction of Multi DPWH, Capiz Construction of
Purpose Building - Construction of | 1st DEO, Competitive Nov. 24 - 30, !
PO0832853VS . - N Yes o Dec. 14, 2023 | Jan. 31, 2024 | Feb, 07, 2024 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Multi Purpose
Muiti-Purpose Building, Barangay Construction Bidding 2023 Building
New Guia, Maayon, Capiz Section
DPWH, Capiz
24GD0003 - Construction of Concrete :
ith .24 - Construction of
P00832265VS |Road - Construction of Road, éi;[:tfuoéﬁon Yes g;’;i:““"e N°"2(2;2'3 30, | pec. 14,2023 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 | e C e
Barangay Ensefiagan, Panitan, Capiz Section
24GD0004 - Construction of Muiti DPWH, Capiz Construction of
PO0832852vs || UrPose Building - Construction of | 1st DEO, Yes jrompetitve Nov.24-30, | o0 14,2023 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Multi Purpose
Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Construction Bidding 2023 Building
Navitas, Panay, Capiz Section
N DPWH, Capiz
24GD0005 - Construction of Concrete Y i
iti - Construction of
PO0832267VS |Road - Construction of Road, (l:ztngtlit?c’tion Yes g;’;‘i""em"’e N""'Z(Z):a 30, | Dec. 14,2023 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |- e Road
Barangay San Blas, Pilar, Capiz . 9
Section
24GD0006 - Construction of Flood  |DPWH, Capiz Construction of
P00820031vs |Mudation Structure - Canstruction of |1st DEO, Yes Competitive | Nov. 29 - Dec. | 1y 18 2023 | 3Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 100,000,000.00 100,000,000.00 |Fiood Mitigation
River Control at Balisong River, Construction Bidding 05, 2023 Structure
Barangay San Ramon, Pilar, Capiz Section
24GD0007 - Construction of Flood  |DPWH, Capiz Construction of
Mitigation Structure - Construction of |1st DEO, Competitive Nov. 29 - Dec. .
P00820032VS . y . . Yes i Dec. 18, 2023 | Jan. 31, 2024 | Feb. 07, 2024 GoP 100,000,000.00 100,000,000.00 |Flood Mitigation
River Control at Zibala River, Construction Bidding 05, 2023 structure
Barangay Poblacion, Pitar, Capiz Section |
DPWH, Capiz
24GD0008 - Widening of Bridge - 1st DEO, Competitive Nov. 30 - Dec. Widening of
i . . . 10,000,000. .
P00800692VS Maayon Bypass Road, Capiz Construction Yes Bidding 06, 2023 Dec. 20, 2023 | Jan. 31, 2024 | Feb. 07, 2024 GoP 10,000,000.00 ,000,000.00 Bridge
Section




Department of Public Works and Highways Capiz 1st DEO Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2024 (APP Non-CSE)

Estimated Budget (PhP)

[ = Schedule for Each Procurement Acti\ﬁ'ty
Is ;hliy an = T cource Remarks
ar ] . L
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ - (brief description
Code (PAF) Program/Project End-User Pr::;:.m:nt Procurement Posting of Os::iz"lsz'fogi/ds Notice of Award %c;n:;:ct Fu‘;f ds Total MOOE Cco of Program/
0{es’ll:z) ) 1B/REI pening gning Activity/ Project)
DPWH, Capiz
24GD0009 - Construction of Concrete|1st DEO, Competitive Nov. 30 - Dec. Construction of
. . . G 80,000,000.00 80,000,000.00
P00800695VS Road - Panitan By-Pass Road, Capiz |Construction Yes Bidding 06, 2023 Dec. 20,2023 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07, 2024 op 4 [ Concrete Road
Section
24GD0010 - Construction of Multi . |
Purpose Building - Construction ;):;V;I;,OCaplz Competitive Nov. 30 - Dec Construction of
P00832842VS |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose ', Yes . .pe ’ | Dec. 20,2023 | Jan. 31, 2024 | Feb. 07, 2024 GoP 2,500,000.00 2,500,000.00 | Multi Purpose
P Construction Bidding 06, 2023 o
Building (Gym), Barangay Section ! Building
Natividad, Pilar, Capiz
24GD0011 - Construction of Multi .
Purpose Building - Construction ?;Vg;’ocaplz Competitive Nov. 30 - Dec Construction of
P0O0832843VS |(Completion) of Muiti-Purpose Constru r:tion Yes Bid dize 0‘6 2023 " | Dec. 20,2023 | Jan. 31, 2024 | Feb. 07, 2024 GoP 2,500,000.00 2,500,000.00 |Multi Purpose
Building (Gym), Barangay Section 9 ! Building
Poblacion llaya, Pontevedra, Capiz
24GD0012 - Construction of Multi DPWH, Capiz Construction of
PO0832848vs | UrPose Building - Construction of 1st DEO, Yes Competitive | Dec. 06 -12, | 1 7 5023 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Mutti Purpose
Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Construction Bidding 2023 Building
Butacal, Panay, Capiz Section
24GD0013 - Road Widening - Tioilo ?;“g;’ocap'z Compeiitve || Dec. 06~ 12
PO0800008VS |East Coast-Capiz Rd - K0169 + 000 - Construétion Yes Bid dize '2023 ' | Dec, 27,2023 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07, 2024 GoP 32,700,000.00 32,700,000.00 |Road Widening
K0170 + 132 > |piaeing
Section
. DPWH, Capiz
24GD0014 - Construction of Concrete .
- 1st DEO, Competitive Dec. 06 - 12, Construction of
PO0800694VS :oag -CRO).(as City Airport Bypass Construction Yes Bidding 023 Dec. 27,2023 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 78,700,000.00 78,700,000.00 | . . ote Road
oad, Lapi Section
24GD0015 - Construction of Flood DPWH, Capiz Construction of
P00820311VS L"ﬁfﬁé‘g:ﬁ:{ﬁ‘:};‘*Pai‘;’)‘ls;’;;:";’t‘ of éitngtESétion Yes g;’;‘i‘:“;t't“’e Dec.zgg:; 12/ | pec. 27,2023 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 150,000,000.00 150,000,000.00 | Flood Mitigation
Structure
Barangay Cogon, Panay, Capiz Section [
. DPWH, Capiz
24GDO0016 - Rehabilitation of Paved ! P
iti - | Rehabilitation of
PO0801051VS |Road - Tloilo East Coast-Capiz Rd - éztngti?c'“on No g;:jrcr;ir:]etmve DJeC' 2(;2 22%223 4 | Jan. 18,2024 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 s:ve 4 Road
KO120 + 000 - K0120 + 252 . g an- %%
Section |
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Schedule for Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

=5 = T
Is ;::::yan —— S I Remarks
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ . (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procu_r e:ment Procurement | Posting of Sub.mlssmn_/ Notice of Award C(,mt','aCt of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? IB/REI Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
ﬁiﬁl’.?‘iﬁquﬁ.eﬂﬂ?Jﬁi’%ﬁ.ﬂdﬂ?‘" DPWH, Capiz Rehabilitation /
- " 1 jor Repair of
PO0832859VS |Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose éztn[:t'ffc’ﬁon No g;’:;etmve E;‘;“n 209;} 22002234 Jan. 18,2024 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 7,500,000.00 7,500,000.00 mrpufﬂe
Building (Mar Hall), Barangay Section 9 Y Building
Poblacion Hawod, Pontevedra, Capiz
24GD0018 - Construction of Drainage| DPWH, Capiz Construction of
P00800292VS (s&tvit;fu:e";ﬁgl(ﬁigg ;"f;'g'_czg'lzo';d éztngti?c'ﬁon No g;j':i':;t't”e DJ'“;Cn 2;2 22002234' Jan. 18,2024 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb, 07,2024 | GoP 5,400,000.00 5,400,000.00 |Prainage Structure
Y l Road
+ 620, K0110 + 800 - K0110 + 850 |Section Fong a2
24GD0019 - Construction of Muiti DPWH, Capiz Construction of
P00832855Vs | urPose Building - Construction of |1st DEO, No Competitive | Dec. 29,2023 -1 5 48 5074 | Jan. 31,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Multi Purpose
Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay San|Construction Bidding Jan. 04, 2024 Building
Nicolas, Pilar Capiz Section
. DPWH, Capiz
24GD0020 - Construction of Concrete ! :
~ 1st DEO, Competitive Jan. 12 - 18, Construction of
P00800693VS g:a:iz Pontevedra Bypass Road, Construction No Bidding 2024 Feb. 01, 2024 | Feb. 21, 2024 | Feb. 28, 2024 GoP 31,600,000.00 31,600,000.00 Concrete Road
P Section
O DPWH, Capiz
24GD0021 - Rehabilitation of Paved -
iti - habilitation of
PO0801053VS |Road - Tioilo East Coast-Capiz Rd - éztngtESc'tion No g;’;ﬁem"’e Jan.2322 . 18, | Feb. 01,2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | Feb. 28,2024 | GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 s:v:d 'Road
K0127 + 846 - K0127 + 779 . 9 '
Section
24GD0022 - Construction of Multi DPWH, Capiz Construction of
P00832857VS ;‘Lr"t’i‘_’;:rg;"s'g'g?ﬂ; dicr‘°g"5;’;':;r"‘;'; ;’f éi;?ti?éﬁon No g;’;z‘;tm"e Ja"'zgé; 18, | reb. 01,2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | Feb. 28,2024 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Multi Purpose
i uildin
Tincupon, Panitan, Capiz Section 8 9
24GD0023 - Construction of Multi N
Purpose Building - Construction ?;Vm’ocap'z Competitive Jan. 12 - 18 Construction of
P00832839VS |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose Construc'tion No Bid di?‘l ! an'202 4 ' | Feb.01,2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | Feh. 28, 2024 GoP 2,500,000.00 2,500,000.00 |Multi Purpose
Building (Gym), Barangay Bago Section 9 Building
Grande, Panay, Capiz
. | = L )
24GD0024 - Construction of Multi DPWH, Capiz Construction of
Purpose Building - Construction of 1st DEO, Competitive Jan. 12 - 18, X
P00832850VS Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Construction No Bidding 2024 Feb. 01, 2024 | Feb. 21, 2024 | Feb. 28, 2024 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Multi Purpose
X X uildin
Hanglid, President Roxas, Capiz Section Building

L
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Department of Public Works and Highways Capiz 1st DEO Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2024 (APP Non-CSE)

a T : Schedule for Each Procurement Activity | _Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an —_—r—e - Remarks
Early . Source . o
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ .. (brief description
C
ode (PAP) Program/Project End-User Pr::i';,eit";‘:"t Procurement Posting of OE::irr:gscS):’o;i/ds Notice of Award c;:;::i;t Fu‘:lf ds Total MOOE co of Program/
: ivity/ Project
(Yes/No) IB/REIL Activity/ Project)
. DPWH, Capiz
24GD0025 - Construction of Concrete :
. ) 1st DEO, Competitive Jan. 12 - 18, Construction of
P0O0832266VS g::ln aCor;:tru(ian gfl Ro?:d, ) Construction No Bidding 2024 Feb. 01, 2024 | Feb. 21, 2024 | Feb. 28, 2024 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Concrete Road
gay Manoling, Pilar, Capiz Section
e ;
24GD0026 - Construction of Road DPWH, Capiz Construction of
Slope Protection Structure - Iloilo 1st DEO Competitive Jan. 12 - 18, Road Slope
P0O0S80O0. 4 ’ . . . X .00 .
378VS | East Coast-Capiz Rd - K0132 + 718 - |Construction No Bidding 2024 Feb. 01,2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | Feb. 28,2024 |  GoP 1,700,000.00 1,700,000.00 | o ction
K0132 + 790 Section Structure
24GD0027 - Construction of Muiti .
Purpose Building - Construction Il)SPthI;,OCaplz Competitive Jan. 12 - 18 Construction of
P00832840VS |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose - No i _pe " ‘| Feb. 01, 2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | Feb. 28, 2024 GoP 2,500,000.00 2,500,000.00 |Multi Purpose
. Construction Bidding 2024 o
Building (Gym), Barangay . Building
; . . Section
Binaobawan, Pilar, Capiz
I DPWH, Capiz
24GD0028 - Rehabilitation of Paved - I
PO0BO01052VS |Road - Iioilo East Coast-Capiz Rd - | 1o PEO” No Competitive Jan.23-29, | coy 13 2024 | Mar. 05,2024 | Mar. 12,2024 | GoP 17,000,000.00 17,000,000,00 |Renabilitation of
Construction Bidding 2024 Paved Road
K0117 + 718 - K0118 + 090 )
Section
24GD0029 - Rehabilitation of Paved |DPWH, Capiz
Road - Roxas City-Cagay-Sibaguan- |1st DEO, Competitive Jan. 23 - 29, Rehabilitation of
Balijuagan-Cudian-Ivisan Rd - K0109 |Construction No Bidding 2024 Feb. 13,2024 | Mar. 05,2024 | Mar. 12,2024 |  GoP 5,200,000.00 5,200,000.00 Paved Road
+ 613 - K0109 + 860.50 Section |
24GD0030 - ?onstructlon of Road DPWH, Capiz Construction of
Slope Protection Structure - Maayon- |, i Competitive Jan. 23 - 29 Road Slope
PO0800380VS |Ict Bailan Rd - K0122 + 185 - K0122 - No ) .pe ' " | Feb. 13,2024 | Mar. 05, 2024 | Mar. 12, 2024 GoP 3,300,000.00 3,300,000.00 : 4
Construction Bidding 2024 Protection
+ 225, K0123 + 612 - K0123 + 654, Section Structure
K0124 + 675 - K0124 + 700 © .
24GD0031 - (;onstructlon of Road DPWH, Capiz Construction of
Slope Protection Structure - Jct Nati .,
1st DEO, Competitive Jan. 23 - 29, Road Slope
POO800379VS |Rd Cuartero-Tapulang-Maayon Rd - Construction No Biddi 2024 Feb. 13, 2024 | Mar. 05, 2024 | Mar. 12, 2024 GoP 2,000,000.00 2,000,000.00 Protection
K0117 + 450 - K0117 + 510, K0118 Se(r:ltion ng Structure
+ 883 - K0118 + 959
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Department of Public Works and Highways Capiz 1st DEO Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2024 {APP Non-CSE)
' Estimated Budget (PhP)

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity

Is;hifyan l Source 3l Remarks
ari - e
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ . (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procu_r e:ment Procurement Posting of Sub_mlssnon_/ Notice of Award Ct?ntl'-act of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No) IB/REL fty )

Construction of Flood Mitigation DPWH, Capiz Construction of
PO0832624vs | uructure - Construction of Flood - 1st DEO, No Compefitive | Jan. 30 - Feb. | v, 56 2024 | Mar. 12,2024 | Mar. 19,2024 | GoP 25,000,000.00 25,000,000.00 |Flood Mitigation

Control Structure along Barangay Construction Bidding 05, 2024 Structure

VI and VII, Roxas City, Capiz Section

Construction of Multi Purpose .

Building - Construction ?;Vgé’ocaplz Competitive Jan. 30 - Feb Construction of
P00832841VS |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose Constru c’tion No Bid dize 0'5 2024 " | Feb. 20,2024 | Mar, 12, 2024 | Mar. 19, 2024 GoP 2,500,000.00 2,500,000.00 |Multi Purpose

Building (Gym), Barangay Cogon, Section 9 ! Building

Panitan, Capiz

Construction of Muiti Purpose .

Building - Construction ;):tvgl-é,OCaplz Competitive Jan. 30 - Feb Construction of
P00832844VS |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose Constru t;tion No Bid diﬁe 0'5 2024 " | Feb. 20,2024 | Mar. 12, 2024 | Mar. 19, 2024 GoP 2,500,000.00 2,500,000.00 |Multi Purpose

Building, Barangay Cabugao Oeste, Secr:ltjon 9 ’ Building

Panay, Capiz

Construction of Multi Purpose DPWH, Capiz Construction of
P00832846vs |DUilding - Construction of 1st DEO, No Competitive | Jan. 30 - Feb. | o\ 54 5024 | Mar. 12, 2024 | Mar. 19,2024 [ Gop 7,500,000.00 7,500,000.00 |Multi Purpose

Multi-Purpose Building (Gym), Construction Bidding 05, 2024 Building

Barangay Talon, Roxas City, Capiz Section

Construction of Multi Purpose DPWH, Capiz Construction of
PO0832851vs |BUilding - Construction of 1st DEO, No Competitive | Jan. 30 Feb. | o 55 5024 | Mar. 12, 2024 | Mar. 19,2024 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 | Multi Purpose

Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Construction Bidding 05, 2024 Building

Linateran, Panay, Capiz Section

Construction of Multi Purpose DPWH, Capiz Construction of
Po0832854vs |Suilding - Construction of Ist DEO, No Competitive | Jan. 30 - Feb. | . 54 5074 | Mar. 12,2024 | Mar. 19,2024 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 | Multi Purpose

Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Construction Bidding 05, 2024 Building

Old Guia, Maayon, Capiz Section

Construction of Multi Purpose DPWH, Capiz Construction of
P00832858vs |C|iding - Construction of 1B DEO, No Competitive | Jan. 30 - Feb. | po, o0 5004 | Mar. 12,2024 | Mar. 19,2024 | Gop 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 | Multi Purpose

Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Construction Bidding 05, 2024 Building

Tuburan, Maayon, Capiz Section

- == | — £
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Is this an | Schedule for Each Procurement Activity ! Estimated Budget (PhP) -
[ o ] Remar!
Early N Source . N
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ . (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Pr:i:;:t"y":nt Procurement Posting of Os:rl:ir:lszlfogi/ds Notice of Award Cs(imrt‘:zd Fut::f ds Total MOOE co of Program/
(Yes/No) IB/REL pening 9ning Activity/ Project)
Construction of Multi Purpose R
Building - Construction of ;);V;I—é,OCaplz Competitive Jan. 30 - Feb Construction of
P00832845VS |Multi-Purpose Building (Covered Construétion No Bid diir)le v 0'5 2024 " | Feb. 20,2024 | Mar. 12, 2024 | Mar. 19, 2024 GoP 9,000,000.00 9,000,000.00 |Multi Purpose
Court), Barangay, Daga, Panay, Section 9 ’ Building
Capiz
Construction of Multi Purpose DPWH, Capiz Construction of
Building - Construction of 1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 06 - 12, .
P00832849VS A L . No e Feb. 27, 2024 | Mar, 19, 2024 | Mar. 26, 2024 GoP 9,000,000.00 9,000,000.00 |Multi Purpose
Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Construction Bidding 2024 Building
Guba, Pontevedra, Capiz Section
Construction of Multi Purpose DPWH, Capiz Construction of
a . - ~ . [ 5
Po0832856vs |Uiding - Construction of 1st DEO, No Competitive Feb. 0612, | coy 27,2024 | Mar. 19, 2024 | Mar. 26,2024 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Multi Purpose
Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Construction Bidding 2024 Building
Sibaguan, Roxas City, Capiz Section
Construction of Multi Purpose DPWH, Capiz Construction of
Po0832847vs |Duilding - Construction of 1st DEO, No Competitive Feb. 06 - 12, | o, 27,2024 | Mar. 19, 2024 | Mar. 26,2024 | GoP 9,000,000.00 9,000,000.00 | Multi Purpose
Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Construction Bidding 2024 Building
Binangig, Panay, Capiz Section |
[ i DPWH, Capiz
Rehabilitation of Paved Road - Tioito- Y = P
i 1st DEQ, Competitive Feb. 06 - 12, Rehabilitation of
?aKgI:OI;d -:l‘;:vlv Route) - K0106 + 612 Construction No Bidding 2024 Feb. 27, 2024 | Mar. 19, 2024 | Mar. 26, 2024 GoP 18,400,000.00 18,400,000.00 paved Road
Section
Comarctn of ot Mten v, cape |
R iti . 06 - Construction of Flood
Mitigation Facilities alon lst DEO, No Competitive Feb. 06 -12, | oy 27 2004 | Mar. 19, 2024 | Mar. 26,2024 | GoP 75,000,000.00 75,000,000.00 | 0TS
9 Construction Bidding 2024 Mitigation Structure
Panay/Mambusao River Basin, Section
Agbalo River Control, Panay, Capiz L
Construction of Flood Mitigation
Structure - Construction of Flood DPWH, Capiz
Mitigation Facilities along 1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 06 - 12, Construction of Flood
. 27, 4 | Mar. . 75,000,000.00 75,000,000.00 | .. .
Panay/Mambusac River Basin, Construction L Bidding 2024 Feb. 27, 202 ar. 19, 2024 || Mar. 26, 2024 GoP 4 000, Mitigation Structure
Panitan River Control (Downstreamy), |Section
Panitan, Capiz =
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Department of Public Works and Highways Capiz 1st DEO Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2024 (APP Non-CSE)

= Is this an | Schedule for Each Procurement Activity TI Estimated Budget (P'||P) _ ] Remarks
Early . Source . -
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ e | (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procu_r e_ment Procurement Posting of Sub.mussmn{ Notice of Award C‘_mt'_'aCt of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? 1B/REL Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
Construction of Flood Mitigation
Structure - Construction of Flood DPWH, Capiz
Mitigation Facilities along 1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 06 - 12, Construction of Flood
. | . .
Panay/Mambusao River Basin, Construction No Bidding 2024 Feb. 27,2024 | Mar. 19,2024 | Mar. 26, 2024 GoP 75/000,000.00 75,000,000.00 Mitigation Structure
Panitan River Control (Upstream),  |Section
Panitan, Capiz
iti . 06 - cti d
Mitigation Facilities afong 1st DEO, No Competitive Feb. 06 - 12, | ko 27,2024 | Mar. 19,2024 | Mar. 26,2024 | GoP 75,000,000.00 75,000,000,00 | Construction of Floo
. . Construction Bidding 2024 Mitigation Structure
Panay/Mambusao River Basin, Section
Ambilay River Control, Panitan, Capiz
. DPWH, Capiz
Construction of Concrete Road - iy .
- 13- f
Construction of Road, Barangay | ot DEOr No Competitive Feb. 1319, | \1r 05,2004 | Mar. 26,2024 | Apr. 02,2024 | GoP 30,000,000.00 30,000,000.00 | ConStruction o
" R Construction Bidding 2024 Concrete Road
Dayao, Roxas City, Capiz .,
Section
. DPWH, Capiz
Construction of Concrete Road - " |
Construction of Road, Barangay San |- CcO" No Competitive Feb. 1319, |\ 05,2024 | Mar. 26,2024 | Apr. 02,2024 | GoP 30,000,000.00 30,000,000.00 | Construction of
. i Construction Bidding 2024 Concrete Road
Jose, Roxas City, Capiz :
Section
DPWH, Capiz
Construction of Multi-Purpose 1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 13 - 19, Construction of Multi-
Building, Roxas City, Capiz Construction No Bidding 2024 Mar. 05, 2024 | Mar. 26, 2024 | Apr. 02, 2024 GoP 20,250,000.00 20,250,000.00 purpose Building
Section
. . DPWH, Capiz
Construction of Multi-Purpose Y L : i

S N oy 1st DEOQ, Competitive Feb. 13 - 19, | | Construction of Muiti-
B}Jlldlng (Leglslatlve Building), Roxas Construction No Bidding 004 Mar. 05, 2024 | Mar. 26, 2024 | Apr. 02, 2024 GoP 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 Purpose Building
City, Capiz .

Section
DPWH, Capiz
Construction of Multi-Purpose 1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 13 - 19, Construction of Multi-
Building, Roxas City, Capiz Construction No Bidding 2024 Mar. 05, 2024 | Mar. 26, 2024 | Apr. 02, 2024 GoP 50,500,000.00 50,500,000.00 purpose Building
Section
- . DPWH, Capiz
Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose . .

- . 5 1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 13 - 19, Construction of Multi-
Bmlfilng (Parfltan People’s Hall), Construction No Bidding 2004 Mar. 05, 2024 | Mar. 26, 2024 | Apr. 02, 2024 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 purpose Building
Panitan, Capiz

Section
- s 1
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Department of Public Works and Highways Capiz 1st DEO Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2024 (APP Non-CSE)

Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
. Remarks
Early . Source . P
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ - (brief description
C
ode (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procu.r e:ment Procurement Posting of Sub.mlssmn-/ Notice of Award Cv.:mtt.'act of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? IB/REI | Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
. . DPWH, Capiz
Construction of Multi-Purpose : . i i
Building (Capiz Province Cultural and | -t PEO No Competitive Feb. 1319, | \iar 05, 2024 | Mar. 26,2024 | Apr. 02,2024 | GoP 25,000,000.00 25,000,000.00 | Construction of Mult
. X Construction Bidding 2024 Purpose Building
Sports Center), Roxas City, Capiz .
Section
i i DPWH, Capiz
Reconstruction of Multi-Purpose ¢ . i i
Bullding (Sports Arena), Dinggoy | - Deor No Competitive Feb. 20 -26, | \ar 12,2024 | Apr. 02,2024 | Apr. 09,2024 | GoP 80,000,000.00 80,000,000.00 |Construction of Mult
. . _ Construction Bidding 2024 Purpose Building
Civic Center, Roxas City, Capiz .
Section
N . DPWH, Capiz
Construction of a Multi-Purpose : - i i
e 1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 20 - 26, Construction of Multi-
Building _(Gym) , Brgy. Lawaan, Construction No Bidding 2024 Mar. 12,2024 | Apr, 02, 2024 | Apr. 09, 2024 GoP 7,500,000.00 7,500,000.00 Purpose Building
Roxas City, Capiz :
Section
. . DPWH, Capiz
Construction of a Multi-Purpose 4 - ; ;
e 1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 20 - 26, Construction of Muiti-
g:mi:lzlng, Brgy. Indayagan, Maayon, Construction No Bidding 2024 Mar. 12, 2024 | Apr. 02, 2024 | Apr. 09, 2024 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Purpose Building
P Section
. DPWH, Capiz
Construction of a Multi-Purpose " i i
i ist DEO, Competitive Feb. 20 - 26, Construction of Multi-
gzlkiizlng, Brgy. Bongbongan, Maayon, Construction No Bidding 2024 Mar. 12, 2024 | Apr. 02, 2024 | Apr. 09, 2024 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Purpose Building
P Section
DPWH, Capiz
Construction of a Multi-Purpose 1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 20 - 26, Construction of Multi-
Building, Brgy. Tico, Panay, Capiz Construction No Bidding 2024 Mar. 12,2024 | Apr. 02,2024 | Apr. 09, 2024 Gop 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Purpose Building
Section
. . DPWH, Capiz
Construction of a Multi-Purpose : " i j
. . ist DEO, Competitive Feb. 20 - 26, Construction of Multi-
g:lkiizlng, Brgy. Linateran, Panay, Construction No Bidding 2024 Mar. 12, 2024 | Apr. 02, 2024 | Apr. 09, 2024 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 purpose Building
P Section
. . . |DPWH, Capiz
Construction (Completion) of Multi- iy - i i
Purpose Building, Calaan Panitan, | Lot DEOr No f-ompetiive Feb. 20 26, | \ior 12,2024 | Apr. 02,2024 | Apr. 09,2024 | GoP 2,500,000.00 2,500,000,00 | Construction of Mult
Capiz Construction Bidding 2024 | Purpose Building
Section
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o B [ ) Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is ;I"Ty an | | P | I Remarks
ari N - P
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ . | (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procu.r e:ment Procurement Posting of Sublmlssmn./ Notice of Award Ct?ntx:act of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? 1B/REL Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
GOODS AND SERVICES
|Procurement of General Services |DPWH Competitive General Services
- [ ' Capiz 1st omE GoP 2,700,331.67 2,700,331.67 h
Supplies DEO Bidding Supplies
1st Quarter No g;’;‘ﬁm"’e Ja"'z?); 10 | jan. 24,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | Feb, 21,2024 | -do- 675,082.92 | 675,082.92 -do-
Competitive Mar. 04 - 11,
2nd Quarter No Bidding 5024 Mar. 25, 2024 | Apr. 08,2024 | Apr. 22, 2024 -do- 675,082.92 675,082.92 -do-
3rd Quarter No g;’;ﬁzm“’e J”"'Zg;‘; 10; | 3un. 24,2004 | Jul. 08,2024 | ul 22,2024 | -do- 675,082.92 675,082.92 -do-
4th Quarter No g;’;‘izzt“”e Septigzz " 09 | ept. 23,2024 | Oct. 04,2024 | Oct. 21,2024 | - do - 675,082.92 675,082.92 -do-
. DPWH .
- :’:ci";f:‘:"t of Office Capiz 1st :;:::’et't“'e GoP 490,950.00 490,950.00 | Office Equipment
quipmen DEO ng
1st Quarter No g;’:i‘r’;m"’e Ja“'z‘(’;; 10, | 3an. 24,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | -do- 122,737.50 122,737.50 - do -
2nd Quarter No gi‘:;:iﬁ:tmve Ma"zg;' Y| Mar. 25,2024 | Apr. 08,2024 | Apr.22,2024 | -do- 122,737.50 122,737.50 -do-
3rd Quarter No g;’;‘iﬁ';“t"’e J”"'zg; 10, | 30, 24,2024 | Jul. 08,2024 | Jul. 22,2024 | -do- 122,737.50 122,737.50 -do-
4th Quarter No gi‘;':iﬁzm"’e Sept'zgzz " 99 | sept. 23,2024 | Oct. 04,2024 | Oct. 21,2024 | - do- 122,737.50 122,737.50 -do-
_ Procurement of IT Peripherals DP“.'HI Competitive GoP 2 866,666.48 2 866,666.48 IT Peripherals and
and Accessories g:::z st Bidding < e T | Aecessories
1st Quarter No g;’;’iﬁt'ﬁ"e Ja"'zgi; 10, | jan. 24,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | -do- 716,666.62 716,666.62 - do -
2nd Quarter No g;’;’i’:“;m“’e Ma"zg;‘; 1, | Mar. 25,2024 | Apr. 08,2024 | Apr. 22,2024 | -do- 716,666.62 716,666.62 -do-
- Competitive J_un._O3 - 10, . |
3rd Quarter No Bidding oo Jun. 24,2024 | Jul. 08,2024 | Jul. 22,2024 | -do- 716,666.62 716,666.62 -do-
4th Quarter No gi‘(’j’:i’r’;t't've Sept'zgg 4' % | sept. 23,2024 | Oct. 04,2024 | Oct. 21,2024 | - do- 716,666.62 716,666.62 -do-
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———= . Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) T
Is this an Remarks
Early . Source o
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ . {brief descrigtion
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procu.r e:ment Procurement Posting of Sub.mlssmn./ Notice of Award Ct?ntract of Total MOOE co of Prograxe]
Activity? 1B/REI Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ joct) I
{Yes/No)
?;Vgig i Competiti For ¥
- Paints R ompetitive GoP 1,015,080.00 |  1,015,080.00 of National Reads
Maintenance Bidding and Brid
Section
T “|Competitive | Jan. 03 - 10, o N \ .
1st Quarter No Biddina 2024 Jan. 24, 2024 | Feb, 07, 2024 | Feb. 21, 2024 do 1,015,080.00 1,015,080.00 5 [
_— 2nd Quarter — _ - - - - - - - - i -
3rd Quarter = - - = - - - - - - - i -
4th Quarter - - - = - : = - — = =
DPWH Capiz
1st DEO, Competitive For Miukattaece
- Pavement Markings e e ol GoP 3,934,000.00 3,934,000.00 of Nationul Reads
Maintenance Bidding and Brid
Section
1st Quarter No Competitive Jan. 0310, | 5., 54 2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | -do- 1,967,000.00 |  1,967,000.00 - do -
Sl __|Bidding 2024 | |
2nd Quarter = = = - = - - Sy - - -
3rd Quarter No [Competitive | Jun.03-10, | 5\ 54 2024 | Jul.08, 2024 | Jul22,2024 | -do- 1,067,000.00 |  1,967,000.00 “do-
Bidding 2024 1 | |
_ |4th Quarter - - - z = = - - = =
?Si’t\l\él;gaplz Competitive For Misintansince:
- Oxygen/acetylene Ot omp GoP 346,280.00 346,280.00 of Nationat Roads
Maintenance Bidding and Brid
Section —
1st Quarter No frompetiive Jan. 03 =10, | 5.1 54 2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | -do- 173,140.00 173,140.00 <o~
_ o Bidding 2024 S R B =
2nd Quarter | * - - - - - - - = —
Competitive Jun. 03 - 10, B e
3rd Quarter No Bidding 2024 O Jun. 24, 2024 | 3Jul. 08,2024 | Jul. 22, 2024 do | 173,140.00 _ 173,1_40.00 do
L _|4th Quarter - - - - - - - - o - il
?;V\gég A Competitive For Malnt )
- Bituminous Materials i ! - p GoP 1,656,000.00 1,656,000.00 of National Roads
Maintenance Bidding and Brid
Section L N . I ]
1st Quarter No g;’;’r’;t't“’e Ja"'z(;; 10: | jan. 24, 2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | -do- 1,656,000.00 |  1,656,000.00 ~do-
2nd Quarter - - - - - B - - - - =
3rd Quarter - - | - | - - - - - - -
4th Quarter - - [ - - L - - - - - =
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Is this an | Schedule for Each Plrocurement Activity | Estimated Budget (PhP) iy
Early ] Source . .
P rief description
Code (PAP) P Procuremer_nt Mo/ Procurement Mode of Advem‘sement/ Submission/ . Contract of (b
rogram/Project End-User - Procurement Posting of . . .| Notice of Award L Total MOOGE co of Prograwnf
Activity? IB/REI Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity] Project)
(Yes/No)
DPWH Capiz B i For Mak ‘
- Aggregates Lst DEO, Competitive GoP 814,500.00 814,500.00 of National Reads
Maintenance Bidding
i = Section and Bridges
1st Quarter No g;’:izzm“’e Ja“'z‘fz; 10, | 3an. 24,2024 | Feb. 07,2024 | Feb. 21,2024 | -do- 414,700.00 414,700.00 | . - do -
2nd Quarter No g;’:i';’]‘;“t“’e Mar'zg;; 1, | Mar. 25,2024 | Apr. 08,2024 | Apr. 22,2024 | -do- 399,800.00 399,800.00 ~do-
3rd Quarter - - - - - [ - - N | z =
4th Quarter - - = - = = - N
DPWH Capiz For Maint
- Various Construction Materials Itlsatil?ti(:;nce :;:":::;t““'e GoP 1,004,226.40 | 1,004,226.40 of National Reads
Section and Bridges
1st Quarter - = — - = - - - = =
2nd Quarter No gi‘;':;i‘r’;“t“’e Mar'zg;; | Mar, 25,2024 | Apr. 08,2024 | Apr.22,2024 | -do- 559,976.40 559,976.40 ~ do~
3rd Quarter No g;’;‘ﬁ“"’e J”"'z((’fz; 10 | jun. 24,2024 | Jul. 08,2024 | Jul. 22,2024 | -do- 444,250.00 444,250.00 - do-
- 4th Quarter_' B = g - - - - i - T - - IB - l
DPWH Capiz For
. . 1st DEC, Competitive
- Spareparts, Oil, and Lubricants ) e GoP 800,000.00 800,000.00 of Nstionaf Reads
Maintenance Bidding and Brid
Section . B
1st Quarter - - L - - - - - - R
2nd Quarter No g;’;‘r’g‘t“’e Ma"zgg . | Mar, 25,2024 | Apr. 08,2024 | Apr.22,2024 | -do- 400,000.00 480,000.00 -de-
_|3rd Quarter - - ~ - - - - - - =
4th Quarter No (B:;';‘;Zm“’e Septﬁ 322 . 0% | gept. 23,2024 | Oct. 04,2024 | Oct. 21,2024 | -do - 400,000.00 400,000.00 -do-
DPWH Capiz i ——= — === — = ;
1st DEO, Competitive Forintanpace
- Tools : ome GoP 800,000.00 800,000.00 of National Reads
Maintenance Bidding
= and Bridges
1st Quarter - - ' - - | - = - -
2nd Quarter No gi‘;’;‘iﬁ:t't“’e Mar.zgg; 11 Mar. 25,2024 | Apr. 08,2024 | Apr. 22,2024 | -do- 400,000.00 400,000.00 ~do -
3rd Quarter B - - = L - | - - - - - -
4th Quarter No g;’:i’:];“t“’e Sept.zgzz . 0% | sept. 23,2024 | Oct. 04,2024 | Oct. 21,2024 | -do - 400,000.00 400,000.00 - do -
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Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
T -
S B B
Code (PAP Procurement PMO/ P Early nt Mode of Advertisement/ Submission/ o:frc € {brief dmipﬁon'
ode ( ) Program/Project End-User rocu-r e.me Procurement Posting of 3 . | Notice of Award Total MOOE [os] | of Program]
Activity? IB/REI Opening of Bids Funds Activity] Project}
{Yes/No)
DPWH Capiz | B For Maint
- Fuel 1st DEO, Competitive GoP 3,000,000.00 |  3,300,000.00 of National Roads
Maintenance Bidding and Bridges |
Section - !
1st Quarter No g;’;‘i‘r’]‘;m“’e Ja"'z‘(’); 10, | jan. 24,2024 | Feb. 07, 2024 ~do- 1,500,000.00 | 1,500,000,00 | - do-
2nd Quarter - - - - - - - - N
3rd Quarter No g;’;‘iﬂ‘;m"’e J”“'Zgz‘; 10, | 3un. 24,2024 | Jul. 08, 2024 ~do- 1,500,000.00 | 1,500,000.00 | ~do-
- 4th Quarter =l = = . - - = 1 : - 1
BRap | For Maintenance
- Uniforms and PPEs :ds:ir?tgg;me :;“;:;“t“’e GoP 500,000.00 500,000.00 of National Roads
and Bridyes
Section _— —
1st Quarter = = = = - = -
2nd Quarter No g;’:iﬁztm"e Ma"zg‘z"; Y| Mar, 25,2024 | Apr. 08, 2024 - do- 500,000.00 500,000.00 -do -
3rd Quarter o - - - - | - - - - = |
|4th Quarter - - - | - I - - - - .
CONSULTING SERVICES _l
[DPWH, Capiz r |
Consulting Services for the Conduct |1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 13 - 19 Soif Subsurface
- of Soil Subfurface Exploration for Planning and No Biddin '202 4 ’ | Mar. 05, 2024 | Mar. 26, 2024 GoP 200,000.00 200,000,00 | Exploration of Bridge
Various Bridge Structures Design 9 Structures
o Section o | B
DPWH, Capiz
Consulting Services for the Conduct |1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 13 - 10 Soil Subsurfate
- of Soil Subfurface Exploration for Planning and No Bid di;:l '202 4 7| Mar. 05,2024 | Mar. 26, 2024 GoP 750,000.00 750,000.00 |Exploration of Flood
Various Flood Control Structures Design 9 Control Structures
Section
DPWH, Capiz ‘
Consulting Services for the Conduct |1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 13 - 19 Soil Subsm
- of Soil Subfurface Exploration for Planning and No Bid dii 2 024 ' | Mar. 05,2024 | Mar. 26, 2024 GoP 1,800,000.00 1,800,000.00 Explpfaﬂwn of
Various Buildings Design g Bulidings
Section |

Approved by:

Head of Procuring Entity



