Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS
CAP1Z 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE
REGION VI
Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY-2023

1s this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Early Source BesRSrhs
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ e (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Pr:z;l:e it";:nt Procurement Posting of OS::?'S(S)?;QS Notice of Award Cs?n:::d Fu‘:‘f ds Total MOOE Cco of Program/
(Yes/No) IB/REI penne oning Activity/ Project)
CIVIL WORKS
23GD0001 - Construction of Concrete If;tPVélé,OCaplz Competitivs Oct. 12 - 18 . Construction of By-
PO0705277VS |Road - Pontevedra By-Pass Road, Constru (';ti Yes B;:! d":] € '2 022 " | Nov. 04,2022 | Jan. 09, 2023 | Jan. 18, 2023 GoP 50,000,000.00 |1 50,000,000.00 |Pass and Diversion
Capiz s on ng I Roads
Section I
!
B i i ' Rehabilitation/
ez Condton 0% omur, cap | iy
it - ds with Sli
PO0706041VS |East Coast-Capiz Rd - K0166+840 - éii“:sﬁ)&m Yes g;’;‘i‘r"emwe oa'ztzzz 18, | Nov. 04,2022 | Jan. 09,2023 | Jan. 18,2023 | GoP 12,710,000.00 12,710,000.00 :I(:)ae - “apséps;n )
K0166+945.32, K169-+040 - e tion 9 Lan’:isli T
K0169+480 Secondary Roads
[ R Access Roads and/or
ridges fi th
23GD0003 - Construction of Concrete|DPWH, Capiz l za:tignZI ;oor: ds, /es
P00731743VS i";‘a’rarf;’:;t\'/‘l‘zcct:;'; 0; r’;‘;’;:::t%ad é:thgtfgc'ﬂm Yes g;;';'i"::t't“’e O“'Zt; 20, | Nov. 04,2022 | Jan. 09,2023 | Jan. 18,2023 | GoP 10,000,000.00 i' 10,000,000.00 |leading to
’ ! i Major/Strategic
Roxas, Capiz Section public
I | Buildings/Facilities
[ Rehabilitation/
|
P00705857VS |Road - Maayon-Jct Bailan Rd - K0121 ! Yes . .pe ! ; * | Nov. 04,2022 | Jan. 09, 2023 | Jan. 18, 2023 GoP 12,276,000.00 | 12,276,000.00 d Paved
+ 520 - KO122 + 558 Construction Bidding 2022 Damaged Pave
Section | Roads - Secondary
i o S | Roads
Rehabilitation/
23GD0006 - Construction of Road DPWH, Caplz - Reconstruction of
Slope Protection Structure - Tioilo 1st DEO, Competitive Oct. 26 - Nov. Roads with Slips,
P00706044VS East Coast-Capiz Rd K0142 + 522 -  [Construction Yes Bidding 01, 2022 Nov. 15,2022 | Jan. 09, 2023 | Jan. 18, 2023 GoP 1,680,000.00 .I 1,680,000.00 Slope Collapse, and
K0142 + 788 Section Landslide -
secondary Roads
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Final Annual Procurement P

Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS
CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

lan for.FY.2023

: Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early . Source . e
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ i (brief description
P :
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procurefment Procurement Posting of SUb,m'SS'on,/ Notice of Award Cc?ntfact of Total MOOE Co of Program/
Activity? IB/REI Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
23GD0007 - Road Widening - Tioilo  |DPWH, Capiz |
East Coast-Capiz Rd - K0156 + 1st DEO, Competitive Oct. 26 - Nov. Road Widening -
. . . ,000.00 16,068,000.00
P0O0705275VS 063.50 - KO156 + 608, KO156 + 656 -|Construction Yes Bidding 01, 2022 Nov. 15, 2022 | Jan. 09, 2023 | Jan. 18, 2023 GoP 16,068,000.0¢ ,068, Secondary Roads
K0156 + 729.50 Section
|
23GD0008 - Road Widening - Roxas
" . . DPWH, Capiz
City Bdry-Panitan-Bailan Rd - K0113 y - I ideni
- d Wid -
P00705276VS |+ 096 - KO113 + 849, KO117 + 000 - éitn[s)fgéﬂon Yes gf;':_"e"""e ch)' 1262 02N2°"' Nov. 15,2022 | Jan. 09,2023 | Jan. 18,2023 | GoP 42,874,000.00 | 42,874,000.00 #:fﬂary'ki':gsg
K0117 + 440, KO117 + 789 - KO118 | wo’ dding '
+000 ection
] terjurisdictional
23GD0009 - Rehabilitation of DPWH, Capiz | gloags and/or
) o . R I
Po0731603vs |Concrete Road - Rehabilitation of — Jist DEO, Yes Competitive | Oct. 26 - Nov- | . 45 5027 | Jan. 09,2023 | Jan. 18,2023 | GoP 50,200,000.00 50,200,000.00 |Bridges (or, roads
Cabug-cabug - Bayuyan - Yating -  |Construction Bidding 01, 2022 that traverse multiple
Tabun-acan Road in Pilar, Capiz Section LGU jurisdictions)
o N Rehabilitation/
23GD0019 - IRehabilitation (_)f Paved DPWH, Caplz Reconstruction/
Road - Tloilo East Coast-Capiz Rd - |/ /ey Competitive Nov. 9 - 16 | Upgrading of
PO0705855VS (K0122 + 240 - KO122 + 718, K0123 ! Yes . .p v ! Nov. 29, 2022 | Jan. 09, 2023 | Jan. 18, 2023 GoP 30,272,000.00 30,272,000.00
Construction Bidding 2022 Damaged Paved
+ 015 - K0123 + 786, KO146 + 313 -
Section Roads - Secondary
K0146 + 813 —
| . Roads
Il
) ; Rehabilitation/
23GD0011 - C_onstructlon of Ro_ad DPWH, Caplz Reconstruction of
Slope Protection Structure - Tioilo 1st DEO Competitive Nov. 9 - 16 Roads with Slips
P00706040VS |East Coast-Capiz Rd - K0167 + 180 - ’ Yes omp 24 " | Nov. 29,2022 | Jan. 09,2023 | Jan. 18,2023 | GoP 17,220,000.00 — 17,220,000.00 ]
Construction Bidding 2022 Slope Collapse, and
K0167 + 540, K0168 + 422 - K0168 :
+ 962 Section Landslide -
secondary Roads
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Republic of the Philippines

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2023

i Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early Source N .
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ . (brief description
Code (PAP .
ode (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procure:ment Procurement |  Posting of SUb,m'SS'on_/ Notice of Award C'"?ntr,ad: of Total MOOQE co of Program/
Activity? IB/RET Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
= Construction/
Improvement of
23GD0012 - Reconstruction to DPWH, Capiz Access Roads leading
Concrete Pavement - Dayao-Libas- | 1st DEO, Competitive Nov. 9 - 16, [ o Seaports (Kalsada
P0O0731015VS Culasi Road leading to Culasi Port,  |Construction Yes Bidding 2022 Nov. 29, 2022 | Jan. 09,2023 | Jan. 18, 2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 | 10,000,000.00 Tungo sa Paliparan,
Roxas City, Capiz Section Riles at Daungan
! Program -
| KATUPARAN)
I (] Rehabilitation/
23GD0013 - Rehabilitation of Paved E:t“gébcaplz Competitive Nov. 9 16 ﬁecfgjit;”c;':"/
P00705856VS |Road - Tioilo East Coast-Capiz Rd - , Yes ompe ov. 9-16, | oy, 29,2022 | Jan. 09,2023 | Jan. 18,2023 | GoP 6,858,000.00 | 6,858,000.00 |PSraing
Construction Bidding 2022 Pamaged Paved
K0137 + 321.50 - K0137 + 641
Section | Roads - Secondary
[ Roads
23GD0014 - Rehabilitation of Paved J FehabiEtoT]
§ R DPWH, Capiz Reconstruction/
Road - Roxas City Bdry-Panitan- 15t DEO Competitive Nov. 19 - 26, | Upgrading of
POO705858VS |Bailan Rd - K0116 + 134 - KO116 + ! Yes . -p ) " | Dec. 12,2022 | Jan. 09,2023 | Jan. 18, 2023 GoP 12,145,000.00 | 12,145,0600.00 P9 9
Construction Bidding 2022 | Damaged Paved
166, K0116 + 262 - K0116 + 607, Section Roads - Tertia
K0121 + 611 - K0122 + 000 | o 4
I narle
|| Construction/
Improvement of
I DPWH, Caplz Access Roads leading
23GD0015 - Access Road leading to ! i
R . 1ist DEO, Competitive Nov. 24 - Dec. 1o Declared Tourism
PO 1016VS tal . ! . . . X . .
073101 A_g in SI*-lrlne, Brgy. Dulangan, Construction Yes Bidding 01, 2022 Dec. 15,2022 | Jan. 09, 2023 | Jan. 18, 2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Destinations
Pilar, Capiz .
Section (Tourism Road
Infrastructure
program - TRIP)
N ) DPWH, Capiz 2
23GD0016 - Widening of Bridge - ’ " | .
: . |1st DEO, Competitive Nov. 24 - Dec. | Widening of
P00706164VS |Quiasan Br. (B(?0253PN) along Tloile Construction Yes Bidding 01, 2022 Dec. 15, 2022 | Jan. 09, 2023 | Jan. 18, 2023 GoP 14,000,000.00 14,000,000.00 permanent Bridges
East Coast-Capiz Rd Section
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Republic of the Philippines

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY. 2023 .

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is;:::yan Source Remarks
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ e {brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procure:ment Procurement Posting of SUb_m'SS'on./ Notice of Award C(?nt'faCt of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? IB/REI Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
. . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
23GD0017 - Construction of Muiti- ! o e
. i ist DEO, Competitive Nov. 24 - Dec. Buildings/Facilities to
P00732176VS 2\:’[?;56 Building, President Roxas, Construction Yes Bidding 01, 2022 Dec. 15,2022 | Jan, 09, 2023 | lJan. 18, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 support Social
P Section Services
Construction/
Improvement of
23GD0018 - Construction of Road DPWH, Caplz Access Roads leading
Slope Protection Structure - Access  |1st DEG, Competitive Dec. 13 - 20, ' to Declared Tourism
P00731017VS Road leading to Hinulugan Falls, Construction No Bidding 2022 Jan. 03,2023 | Jan. 11, 2023 | Jan. 20, 2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Destinations
Brgy. Tabun-acan, Pilar, Capiz Section {Tourism Road
Infrastructure
Program - TRIP)
23GD0019 - Construction of Road, ?:t\m'ocap'z Conoetiive | Dec. 21- 27
- Barangay Culilang, President Roxas, Constru t,:tion No Bid di?l '2022 7 | Jan. 10,2023 | Jan. 18,2023 | Jan. 27,2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Construction of Road
Capiz 9
Section
DPWH, Caplz
- ;if;:;gioéui‘;g“;:ﬁt:;" g;;;ad' é‘:’fnggzﬂon No g;’:i‘;:t't"'e e 27| 3an. 10,2023 | Jan. 18,2023 | Jan.27,2023 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Construction of Road
Section
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Republic of the Philippines

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

Final Anhual Procurement Plan for FY-2023

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an
Early Source Remarks
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ ) (brief description
Code (PAP . i
( ) Program/Project End-User Procure_ment Procurement Posting of SUb.m'SS'on./ Notice of Award C(?ntfad of Total MOOE Cco of Program/
Activity? IB/REI Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
{Yes/No)
DPWH, Capiz
23GD0021 - Construction of Road, 1st DEO, Competitive Dec. 21 -27, N
Barangay Bago, Roxas City, Capiz _|Construction No Bidding 02 Jan. 10,2023 | Jan. 18,2023 | Jan. 27,2023 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Construction of Road
Section
23GD0022 - Construction of Road, ?;Vé’;bcap‘z competitive | D2 28,2022~ Il
- Barangays Olalo-San Silvestre-Yating- Constru c’ tion No Bid diir)w g January 03, | Jan. 17,2023 | Jan. 23,2023 | Feb. 02, 2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 I| 10,000,000.00 |Construction of Road
Tabun-acan Road, Pilar, Capiz Section 2023
DPWH, Caplz
i . Dec. 28, 2022 -
_ 23GD0023 - Construction of Road,  |1st DEQ, Competitive v N
Barangay Bahit, Panitan, Capiz Construction No Bidding January 03, Jan. 17,2023 | Jan. 23,2023 | Feb. 02, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |Construction of Road
2023
Sectlon
B . . |DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
23GD0024 - C_onstructlon of Mutti |1t DEO, Competitive Dec. 28, 2022 - Buildings/Facilities to
- Purpose Building, Barangay Malag-it, Construction No Bidding January 03, | Jan. 17,2023 | Jan. 23, 2023 Feb. 02, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 | 5,000,000.00 support Social
Pontevedra, Capiz Section 2023 gervices
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Repubiic of the Philippines

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI
Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for-FY.2023

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Remarks
(brief description
of Program/
Activity/ Project)

Construction/
Rehabilitation of
Flood Mitigation
Facilities within
Major River Basins
and Principal Rivers

Construction/
Rehabilitation of
Flood Mitigation
Facilities within
Major River Basins
and Principal Rivers

Construction/
Rehabilitation of
Flood Mitigation
Facilities within
Major River Basins
and Principal Rivers

Multi-Purpose
Buildings/Facilities to
support Social
gervices

Construction of Road

Is this an
Early . Source
Code (PAP) Pmcureme'.'t PMO/ Procurement Mode of Advert|§ement/ Submission/ . Contract of
Program/Project End-User ) Procurement |  Posting of ; ' | Notice of Award Lo Total MOOE co
g
Activity? IB/RET Opening of Bids Signing Funds
(Yes/No)
23GD0025 - Construction of Flood
Mitigation Structure - Construction of [DPWH, Capiz
P00721733VS g:’::ym;%;gz:aza;;tgfsszg:9 éitngtESéﬁm No g;’;’r’:;t't“'e Ja"'zggs' 12: | 3an. 26,2023 | Jan. 31,2023 | Feb. 10,2023 | GoP 91,400,000.00 91,400,000.00
;
Panitan River Control (Downstream), |Section
Panitan, Capiz
23GD0026 - Construction of Flood  |DPWH, Caplz
Mitigation Structure - Construction of | 1st DEQ, Competitive Jan. 12 - 18,
. .07, . . 1,400,000.00
P00721732VS Cadio Flood Control along Panay Construction No Bidding 2023 Feb. 01, 2023 | Feb. 07,2023 | Feb. 17, 2023 GoP 91,400,000.00 9 0,0
River, Barangay Cadio, Panitan, Capiz|Section
23GD0027 - Construction of Flood
Mitigation Structure - Construction of |DPWH, Caplz
P00721724VS g:’::ymx;’zgaza;;tt:sBZg:9 éz‘ngtf‘?éﬂm No g:;’;‘i‘r’;m“’e Ja"'22323' B | Feb. 03,2023 | Feb. 09,2023 | Feb. 17,2023 | GoP 91,400,000.00 91,400,000.00
Panitan River Control (Upstream),  |Section
Panitan, Capiz
23GD0028 - Construction of Multi- ?;Vgébcap‘z Comoetive || 3an. 14- 20
- Purpose Building, Barangay Gabuan, Constru (':tion No Bid di’r)\ '2023 7 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 14, 2023 | Feb. 22, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00
Roxas City, Capiz . 9
Section
DPWH, Capiz
23GD0029 - Construction of Road,  |1st DEO, Competitive Jan, 14 - 20, k
- : . . . 000,000,
Barangay Talon, Roxas City, Capiz Construction No Bidding 2023 Feb. 06, 2023 | Feb. 14,2023 | Feb. 22, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00
Sectlon
23GD0030 - Road Widening - Ict Natl ?;V‘é:bcap" Lormettve || an. 19- 25
- Rd Cuartero-Tapulang-Maayon Rd - Cons’cruétion No Bid di':x '2023 ’ | Feb. 08,2023 | Feb. 14,2023 | Feb. 24, 2023 GoP 35,230,000.00 35,230,000.00
K0115+(-394) - K0115+961 Section 9

Widening of Road
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Republic of the Philippines

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2023

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an Remarks
Early . Source . -
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ o (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Pr:z;l;::itn;gnt Procurement Posting of Os::i:‘glsz'fo;i/ ds Notice of Award Csc:;]rt‘::;t Fuc:: ds Total MOOE co of Program/
: Activi Project
(Yes/No) 18/REI ctivity/ Project)
23GD0031 - Road Widening - Tioilo ?;\Aé?ocap'z cornetive || 3an. 19 - 25
- East Coast-Capiz Rd - K0159+015 - ! No . p } " | Feb. 08,2023 | Feb. 14,2023 | Feb. 24, 2023 GoP 18,772,000.00 18,772,000.00 |Widening of Road
K0159+722 Construction Bidding 2023
Section
23GD0032 - Construction of Flood Construction/
. habilitation of
Mitigation Structure - Construction of ?;\AgébCaplz Competitive Jan. 20 - 26 i ‘;:)o?i MitigI:tion
P00721735VS |Flood Mitigation Facilities along ! No ) -p an. " | Feb. 10,2023 | Feb. 16, 2023 | Feb. 24, 2023 GoP 91,400,000.00 | 91,400,000.00 L s
panay/Mamb River Basin, Ti Construction Bidding 2023 Facilities within
o n yC atm |usao |v2r 'a in, Tico Section Major River Basins
iver Control, Panay, Capiz and Principal Rivers
DPWH, Capiz
23GD0033 - Construction of Road,  |1st DEQ, Competitive Jan. 20 - 26, b .
- . . 3 . 24, 2 X 5,000, X onstruction of Road
Barangay Cagay, Roxas City, Capiz  |Construction No Bidding 2023 Feb. 10,2023 | Feb. 16,2023 | Feb. 24, 2023 GoP 3,000,000.00 1000,000.00 €
Section
F==———_N
. . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
23GD0034 - Construction of Mutti- ! o s
- . 1st DEQ, Competitive Jan. 28 - Feb. Buildings/Facilities to
- gur;.)tt;se gum‘jmg, Municipality of Construction No Bidding 03, 2023 Feb. 20, 2023 | Feb. 27,2023 | Mar. 10, 2023 GoP 5,250,000.00 5,250,000.00 support Social
anitan, Capiz Section services
i . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
23GD0035 - Construction of Multi- ! . .
o P—— 1st DEO, Competitive Jan. 28 - Feb. Buildings/Facilities to
* :urposeCBu.xldlng, Municipality of Construction No Bidding 03, 2023 Feb. 20,2023 | Feb. 27,2023 | Mar. 10, 2023 GoP 5,250,000.00 5,250,000.00 support Social
anay, Capiz Section services
) DPWH, Caplz Multi-Purpose
23GD0036 - Construction g 1 . -
it - ildings/Facilities to
- (Completion) of Multi-Purpose 1st DEO, No jompetitve Jan. 28 - Feb. | o\ 562023 | Feb. 27,2023 | Mar. 10,2023 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 |19 /Fa
Building, Ba Olalo, Pilar, Capi Construction Bidding 03, 2023 support Social
uilding, Barangay Olalo, Pilar, Capiz | . Services
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Republic of the Philippines

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2023

Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) N .
emarks
Early . Source . .
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ . {brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Pr?:::i': itn;:nt Procurement Posting of Os:r:)ir:lsz:?;i/ ds Notice of Award Cs?n:i'zct Fu:f ds Total MOOE co of Program/
(Yes/No) IB/REL peming aning Activity/ Project)
Rehabilitation/
DPWH, Capiz Reconstruction of
Tloilo East Coast-Capiz Rd - K0141 + |1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 02 - 08, Roads with Slips,
P00706042VS 138 - KO141 + 279 Construction No Bidding 2023 Feb. 22, 2023 | Feb. 28,2023 | Mar. 10, 2023 GoP 2,070,000.00 | 2,070,000.00 Slope Collapse, and
Section Landslide -
Secondary Roads
Rehabilitation/
DPWH, Capiz Reconstruction of
Tioilo East Coast-Capiz Rd - KO141 + |1ist DEO, Competitive Feb. 02 - 08, Roads with Slips,
P00706043VS 279 - KO141 + 412 Construction No Bidding 2023 Feb. 22,2023 | Feb. 28,2023 | Mar. 10, 2023 GoP 1,680,000.00 | 1,680,000.00 slope Collapse, and
Section Landslide -
Secondary Roads
DPWH, Caplz Construction of By-
. st DEQ, Competitive Feb, 02 - 08, Lo
P00705278VS |Maayon By-Pass Road, Capiz Construction No Bidding 2023 Feb. 22, 2023 | Feb. 28,2023 | Mar. 10, 2023 GoP 75,000,000.00 | 75,000,000.00 |Pass and Diversion
d
Sectlon oads
DPWH, Caplz
Anhawon Br. (B00244PN) along Hoilo | 15t DEO, Competitive Feb. 02 - 08, Widening of
P0O0706163VS East Coast-Capiz Rd Construction No Bidding 2023 Feb. 22, 2023 | Feb. 28,2023 | Mar. 10, 2023 GoP 14,560,000.00 14,560,000.00 Permanent Bridges
Section
DPWH, Capiz
Salocon Br. (B00279PN) along Roxas |1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 09 - 15, Widening of
P00706162VS City Bdry-Panitan-Bailan Rd Construction No Bidding 2023 Mar. 01,2023 | Mar. 07,2023 | Mar. 17, 2023 GoP 11,200,000.00 | 11,200,000.00 permanent Bridges
Section
Construction/
Construction of Flood Mitigation DPWH, Capiz Rehabilitation of
Facilities along Panay/Mambusao 1st DEO, Competitive Feb. 09 - 15, Flood Mitigation
P0O0721736VS River Basin, Agbalo River Control, Canstruction No Bidding 2023 Mar. 01, 2023 | Mar. 07, 2023 | Mar. 17, 2023 GoP 91,400,000.00 91,400,000.00 Facilities within
Panay, Capiz Section Major River Basins

and Principal Rivers

8of 17




Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS
CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI
Roxas City, Capiz
Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2023
1s this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Early Source Remarks
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ o (brief description
Code (PAP .
ode (PAP) Program /Project End-User Procure_rnent Procurement | Posting of Sub-mlssmn./ Notice of Award C?ntfad of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? IB/RET Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
{Yes/No)
i | i
Construction of MultiPurpase ?sptvg:slocaplz Competitive | Feb. 09 - 15 ' ::;Ea: usr;):::ilities to
P00732180VS |Building, Barangay Dulangan, pilar, ! No i -p ' 7 | Mar, 01,2023 | Mar. 07,2023 | Mar. 17, 2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 gs/ra
Caniz Construction Bidding 2023 i support Social
P Section i Services
. . DPWH, Capiz N 1 Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose g L . .
P00732181VS |Building, Barangay San Jose, Roxas | Lot DEO No Competitive Feb.09-15, | o 01,2023 | Mar. 07,2023 | Mar. 17,2023 | GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 |Buiidings/Facilities to
§ . Construction Bidding 2023 support Social
City, Capiz i !
Section | Services
|| - : =
Construction of Multi-Purpose [;:tvgé,OCaplz Competitive Feb. 16 - 22 | gl;::.g u;;’:asceimies to
PO0732179VS |Building, Barangay Cabug-Cabug, i~ No omp ) 7 | Mar. 08, 2023 | Mar. 14, 2023 | Mar. 24, 2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 gsita
. K Construction Bidding 2023 support Social
President Roxas, Capiz i
Sectlon I Services
Construction of Multi-Purpose DPWH, Capiz I Multi-Purpose
Building, Barangay Jumaquicjic Ville, |1st DEQ Competitive Feb. 16 - 22, ‘ Buildings/Facilities to
07. V! ’ v ’ ’ ) . X A .
PO0732178VS Barangay Jumaquicjic, Roxas City, |Construction o Bidding 2023 Mar. 08, 2023 | Mar. 14,2023 | Mar. 24,2023 |  GoP 10,000,000.00 i | 10,000,000.00 support Social
Capiz Section | Services
DPWH, Capiz [I= i Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose ist DEO, Competitive Feb. 16 - 22 Buildings/Facilities to
POO 7 ! ’ . . . .
732177YS g1jiding, Maayon, Capiz Construction No |Biading 2023 Mar. 08, 2023 | Mar. 14,2023 | Mar. 24,2023 | - GoP SA00.0002 500000090 | qupport Social
Section Services
DPWH, Caplz i
_ Road Widening - Maayon-Jct Bailan |1ist DEO, Competitive Feb. 16 ~ 22, | -
Rd - KO124 + 200 - KO125 + 351 Construction No Bidding 2023 Mar. 08, 2023 | Mar. 14, 2023 | Mar. 24, 2023 GoP 29,848,000.00 | 29,848,000.00 |Widening of Road
Section | . :
Road Widening - Iloilo East Coast- 5;“‘;‘;3:3"‘2 Competitive Feb. 16 - 22 f |
- Capiz Rd - K0156 + 646 - K0157 + ’ No omp : 7 | Mar. 08, 2023 | Mar. 14, 2023 | Mar. 24,2023 | GoP 27,066,000.00 27,066,000.00 |Widening of Road
Construction Bidding 2023
739 .
Section
. . = — . Construction/
COnStrl:ICtIOn of River Bank Slope DPWH, Capiz Rehabilitation of
Protection (Upstream of Maayon 4 yeq, Competitive | Feb. 23 - Mar Flood Mitigation
- Bridge)(Right Bank) Sta. 000+000 - . No ormp ’ " | Mar. 15,2023 | Mar. 21,2023 | Mar. 31,2023 | GoP 79,084,000.00 | 79,084,000.00 |1 00¢ MIGAHC
. Construction Bidding 01, 2023 Facilities within
Sta. 000+322.40, Brgy. Poblacion . i . .
. Section Major River Basins
Tlaya, Maayon, Capiz and Princi :
| Princinal Rivers |
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Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS
CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE
REGION VI
Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2023

; Schedule for Each Procurement Activity ' Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early Source ; .
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ ) (brief description
d .
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User | PTOUrement| o ocurement | Posting of Submission/ |\ e of Award|  ComHract of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? 1B/REI Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
{Yes/No)
. . DPWH, Capiz I
Rehabilitation of Bridge, Tuburan § " P
- Bridge, Barangay Tuburan, Maayon, éitngtfsc'ﬁm No g;':i‘r’“;t't"’e Fet(’)' 1232(;2’;'5'" Mar. 15, 2023 | Mar. 21,2023 | Mar. 31,2023 | GoP 10,000,000.00 | 10,000,000.00 g;:g:"'tam" of
. ]
Capiz Section " .
. ] DPWH, Capiz | Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose ! " o i
- Building, Jumaguicjic Ville, Barangay éi;gtf‘?c'ﬁon No g;’;‘r’\eﬂ“"e Fet(’)' 1232(;;;"'"‘ Mar. 15, 2023 | Mar. 21,2023 | Mar. 31,2023 | GoP 10,000,000.00 | 10,000,000.00 gsggﬁss/:;lmes ¥
Jumaguicjic, Roxas City, Capiz Section 9 ’ | Services
. Ny DPWH, Capiz (. Multi-Purpose
Construction of MultrPurpose |y ey Competitive | Feb, 23 - Mar. Buildings/Facilities to
- Building, Barangay Tiza, Roxas City, Canstruction No Bidding 01, 2023 Mar. 15, 2023 | Mar. 21,2023 | Mar. 31, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 support Social
Capiz Section services
. Ny DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Copsltructlon of Multh-Purpose 1st DEQ, Competitive Mar. 02 - 08, Buildings/Facilities to
- Building, Barangay Candual, Panay, Construction No Bidding 2023 Mar. 22, 2023 | Mar. 28, 2023 | Apr. 07, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 support Social
Capiz Section l] o B gervices
. . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose ) " e s
R L 02 - it
. Building, Barangay Agbalo, Panay, éf)tnstfgémn No g;’gi‘r’:;m"’e Marzg§3 8, | Mar. 22,2023 | Mar. 28,2023 | Apr.07,2023 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 gﬁ:gg‘rfss/gfi:': les b
Capiz Section | | Services
|
. - DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Constriction of Hulth PUMoSe 1st DEO, Competitve | Mar. 02 - 08, Buildings/Facilities to
- Buﬂdmg, Barangay Lantangan, Construction No Bidding 2023 Mar. 22, 2023 Mar. 28, 2023 Apr. 07, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 support Social
Pontevedra, Capiz Section Services
— —
. . DPWH, Capiz e ——— Multi-Purpose
COT\S-tI'UCtion of Multi-Purpose 1st DEO, Competitive Mar. 02 - 08, Buildings/Facilities to
- Building, Barangay Manapao, Construction No Bidding 2023 Mar. 22,2023 | Mar. 28,2023 | Apr. 07,2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 | 5,000,000.00 support Social
Pontevedra, Capiz Section [ Services
. . DPWH, Capiz . " | Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose ! L L -
- | d
- Building, Barangay Pob. Iwaod, éitngtfgc'uon No g;’:i‘r"‘;mwe Mar.zgga 08 | Mar. 22,2023 | Mar. 28,2023 | Apr. 07,2023 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 gj:pg’rgsslfg‘::mes "
Pontevedra, Capiz Section | ' Services
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Republic of the Philippines

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for-FY-2023

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is thisan
Early Source ( g enarks
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ ' brief description
Code (PAP i
ode (PAP) Program/Project End-User Pr:z:;:;:nt Procurement Posting of OS::_r:'ss?gi/ds Notice of Award Cs?":;:d Fu:f ds Total Cco of Program/
(Yes /No) IB/REI pening o gning Activity/ Project)
) . DPWH, Caplz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose 1st DEO, ’ Competitive Mar. 02 - 08 Buildings?FaciIities to
- Building, Barangay Batabat, Ma- - No o . 7 | Mar. 22, 2023 | Mar. 28, 2023 | Apr. 07,2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 .
R Construction Bidding 2023 support Social
ayon, Capiz . .
Section Setvices
Construction (Completion) of Mult ?;“rgkébcaplz Competitive Mar. 09 -15 ;:E;: u;;):as::ailities to
- Purpose Building, Barangay Tinighan, ' No . _p r * | Mar. 29,2023 | Apr. 04,2023 | Apr. 14, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 gs/ra
i . Construction Bidding 2023 support Social
Panitan, Capiz .
Section Services
Construction (Completion) of Muti- ‘:;V\g‘ébcapll Competitive Mar. 09 -15, gl:l:g;: usr[pl(:):::eilities to
- Purpose Building, Barangay ‘L No . .p : * | Mar. 29,2023 | Apr. 04,2023 | Apr. 14, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 gs/a
. ; . Construction Bidding 2023 support Social
Badiangon, President Roxas, Capiz 3
Saectlon Services
X . . |DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Constructlorw (‘Completlon) of Multi 1st DEIO ’ Competitive Mar. 09 -15 Buildings;)FaciIities to
- Purpose Building, Barangay Ibaca, ! No o . 7 | Mar. 29,2023 | Apr. 04,2023 | Apr. 14,2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 R
R . Construction Bidding 2023 support Social
President Roxas, Capiz .
Section Services
. . . |DPWH, Caplz Multi-Purpose
Construction (Completion) of Multi- ! - . -
- purpose Building, Barangay Marita, |5t DEO" No Competitive Mar. 09 -15, | w1 20, 2023 | Apr. 04,2023 | Apr. 14,2023 | GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000,00 | BUidings/Facilties to
Presi i Construction Bidding 2023 support Social
resident Roxas, Capiz .
Section Services
DPWH, Caplz
_ Construction of Solar Water System, |1st DEO, Competitive Mar. 09 -15, Construction of Solar
Barangay Butacal, Panay, Capiz Construction No Bidding 2023 Mar. 29, 2023 | Apr. 04,2023 | Apr. 14,2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 \Water System
Sectlon
. DPWH, Capiz
Construction of Solar Water System, : - .
1st DEQ Competitive Mar. 09 -15, Construction of Solar
- B C 4 ! . . i K
C:Laizngay abugao, Pontevedra, Construction No Bidding 2023 Mar. 29, 2023 | Apr. 04, 2023 | Apr. 14,2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Water System
Section
DPWH, Capiz
~ Construction of Solar Water System, |1st DEO, Competitive Mar. 16 - 22, Construction of Solar
Pilar, Capiz Construction No Bidding 2003 Apr. 05,2023 | Apr. 11,2023 | Apr. 21, 2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Water System
Section
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Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS
CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE
REGION VI
Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2023

Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Early Source Remarks
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ . (brief description
d: P
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Pr:i;':: .:;s“t Procurement Posting of Os:rl\)ir:lsz:’ogi/ds Notice of Award Cs?n;;:d Fu‘:nf ds Total co of Program/
(Yes/No) IB/REL pening aning Activity/ Project)
DPWH, Caplz
Construction of Solar Water System, |1st DEO, Competitive Mar. 16 - 22, Construction of Solar
Maayon, Capiz Construction No Bidding 2023 Apr. 05,2023 | Apr. 11,2023 | Apr. 21, 2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Water System
Section
. . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose ! " L e
PN 1st DEO Competitive Mar. 16 - 22, Buildings/Facilities to
- ld : . ' g : .11, L 21, X . ,000,000. )
gg:( aglgCI: :irgy Pantalan, Pres Construction No Bidding 2023 Apr. 05,2023 | Apr. 11,2023 | Apr. 21, 2023 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 support Social
s Lap Section Services
. . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose y . - .
~ I 1st DEO, Competitive Mar. 16 - 22, Buildings/Facilities to
E:lkiizlng in Brgy. Jebaca, Maayon, | o tion No Bidding 5003 Apr. 05,2023 | Apr. 11,2023 | Apr.21,2023 | GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 support Social
P Section services
DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
~ Construction of Multi-Purpose st DEO, Competitive Mar. 16 - 22, Buildings/Facilities to
Building Roxas City, Capiz Construction No Bidding 2023 Apr. 05,2023 | Apr. 11,2023 | Apr. 21, 2023 GoP 5,250,000.00 5,250,000.00 support Social
Sectlon Services
. . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose ! - . e
~ . - 1st DEO, Competitive Mar. 23 - 29, puildings/Facilities to
g::kiizmg, Municipality of Maayon, Construction No Bidding 2023 Apr. 12,2023 | Apr. 18,2023 | Apr. 28, 2023 GoP 5,250,000.00 5,250,000.00 support Social
3 Section Services
) ) DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose J . o o
_ e - 1st DEO, Competitive Mar, 23 - 29, Buildings/Facilities to
(B::lkiizmg, Municipality of Pres. Roxas, Construction No Bidding 2023 Apr. 12,2023 | Apr. 18,2023 | Apr. 28, 2023 GoP 5,250,000.00 5,250,000.00 support Social
P Section Services
. . DPWH, Caple Mutltl-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose y . i . .
~ - I 1st DEQG, Competitive Mar. 23 - 29, Buildings/Facilities to
g:nkiizmg, Municipality of Pontevedra, Construction No Bidding 2023 Apr. 12,2023 | Apr. 18,2023 | Apr. 28, 2023 GoP 5,250,000.00 5,250,000.00 support Social
P Section services
DPWH, Capiz Mutlti-Purpose
_ Construction of Multi-Purpose 1st DEO, Competitive Mar. 23 - 29, Buildings/Facilities to
Building, Municipality of Pilar, Capiz |Construction No Bidding 2023 Apr. 12,2023 | Apr. 18,2023 | Apr. 28, 2023 GoP 5,250,000.00 5,250,000.00 support Social
Section Services
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Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS
CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE
REGION VI
Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2023

: Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is ;I;:y an Sourc Remarks
e - . oa
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ . (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Pr:z:;::y':“t Procurement Posting of Os::ir:'s:?gi/ds Notice of Award Cs?n;:ﬁd F“‘:‘f ds Total MOOE co of Program/
(Yes/No) IB/REI penmng aning Activity/ Project)
. . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose ! . I e .
I L 1st DEO Competitive Mar. 23 - 29 I Buildings/Facilities to
- Building (New Municipal Hall), » No o ’ | Apr. 12,2023 | Apr. 18,2023 | Apr. 28, 2023 GoP 5,000,000.00 . 5,000,000.00 t Social
Pontevedra, Capiz Consltructlon Bidding 2023 | suppo ocial
Section :!__ e 'y o Services
GOODS AND SERVICES
Procurement of General Services PPWH Competitive ! General Services
- . Capiz 1st N GoP 131,527.92 | 131,527.92 A
Supplies DEO Bidding supplies
1st Quarter No g;;’;‘i’[";t't“'e Ja“'z(()); 10: | 3an. 23, 2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb.20,2023 | -do- 32,881.98 | L 32,861.98 -do-
—_—
iti - |
2nd Quarter No Competitive Feb. 07 - 14, | oy 27,2003 | Mar. 13, 2023 | Mar. 27,2023 | -do- 32,881.98 32,881.98 -do-
Bidding 2023 . |
3rd Quarter No g:;:i‘;zm've Mayz?)g 15| May 24, 2023 | June 07,2023 | June 21,2023 | -do- 32,881.98 | 32,861.98 -do-
4th Quarter No Competitive Aug. 02-09, | 50 57 2023 | Sept. 05,2023 | Sept. 19,2023 | -do- 32,881.98 32,881.98 -do-
Bidding 2023 |
] DPWH -
B :;‘;‘i“::‘:“t of Office Capiz 1st :;::::‘etltwe GoP 936,314.32 | 936,314.32 | Office Equipment
P DEO s | =1
Competitive Jan. 03 - 10 f =g
g . b. 3 . -do - . 234,078. -do-
1st Quarter No R 023 Jan. 23,2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20,2023 | -do 234,078.58 s 1 078.58 |
. . i
2nd Quarter No g;':iﬁzm“’e Feb-2 ?)23 | reb. 27,2023 | Mar. 13,2023 | Mar. 27,2023 | -do- 234,078.58 [ 234,078.58 -do-
Sl
3rd Quarter No g;’:;‘;t't“'e Mayzgg 1,1 May 24, 2023 | June 07,2023 | June 21,2023 | -do- 234,078.58 234,078.58 -do-
4th Quarter No g;’:i'r’]‘;t't“’e A"g'zg;; 9 | Aug. 22,2023 | Sept. 05, 2023 | Sept. 19,2023 | - do- 234,078.58 | 234,078.58 -do-
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Republic of the Philippines

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2023

; Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early Source P
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ o {brief description
d P
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Pr:t;:il;'eitn;:nt Procurement Posting of O::[:’::z:’gi/ds Notice of Award Csc:g::(g:t FI::If ds Total co of Program/
(Yes/No) IB/REL Activity/ Project)
. Procurement of IT Peripherals CD:“i’zHI ot Competitive GoP 2 306.192.86 2 306.192.86 1T Peripherals and
and Accessories DEZ Bidding A TR | Accessories
1st Quarter No Competitive Jan. 03-10, | 3.0 53 2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20,2023 | -do- 576,548.22 576,548.22 -do -
Bidding 2023 e ———
Competitive Feb. 07 - 14, o wdo-
2nd Quarter No Bidding 2023 Feb. 27,2023 | Mar. 13,2023 | Mar. 27, 2023 do 576,548.22 576,548.22
3rd Quarter No [|Competitive | May 04 -11, |\ 54 2023 | June 07,2023 | June 21,2023 | -do- 576,548.22 576,548.22 ~do-~
Bidding 2023
Competitive Aug. 02 - 09, e
4th Quarter No Bidding 2023 Aug. 22, 2023 | Sept. 05, 2023 | Sept. 19, 2023 do 576,548.22
DPWH Caplz
. . 1st DEO, Competitive
Paints Malntenance Bidding GoP 1,159,200.00
Section
Competitive Jan. 03 - 10, e
1st Quarter No Biddin 5023 Jan. 23,2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20, 2023 do 463,600.00
Competitive Feb. 07 - 14, o
2nd Quarter No Bidding 2023 Feb. 27,2023 | Mar. 13,2023 | Mar. 27, 2023 do 115,900.00
Competitive May 04 - 11, e
3rd Quarter No Bidding 2023 May 24, 2023 | June 07, 2023 | June 21, 2023 do 463,600.00
Competitive Aug. 02 - 09, o
4th Quarter No Bidding 2023 Aug. 22, 2023 | Sept. 05, 2023 | Sept. 19, 2023 do 116,100.00
i)Pth'é gaplz 5 tive | For Maintenance
- Pavement Markings st UEY, ompetitiv GoP 2,235,600.00 of National Roads
Maintenarice Bidding | and Bridges
Section
Competitive Jan. 03 - 10, o
1st Quarter No Bidding 2023 Jan. 23,2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20, 2023 do 895,000.00 895,000.00 _
2nd Quarter No frompetitive Feb. 0714, | o 27,2023 | Mar. 13, 2023 | Mar. 27,2023 | -do- 223,500.00 223,500.00 ‘
Bidding 2023 !
Competitive May 04 - 11, o
3rd Quarter No Bidding 2023 May 24, 2023 | June 07, 2023 | June 21, 2023 do 895,000.00 895,000.00
4th Quarter No g;’:i‘:‘:“t“’e Aug.zgi?’- 9 | aug. 22,2023 | Sept. 05, 2023 | Sept. 19,2023 | -do- 222,100.00 222,100.00
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DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY-2023

1s this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) femarke
Code (PAP) Procurement PMO/ Proch::rynent Mode of Advertisement/ Submission/ Contract Soﬁ;ce {brief description
Program/Project End-User " Procurement |  Posting of u ,m'ss'on_ Notice of Award ontr Total MOOE [oe] of Program)
Activity? 9 Opening of Bids Signin Funds
(Yes/ No.) IB/REL pening oning Activity/ Project)
e | |For Maistenance
ist DEO, Competitive L
- 250,000.00 250,000.00 of National Roads
Oxygen/acetylene Maintenance Bidding GoP 30,0 ! )
Section — :
1st Quarter No B;;:i':;m“’e Ja"'2%323' 10, | 325,23, 2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20,2023 | -do- 62,500.00 62,500.00
2nd Quarter No S:;’;‘iﬂ‘;t't“’e Fe"‘zgg % | Reb. 27,2023 | Mar. 13,2023 | Mar. 27,2023 | -do- 62,500.00 62,500.00
3rd Quarter No gm‘i';‘;t't“’e Mayzgg 11| May 24, 2023 | June 07,2023 | June 21,2023 | -do- 62,500.00 62,500.00
4th Quarter No gi‘;’:i‘r’;“t“’e Aug.zg;- 09, | pug. 22,2023 | Sept. 05, 2023 | Sept. 19,2023 | -do- 62,500.00 62,500.00
DPWH Caplz For Malatenance
S . 1st DEO, Competitive
- Bituminous Materials P GoP 1,886,000.00 1,886,000.00 of National Roads
Malntenance Bidding
Sectlon
1st Quarter No g;’:i';et't"'e Ja"‘zg; 10 | jan. 23,2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20,2023 | -do- 471,500.00 471,500.00
2nd Quarter No g;’;’i;"‘;t“'ve Fe"'zgg 14 | Feb. 27,2023 | Mar. 13,2023 | Mar. 27,2023 | -do- 471,500.00 471,500.00 |
3rd Quarter No gg;“i‘r"zm'v N Mayzg;; 1| May 24,2023 | June 07, 2023 | June 21,2023 | -do- 471,500.00 471,500.00
4th Quarter No g;:i‘:;m”e Aug.zgi:; 0% | Aug. 22,2023 | Sept. 05,2023 | Sept. 19,2023 | -do- 471,500.00 471,500.00
DPWH Capiz
alstenance
1st DEO, Competitive M’ Mah
- Aggregates ) s GoP 858,700.00 858,700.00 of National Roads
Maintenance Bidding
1st Quarter No g;’;‘:\eﬂm’e Ja"'zg323' 10, | 3an. 23,2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20,2023 | -do- 214,675.00 214,675.00
2nd Quarter No g;’;‘i‘r’;‘m‘"’ Feb'zgg 14 | Feb. 27,2023 | Mar. 13,2023 | Mar. 27,2023 | -do- 214,675.00 214,675.00
3rd Quarter No g;r:iﬁ:m"e Mayz?);; 1| May 24, 2023 | June 07, 2023 | June 21,2023 | -do- 214,675.00 214,675.00
4th Quarter No g;’;i':‘:m"’e Aug.zgg 9% | Aug. 22,2023 | Sept. 05,2023 | Sept. 19,2023 | -do- 214,675.00 214,675.00
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Republic of the Philippines

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annhual Procurement Plan for FY-2023

1s this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) 2 s
Early Source .
Procurement PMO/ Mode of | Advertisement/ . {brief description
c AP i
ode (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procure:ment Procurement Posting of S“b,m'ss”“,/ Notice of Award C‘?ntfaCt of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? IB/REI Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
I:Pt\l\gé gapiz —— For Maintenance
- Portland Cement st OEO, ompe GoP 220,000.00 220,000.00 of National Roads
Maintenance Bidding and Bridges
Competit Jan. 03 - 10
ompetitive an. 03 - 10, e cdo~
1st Quarter No i oy Jan. 23,2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20,2023 | -do 55,000.00 55,000.00 |
2nd Quarter No fompetitve Feb. 07 -14, | oy 57,2023 | Mar. 13,2023 | Mar. 27,2023 | -do- 55,000.00 55,000.00 - do -
Bidding 2023 L
Competitive May 04 - 11,
-do- . ,000.00 | ~do -
3rd Quarter No Cutding oo May 24,2023 | June 07, 2023 | June 21,2023 | -do 55,000.00 55,0
4th Quarter No frompetitive Aug. 02-09, | » 0 55 2023 | Sept. 05, 2023 | Sept. 19,2023 | - do - 55,000.00 55,000.00 ~do-
Bidding 2023
?;V\[l;;gaplz Competitive For Maintenance
- Fuel, Oil, Lubricants ‘ - p GoP 4,100,000.00 4,100,000.00 of National Roads
Maintenance Bidding
and Bridges
Section
1st Quarter No fompetiiive Jan. 0310, | 5.0 53 2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20,2023 | -do- 1,025,000.00 |  1,025,000.00 ~do-
Bidding 2023
2nd Quarter No Competitive Feb. 07 - 14, | oy 27, 2023 | Mar. 13,2023 | Mar. 27,2023 | -do- 1,025,000.00 |  1,025,000.00 ~do-
Bidding 2023
3rd Quarter No Competitive May 0411, | Vv 24,2023 | June 07, 2023 | June 21,2023 | -do- 1,025,000.00 |  1,025,000.00 ~do-
Bidding 2023
4th Quarter No g;’;‘i‘r’;m“’e A“g'zgg 0% | Aug. 22,2023 | Sept. 05, 2023 | Sept. 19,2023 | - do - 1,025,000.00 | 1,025,000.00 «do -
?Pt“gé ((3: apiz c titive For Maintenance
- Tools St UEL, ompe GoP 600,000.00 600,000.00 | of National Roads
Maintenance Bidding and Bridges
1st Quarter No frompetitive Jan. 03-10, | 50 53 5023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20,2023 | -do- 150,000.00 150,000.00 »do -
Bidding 2023 L
2nd Quarter No pompetitive Feb. 07 - 14 | oy 27,2023 | Mar. 13,2023 | Mar. 27,2023 | -do - 150,000.00 150,000.00 |' ~do -
Bidding 2023
3rd Quarter No jpompetitlve May 04 - 11, |\ 24, 2023 | June 07, 2023 | June 21,2023 | -do- 150,000.00 150,000.00 - do-
Bidding 2023 :
4th Quarter No g;’;‘i‘r’g‘t"’e Aug'zgi_," 99 | Aug. 22,2023 | Sept. 05, 2023 | Sept. 19,2023 | - do- 150,000.00 150,000.00 | - do -
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DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

CAPIZ 1ST DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

REGION VI

Roxas City, Capiz

Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2023

Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Early Source I Remarks
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ o {brief description
P
Code (PAP) Program /Project End-User Procure:ment Procurement Posting of SUb_m'SS'on,/ Notice of Award C‘?ntfad of Total MOOE o of Program/
Activity? IB/REI Opening of Bids Signing Funds Activity/ Project)
{Yes/No)
?Pt“ll;l‘igapiz Competitive For Mahs nem
- Equipment s ! . P GoP 8,000,000.00 8,000,000.00 of National Reoads
Maintenance Bidding and Brid
1Sagtion — = —
1st Quarter No Competitive Jan. 03-10, | 5.1 23 2023 | Feb. 06,2023 | Feb. 20,2023 | -do- 500,000.00 500,000.00 ~do-
Bidding 2023 = — —
2nd Quarter No Competitive Feb. 07 - 14, | op 27, 2023 | Mar. 13,2023 | Mar. 27,2023 | -do- 2,500,000.00 |  2,500,000.00 -do-
Bidding 2023 .
T ~ i NI
3rd Quarter No  |Competitive | May04-11, | o 54 2023 | June 07,2023 | June 21,2023 | -do- 2,500,000.00 | 2,500,000.00 ~do-
Bidding 2023 5l
4th Quarter No g;’:i‘;zm“’e Aug'zg;' 0% | Aug. 22, 2023 | Sept. 05,2023 | Sept. 19,2023 | -do - 2,500,000.00 | 2,500,000.00 -de-
CONSULTING SERVICES
I
DPWH, Capiz i
Consulting Services for the Conduct | tst DEO, Competitive Mar. 23 - 29 : Soli Subsurface
- of Soil Subfurface Exploration for  |Planning and No o d." a"2023 " | Apr. 12,2023 | Apr. 18,2023 | Apr. 28,2023 | GoP 750,000.00 | 750,000,00 |Exploration of River
Various River Control Structures Design ading i Control Structures
Section |
1= 1
Submitted by: Recommending Approval: Approved by:
R{Y C. PACANAN NONIE A. VIYAR
District Engineer

17 ef17



