DPWH-CAGAYAN 2ND DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE-Final Annual Procurement Plan FY 2021 for Infrastructure Projects (2nd Semester)

Is this s Source of 2
ABC) Estimated Budget (Ph.
an: Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estim udget (Ph.)
Procure |Mode of
ks
Code (PAP) Procurement  Program/Project .y dMO" ment | Procuremen w (Brier g“nlacrn tion)
End-User | penvity [t Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract _— 8 o P
(Yes/No IAEB of Bids Award Signing =
)
DPWH-
21BC0024-Network Development- Program-Construction of |Cagayan " . o
310204101297000 | By-pass and Diversion Roads-Claveria Diversion Road, nd DEO- |vES  [COMPENEVE | 3 nec 20| 28-Dec-20| 26-Aug-21| 3-Sep-21|MAFY | 45,793,220.00 48,793,220.00 |RCP: Roads Construction
) Bidding 2021 PCCP
Cagayan, Phase II Constructio
n Section
21BC0052-Organizational Outcome 1: Ensure Safe and ;
= : ds Construction-
Reliable National Road System-Network Development g:;:van ?gCPP.RgaCST,S?EZ:‘;S.I
Pragram-Road Widening-Primary Roads-Bangag Magapit Rd Competitive T e | GAA FY 33.685.940.00 e | '
310201100740090 | 0687+ 1019-K0688+200, KOGB9+970-K06BI+92, | |siading el dePer2l) 0l SRePslonny i R gor:titm”.gnmfs;;pe
K0690+057-K0690+130, K0691+180-K0691+934, Allacapan, | o Structural Measures
Cagayan
DPWH- idinae:
21BC0055-Local Infrastructure Program-Construction of Cagayan Co iti GAA FY gé?ﬁiti:ﬂ%ﬂipna
3001042002900 |Langagan Elementary School Mult purpose Building, Brgy.. |2nd DEO- [Yes | d”;i‘r’g‘ Y®| 139an-21]  8-Feb-21] 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21| o 1,000,000.00 1,000,000.00 |~ 0 e Concrete
Langgagan, Sanchez Mira, Cagayan Constructio 1 to 5 store
i (Frame ) ( reys)
21BCO057-Organizational Outcomel: Ensure Safe and DPWH-
Reliable National Road System-Asset Preservation Program-  |Cagayan . . i
310104100285000 | Rehabilitation/Reconstruction/Upgrading of Darmaged Paved [2nd DEO- |ves  |SOMPEUVE | yq5an01|  g-reb-21| 26-Aug-21| 2:5ep21| 5o |  29,818,260.00 20,818,260.00 [RCP: Roads Construction
Roads-Primary Roads-Manila North Road- K0O603+724- Constructio 9
K0604+307, Claveria, Cagayan n Section
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0058-Convergence and Special Support Program- . Construction-without Piles
Construction./Improvement of Various Infrastructure in Cagayan Low Rise-Concrete
Support of Security (Tatag ng Imprastruktura para sa Competitive GAA FY (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
710047 = -Jan- -Mar- -Aug- -Sep- Y 9,800,000.00 -
30020 0000 Kapayapaan at Seguridad Program-TIKAS)-Construction of éggslzzi)h . No Bidding 19-Jan-21| 29-Mar-21| 26-Aug-21| 3-Sep-21 2021 9,800,000.00 8 Re-scheduled opening of
Mititary Camp Philippine Army (PA) Matucay, Allacapan, piimth bids due to change of
Cagayan i 10%] design requested by the
End user
DPWH- _Ruildinas-
21BC0060-Local Program-National Building Program- Cagayan Competitive GAA FY %ﬂiﬁnﬁlﬂ&gﬂ:'mles
300105200441000 |Construction of DPWH Resthouse Building at Taggat, Claveria, | 2nd DEQ-  |No : pet: 19-Jan-21| 9-Feb-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 9,800,000.00 9,800,000.00 L RiseCoticyetie
Cagayan Constructio Bidding 2t ow !

n Section

(Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
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Is this G Source of| @
Budget (Ph.
an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estimated (Ph.)
Procure | Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Program/Project ER ment | Procuremen w (Brie? eDmesamrlfgﬂun)
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)
i U DPWH- 4
21BC0061-Construction /Maintenance of Flood mitigation oy FCSPS-Flood Control:
Structures and Drainage Systems-Reconstruction of Canayun- Competitive my Ak , o o4 |GAA FY 4 oo |Construction- Slope
3201010658400 | i Dana-ili Flood Control Structure along Abulug River, ég:sgigé No  Bidding irdesl] (S-hebedl| ov-il) B WOEL Snoy R 3,000,000.00 | oction using
Abulug, Cagayan Sta. 12+860-Sta.12+980(L/S) uedo Structural Measures
n Section
. DPWH-
21BC0064-Convergence and Special Support Program- Cagayan
Construction/improvement of Access Roads leading to g Competitive ey g . Nov.21|GAA FY op | RCP: Roads Construction-
300203101551000 Declared Tourism Destinations-Claveria Bay View Boulevard g;ﬁ(gﬁ . No Bidding 27-Jan-21| 15-Feb-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 2021 29,294,500.00 29,294,500. PCCP
including Access Road, Claveria, Cagayan n Section
21BC0068-Convergence and Special Support Program- DPWH-
Construction/improvement of Access Roads leading to Cagayan
Declared Tourism Destinations-(Tourism Road Infrastructure Competitive : e o1 | GAA FY RCP: Roads Construction-
300203101552000 Program-TRIP)-Bidduang Bay View Boulevard including ér;d zﬁg No Bidding 5-Feb-21| 1-Mar-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 2021 19,600,000.00 19,600,000.00 pCcP
Access Road leading to Beach Resorts, Bidduang, Pamplona, Sn:ct o
Cagayan N on
21BC0070-Organizational Qutcome 2: Protect Lives and DPWH-
Properties Against Major Foods: Construction/Rehabilitation Cagayan FCSPS-Aood Control:
of Flood Mitigation Facilities within Major River Basins and Competitive GAA FY Construction- Slope
320102104064000 - 2 ,500,000. g
Principal Rivers-Reconstruction of Canayun-Sirit-Dana-ili Flood égd EECCL e Bidding - TR bt R e 2021 S 9650,000.% Protection using
Control along Abulug River, Abulug, Cagayan Sta. 12+700- ‘_?:ct 2 Structural Measures
Sta. 12+860, Sta. 13+220-Sta. 13+300 (L/S) i
21BC0072-Convergence and Special Support Program-
Construction/Improvement of Access Roads leading to DPWH-
Declared Tourism Destinations-(Tourism Road Infrastructure |Cagayan i i B
300203101550000 | Program-TRIP)-Construction/improvement of Access Roads | 2nd DEO- | No gi‘g;;e““"e 9-Feb-21|  2-Mar-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 %‘;1” 29,400,000.00 29,400,000.00 ﬁg& R asicecn
leading to Declared Tourism Destinations-Abulug-Ballesteros | Constructio g
Bay View Boulevard including Access Road leading to Beach |n Section
R
21BC0076 -Convergence and Special Support Program- DPWH-
Construction/Improvement of Access Roads leading to
s0020310184sopy | DECared Tourlsm Destinaions-(Tourts Road Inrasructure (o 008\ |Competitve | 6 ron 51| a1 22Now-21| 25:Nov-21|SPAPY | 45,000,000.00 49,000,000.00 [RCP: Roads Construction-
Program-TRIP)-Abulug-Ballesteros Bay View Boulevard st © Bidding 2021 e [ | o ol
including Access Road leading to Beach Resorts, Abulug, OS? y e o
Cagayan n Section
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)
21BC0077-Organizational Outcome 1: Ensure Safe and DPWH- RCSPS- Roads:
Reliable National Road System-Asset Preservation- Cagayan C itive GAA FY Construction 5]0 e
310107100251000 | Rehabilitation/Reconstruction of National Roads with Slips, 2nd DEO- [No ompet 16-Feb-21| 8-Mar-21| 26-Aug-21| 1-Sep-21 14,700,000.00 14,700,000.00 . R
: : C ¢ Bidding 2021 Protection using
Slope Collapse, and Landslide-Primary Roads-Manila North Constructio Structural Measures
Road-K0602 +340-K0602+410, Claveria, Cagayan n Section
21BC0079 (re-ad)-Local Program- DPWH-
Construction/Repair/Improvement of Various Infrastructure  |Cagayan ¢ s GAA FY RCP: Roads Construction-
300116203971000 |including Local Projects-Local Roads and Bridges-Concreting |2nd DEO-  |No B%rgpetl Vel 12-Mar-21 5-Apr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 2021 4,900,000.00 4,900,000.00 |PCCP Re-adv. due to
of Lasam-Sto. Nino Farm-to-Market Road, Lasam and Sto. | Constructio R Failure of Bidding
Nino, Cagayan n Section
21BC0O080-Local Program-Local Infrastructure Program- gapsvace;n BICWOPLC-Buildings:
300104220027000 |Buildings and Other Structures -Multipurpose/Facilities- Competitive i T s Moo |GAA FY Construction-without Piles
300104220022000 | Construction of Multi-Purpose Building, Brgy. San Agustin, é?mfjs[;f&o Na Bidding ifEDal) Sarel SSovll 26HH ooy 0NN 2/000,000.00 | .\ Rise-Concrete
Abulug, Cagayan, Brgy. Guiddam, Abulug, Cagayan n Section (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
21BC0081-Organizational Qutcome 1: Ensure Safe and DPWH- RCSPS- Roads:
Reliable National Road System-Asset Preservation- Cagayan Barsanna GAA FY Construction Stope
310107100202000 | Rehabilitation/ Reconstruction of Roads with Slips, Slope 2nd DEOC- [No i ddf:]eu 16-Feb-21| 8-Mar-21| 10-Sep-21| 20-Sep-21 2021 96,500,000.00 96,500,000.00 Protection using
Collapse, and Landslide - Primary Roads-Manila North Rd- Constructio WK Structural Measures
KO614 + 524 - KD614 + 604, Claveria, Cagayan n Section
DPWH- i
21BCO082-LOCAL PROGRAM-National Building Program- | Cagayan Gompelii GAA FY g;mg:ﬂggﬁ Piles
300105200440000 | Construction (Expansion) of DPWH Cagayan 2nd DEC 2nd DEO- |No PEUUVE | 16-Feb-21| 8-Mar-21| 22-Nov-21| 26-Nov-21 19,600,000.00 19,600,000.00 ;
Building, Libertad, Abulug,Cagayan Constructio Bddng, 2021 ?;v; n;m\:iffﬂtgr;t:to ;
n Section e
21BC0084-Local Program-Local Infrastructure Program- DPWH- idi
ol ! e BICWOPLC-Buildings:
Buildings and Other Structures -Multipurpose/Facilities- Cagayan o i Or-wi i
3010120005008 | CoNStruction of Mult-Purpose Building Bray. Casitan, ndDEO- [No  |COMPRUVE | yg pabo|  g.Mar-21| 22-Nov-21 | 26-Nov-21| SO Y 1,500,000.00 1,500,000.00 | SOStCaon wihout Pies
Pamplona, Cagayan, and Brgy. Capalalian, Pamplona, Constructio lading (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
Cagayan n Section
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Is this . Source of :
an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estimated Budget (Ph.)
Procure |Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Program/Project PMO/ ment | Procuremen w Bri ;lgr:sarlfs )
End-User |, <ivity It Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract s (Brief Description)
ty ‘ o Total co
(Yes/No IAEB of Bids Award Signing =
)
DPWH-
Sahii a0y |2 PCOBESsEcER Tahast uckiee Progiai-SantiSHng of ﬁgaggg- No  |COMPVE ! 4 cep51| 10-Mar-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21| A4 FY 6,682,500.00 £500,5p07 | Ruaks Consbuction:
Barangay Road, Brgy. Dana Ili, Abulug, Cagayan Constructio Bidding 2021 e R | eel
n Section
I DPWH- .
21BC0089-Local Infrastructure Program-Rehabilitation/ Cagayan RCSPS- Roads:
Reconstruction of Roads with Skips, Slope Collapse and d Competitive o TR T New.1{ | GAA FY 0 Construction Slope
300112200196000 Landslide km 602+430 to km 602-+495, Sta, Praxedes, (2:2?152581: : No Bidding 23-Feb-21| 15-Mar-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 021 19,800,000.00 19,800,000.0! Protection using
Cagayan Valley n Section Structural Measures
DPWH- . ion-
21BC0091-Local Program-Local Infrastructure Program- Cagayan Competitive GAA FY ?gcpl', iéooa::cﬁﬁs;;uctm
300117208218000 | Local Roads and Bridges-Concreting/Improvement of Road  |2nd DEO- [No Bid dip 23-Feb-21| 15-Mar-21| 30-Jul-21| 3-Aug-21 2021 4,927,800.00 4,927,800.00 Approved Budget for the
(Phase 2), Barangay Balatubat, Calayan, Cagayan Constructio ng C P
i ontract
n Section
21BC0093-Local Infrastructure Program-Buildings and Other g::‘a"c;n BICWOPLC-Buildings:
300104220005000 | Structures-Multipurpose/Facilities-Construction of Multi- § Competitive Fak i R New.s 1 |GAA FY Construction-without Piles:
300104220002000 | Purpose Building, Brgy. Fugu and Sta. Cruz, Ballesteros, %gg s?rif:)ﬁo Ko Bidding 25-Febe2l] 13-Mar2L 22:-Nov-al | 25-Hov-21 2021 1R000.00 1,500,000.00 Low Rise-Concrete
Cagayan n Section (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
21BC0100-Organizational Outcome 1-Ensure Safe and DPWH- ~
Reliable National Road System-Asset Preservation Program-  |Cagayan Competiti GAA FY g" H°°‘?OE‘_’S::I:H &
310112100248000 | Construction/ Upgrading/ Rehabilitation of Drainage along  |2nd DEO-  [No a:: d_p Ve 2.Mar-21| 22-Mar-21| 26-Aug-21| 3-Sep-21 s 4,410,000.00 4,410,000.00 | 5 osed's"uca" At <
National Roads - Tertiary Roads-Cagayan Apayao Rd Constructio ng Conduits e
(S00655LZ) KO543+380-K0543+730, Rizal, Cagayan n Section
21BC0104-Local Program-Local infrastructure Program- Ec’ap;‘;vén BICWOPLC-Buildings:
300104220035000 |Buildings and Other Structures-Multipurpose/Facilities- Competitive O p— —_— Newoo1 | GAA FY Construction-without Piles
300104220020000 | Construction of Multi-Purpose Building at Brgy. Callao Sur and | 204 DFC- 1N pigding ZMar-21) 22-Mar-21) 22-Nov-21) 25-Nov-21 5, 1,500,000.00 1,500,00000 | (o Rise-Concrete

Brgy. Sicalao, Lasam, Cagayan

n Section

(Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
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Is this > 2 Source of i
Schedi Each AB Budget (Ph.
an Early ule for Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estimated (Ph.)
Procure |Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Program/Project PMO/ ment |Procuremen w Brie? Er:scr:s tion)
End-User |, ivity |t Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract il 3 & ( P
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)
) DPWH- i
S —— 21BC0105-Local Program-Local infrastructure Program- Cagayan BICWOPLC-Buildings:
300104220028000 | Buildings and Other Structures Multipurpose/Facilties- and DEO- [No  |COMPEHEVE | 5 ward1| 22-Mar-21| 22-Nov-21 | 25-Nov-21|SM FY 1 3,000,000.00 3,000,000.0p |ConStruction-without Piles
300104220015000 |Construction of Multi-Purpose Building at Brgy. Siguiran, Constructio Bidding 2021 Low Rise-Concrete
Simayung and Sta. Filomena, Abulug, Cagayan  Section (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
DPWH- s
; BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0111-Local Program-Local infrastructure Program- Cagayan - S :
I aasosoaso |Buldings and Other Structures-Construction of Multi-Purpose |2nd DEO- | No g;’d”;if]e““"e 3-Mar-21| 23-Mar-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 ‘253;1” 1,500,000.00 1,500,000.00 Egnwsg;?ggn"c‘:‘ex”t Wlles
Bullding, Brgy. Cabayu and Baran, Ballesteros, Cagayan Constructio g
. (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
n Section
g DPWH- idinas:
21BC0112-Local Program-Local infrastructure Program- Cagayan BICWOPLC-Buildings:
300104220025000 |Buildings and Other Structures-Construction of Multi-Purpose Competitive o i R Nou.o1 |GAA FY Construction-without Piles
300104220026000 | Building, Brgy. Dana-Ili, and Brgy. Sto. Tomas, Abulug, égisi’ri(;o Ko Bidding SHanal] 2 Mordl| 22 Nov-al| S3HRFek oo AR DE0N 2,000,00000 |, . Pica Concrate
5 st
Ll n Section (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
21BC0123-0rganizational Outcome 1: Ensure Safe and DPWH-
Reliable National Road System-Asset Preservation- Cagayan RCSPS- Roads:
Rehabilitation/ Reconstruction of Roads with Slips, Slope . Competitive e . i e 9y [GAA FY 5 880.000.00 Construction Slope
SIS0 Collapse, and Landslide - Tertiary Roads-Cagayan Apayao Rd égg 5[;52&0 ha Bidding 12-2]  SAFALI 6-A0p2) 2509721 2021 SES0p00.00 L Protection using
(S00655L.Z) K0540+020-K0540+080, KO540+980 - f Bactian Structural Measures
KO541+100, Rizal, Cagayan
21BC0124-Local Program: DPWH-
Construction/Repair/Rehabilitation/Improvement of Various  |Cagayan o : oy
300116203975000 | Infrastructure Including Local Projects-Local Road and 2ndDEO- [No  |SOMPENME | ypar2y|  sapr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 S ™Y | 14,700,000.00 sz o0 | So Rk Capsiain
Bridges: Local Roads-Concreting of Colonial Road ,Sitio Constructio 9
Pagappo,Guiddam, Abulug, Cagayan n Section
21BC0127-Local Program; DPWH- _Buildinas:
Construction/Repair/Rehabilitation/Improvement of Various  |Cagayan Competitive GAA FY ﬂﬁgﬁi‘ﬂmﬁf’m les
300207100332000 | Infrastructure Including Local Projects-Construction of 2nd  |2nd DEO-  |No Biddin 19-Mar-21| 12-Apr-21| 10-Sep-21| 20-Sep-21 2021 24,125,000.00 24,125,000.00 § ool Rica o =
Cagayan Provincial Mobile Force Company Building including |Constructio 9 (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
Multi-Purpose Building, Pamplona, Cagayan n Section
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an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity ) (ABC) Estimated Budget (Ph.)
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)
DPWH- _Buildinae-
21BC0128-Local Infrastructure Program-Buildings and Other|Cagayan e arice S gﬁﬁgﬁnﬁﬂgﬂfp" -
300104220031000 | Structures-Construction of Multi-Purpose Building, Brgy. 2nd DEO- [No Bid dilfg 19-Mar-21| 12-Apr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 2021 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Low Rise-Concrete
Masical, Sto.Nino, Cagayan Constructio
5
n Section (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
i s DPWH- itdinae:
21BC0129-Local Program-National Building Program- Cagayan BICWOPLC-Buildings:
Construction of DOJ Building (National Prosecution Service, Competitive o g N a1 |GAA FY Construction-without Piles
3001052004200 |y ovincial Prosecution Office, Ballesteros, Cagayan Satellite (Zlggs[n)zgio o Bidding UPEL Dihiy ST SRt 2021 11,760,000.00 11,750,000.00 Low Rise-Concrete
Office) at Centro East, Ballesteros, Cagayan : (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
n Section
DPWH- R
300104220014000 |21BC0O130-Local infrastructure Prigam-Construction of Multi- |Cagayan Competiiive GAA FY gzcn?&z;g: umq;jr'wggui-mes
300104220018000 | Purpose Buildings at Brgys. Calapangan Norte, Aggunetan & |2nd DEO- {No omp 15-Mar-21| 12-Apr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 2,250,000.00 2,250,000.00 :
300104220019000 . Bidding 2021 Low Rise-Concrete
Nabannagan East, Lasam, Cagayan Constructio
: (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
n Section
21BC0131 -Convergence and Special Support Program- DPWH-
Construction /Improvement of Various Infrastructures in Cagayan BICWOPLC-Buildings:
Support of National Security (Tatag ng Imprastraktura para Competitive GAA FY Construction-without Piles
71 - - -Apr- -Aug- -Sep- i ,000. -
300207100463000 sa Kapayapaan at Sequridad Program- TIKAS)-Cons ion of (Z:Zd !;ESU No Bidding 26-Mar-21| 19-Apr-21| 26-Aug-21| 3-Sep-21 2031 14,700,000.00 14,700,000.00 Low Rise-Coricrete
Barracks including MPB and other ancillary structures, Bravo " ;: i 2 (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
Company, 17th 1B, Gagabutan West, Rizal, Cagayan
21BCO0132 - Convergence and Special Support Program- DPWH-
Construction /Improvement of Various Infrastructures in i BICWOPLC-Buildings:
Support of National Security (Tatag ng Imprastraktura para Competitive GAA FY Construction-without Piles
300207100469000 2 -Mar- -ADr- -Aug- -Sep- T h
sa Kapayapaan at Seguridad Program- TIKAS)-Construction of 52:525(;’ No Bidding 26-Mar-21| 19-Apr-21| 26-Aug-21| 1-Sep-21 2021 14,700,000.00 14,700,000.00 Low Rise-Concrete
Military Camp Philippine Army (PA), Balanni, Sto. Secti © (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
Nifio,Cagayan n ection
DPWH- _Bri i
21BCO133- Local Program- Local Infrastructure Program-  |Cagayan Comnpetiti GAA FY gﬁf&gﬁ?ﬁéncm
300119200452000 |Local Roads and Bridges-Construction of Tupanna Bridge,  |2nd DEO- |No OMPEUUVE | y6-Mar-21| 19-Apr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00 ;
. Bidding 2021 (Superstructure) Driven
Brgy. Tupanna, Pamplona, Cagayan Constructio piles
n Section
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DPWH- dinas:
21BC0134-Local Program-Local Infrastructure Program- Cagayan BICWOPLC-Buildings:
Buildings and Other Structures-Multipurpose/Facilities- Competitive P B Nev_ 1 |GAA FY Construction-without Piles
300104220001000 Construction of Multipurpose Bulding, Brgy. Matucay, ég:slzig;o No Bidding 26-Mar-21| 19-Apr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 2021 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Lol Riga.Concrete
Allacapan, Cagayan n Section (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
DPWH- idinae:
SR 21BCO135-Local Program-Local Infrastructure Program- Cagayan BICWOPLC-Buildings:
Buildings and Other Structures-Multipurpose/Facilities- Competitive e o . Neav.1 | GAA FY Construction-without Piles
;g:xﬁgﬁ% Construction of Multi-Purpose Buildings at Brgys. Labben, égﬁsgrﬁgt;o No Bidding 26-Mar-21| 19-Apr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 2021 2,500,000.00 2,500,000.00 Low Rise-Concrete
Nagattatan and Capagaran, Allacapan, Cagayan n Section (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
DPWH BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0136 - Local Program-Local Infrastructure Program- Cagay;n Construction-without Piles:
300104220011000 | Buildings and Other Structures-Multipurpose/Facilities- Competitive . g o a1 e |GAA FY Low Rise-Concrete
300104220013000 | Construction of Multi-Purpose Buildings at Brgys. San Juan éggsfrﬁgé No | Bidding SRl J0-Maysdt) 22 NowRl SNt oom LG 1,500,000.00 | e -me ) (1 to 5 storeys)
and Gattu, Pamplona, Cagayan ot Re-advertised due to
1 Section failure of bidding
21BC0137-Local Program-Construcion/Repair/Rehabilitation g:;’:;';n BICWOPLC-Buildings:
{Improvement of Various Infrastructure Including Local Competitive GAA FY Construction-without Piles
300116203972000 - 3 -ADr- Nov- -NOv- i
Projects-Local Roads and Bridges-Local Roads-Construction of (Z:ndstgigti Ll Bidding 6By ST ShRoREE DRel 2021 %900,000.00 R Low Rise-Concrete
Road in Brgy. Libertad, Abulog, Cagayan SIUCHD (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
n Section
DPWH- WSL283 Water Supplu
21BC0138-Local Infrastructure Program-Water Management |Cagayan c i GAA FY (Level 2 & 3):
300121201059000 | Facilities-Water Supply-Construction of Water System, Brgy. |2nd DEO- [No &g‘n;pet Ve 26-Mar-21 19-Apr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 2021 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 |Construction (Pipe Water
Libertad, Abulug, Cagayan Constructio "9 with Communal/Private
n Section Water Point)
DPWH- I
21BC0139-Local Infrastructure Progam-Buildings and Other |Cagayan Competit GAA FY m&gﬁ:ﬁﬁgﬂ: ‘Piles
300104220010000 |Strucutres-Construction of ABC Hall, Brgy. Centro 1, Lasam, |2nd DEO- [No Bi ddipn?uve 26-Mar-21| 19-Apr-21{ 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 2021 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Low Rise-Corcrete
Cogeyen r?osnescbt':) C:O (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
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Is this s 5 Source of| ;
an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estimated Budget (Ph.)
Procure | Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Program/Project E P:OI ment | Procuremen w Bri fema”fsﬁ
g Lser Activity |t Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract 3 (Brief Description)
g S Total co
(Yes/No IAEB of Bids Award Signing =
)
21BC0140-Organizational Outcome 2: Protect Lives and DPWH-
Properties Against Major Floods: Construction/Maintenance of Cagayan FCSPS-Flood Control:
Flood Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems: Competitive e gy T w1 | GAA FY Construction- Slope
320101106586000 | o - nstruction of Dugo Flood Control Structure along Abulug 2“: g DEO',O No | Bidding Sardl) 2Ohpr-el) Bdoval, SRl 43800,000. 00 49,000,000.00 | 1t ection using
River, Dugo, Banguian, Abulug, Cagayan Sta. 9+820-Sta, 1 Section Structural Measures
9+970 (R/S)
19 o : DPWH-
21BC0141-Organizational Qutcome 2: Protect Lives and i FCSPS-Floed Control:
Properties Against Major Floods: Construction/Maintenance of agaye 3 Competitive i a1 |GAA FY Construction- Slope
320101106581000 Flood Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems: 2nd DEG n No Bidding 3/30/2021| 4/20/2021| 30-Jul-21| 3-Aug-21 2021 29,400,000.00 29,400,000.00 Protection using
Construction of Zinundungan River Control, Lasam, Cagayan n:asi ectlﬁh' u;nh Structural Measures
21BC0142-Convergence and Special Support Program- DPWH-
Construction/Improvement of Various Infrastructure in i BICWOPLC-Buildings:
Support of National Security (Tatag ng Imprastruktura para Cagay Competitive M T ATiED Can.a1 |GAA FY Construction-without Piles
A e sa Kapayapaan at Seguridad Program-TIKAS)-Construction of (Ziﬁszf&u e Bidding UML) RARESH R6AIR) * 2Eecgaa 2021 9:800,000.00 2500,000.00 Low Rise-Concrete
Barracks 20th Marine Company, Marine Battalion Landing reCartn (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
Team-10, Sta. Praxedes, Cagayan
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
DPWH- Construction-without Piles:
21BCO144-Local Infrastructure Program- Buildings and Cagayan Competitive GAA FY Low Rise-Concrete
300104219970000 | Other Structures-Construction of Multi-Purpose Building 2nd DEO- |No Bid dil::1 VE| 25-Aug-21| 14-Sep-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 2021 24,750,000.00 24,750,000.00 |(Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
(Municipal Hall), Brgy. Libertad, Abulug, Cagayan Constructio 9 re-advertised due to
n Section Section 41 of Revised
IRR of RA 9184
21BC0145-Convergence and Special Support Program- DPWH- S——
Construction/Improvement of Various Infrastructure in Cagayan Competitive GAA FY BICW;’Z;E: um"g_':;?j: 'p" &
300207100472000 |Support of National Security (Tatag ng Imprastruktura para  |2nd DEO- | No . di‘; V€| 30-Mar-21{ 20-Apr-21| 26-Aug-21| 1-Sep-21 ioiet] 34,300,000.00 34,300,000.00 C”mwﬁmse_&m s
sa Kapayapaan at Seguridad Program-TIKAS)-Construction of |Constructio 9 (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
Multi-purpose Building with Firing Range, Abulug, Cagayan  |n Section d
21BC0146-Convergence and Special Support Program- DPWH-
Construction/Improvement of Various Infrastructure in Cagayan BICWOPLC-Buildings:
Support of National Security (Tatag ng Imprastruktura para Competitive GAA FY Construction-without Piles
300207100464000 L -Mar- -ADr- -Aua- Sep- ; ¥ !
sa Kapayapaan at Seguridad Program-TIKAS)-Construction of ég:sg_uE?ﬁu e Bidding i R 2021 14.700,000.00 Le 2000000 Low Rise-Concrete
Barracks including MPB and other Ancillary Structures, Charlie of Saeiors (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)

Company, 171B 5ID, Camp Sicalao, Lasam, Cagayan
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Is this L Source of .
an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estimated Budget (Ph.)
Procure |Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Programy/Project PMO¢ ment | Procuremen i - feD'?:fl_Gﬁ
End-User | » wvity ¢ Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract i S - (Brief Description)
(Yes/No IAEB of Bids Award Signing =
)
21BC0147-Local Program- DPWH-
Construction/Repair/Rehabilitation/Improvement of Various  |Cagayan - : o
3001620397400 | Infrastructure Including Local Projects-Local Roads and 2nd DEO- |No g.‘;";.‘ft'“"e 30-Mar-21| 20-Apr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21 ‘253;1':" 19,600,000.00 19,600,000.00 ,5555 B GorERvEon
Bridges-Local Roads-Concreting of Colony Road, Libertad, Constructio ading
Abulug, Cagayan n Section
0010420004000 21BC0148-Local Infrastructure Program- Buildings and (I::):g\g;i:;n BICWOPLC-Buildings:
20003 Other Structures-Construction of Multi-Purpose Buildings, Competitive M g Ny Nev_o1 | GAA FY Construction-without Piles
3281332000& Brgys. Payagan East, Mabuttal West and Zitanga, Ballesteros, (Ziggsg-ig;o No Bidding Atardl| Zirbordl| R2-Noy-Zll 25-Hav-l 2021 230,000 LAn00 Low Rise-Concrete
Cagayan n Section (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
21BC0149-Local Infrastructure Program- Buildings and DPWH- itdi
: : = BICWOPLC-Buildings:
Other Structures-Construction of Multi-Purpose Building, Brgy. |Cagayan - o z
300104220030000 | o i, Sanchez Mira,Cagayan and Construction of nd DEO- |No  |COMPEHUVE | 36 vardi| 20-Apr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21|CAA FY 2,000,000.00 2,000,000,00 |CNstruction-without Piles
300104220034000 - ol . Bidding 2021 Low Rise-Concrete
Namuac-San Andres Multipurpose Building, Brgy.Namuac, Constructio (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
Sanchez Mira, Cagayan n Section X
DPWH- i
- BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0150-Local Infrastructure Program- Buildings and Cagayan . P i
3001042202300 | (yher Structures-Construction of Multi-Purpose Buildings,  |2nd DEO- [No | COMPEUVE | 30 yaro1|  20-Apr-21| 22-Nov-21| 25-Nov-21|{%A4 FY 2,000,000.00 Zaonsoony |FonsucHtwthou Blles
300104220024000 : g Bidding 2021 Low Rise-Concrete
Brgys. Canayun and Banguian, Abulug, Cagayan Constructio
3 {Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
n Section
DPWH-
¥ 2 . |Cagayan o GAA FY . o
9999999999999 i;ﬁ‘c’:;:‘;f’e""g of Broy. Dana-il FHIR, Bray. Dana-tl |ong DEO- [No  [COMPEUNE | 30500.01)  21-0u-21| 26-ui21 3-Aug-21|2021 DA-|  11,914,680.00 11,914,680.00 [RCP: Roads Construction
i LAGAY Constructio 9 FMRP
n Section
DPWH- ildinng
21BC0175-Construction/Completion of 2-Storey 4- Cagayan — al o S
300101200001000 | Laboratory 2-Classroom, Piat National High School, Piat, 2nd DEO- No g dr;‘i':fgt' V€| 30un-21| 21-3ul-21] 20-Sep-21| 24-Sep-21 DepEd- 2,642,224.28 2,642,224.28 Low Rise-Concrete
Cagayan g‘ggi‘;f" BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
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n Section

Is this L Source of .
an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estimated Budget (Ph.)
Procure |Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Program/Project POy ment | Procuremen w Bri ;leDr:sarifs ;
End-User | »covity ¢ Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract — S . (Brief Description)
(Yes/No IAEB of Bids Award | Signing 4
)
DPWH- BICWOI::Et_‘C-Bm!drlIngs:P_I
Cagayan A gg;lFY (L:ons;u _gn-wmeuc;ut iles-
21BC0176-Construction/Completion of 2-Storey 4 ompetitive ow Rise-Concr
012 000 5 Jun- -Aug- Sep- Sen- .
0010120000100 | -1 ey, Cabatacan National High School, o énd ;ﬁSﬁ No | pia ding 30-Jun-21| 21-Aug-02| 20-Sep-21| 24-Sep-21 DepEd- 3,174,736.37 3,174,736.37 (P ) (1 i & sy
e BEFF Re-scheduled due to
n Section change of ABC
gapg::li;n GAA FY BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0177-Construction/Completion of 2-Storey 6~ Competitive can.aq 2021 Construction-without Piles
300101200001000 Laboratory, Abulug School of Fisheries, Abulug, Cagayan égﬁsz-i?éo No Bidding 08-Jul-21| 28-Jul-21| 20-Sep-21| 28-Sep-21 DepEd- 3,312,275.63 3,312,275.63 LW RIsa-Conreta
n Section BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
gap;\ar:a;n GAA FY BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0178-Construction/Completion of 2-Storey 4 Competitive 2021 Construction-without Piles
300101200001000 " Jul- Jul- Sep- _Sep-
Laboratory, Cabatacan National High School, (Building) é&iﬁﬁo No | Bidding PE-hiZl) 28:Mil2L A0Sepdl | 27Bemlline e L23510024 3,252,108.24 | .\ Rise-Concrete
n Section BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
DPWH- .
21BC€0179-Construction/Completion of 2-Storey 2- Cagayan Competitive SOAQIFY g;?:u?:f:tﬁﬁﬂg;gﬁmles
300101200001000 | Laboratory 4 Classroom, Callao National High School, Lasam, |2nd DEO- No |gg di'; g VE| o8-Jul-21| 28-Jul-21| 20-Sep-21| 28-Sep-21 DepEd 3,610,148.56 3610,148.56 || orce Concrete
Cagayan Constructio i
n Section BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
DPWH- Lo
21BC0180-Construction/Completion of 2-Storey 4 Cagayan Competiti ggg IFY g:,ﬁ‘fom mpl-iﬁuwl!srﬂa: Piles
300101200001000 |Classroom, 2-Laboratory, Claveria National High School, 20dDEO- | Mo oo dipn g' Ve pg-Jul-21| 28-Jul-21| 20-Sep-21| 27-Sep-21 Deped 5,234,986.79 3108678 | e et
Claveria, Cagayan Constructio )
n Section BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
gg;?\;n GAA FY BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BCO181-Construction/Completion of 2-Storey 4- Competitive 2021 Construction-without Piles
300101200001000 i -Jul- -Jul- -Sep-. Sep- i !
Laboratory,Namucayan Integrated School, Sto. Nifio, Cagayan (z:ggsg-uEgﬁo Mo Bidding GRIURl PN USEETY| 2F-Sopeal DepEd- Sl SO Low Rise-Concrete
BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
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Is this - Source of| :
Budget (Ph.
an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estimated (Ph.}
. Procure |Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Program/Project FIc ment | Procuremen L Bri ? eDr;argsﬁon
End-User Activity |t Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract Total g e (Frif Descriptiony)
(Yes/No [AEB of Bids Award Signing =
)
DPWH- _Ruiildings:
21BC0182-Construction/Completion of 2-Storey 4- Cagayan Competitive SQZAIFY gf,f,‘fﬂ;gﬁﬂ:?;gﬂ?pi|es
300101200001000 | Laboratory, Abulug National Rural Vocational High School, |20 DEO- | No | di‘:g" Ve | 08-Jul-21| 28-Jul-21| 20-Sep-21| 27-Sep-21 iy 3,207,898.74 ST L e crnorats
Abulug, Cagayan Constructio
5 stor
e BEFF (Frame ) (1 to eys)
DPWH- CWO ildings:
21BC0183-Construction/Completion of 2-Storey 4- Cagayan — ggg IFY gnmz;%ﬂg"gﬁi'ﬁ,es
300101200001000 | Laboratory, Sta. Praxedes High School, Sta. Praxedes, ndDEO- | No |piite e | 08u-21)  28ul-21) 20Sep-2t| 27-Sep21 [ | 5047,437.07 SO AR | focrete
Cagayan Constructio
ot BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
DPWH- CWe TR
21BC0184-Construction/Completion of 2-Storey 4- Cagayan Competiti gg;lFY gfmstﬁf,:ﬁgﬂﬂi'pnes
300101200001000 |Classroom, Sto. Nifio National High Schoal, Sto. Nifio, 2ndDEO- | No [COMPSNVE | 08ul21|  28-Jul-21) 20-5ep-21| 27-Sep-21| 30 1,686,264.33 1,686,264.33 | ow Rise-Concrete
Cagayan Constructio i
izl BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
DPWH- T
21BC0185-Construction/Completion of 4-Storey 4- Cagayan c iti SOA;lFY géﬁ?tr?;l&gnﬂgrﬁgipi!s
300101200001000 |Laboratory, Matucay National High School, Allacapan, ndDEO- | Mo | WRCTV)\ 08dul21|  28ul21| 20Sep-21) 27-Sep21| T 1,061,943.37 1,061,943.37 | 0 Concrete
Cagayan Constructio i
i BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
DPWH- _Buildinas:
21BC0186-Construction/Completion 2 Storey 4 Laboratory  [Cagayan Competitive SDA;,_FY gﬁﬁiﬁ:ﬂfﬂrsﬂz'pnﬁ
300101200001000 |Abariongan National High School, Santo Nifio (Faire), 2nd DEO- No  |aig di'; " 19-Jul-21| 09-Aug-21| 20-Sep-21| 28-Sep-21 DepEd- 4,235,181.20 4,235,181.20 Low Rise-Concrete
Cagayan Constructio
phiishecs BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
DPWH- CWO i dinae:
21BC0187-Construction/Completion of 2 storey 4 Cagayan C it SS;IFY ginmt’;iﬂfrzgﬂi'puﬁ
300101200001000 | Laboratory, (Building 1) Pamplona National High School,  |2nd DEO- | No Bi‘(’irgi‘;? Ve 1 19-3ul-21| 09-Aug-21| 20-Sep-21| 27-Sep-21 DepEd- 4,348,418.03 434841803 | bice-Concrete
Pamplona, Cagayan gosnesgiu:)cr']ao BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
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Is this - Source of }
an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estimated Budget (Ph.)
Procure |Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Program/Project e ment |Procuremen i . ?emarlfs‘
End-User | vty It Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract o 9 &5 (Brief Description)
(Yes/No 1AEB of Bids Award Signing =
)
DPWH- itdinae:
21BC0188-Construction/Completion of 2 storey 4 Cagayan Competitive ?g‘;lw W&gﬁhﬁﬂmg&pu -
300101200001000 |Laboratory, ( Building 2) Pamplona National High School, 2nd DEO- No Bid dipn o i 19-Jul-21| 09-Aug-21| 20-Sep-21| 27-Sep-21 DepEd- 6,228,140.43 6,228,140.43 Livi RISB-Conerete
Pamplona, Cagayan Constructio
n Section BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
g:;;r;n GAA FY BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0189-Construction/Completion 2 Storey 4 Laboratory ~ Competitive e R L] PO cam_1 |2021 Construction-without Piles:
PRAIRR R Sanchez Mira National High School, sanchez Mira, Cagayan ?:ggszicc)ﬁo o Bidding F-iRL| Mo-hug-2l 20:8ep-al| 7-Sep-2l DepEd- SEMEE0.18 it Low Rise-Concrete
n Section BEFF {(Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
gaP;VaSa-n GAA FY BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0190-Construction/Completion of 3-Storey 6 Classroom Competitive 2021 Construction-without Piles
300 g Jul- -Aug- Sep- _Sep- 5 i
101200001000 at Palusao Primary School, Sot. Nifio,(Faire), Cagayan 2nd [:-Egu . No Bidding 27-Jul-21| 16-Aug-21| 20-Sep-21| 27-Sep-21 DepEd- 1,426,239.37 1,426,239.37 Lo Risa-Concrets
n Section BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
E:;’:S;n GAA FY BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0191-Completion of 2 storey 2 Laboratory at Western Competitive 2021 Construction-without Piles
30010120000 = -Aug- -Sep- -Dec- -Jan- J
1 Cagayan Schhol of Arts and Trades, Lasam, Cagayan (2:22 5[;52“0 e Bidding s e e R DepEd- L L S Low Rise-Concrete
n Section BEFF {Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
[C)apg\;:vav;n GAA FY BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0203-Completion of 2-Storey 6 Laboratory, David M. Competitive 2021 Construction-without Piles
01 1 A -AuG- Sep- -Dec- Jan- .
AP0l ZRcORNg Puzon Memorial National High School, Pamplona, Cagayan (ztgﬁsgrigﬁo NG Bidding s e DepEd- #AIEATIS L Low Rise-Concrete
n Section BEFF (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
g;:"a;';n FCSPS-Fiood Control:
3002001000030 | 22BCO210-Restoration of Sicalao Aood Control, Sicalao, 1504 peg. | g [SOMPEEVE | g1 0ct01) 22.0ct-21| 26-Oct-21 | 28-0ct-21 | GoP | 21,287,900.00 21,287,900.00 |COnStruction- Siope
Lasam, Cagayan Maint Bidding Protection using
intenanc Structural Measures
e Section
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Is this i Source of i
an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estimated Budget (Ph.)
Procure | Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Program/Project EnZMS / ment | Procuremen w Bri fgr;acrlfs ¢
User | activity |t Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract —_—_ ] - (Brief Description)
(Yes/No IAEB of Bids Award Signing =
)
21B€0211-Construction of DPWH Logo at Flag Pole, 2:;!:;” BICWOPLC-Buildings:
Canteen at Gymnasium & Replacement of Sewer Line at g Competitive S i ez S Construction-without Piles
32010210458000 District Engineer’s OfficeBrgy. Libertad, Abulug, Cagayan Zm?l DEO No Bidding 25-Nov-21| 17-Dec-21| 27-Dec-21| 4-Jan-22 GoP 900,000.00 900,000.00 Low Rise-Concrete
Haitenang (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
e Section
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
g:;‘;u;n Construction-without Piles
21BC0192-Completion of 2-Storey 6 Laboratory @ Western " Competitive i — Sy — Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 Cagayan School of Arts and Trade, Lasam, Cagayan i'nq ?EnO No Bidding 18-Aug-21| 7-Sep-21| 1-Feb-22| 8-Feb-22| GoP 5,281,931.34 5,281,931.34 (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
3 ;'ch ozm Awaiting for the release
of fund
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
g:;:c;n Construction-without Piles:
21BC0193-Completion of 2-Storey 8 Laboratory at Western 0 Competitive o g oy Pk Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 Cagayan School of Arts, Lasam, Cagayan :Ir;? ngeicgm No Bidding 18-Aug-21| 7-Sep-21| 1-Feb-22| 8-Feb-22| GoP 7,362,592.57 7,362,592.57 (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
& Sacion Awaiting for the release
of fund
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
g:;’:ga' ’ Construction-without Piles
21BC0194-Completion of 2-Storey 4 Laboratory (S, ICT), Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 4 4 - _AUG- Sep- -Feb- . ; E
oo Claveria School of Arts and Trade, Claveria, Cagayan i‘lnaaneErgnc No Bidding IBangdl| #Serdl| Aol Shchdy GO 3455,200.23 SIS (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
& SI on Awaiting for the release
of fund
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
gj;’:;‘;n Construction-without Piles
21BC0195-Completion of 2-Storey 6 Laboratory, Claveria Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
0 2 -AUG- Sep- _Feb-: -Feb-
300101200001000 School of Arts and Trade, Claveria, Cagayan an DEO No Bidding 18-Aug-21| 7-Sep-21| 1-Feb-22| 8-Feb-22| GoP 3,006,263.35 3,006,263.35 (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
Maintenanc s
Secti Awaiting for the release
e on of fund
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
ggg"!v; N Construction-without Piles
21BC0196-Completion of 3-Storey 6 Laboratory, Ballesteros, Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 2 -Aug- .Sep- -Feb- -Feb- J ,109,875.
National High School, Ballesteros, Cagayan f&r;qntDeEnc;nc No Bidding 18-Aug-21| 7-Sep-21| 1-Feb-22| 8-Feb-22| GoP 1,109,875.91 1,109,875.51 (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
. S‘ech Awaiting for the release
on of fund
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Is this " Source of| :
an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Rl (ABC) Estimated Budget (Ph.)
Procure |Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Programj/Project ey ment | Procuremen w ~ Remarks
End-User | »ctivity [t Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract - S - (Brief Description)
(Yes/No IAEB of Bids Award Signing =
)
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
DPWH-
i BeDLeT tunis ; Cagayan Construction-without Piles
-Completion of 3 Sorey 6 Laboratory 3 Classroom Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 | = . : 2nd DEO- N ot 18-Aug-21| 7-Sep-21| 1-Feb-22| 8-Feb- } ]
, Libertad National High School, Abulug, Cagayan ond OF0- | M |siding g P e B 3, 8205pa2.00 3828,537.00 | 2me ) (1 to 5 storeys)
e Section Awaiting for the release
of fund
DPWH- BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0198-Compl 5 Cagayan Construction-without Piles
-Completion of 2 Storey 6 Laboratory (Sci, lab & Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 ) ; ; 2nd DEO- N ey 18-Aug-21| 7-Sep-21| 1-Feb-22 -Feb- # .
ICT), Iluru National High School, Rizal, Cagayan Smoeone| T [Bidding g P el SRy, Top dnalo0e 393431982 | rome ) (1 to 5 storeys)
Gt Awaiting for the release
of fund
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
DPWH-
21BC0199-Completion of 2-Storey 2 Labo Eaoayn sk
-Completion of 2-Storey 2 Laboratory, Mauanan Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 : : s . - -Aug- -Sep-. -Feb- -Feb- &
National High School (Building 1), Rizal, Cagayan Ifdg?n?ei(;nc B Bidding gAl FSepdl] FRandd Ofehad Cop s L s (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
e Section Awaiting for the release
of fund
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
DPWH-
21BC0200-Completion of 3-Starey 2 Cagayan Construction-without Piles
-Completion of 3-Storey 2 Laboratory 5 Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 : . ; 2nd DEO- N - 25-Aug-21| 14-Sep-2 -Feb-22 - : B
Classroom, Libertad National High School, Abulug, Cagayan &< PE2° | N I idding e i) Hebis Meely eof AR3AI0528 363312528 | crame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
e Section Awaiting for the release
of fund
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
DPWH-
BT e . o Cagayan Construction-without Piles
-Completion of 2-Storey 2- ratory, Ballesteros Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 : : ’ 2nd 3 sk, -Aug- Sep- -Feb-; -Feb- ; i
National High School, Ballesteros, Cagayan s intD:nth No | Gidding 25-Aug-21| 14-Sep-21| 1-Feb-22| B8-Feb-22| GoP 1,518,835.64 151883564 | Lo N (1 to 5 storeys)
& Seitlon Awaiting for the release
of fund
DPWH- BICWOPLC-Buildings:
21BC0202-Completion of 2-Storey 4 Laboratory (S, ICT) Cagayan a i Construction-without Piles
300101200001000 |David M. Puzon Memorial National High School, Pamplona,  |2nd DEO- | No B.‘{’;;F‘e“ Ve | 25-aug-21| 14-Sep-21| 1-Feb-22| 8-Feb22| GoP 4,325,525.24 4,325,525.0¢ |LOW Rise-Concrete
Cagayan Maintenanc idding (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
e Section Awaiting for the release

of fund
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Is this - Source of .
an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Funds (ABC) Estimated Budget (Ph.)
Procure |Mode of
Code (PAP) Procurement  Program/Project PO/ ment | Procuremen & _Remarks
End-User | »ctivity [t Ads/Post of | Sub/Open | Contract | Contract ok ] - (Brief Description)
(Yes/No IAEB of Bids Award Signing =
)
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
g:’;!;i;n Construction-without Piles
21BC0205-Completion of 2-Storey 2 Laboratory, Mauanan Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 : ' - _Aug- Sep- -Feb- -Feb-
National High Schoal, (Building 2) Rizal, Cagayan ;r;?nfeigm NO | Bidding R9:ANgeL] ISeprdl), bRl Beazd dP M08 94521078 | e ame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
S i i Awaiting for the release
of fund
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
g::::lan Construction-without Piles
21BC0206-Completion of 3 Storey 9 Laboratory (R, S & Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 : d - -Aug- Sep- Feb- -Eeb- ¢
ICT), Sto. Nifio, Cagayan il‘;?n?elirgm No Bidding 25-Aug-21| 14-Sep-21| 1-Feb-22| 8-Feb-22| GoP 4,952,856.94 4,952,856.94 (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
e Section Awaiting for the release
of fund
BICWOPLC-Buildings:
g:;::a = Construction-without Piles
21BC0207-Completion of 2-Storey 4 Laboratory, Allig Valiey Competitive Low Rise-Concrete
300101200001000 3 . : 2 -Aug- Sep- “Feb- _Feb-
National High School, Allacapan, Cagayan i‘[r:n(?efgnc No Bidding 25-Aug-21| 14-Sep-21| 1-Feb-22| 8-Feb-22| GoP 3,426,531.75 3,426,531.75 (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
e Section Awaiting for the release
of fund
" BICWOPLC-Buildings:
il Construction-without Piles
0010120000100 | 2LBCO208-Completion of 2 Storey 4 Laboratory (5, 1CT) 5009030, |\ (Compettve | oo p 0| 1qsepat| 1reb22| sreb22| Gop | 335695424 3,356,954.24 | LOW Rise-Concrete
Utan IS, Allacapan, Cagayan Mo Bidding 9 i W92 #390,29%£% | Eame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
& Gt Awaiting for the release
of fund
. BICWOPLC-Buildings:
. Construction-without Piles:
scototaonootono | Z1BCO208-Completion of 4 Storey 8 Laboratory Caveria 500020 | |Competitve | oo pon| yqsepat| 1reb22| sreb22| Gop | 790102175 ks | ey
Rural Vocational High Schoal, Claveria, Cagayan e ©  |Bidding g P o el OLEEL ] (Frame ) (1 to 5 storeys)
S Awaiting for the release
of fund
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