DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS
PAMPANGA 3RD DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

San Francisco St., Brgy. Pampang, Angeles City, Pampanga

FINAL ANNUAL PROCUREMENT PLAN (APP) FOR FY 2025 - CIVIL WORKS

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an
PMO/ Early Mode of Source Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/Project Procuremen Advertisement |Submission/ X of (brief description of
End-User Procurement i 5 Notice of |Contract
t Activity? /Posting of Opening of Funds Total MOOE co Program/Activity/Project)
< Award Signing
Yes/No IB/REI Bids
Flood Management Program — Construction/Maintenance of Flood
Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems — Construction of Construction Competitive Consfruction of Slope Protection
25¢i0001 Slope Protection Structure along Abacan River, Barangay Section No Bidding 1018125 Darznies 0227ize 03/06/25(  GoP 100,139,000.00 . 100;132,000.00 Structure
Sapalibutad, Angeles City, Pampanga
Flood Management Program — Construction/Maintenance of Flood
Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems — Construction of Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
25Ci0002 Flood Control Structure along Sapangbalen River, Sitio Pitabacan, Section No Bidding 101825 0212125 02117125 02R425) GoP 120,000,000.00 ) 120,000,000.00 Structure
Barangay San lldefonso, Magalang, Pampanga
Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP); BIP ~ Flood Mitigation
Structures Protecting Public Infrastructures/Facilities — Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
25C10003 | G onstruction of Flood Control Structure along Quitangil River Section Ne  IBidding 10118/25) 0212125 02117/25|  02/24/25| GoP | 150,000,000.00 : 150,000,000.00 Structure
(Phase IV), Barangay Turu, Magalang, Pampanga
Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP); BIP ~ Flood Mitigation
Structures Protecting Public Infrastructures/Facilities — Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
25010004 Construction of Flood Control Structure along Quitangil River Section No Bidding 1041825 02/1225 Q21725 02R24729)  GoP 150,000,000.90 - 150,000,000.00 Structure
(Phase |) Barangay Escaler, Magalang, Pampanga
Flood Management Program — Construction/Maintenance of Flood
Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems ~ Construction of . " .
25CI0006 | Flood Control Structure along Sapangbalen River, Phase 2, Cobstruction No  |Competiive 101825| 021425 02:21/25|  0212825| GoP | 120,000,000.00 - 120,000,000.00] Construetion of Flood Conirol
s ¥ Section Bidding Structure
Barangay Atlu Bola to Barangay Mangalit, Mabalacat City,
Pampanga
Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP); BIP — Flood Mitigation
Structures Protecting Public Infrastructures/Facilities — Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
23610007 Construction of Flood Control Structure along Quitangil River Section . Bidding 1082e DaH2zs 0221129 02126/25|  GoP 150,000,000.00 ° 150,000,000.00 Structure
(Phase Ill), Barangay Turu, Magalang, Pampanga
Flood Management Program — Construction/Maintenance of Flood
Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems — Construction of Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
25CI0008 Flood Control Structure along Sapangbalen River, Phase 1, Section Yes Bidding 10/18/25 12/20/25 02/04/25 02/13/25] GoP 120,000,000.00 - 120,000,000.00 Structure
Barangay San lidefonso, Magalang, Pampanga
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG) —
Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Public . " .
25C10010 | Infrastructures/Facilities — Construction of Flood Control Structure | Consiruction Yes ~ (Competiive 11/08/25 1212025|  02/04i25| 021325| GoP | 50,000,000.00 , 50,000,000,00| Construction of Flood Control
; Section Bidding Structure
along Alasas Creek (Phase |), Barangay San Agustin, Magalang,
Pampanga
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG) —
Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Public . - .
25CI0011  Infrastructures/Facilities — Construction of Flood Control Structure | Construction |y |Competiive 1100825 122025 02/04725| 021325| GoP | 50,000,000.00 - 50,000,000,00 | Construction of Flood Control
. Section Bidding Structure
along Alasas Creek (Phase ll), Barangay San Agustin, Magalang,
Pampanga
Flood Management Program — Construction/Maintenance of Flood
25C10012 Mitigation Structures and Drainage System — Construction of Flood Constrl:lcuon Yes C_ompemrve 11/08/25 12120025 02104125 02113/25] GoP 50,000,000.00 ) 50,000,000.00 Construction of Flood Control
Control Structure along Alasas Creek (Phase Ill), Barangay San Section Bidding Structure
Agustin, Magalang, Pampanga

Page 1 of 7




Convergence and Special Support Program ~ Sustainable
Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG) — Flood Mitigation . - .
25C10015 |Structures protecting Public Infrastructures/Facilities — Conetnistion NG [T 11/08/25 02/04/25|  02/10/25|  02/19/25| GoP | 100,000,000.00 100,000,000,00| Construction of Flood Control
. g i Section Bidding Structure
Construction of Flood Control Works along Quitangil River,
Magalang, Pampanga
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG) —
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to Construction Competitive
25CI0018 |Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities — Construction of By- : No omp 11/29/25 03/04/25 - -| GoP 98,477,000.00 98,477,000.00 Construction of Road
i ’ : Section Bidding
Pass Road at Arayat Blvd connecting to West Circumferencial
Road, Angeles City, Pampanga
Convergence and Special Support Program (CSSP): Construction/
Improvement of Access Roads leading to Trades, Industries and
Economic Zones (Roads Leveraging Linkages for Industry and Construction Competitive Construction/ Improvement of
25CI0019 | Trade Infrastructure Program - ROLL-IT) East Circumferential i No omp 11/30/25 03/12/25 03/25/25 04/03/25] GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 P
3 ; Section Bidding Access Roads
Road connecting MacArthur Highway to Angeles-Magalang Road
in support of Handicraft, Furniture and Garments, and Food
Processing Industries, Angeles City, Pampanga
Convergence and Special Support Program; Construction/
Improvement of Access Roads leading to Trades, Industries and
Economic Zones (Roads Leveraging Linkages for Industry and Construction Competitive Construction/ Improvement of
25C10021 |1 e Infrastructure Program - ROLL-T) NLEX-SCTEX Section No Igigding V025 D30725( DAMARSE 032125 TGP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Access Roads
Connecting Road in support of Furniture, IT-BPM, Hotels,
Garments and Textile Industries, Angeles City, Pampanga
Special Road Fund Motor Vehicle User's Charge (MVUC) as per o i . §
25CI0022 |RA 11239; Construction of Pedestrian Overpass along Arayat Bivd,| Cnstruction No Compeitive 01/25/25 0214125  0718/25| 07125125 GoP 25,000,000.00 25,000,000,00 Construction of Pedestrian
! 4 Section Bidding Overpass
Angeles City, College, Angeles City
Special Road Fund Motor Vehicle User's Charge (MVUC) as per 5 - . .
25CI0023 |RA 11239; Construction of Pedestrian Overpass along Arayat Bivd,| Construction No  |Compefitive 012525  0214725| o0718i25|  07/25/25| GoP | 25000,000.00 25,000,000,00 | Construction of Pedestrian
" " 5 g Section Bidding Overpass
Rafael Lazatin Memorial Hospital, Angeles City
Convergence and Special Support Program; Sustainable
Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG); SIPAG ~ Access Constriction Competitive
25CI0024 |Roads and/or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to % No omp 01/25/25 03/18/25 03/26/25 04/03/25| GoP 100,000,000.00 100,000,000.00 Construction of Bridge
. " : ks el A . Section Bidding
Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities; Construction of Bridge
along Abacan River, Barangay Pampang, Angeles City, Pampanga
Flood Management Program; Construction/Rehabilitation of Flood
Mitigation Facilities within Major River Basins and Principal Rivers, | Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
25Ci0025 Construction of Flood Control Structure along Rio Chico River Section Ne Bidding 0200025 02021125 10720 O3H7/25), GoP 100,000,000:00 100,000,000.00 Structure
(Phase 1), Magalang, Pampanga
Flood Management Program; Construction/Rehabilitation of Flood
Mitigation Facilities within Major River Basins and Principal Rivers, | Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
25CIn026 Construction of Flood Control Structure along Rio Chice River Section No Bidding 92105725 02727125 03110725 QN7f29] GoP 100,000,000.00 109,000,000.00 Structure
(Phase 2), Magalang, Pampanga
Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP) — BIP — Flood Mitigation
Structures Protecting Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
25010027 Construction of Flood Control Structure along Sacobia River Section No Bidding 02007125 0227128 0303025 0306/25] "GP 156,000,000,00 150,000,000:00 Structure
(Phase Ill), Mabalacat City, Pampanga
Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP) — BIP — Flood Mitigation
Structures protecting Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities, - | Construction Competitive Rrehabilitation of Flood Control
25¢l0028 Rehabilitation of Flood Control Structure along Sacobia River, Section Ne Bidding 020725 0227725 OS5 O506/25] GoP 150,000,000.00 150,000,000.00 Structure
Mabalacat City, Pampanga
SIPAG — Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads
leading to Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities: Construction | Construction Competitive Construction of By-Pass Road
256i0028 of By-Pass Road including Drainage System, Phase VI, Barangay Section No Bidding 9207125 032 032525 04/03/25) - GoP 20,000,000.00 20,900900.00 including Drainage System
Cutud to Barangay Sapalibutad, Angeles City, Pampanga
Flood Management Program; Construction/Maintenance of Flood Conatriiction Coimipatitive
25CI0030 |Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems, Construction of Sabo N No omp 02/07/25 02/27125 03/10/25 03/17/125) GoP 15,000,000.00 15,000,000.00 Construction of Dam
Section Bidding
Dam at San Nicolas Il CIS, Magalang, Pampanga
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Flood Management Program; Construction/Maintenance of Flood Construction Comptitive
25CI0031 |Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems, Construction of Sabo 3 No =P 02/07/25 02/27/25 03/10/25 03/17/125] GoP 15,000,000.00 15,000,000.00 Construction of Dam
Section Bidding
Dam at Pampanga Delta RIS, Magalang, Pampanga
Flood Management Program; Construction/Maintenance of Flood
Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems — Construction of Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
2scioeaz Flood Control Structure along Sacobia River at Mabalacat City, Section No Bidding 0R/07/25 0227125 /0325 02/06/25|  {GoP 50,000.000.00 $0,000,000.00 Structure
Pampanga (Phase 6)
Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP) — BIP — Flood Mitigation
Structures protecting Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
25CH0a3 Construction of Flood Control Structure along Sacobia River Section No Bidding 020725 0212325 030325 0300625]  LGoP 150,000,000.00 150.000,000.00 Structure
(Phase V), Mabalacat City, Pampanga
Network Development Program; Off-Carriageway Improvement - Construction Competitive :
25Cl0034 Primary Roads: Manila North Rd - KO094 + 733 - K0094 + 927 Section No Bidding 02/07/25 02/27/25 03/27/25 04/03/25| GoP 1,164,000.00 1,164,000.00 | Impravement of Primary Roads
SIPAG — Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads Construction Competitive
25CI0035 |leading to Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction : No i p 02/07/25 03/12/25 07/18/25 07/25/25| GoP 25,000,000.00 25,000,000.00 Construction of Bridge
. " Section Bidding
of Bridge at Brgy. Tabun, Angeles City, Pampanga
Asset Preservation Program; Construction/ Upgrading/
Rehabilitation of Drainage along National Roads - Secondary Construction Competitive d .
25CI0036 Roads: Arayat-Magalang-Mabalacat Rd - K0113 + 693 - KO113 + Section No Bidding 02/07/25 02/27/25 03/10/25 03/17/25] GoP 1,441,000.00 1,441,000.00 Rehabilitation of Drainage
876
CSSP; Construction/improvement of Access Roads leading to
Trades, Industries and Economic Zones (Roads Leveraging Constiiction Compeiti Construction tof
25CI0037 |Linkages for Industry and Trade Infrastructure Program — ROLL- Saction No By d.‘; Hive 02/07/25 03/04/25|  03/14/25|  03/21/25] GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,00000] “°™ "‘: on "‘;""fm"" °
IT); Camachilles-Sapang-Biabas-Bical Road, Mabalacat, ing coess Roads
Pampanga
Flood Management Program — Construction/Maintenance of Flood
Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems — Construction of Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
25610030 Flood Control Structure along Sacobia River (Downstream of Section No Bidding 02i1tzs 02/04zs 01425 032125]  GoP 100,000,000.00 100,000,000,00 Structure
Centennial Bridge), Barangay Tabun, Mabalacat City, Pampanga
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG) —
SIPAG — Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads Construction Competitive
25CI0039 |leading to Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction Section No BiddiF:l 02/11/25 03/05/25 03/14/25 03/20/25| GoP 100,000,000.00 100,000,000.00 Construction of Road Dike
of Abacan Road Dike between Henson Bridge and Abacan Bridge, 9
Angeles City, Pampanga
Flood Management Program; Construction/Maintenance of Flood
Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems, Construction of Flood | Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
29010040 Control Structure along Quitangil River, Downstream of Quitangil Section No Bidding 0211325 0304125 07/08123 Q2 GoP 109,056,000.00 108,056,000.00 Structure
Bridge, Magalang, Pampanga
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads leading to | Construction Competitive Construction of Roads and
25CK041 Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities; Construction of Roads Section No Bidding 02/13/25 0304125 03414725 0321/25| GoP 84,000,000.00 64,000,000.00 Drainage
and Drainage at Angeles City, Pampanga Phase 4
SIPAG — Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads
250i0042 |'e2ding to Major/Strategic Public Bulldings/Faciliies: Construction | ‘Construction No |Compefiive 02113125 0307/25|  07118i25| 07125125 GoP 15,000,000.00 15,000,000.00| Construction of By-Pass Road
of By-Pass Road at Magalang Ave. Brgy. Salapungan to Pandan, Section Bidding
Angeles City, Pampanga
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);
25ci0043 || 2\EAG ~Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads. || Coristruction No Compelitive 02/15/25 03/07/25|  05/19/25] 0502825 GoP | 100,000,000.00 100,000,000.00 Rehabilitation of Road
leading to Major/ Strategic Public Buildings/ Facilities, Section Bidding
Rehabilitation of Road at Angeles City, Pampanga (Phase 27)
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);
SIPAG — Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads Construction Competitive -
25Cl0044 leading to Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities, Rehabilitation Section No Bidding 02/15/25 03/07/25 05/19/25 05/28/25] GoP 100,000,000.00 100,000,000.00 Rehabilitation of Road
of Road at Angeles City, Pampanga (Phase 26)
Flood Management Program; Construction/Maintenance of Flood
2510045 Mitigation Structures and Drainage Syst'ems, Construction of Fl_ood Constrl_xctlon No C'om.petmve 02/15/25 03/07/25 06/16/25 06251250 GoP 25,000,000.00 25,000,000.00 Construction of Flood Control
Control Structures along Sapangbato River, Margot, Angeles City, Section Bidding Structures
Pampanga
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Network Development Program: Off-Carriageway Improvement — Construction Competitive

25CI0046 |Primary Roads: Manila North Rd, Angeles City KO082 + (-751) — 9 No omp 02/15/25 03/12/25 06/16/25 06/25/25] GoP 12,456,000.00 12,456,000.00 | Impravement of Primary Roads
Section Bidding

K0086 + 650

Network Development Program: Off-Carriageway Improvement — Construction Competitive Improvement of Seconda
25CI0047 |Secondary Roads: West Circumferencial Road, Angeles City Bedlion No Bid di’; 02/15/25 0313125  06/16/25|  06/25/25| GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,00000| ™ R” rh ndary

(Phase 2), K0082 + (-389) — K008 + 589 9 oa

Convergence and Special Support Program; Construction/

Improvement of Access Roads leading to Trades, Industries and Constuction Competitive. Gonstruckionfimprovemont of
25CI0048 |Economic Zones (Roads Leveraging Linkages for Industry and Section No Bid dii 02/15/25 03/12/25 03/25/25 04/03/25] GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Accoss Rpoa ds oI o

Trade Infrastructure Program — ROLL-IT): Sta. Ines-Atlu Bola 9 S

Road, Mabalacat, Pampanga

Networl Development Program; Off-Carriageway Improvement — . P
25CI0048 | Secondary Roads: Old Manila North Rd, Angeles City Koog2 + (| Construction No Competitive 02/15/25 03/12/25|  06/16/25|  06/25/25| GoP 15,000,000.00 15,000,00000| Mprovement of Secondary

Section Bidding Roads

640) — K0085 + 048

Netivark Develapment Frograim; Off-Carriageway Improvermient —~ Construction Competitive Improvement of Secondal
25CI0050 |Secondary Roads: West Circumferencial Road, Angeles City Saction No Bid dii: 02/15/25 03/13/25 06/16/25 06/25/25] GoP 22,914,000.00 22,914,000.00 P Roads b

K0082 + (-640) — K005 + 048 9

Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP); BIP — Flood Mitigation

Structures protecting Major/ Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction Competitive Construction of Flood Control
25CH051 Construction of Flood Control Structures with provision of Section No Bidding 02115725 03/07/25 0320025 De/oar25| GoP 100.090,000.00 100,000,000:00 Structures

Groundsill along Sapangbalen River, Mabalacat City, Pampanga

Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);

SIPAG - Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Major/Strategic Construction Competitive Construction of Slope
250i0052 Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction of Slope Protection at Section No Bidding 02/15/25 03/12/25 07116725 07/25/25)  GoP 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 Protection

Angeles City, Pampanga (Phase 2)

Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);

SIPAG - Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Major/Strategic Construction Competitive Construction of Slope
25010053 Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction of Slope Protection at Section Ne Bidding 021525 0307425 0rHazs Qr2ss| ek 20:000,000:00 20,000,000.00 Protection

Brgy. Pulung Bulo (Town and Country), Angeles City, Pampanga

Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);

SIPAG ~ Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Major/Strategic Construction Competitive Construction of Slope
25Cio054 Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction of Slope Protection at Section No Bidding 2115725 512125 07/18i25 0725125|  GoP? 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 Protection

Brgy. Sta. Trinidad, Angeles City, Pampanga

Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);

SIPAG - Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Major/Strategic Construction Competitive Construction of Reinforced
25CI0055 | Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction of Reinforced Concrete Section No Bid diFr’w 02/15/25 03/07/25 07/18/25 07/25/25| GoP 50,000,000.00 50,000,000.00 | Concrete Slope Protection with

Slope Protection with Steel Sheet Piles along Sapangbalen River, 9 Steel Sheet Piles

Brgy. Pampang, Angeles City

Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);

SIPAG - Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Major/Strategic Construction Competitive . ;
25CI0056 Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction of Slope Protection at Section No Bidding 02/15/25 03/12/25 07/18/25 07/25/25] GoP 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 | Construction of Slope Protection

Brgy. Sto. Rosario, Angeles City, Pampanga

Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);

SIPAG - Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads Construction Competitive Construction of Road and
23Cl0057 leading to Major/Strategic Public Buildings/ Facilities, Construction Section No Bidding 02115025 D125 0710325 g7/25| GoP 50,000,000.00 50,000,000.00 Drainage

of Road and Drainage at Magalang, Pampanga

Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG) —

Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads leading to | Construction Competitive Concreting of Roads and
25CI0038 | y12joriStrategic Public Buildings/Facilities; Concreting of Roads Section No' |Bidding 021525 03/13/25| 071825  07/25/25| GoP | 15000,000.00 15,000,000.00 Drainage

and Drainage Brgy. San Pedro I, Magalang, Pampanga

SIPAG - Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads Constitiction Comptitive Conatiiiction of Roads:and
25CI0059 |leading fo Major/Strategic Public Buildings/ Facilities; Construction " No P 02/15/25 03/07/25 07/03/25 07/11/25] GoP 15,000,000.00 15,000,000.00 i

. Section Bidding Drainage
of Roads and Drainage at Brgy. Ayala, Magalang, Pampanga
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Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);
SIPAG - Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Major/Strategic Construction Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation of
25CI0060 |Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction/Rehabilitation of Flood . No mp 02/15/25 03/07/25 07/18/25 07/25/25] GoP 94,529,000.00 94,529,000.00 Flood Control Works with
; 4 2 Section Bidding £
Control Works with Groundsills along Sapangbalen River Groundsills
(Damaged Sections Phase 1), Magalang, Pampanga
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG):
SIPAG - Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads Construction Competitive Canstruction of Road and
256100681 leading to Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities; Construction Section Mo Bidding 0215025 0311225 07418125 072525] GoP 100:000:000,00 100,000:000,00 Drainage
of Road and Drainage at Angeles City, Pampanga
Flood Management Program; Construction/Maintenance of Flood Construction Competitive
25CI0062 |Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems, Construction of < No = pe 02/15/25 03/07/25 07/18/25 07/25/25] GoP 120,000,000.00 120,000,000.00| Construction of Groundsills
< : s Section Bidding
Groundsills along Abacan River (U/S), Angeles City, Pampanga
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG):
SIPAG — Access Roads and/or Bridges form the National Roads Constructioh Competitive
25CI0063 |leading to Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities: Construction 5 No omp 02/15/25 03/13/25 07/18/25 07/25/25) GoP 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 | Construction of By-Pass Road
. s 2 Section Bidding
of By-Pass Road Connecting Abacan River Road Dike, Angeles
City, Pampanga
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG):
SIPAG - Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Major/Strategic Construction Competitive Construction of Reinforced
25Cl0064 | Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction of Reinforced Concrete Section No Bid di'; 02/15/25 03/07/25 07/18/25 07/25/25] GoP $0,000,000.00 50,000,000.00 | Concrete Slope Protection with
Slope Protection with Steel Sheet Piles along Sapangbalen River, o Steel Sheet Piles
Brgy. Cutcut, Angeles City
Network Developmient Program; Off-Cartiagsway Improvement — Construction Competitive Improvement of Secondal
25CI0065 | Secondary Roads: Angeles-Porac-Floridablanca-Dinalupihan Rd, Section No Bid di'; 02/15/25 03/13/25 06/16/25 06/25/25| GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 P Roads Y
Angeles City KO084 + (-615) — KO08S5 + 072 9
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);
SIPAG - Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Major/Strategic Construction Competitive . .
25Cl0066 Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction of Slope Protection at Section No Bidding 02/15/25 03/07/25 07/18/25 07/25/25] GoP 30,000,000.00 30,000,000.00 | Construction of Slope Protection
Leoncia Brgy. Sto. Domingo, Angeles City
Special Road Fund — Motor Vehicle User’s Charge (MVUC) as per Construction Competitive Construction of Pedestrian
25C10067 [R.A. 11239; Construction of Pedestrian Lanes along Manila North : No s 02/15/25 03M2/25|  07/0325|  07/11/25| GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 ruction ra
i y + Section Bidding Lanes
Road and West Circumferencial Road, Angeles City
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);
SIPAG — Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads Construction Competitive ; Construction of Roads and
25CI0088 |2 diing to Major/ Strategic Public Buildings/ Facilities, Construction|  Section No  lgidding 021525 baizes)  OU32s|  OZMARS] GoP 2000000000 20,000,000.00 Drainage
of Roads and Drainage at Magalang, Pampanga Phase 2
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to | Construction Competitive Construction of Roads and
25Clooe9 Major Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities: Construction of Roads Section No Bidding 02/15/25 03112725 07118125 07/25/25|  GoP 61,000,000.00 61,000,000.00 Drainage
and Drainage in Angeles City, Pampanga (Phase 7)
SIPAG — Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads T — Competitive Construction of Roads and
25CI0070 |leading to Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities: Construction A No Omp 02/15/25 03/13/25 07/18/25 07/25/25] GoP 72,000,000.00 72,000,000.00 .
i 4 Section Bidding Drainage
of Roads and Drainage at Angeles City, Pampanga Phase 6
Sustainable Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG);
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Roads leadingto | Construction Competitive Construction of Roads and
25Cloo71 Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities: Construction of Roads Section No Bidding n2i1sies 03113725 071925 Q#2251 GoP 69,000,000.00 69,000,000.00 Drainage
and Drainage at Angeles City, Pampanga Phase 5
Network Develapment Program; Construction of
Flyoversfinterchanges/Underpasses/Long Span Bridges; Sto. Construction Competitive -
25C10072 Cristo Flyover along Manila North Road, Angeles City, Pampanga Section No Bidding 02/15/25 04/10/25 07/18/25 07/25/25] GoP 100,000,000.00 100,000,000.00 Construction of Flyover
(Phase 2)
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Convergence and Special Support Program; Sustainable
Infrastructure Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG): SIPAG — Access
Roads and/or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to Construction Competitive . .
25CI10073 Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities: Construction of Bridge Section No Bidding 02/15/25 03/13/25 07/18/25 07/25/25] GoP 100,000,000.00 100,000,000.00 Construction of Bridge
along Abacan River, Barangay Sapaiibutad, Angeles City,
Pampanga
National Building Program; Buildings and other Structures — Gonstrustion Compeitive Constructi £ Multi
25C10074 | Multipurpose/Facilities; Construction of Multipurpose Building at Sacion No B di‘:l 02/15/25 03/07/25|  07/18/25|  07/25/25| GoP 65,000,000.00 65,000,000.00] O™ ';’L“_‘I’ # IpUrPose
DPWH Pampanga 3rd DEO, Angeles City, Pampanga 9 iiding
Basic Infrastructure Program BIP — BIP Multi Purpose Buildings/ Cohstruction Compatitive Colstiiction/ Compleion of
25CI0075 | Facilities Support Social Services/ Construction/ Completion of oo No e di"n 02/15/25 03/2525| 0718/25|  07/25/25| GoP 3,000,000.00 3,000,000.00 ‘T&S “'."P"’" °BP.I‘Z.'°" o
Multi Purpose Building in Brgy. Madapdap, Mabalacat, Pampanga 9 Uil Furpose Buliding
Basic Infrastructure Program BIP — BIP Multi Purpose Buildings/ Construction Competitive Constructi £ Multi
25CI0076 |Facilities Support Social Services/ Construction of Multi Purpose ! No NP 02/15/25 03/13/25|  07/03/25|  07/11/25| GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000,00 | ~orstruction of VWlipurpose
kb Section Bidding Building
Building in Magalang, Pampanga
Basic Infrastructure Program BIP — BIP Multi Purpose Construction Competitive Construction of Multi &
25CI0077 |Buildings/Facilities Support Social Services/Construction/of Multi Slestion No B di'; 02/15/25 03/07/25|  05/28/25|  06/06/25| GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00] “OMUC Bzi"’ oh 1PuUrpos
Purpose Building in Villa Belen, Bryg. Sto. Cristo, Angeles City 9 ing
BIP — Multi Purpose Building/Facilities t o Support Social Construction Competitive Construction of Multipurpose
25CI0078 |Services/Construction of Multi Purpose Building San Pedro || N No omp 02/15/25 03/07/25 07/03/25 07/11/25] GoP 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 o S purpo
Section Bidding Building
Elementary School, Magalang, Pampanga
BIP — Multi Purpose Buildings/Facilities to Support Social Services; Constriction Competitive Construction of Multipu =
25CI0079 [ Construction of Other Facilities at Pampanga State Agricultural 3 No oM 02/15/25 03/07/25|  05/28/25|  06/06/25] GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 uclion ot VUIpUIpoS
. ) Section Bidding Building
University (PSAU), Magalang, Pampanga
Basic Infrastructure Program BIP - BIP — Multi Purpose . e . .
25CI0080 | Buildings/Facilities to Support Social Services; Construction of C°g:‘cr“i‘::°" No g;’g;e“""e 02/15/25 03007/25|  0718/25| 07725025 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 C°“s"”°“;'k‘].‘l’;i?_,"“"’p”'p°se
Multipurpose Building in Brgy. Balibago, Angeles City, Pampanga 9 iding
BIP ~ Multi Purpose Buildings/Facilities to Support Social Services; Construction Competitive Construction of Multiburpose
25C10081 |Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Pampanga State " No omp 02/15/25 03/07/25 05/28/25 06/06/25| GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 g purpo
L Section Bidding Building
Agricultural University), Magalang, Pampanga
Basic Infrastructure Program BIP ~ BIP Multi Purpose
Buildings/Facilities Support Social Services/Construction of Multi | Construction Competitive Construction of Multipurpose
25CI0082 Purpose Building, Brgy. Lourdes Northwest, Angeles Cty, Section No Bidding 02/15/25 03/13/25 07/18/25 07/25/25| GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Building
Pampanaga
BIP — Multi Purpose Buildings/Facilities to Support Social Services; . sis ; .
25CI0083 | Construction of Multi-Purpose Building in Brgy. San Jose, Angeles | Construction No |Competitive 0211525| 0325125 07118125|  07/25/25| GoP |  15,000,000.00 15,000,000.00| Construetion of Multipurpose
. Section Bidding Building
City, Pampanga
SIPAG — Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities; Rehabilitation | Construction Competitive Rehabilitation of Multipurpose
25CI0084 of PNP Regional Training Center — Magalang, Pampanga Section No Bidding 02/15/25 03/07/25 07/03/25 07/11/25] GoP 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 Building
BIP — Multi-Purpose Building/Facilities to Support Social Services; Construction Compeitive Construction of Multipurpose
25CI0085 |Construction of Multipurpose Building with Facilities in Angeles ) No omp 02/15/25 03/07/25 07/18/25 07/25/25] GoP 120,000,000.00 120,000,000.00 i purp
N Section Bidding Building
City, Pampanga (Phase 2)
BIP Multi Purpose Buildings/Facilities to Support Social Services; . - " .
25CI0086 | Construction of Multipurpose Building with Facilities in Angeles | Construction No  |Competitive 0211525 031825 0711825  07/25/25| GoP | 96,000,000.00 96,000,000,0p | Corstruction of Multipurpose
N Section Bidding Building
City, Pampanga (Phase 1)
Flood Management Program; Construction/Maintenance of Flood Congtiisétion Competitive
25CI0087 |Mitigation Structures and Drainage Systems, Construction of Road . No omp 02/15/25 03/13/25 06/19/25 06/25/25] GoP 120,000,000.00 120,000,000.00 Construction of Road Dike
X N el . Section Bidding
Dike (Upstream of Freindship Bridge), Angeles City, Pampanga
Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP): BIP — Flood Mitigation
Structures protecting Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation of
25CI0088 | &5 nstruction/Rehabilitation of Road Dike along Abacan River (ds), | ~ Section N |Bidding Q2fS2s)  Gelizgt 052825)  060625E GoP | 125000.000.00 25,000,000.00 Road Dike
Brgy. Anunas, Angeles City, Pampanga
Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP): BIP — Flood Mitigation
Structures protecting Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities, Construction Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation of
25CI0069 Construction/Rehabilitation of Road Dike along Abacan River (u/s), Section No Bidding 0271525 031225 05726025 06/06/25(. GoP 25,000,000.00 25,000,000.00 Road Dike
Brgy. Anunas, Angeles City, Pampanga

Page 6 of 7




Repair/Rehabilitation of Flood Control Structures with Groundsill Construction Competitive Repair/Rehabilitation of Flood
25CI0090 |along Sapangbalen River, Brgy. Paralayunan, Mabalacat City, Section No Bid dii:r 02/15/25 03/18/25 03/26/25 04/03/25| GoP 50,000,000.00 - 50,000,000.00 Control Structures with
Pampanga 9 Groundsill
Repair/Rehabilitation of Flood Control Structures with Groundsill T — Competitive Repair/Rehabilitation of Flood
25CI0091 |along Sapangbalen River, Downstream of San lldefonso, Section No Bid diFr: 02/15/25 03/18/25 03/26/25 04/03/25) GoP 90,000,000.00 - 90,000,000.00 Control Structures with
Magalang, Pampanga 9 Groundsill
25ci00g2 | Conereting of Brgy. San Roque FMR, Brgy. San Roque, Magalang,| Construction g  [Sompetive 04/03/25 0412325  05M9/25|  05/28/25| GoP |  15,000000.00 . 15,000,000.00  Concreting of Roads
Pampanga Section Bidding
25Ci00g3 | Concreting of FMR at Brgy. San Pablo to Brgy. San Agustin, Construction No  |Compeliive 04/03/25 04/2325|  0519/25|  0528/25| GoP |  35,000000.00 ; 35,000,000.00 Concreting of Roads
Magalang Pampanga Section Bidding
25Cio0g4 | Conereting of Brgy. San Miguel to Brgy. Bucanan to Brgy. San | Construction No  |Compeliive 04103125 04123/25| 0519125  05128/25| GoP |  15,000,000.00 ; 15,000,000.00 Concreting of Roads
lidefonso FMR, Magalang, Pampanga Section Bidding
25Cig005 | Conereting of EMR at Broy. Escaler Road (Phase I). Magalang, | Consiruclion No |Competitve 04/03/25|  04;2325|  o5/19/25|  osr8/25| GoP | 35,000,000.00 : 35000,00000|  Concreting of Roads
Pampanga Section Bidding
Maintenance, Repair, and Rehabilitation of Other Public Buildings, Maintenance Competitive Maintenance, Repair, and
25CI0096 |Repair/Maintenance of DPWH Building Pampanga Il District N No omp 04/03/25 04/23/25 05/19/25 05/28/25| GoP - 531,166.23 - Rehabilitation of Other Public
) . - N Section Bidding i
Engineering Office, Office Building, Angeles City, Pampanga Buildings
25C10097 Convergence and Special Support Program; Rainwater Collector Constrgctlon No Clomlpetmve 04/05/25 04/25/25 05/19/25 0528125 GoP 2,604,02057 ) 2.604,020.57 Construction of Rainwater
System Section Bidding Collector System
25C10098 |Farm to Market Road Brgy. Turu, Magalang, Pampanga C°'S’:’c’;i‘::°“ No g&’;‘i‘r’;"""e 05/22/25 06/11/25|  07/18/25|  07125/25| GoP 34,000,000.00 . 34,000,000.00 Concreting of Roads
Repair and Maintenance of Flood Control Projects, Repair/ Mailtenance Canipehtive Resair and Maltsnaince 6f
25CI0099 |Maintenance of Quitangil Creek Revetment 11 at Brgy. San N No g 05/22/25 06/11/25 07/03/25 07M11/25| GoP - 2,000,000.00 - P .
N Section Bidding Flood Control Projects
Miguel, Magalang, Pampanga (Phase i)
Construction Competitive Complete Construction of 2-
25CI0100 |Complete Construction of 2-Storey 6-Classroom School Building Section No Bid dil:w g 06/25/25 07115125 07/21/25 07/30/25| GoP 20,000,000.00 - 20,000,000.00| Storey 6-Classroom School
Building
Repair/Rehabilitation of Flood Control Structures along Alasas Maintenance Competitive Repair/Rehabilitation of Flood
250i01 Creek (Left Dike), Brgy. San Agustin, Magalang, Pampanga Section No Bidding O7/03/25 07123125 0713025 08/08/25|  GoP 31,731,480.00 ) 31.731,480.00 Control Structures
Repair/Rehabilitation of Flood Control Structures along Alasas Maintenance Competitive Repair/Rehabilitation of Flood
25¢i0102 Creek (Right Dike), Brgy. San Agustin, Magalang, Pampanga Section No Bidding 07/03/25 07723125 07130125 08/08/25|  GoP 31,840,380.00 ) 31.840,380.00 Control Structures
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DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS
PAMPANGA 3RD DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE
San Francisco St., Brgy. Pampang, Angeles City, Pampanga

FINAL ANNUAL PROCUREMENT PLAN (APP) FOR FY 2025 - GOODS & SERVICES

Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
PMO/ Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/Project End-User Procu_rem:nt — Advertiseme | Submission/ o Gombrat (brief des_cr!ption of
Adivityz | orement | Mt/Posting | Openingof [ T2 Sariin Source of Fund Total MOOE co Program/Activity/Project)
¥Yas/No of IB/REI Bids aring
" . : ” - FY2024 RA 11975 REG .
Procurement and Installation of Office Furnitures and Fixtures for | Planning and Compelitive February 15, June 18, Procurement and Installation of]
25GC10001 use in DPWH -~ Pampanga 3rd DEQ Design Section No Bidding 2025 March 7, 2025 | June 10, 2025 2025 2024 CU;AROENT co- 9,999,500.00 0 9,899,500.00 Office Fumnitures and Fixtures
Supply of Various Materials for use in Mainienance, Repair, and FY 2024 RA 11975 EXT Sunoly of Various Materials for
25GCI0002 Rehabilitation of Infrastructure Facilities & other Related Activities | Maintenance No Competitive February 22, March 13, March 21, March 28, REG 2024 CONT 2584.174.00 0 2584 174.00 Emr(ﬂa'nlen ce. Re :ir and
— Routine Maintenance of National Roads (1st Quarter) at DPWH Section Bidding 2025 2025 2025 2025 SR2025-02-005897 IS, BRES LA [ UEe IVISHTIONARCS, ~opail;
Rehabilitation
— Pampanga 3rd DEO MOOE
Supply of Various Materials for|
Supply of Various Materials for use in Maintenance, Repair, and FY 2025 RA 12116 use in Patching Pothales,
Rehabilitation of Infrastruciure Facilities & other Related Activilies | Maintenance Competitive | February 27, March 18, March 25, i Sealing of Cracks, Repainting o
256010003 — Routine Maintenance of National Roads (1st Quarter) at DPWH Section No Bidding 2025 2025 2025 April2,2025 RsEszsgzssog%SeR;ozT 6,093,410.00 0 6,093,410.00 Pedestrian Lane, Cenler Line,
— Pampanga 3rd DEO e Edge Line, Crubs, Wheelguards
and KM Post and Traffic Safety
FY 2025 RA 12116
Procurement of Office Supplies for use in DPWH — Pampanga 3rd | Administrative Competitive REG 2025 CURRENT s
25GCI0004 DEO (3rd Quarter) Section No Bidding June 12,2025 July 4,2025 | July 9, 2025 |July 17,2025 SR2025-02-004350, 3,022,189.00 0 3,022,189.00 | Procurement of Office Supplies
4354 & 4359 CO-EAO
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DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

PAMPANGA 3RD DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE

San Francisco St., Brgy. Pampang, Angeles City, Pampanga

FINAL ANNUAL PROCUREMENT PLAN (APP) FOR FY 2025 - CONSULTING SERVICES

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an
PMO/ Early Mode of Source Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/Project End-User |PFOCuremen| o @ @ ent Advertisement |Submission/ Notice of |Contract of (brief description of
t Activity? /Posting of Opening of o Funds Total MOOE co Program/Activity/Project)
Award Signing
Yes/No IB/REI Bids
No Consulting Services
Prepared by: Recommended by: Approved by: f

. ORT.

Head, BAC Secretariat
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