DPWH - NEGROS OCCIDENTAL 2ND DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY _2024

Code (PAP) Procurement PMO/ Is this an Early| Mode of Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Source of Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
i 8 Procurement i ipti
Project End-User nctivity? Procurement Advertisement|Submission/Op|  Notice of Contract Funds (brief dess:rlptlon of
(Yes/No) Posting of ening of Bids Award Signing Total MOOE co Project)
IB/REI
CIVIL WORKS
24GLO001 - ROAD WIDENING { e o oo Construction of 406 sq. m.
ISABELA-LIBAS NEGROS Competitive Portland Cement Concrete
310203100852000 | 1o “mrey Bh k0075 + 000 ZOSSII:I)DggTAL Yes Bidding 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 15,350,720.00 15,350,720.00 Pavement and a thickness of
KO0O075 + 406 280.0 mm
24GL0002 - CONSTRUCTION
gSI["S:KTG":’CUg\/P::EED NEGROS Competitive 17m x 24m Covered Court
X , g
300226114278000 OCCIDENTAL Yes 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 [including Cladding w/
COURT), BARANGAY 2ND DEO Bidding T ' Concrete Floorin
ROBLES, LA CASTELLANA, 9
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0003 - CONSTRUCTION
g&lr;hg’fggf&%% NEGROS T 17m x 24m Covered Court
300226107782000 OCCIDENTAL Yes pe 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 [including Cladding w/
COURT), BARANGAY 2ND DEO Bidding Coricrete Flood
TALAPTAP, LA CASTELLANA, crete Flooring
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0004 - CONSTRUCTION 1 UnieeAm s {2 Covered
300226114285000 |\ e s AN LA OCCIDENTAL Yes Biddin 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 5,940,000.00 5,940,000.00 |and 1 Unit-17m x 18m
RS FEL £NA. NEGRDS 2ND DEO 9 Covered Court w/ 17m x
OCCIDENTAL 30m Concrete Flooring
24GL0005 - CONSTRUCTION
LTI-PURPOSE
SSI[%JING (éJOVEC:QSED NEGROS Competitive 17m x 24m Covered Court
300226114279000 |\ or OCCIDENTAL Yes 5 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 [including Cladding w/
Ji BOCANGAY 2ND DEO Bldding Concrete Floori
RUMIRANG, ISABELA, nerete Flooring
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0006 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS 17m x 24m Covered Court
BUILDING (COVERED Competitive w/ Concrete
300226114277000 | OURT), BARANGAY gﬁglg:gm. Yes Bidding 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Flooring.Cladding and Lined

MANSABLAY, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
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Canal




4,950,000.00

17m x 24m Covered Court
including Cladding w/
Concrete Flooring

4,950,000.00

17m x 24m Covered Court
including Cladding w/
Concrete Flooring

4,950,000.00

17m x 24m Covered Court
including Cladding w/
Concrete Flooring

4,950,000.00

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

7,623,420.00

REHABILITATION/MAJOR
REPAIR OF BRIDGE

8,844,500.00

REHABILITATION/MAJOR
REPAIR OF BRIDGE

24GL0007 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
300226114276000 |EY!LDING (COVERED OCCIDENTAL Yes Compeitive 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
COURT), BARANGAY 1, oND DEO Bidding
ISABELA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0008 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING (COVERED NEGROS
COURT), PALAYOG Competitive
300226114281000 | ") o8 e io oL, g:g:lj::gTAL Yes Bidding 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
BARANGAY PALAYOG,
HINIGARAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL000Y - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING (COVERED NEGROS
COURT), CALAPI Competitive
300226114261000 | ool SCHOOL, gﬁl)cgaggm. Yes Bidding 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
BARANGAY CALAPI,
HINIGARAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0010 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING (BARANGAY Competitive
300226114275000 |, ALL), BARANGAY MIRANDA, gﬁglgggTAL Yes Bidding 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
HINIGARAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0011 - REHABILITATION |\ - o oo
/MAJOR REPAIR OF BRIDGE Competitive
310304101309000 |y 05 o N BR. (BOO48ANR) gﬁgﬁggﬂu Yes Bidding 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 7,623,420.00
ALONG BACOLOD SOUTH RD
24GL0012 - REHABILITATION |\ - o oo
/MAJOR REPAIR OF BRIDGE Competitive
310304101311000 | /o N BR. (BOOASENR) gﬁglgggTAL Yes Bidding 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 8,844,500.00
ALONG BACOLOD SOUTH RD
24GL0013 - REHABILITATION
/ MAJOR REPAIR OF BRIDGE {NEGROS Conostitive
310304101310000 |SU-AY PARALLEL BR. OCCIDENTAL Yes Bid di‘r" 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 8,349,600.00
(BO0547NR) ALONG 2ND DEO 9
BACOLOD SOUTH RD
24GL0014 - CONSTRUCTION
OF ROAD, BARANGAY NEGROS Compeitive
300215104866000 |GUINTUBHAN (HAD. BACAN), |OCCIDENTAL Yes Bid diﬂ 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 9,800,000.00
ISABELA, NEGROS 2ND DEO 9
OCCIDENTAL

8,349,600.00

REHABILITATION/MAJOR
REPAIR OF BRIDGE
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9,800,000.00

Concreting of 500.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50 m on both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, drainage, and
slope protection on selected
areas




24GLO015 - CONSTRUCTION
OF ROAD, BARANGAY

Concreting of 750.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50 m on both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, drainage, and
slope protection on selected
areas

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

Construction of 5,133.00 sq.
m. Portland Cement
Concrete Pavement and a
thickness of 230.0 mm
including safety devices

NEGROS .
300215104865000 |CABCAB (BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL Yes Compstilve 10118/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024|  2/6/2024|GoP 19,600,000.00 19,600,000.00
PROPER TO SITIO SAN SNYDED Bidding
LUIS), ISABELA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0O016 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING (BARANGAY NEGROS Competilive
300226114273000 |HALL), BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL Yes Bidding 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024 |GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00
MANSALANAO, LA 2ND DEO
CASTELLANA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0O017 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS ——
300226114284000 |BUILDING, BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL Yes Bidding 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00
BAGROY, BINALBAGAN, 2ND DEO
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0O018 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
300226114231000 |BYILDING (BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL Yes Compeltive 10/18/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00
HALL), BARANGAY SNES DED Bidding e
LALAGSAN, LA CASTELLANA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0019 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
300226114274000 zuu_o I, (ASSANCIAY OCCIDENTAL Yos  [COmpetive 10118/2023 11/8/2023 1/30/2024|  2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00
ALL), BARANGAY SNDDED Bidding ! g
MAYTUBIG, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0020 - OFF-
CARRIAGEWAY
IMPROVEMENT: PAVING OF |NEGROS Competiive
310208100625000 |SHOULDERS - OCCIDENTAL Yes Bidding 11/2/2023 11/21/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 19,600,000.00 19,600,000.00
VALLEHERMOSO-CANLAON |2ND DEO
CITY-LA CASTELLANA RD -
K0072 + 000 - K0073 + 855
24GL0021 - ROAD WIDENING {NEGROS Campetilive
310203100851000 |BINALBAGAN-ISABELA RD - |OCCIDENTAL Yes Bidding 11/2/2023 11/21/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 18,840,500.00 18,840,500.00
K0068 + 616 - KOOBY + 179 |2ND DEO
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Construction of 521.00 In.
m., 280 mm thick Portland
Cement Concrete Pavement
with 230 mm thick paved
shoulder and stone masonry




24GL0022 - ROAD WIDENING

NEGROS

Road Widening of 468 Im.
Portland Cement Concrete
with a width of 3.65m on
both sides and a thickness
of 280mm including slope
protection and safety
devices.

Construction of Two(2)
Storey DPWH Main Building
with Roof Deck including
perimeter fence and
drainage development inside
DPWH Negros Occidental
2nd District Engineering
Office primises

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)

310202101730000 |HINIGARAN-ISABELARD -  |OCCIDENTAL Yes g;‘;ﬁ;’“"’e 11/2/2023 11/21/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 20,638,800.00 20,638,800.00
KO066 + 348 - KO066 + 816 |2ND DEO
24GL0024 - CONSTRUCTION
OF (COMPLETION) MULTI-
PURPOSE BUILDING, DPWH [NEGROS Competitive
300105201385000 |BUILDING, NEGROS OCCIDENTAL Yes Bidding 11/2/2023 11/21/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 39,200,000.00 39,200,000.00
OCCIDENTAL 2ND DEO, 2ND DEO
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0025 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING (BARANGAY Competitive
300226114248000 ALL), BARANGAY NATO, LA zo:é:g)ggm. Yes Bidding 11/7/2023 11/28/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00
CASTELLANA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0026 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING (BARANGAY NEGROS Gompetiive
300226114247000 |[HALL), BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL Yes Bidding 11/7/2023 11/28/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00
MANGHANOY, LA 2ND DEO
CASTELLANA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0027 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING (BARANGAY NEGROS T —
300226114246000 |HALL), BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL Yes Bidding 11/7/2023 11/28/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00
CAMANDAG, LA 2ND DEO
CASTELLANA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0028 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING (BARANGAY NEGROS Gormpatiive
300226114245000 [HALL), BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL Yes Bidding 11/7/2023 11/28/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00
CABACUNGAN, LA 2ND DEO
CASTELLANA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0029 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MUL'g—PURP?qSGE NEGROS
BUILDING (BARANGAY Competitive
300226114265000 |, ALL), BARANGAY BIAK NA gﬁglgggm_ Yes Bidding 11/7/2023 11/28/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00

BATO, LA CASTELLANA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
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ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)




24GLO030 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE

4,950,000.00

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)

4,950,000.00

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)

4,950,000.00

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)

4,950,000.00

17m x 24m Covered Court
including Cladding w/
Concrete Flooring

4,950,000.00

17m x 24m Covered Court
including Cladding w/
Concrete Flooring

NEGROS N
BUILDING (BARANGAY Competitive
3002611425700 (1311 S0 ONGAY 2 (POB), ;)’SIJSIIIJJEESJTAL Yes | 17/2023]  11/28/2023 1130/2024|  2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
HIMAMAYLAN CITY, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0031 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING (BARANGAY Competitive
3002614253000 | O POIONG, gﬁgg)gomm_ Yes  |oiee 12023 11/28/2023 13012024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
MOISES PADILLA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0032 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING (BARANGAY NEGROS —
300226114252000 |HALL), BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL Yes  |comPe 1712023 117282023 130/2024|  2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
MAGALLON CADRE, MOISES |2ND DEO 9
PADILLA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0033 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING (COVERED Competitive
300226114263000 COURT), BARANGAY MARINA ?S[():IIIJD:STAL Yes Bidding 11/7/2023 11/28/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
(POB), BINALBAGAN,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0034 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE ——
BUILDING (COVERED Competitive
3002611424000 |2 oG A SAG. gﬁgg):gm_ Yo [ooane 11/712023]  11/28/2023 113012024 2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
ANG, LA CASTELLNA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0035 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE S
300226114282000 |BY!LDING (HEALTH OCCIDENTAL You [|ComPetive 11/712023|  11/28/2023 1130/2024|  2/6/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
CENTER), BARANGAY el Bidding
GARGATO, HINIGARAN,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0036 - PREVENTIVE
MAINTENANCE OF ROAD:  [NEGROS Competiive
310102101867000 [ASPHALT OVERLAY - OCCIDENTAL Yes  |comPe 11/7/2023|  11/28/2023 13012024 2/6/2024|GoP 29,400,000.00
HINIGARAN-ISABELARD - [2ND DEO 9

K0053 + 587 - K0054 + 119

4,950,000.00

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)
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29,400,000.00

Asphalt Overlay of 535.00
linear meter, 50mm
thick(including 324.00 Ln.m.
Paved Shoulder) with Anti -
Rutting Additive and
Thermoplastic Pavement
Markings.




24GL0038 - CONSTRUCTION

4,999,500.00

CONSTRUCTION OF ONE
(1) STOREY BUILDING

14,700,000.00

RECONSTRUCTION OF
720.00 in.m. PORTLAND
CCEMENT CONCRETE
PAVEMENT WITH A
WIDTH OF 3.05 m ON
BOTH LANES AND A
THICKNESS OF 230 mm,
WITH SHOULDER AND
SLOPE PROTECTION ON
SELECTED AREAS

14,700,000.00

Reconstruction of 500.00
L.M. Portland Cement
Concrete Pavement with a
width of 3.05m on both lanes
and a thickness of 230 mm,
with shoulder, drainage and
slope protection on selected
areas

96,500,000.00

CONSTRUCTION OF
REINFORCED CONCRETE
SLOPE PROTECTION
WITH STEEL SHEET PILES]

NEGROS
OF MULTI-PURPOSE Competitive
300226110003000 BUILDING, LA CASTELLANA, SSSIEI;);I)\ITAL Yes Bidding 11/22/2023 12/12/2023 3/20/2024 3/26/2024|GoP 4,999 500.00
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0039 - ACCESS ROAD NEGROS
LEADING TO KAITULARI Competitive
300203101717000 ECOPARK, MOISES PADILLA, SSSEESTAL Yes Bidding 11/22/2023 12/12/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 14,700,000.00
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0040 - ACCESS ROAD
LEADING TO BINADLAN NEGROS Competitive
300203102448000 |FALLS, BRGY. BI-AO, OCCIDENTAL Yes Bid dipe 11/22/2023 12/12/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP 14,700,000.00
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS 2ND DEO ng
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0041 - CONSTRUCTION
OF BINALBAGAN RIVER
BANK SLOPE PROTECTION NEGROS
ALONG JCT. BAGONAWA-LA Competitive
320101111113000 CASTELLANAISABELA ROAD gﬁgll});gTAL Yes Bidding 11/22/2023 12/12/2023 2/2/2024 2/7/2024|GoP 96,500,000.00
BRGY 5 POBLACION,
ISABELA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0042 - CONSTRUCTION
OF BINALBAGAN RIVER NEGROS
BANK SLOPE PROTECTION Competitive
320101111117000 AT HAD. MILLAN, BRGY. ggglg:gm. Yes Bidding 11/22/2023 12/12/2023 2/2/2024 2/7/2024|GoP 96,500,000.00
RUMIRANG, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0043 - CONSTRUCTION
OF GUINTUBHAN RIVER
BANK SLOPE PROTECTION
DOWNSTREAM OF NEGROS Coipsiitve
320101111134000 |GUINTUBHAN BRIDGE (LEFT |OCCIDENTAL Yes Bid diﬁ v 11/30/2023 12/20/2023 2/2/2024 2/7/2024|GoP 67,550,000.00
BANK) ALONG BINALBAGAN- |2ND DEO 9
ISABELA ROAD,
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

96,500,000.00

CONSTRUCTION OF
REINFORCED CONCRETE
SLOPE PROTECTION
WITH STEEL SHEET PILES]
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67,550,000.00

CONSTRUCTION OF
REINFORCED CONCRETE
SLOPE PROTECTION

WITH STEEL SHEET PILES|




67,550,000.00

CONSTRUCTION OF
REINFORCED CONCRETE
SLOPE PROTECTION
WITH STEEL SHEET PILES|

88,258,900.00

CONSTRUCTION OF
REINFORCED CONCRETE
SLOPE PROTECTION
WITH STEEL SHEET PILES

CONSTRUCTION OF ONE
(1) STOREY BUILDING

88,258,900.00

CONSTRUCTION OF
REINFORCED CONCRETE
SLOPE PROTECTION
WITH STEEL SHEET PILES

CONSTRUCTION OF TWO
(2) STOREY BUILDING

Reconstruction of 328.00
L.M. Portiand Cement
Concrete Pavement with a
width of 3.05m on both lanes
and a thickness of 280 mm

27,902,560.00

24GL0044 - CONSTRUCTION
OF BINALBAGAN RIVER —
BANK SLOPE PROTECTION Competitive
3201011116000 | e o e AY BAGROY. (ZJSSIII)J;;JTAL Yes Sk 11/30/2023|  12/20/2023 2/2/2024 2/712024|GoP 67,550,000.00
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0045 - CONSTRUCTION
OF BINALBAGAN RIVER —
320102106482000 |>ANK SLOPEPROTECTION 0 nenra Yes Cosmpeiiie 11/30/2023|  12/20/2023 2/2/2024 2/7/2024|GoP 88,258,900.00
ALONG BINALBAGAN- 2ND DEO Bidding
ISABELA ROAD (LEFT BANK),
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0046 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS Competitive
300226114283000 [BUILDING (HOSPITAL), LA |OCCIDENTAL Yes iy 11/30/2023|  12/20/2023 1/30/2024 2/6/2024|GoP
CASTELLANA, NEGROS 2ND DEO 9
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0047 - CONSTRUCTION
OF BINALBAGAN RIVER NEGROR
BANK SLOPE PROTECTION Competitive
320102106483000 |\ 0\ oA NGAY G ANMUROS, %ggaggml. Yes Bidding 12/1/2023 12/27/2023 2/2/2024 2/7/2024|GoP 88,258,900.00
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0048 - CONSTRUCTION |\ o oo
300226110002000 |OF MULTI-PURPOSE OCCIDENTAL Yes Competitive 11812024 112912024 3/2012024|  3/26/2024|GoP
BUILDING, ISABELA, G e Bidding
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0049 -
RECONSTRUCTION TO
CONCRETE PAVEMENT - |NEGROS Somaeikive
310106101185000 ISABELA-LIBAS NEGROS  |OCCIDENTAL No toling 1/8/2024 1/29/2024 2/712024 2/8/2024|GoP
OCC. BDRY RD - K0077 + 836 {2ND DEO 9
KO078 + 042, KOOBO + 766 -
K0080 + 837
24GL0050 - PREVENTIVE
MAINTENANCE OF ROAD:  |NEGROS S
310101101529000 |ASPHALT OVERLAY - OCCIDENTAL No il 1/8/2024 1/29/2024 2/712024 2/8/2024|GoP 27,902,560.00
BACOLOD SOUTH RD - K0074|2ND DEO ing
+950 - KOOT5 + 463
24GL0051 - PREVENTIVE
MAINTENANCE OF ROAD:
ASPHALT OVERLAY - JCT ~ |NEGROS —
310102101868000 |BAGONAWA - LA OCCIDENTAL No ot 1/8/2024 1/29/2024 2/712024 2/8/2024)|GoP 44,079,420.00
CASTELLANA- ISABELA RD - [2ND DEO 9
K057 + 112 - K0OS8 + 900,
CHAINAGE 0 - CHAINAGE 17

Asphalt Overlay of 515.00
In.m (thickness= 50mm) with
Anti-Rutting Additive and
Thermoplastic Pavement
Markings.

44,079,420.00

Asphalt Overlay with
Correction of 1805.00 linear
meter, 50mm thickness with
Anti-Rutting Additive and
Thermoplastic Pavement
Markings.
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24GL0052 - PREVENTIVE

94,570,000.00

Asphalt Overlay of 1907.00
In.m (thickness= 50mm) with
Anti-Rutting Additive,
Warming Signs, Regulatory
Signs, Thermoplastic
Pavement Markings and
other Road Safety Devices.

8m x 19m Public Market w/
Flooring and Stalls

17m x 24m Covered Court
including Cladding w/
Concrete Flooring

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

MAINTENANCE OF ROAD:
ASPHALT OVERLAY - NEGROS S——
310101101277000 |BACOLOD SOUTH RD - K0081|OCCIDENTAL No il 11812024 112912024 2712024 2/8/2024|GoP 94,570,000.00
+050 - KOO81 + 497, K0OB1 + |2ND DEO 9
497 - KOUB2 + 050, KOOB2 +
050 - KOOB3 + 000
24GL0053 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS —_——
300226114266000 |BUILDING, AT BRGY. OCCIDENTAL No g 111212024 1/31/2024 211212024|  2121/2024|GoP
PATICUI, HINIGARAN, 2ND DEO ldding
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0054 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING (COVERED Competitive
so0z26114271000 (2 1O e ;):chaggm. No o 1112/2024 1/31/2024 21212024 2/21/2024|GoP
MAKILIGNIT, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GLO056 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE —
300226114262000 |BYILDING (BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Competitive 1112/2024 113172024 2112/2024|  2/21/2024|GoP
HALL), BARANGAY it Bidding
CAMALOBALO, HINIGARAN,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0057 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE —
300226114250000 [BUILDING (BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Coffpeiitise 1112/2024 113112024 211202024 2/21/2024|GoP
HALL), BARANGAY e Bidding
BUNGAHIN, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0058 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE —_—
BUILDING (BARANGAY Competitive
300226114254000 |13 O AY QUINTIN gﬁocgaggm_ No S 111212024 1/31/2024 21212024|  2/21/2024|GoP
REMO, MOISES PADILLA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GLO059 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE —
300226114267000 |SUILDING (BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Compatitive 111272024 1/31/2024 2112/2024|  2/21/2024|GoP
HALL), BARANGAY g Bidding
CAMPCLARK, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0060 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE ——
300226114269000 |BYILDING (BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Compétitve 1112/2024 113112024 211212024 2/21/2024|GoP
HALL), BARANGAY S DEN Bidding

SEBUCAUAN, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)
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24GL0061 - CONSTRUCTION
OF ROAD SLOPE

96,432,450.00

Construction of 2,901.94
square meter Mechanically-
Stabilized Earth (MSE)
Retaining Walls.

Repair/Rehabilitation of
School Building

Repair/Rehabilitation of
School Building

Repair/Rehabilitation of
School Building

Repair/Rehabilitation of
School Building

NEGROS .
PROTECTION STRUCTURE - Competitive
1010810143000 | oorr e AS NEGROS ;)'\?chggTAL No Bidding 1/16/2024 2/5/2024 2/13/2024|  2/22/2024 96,432,450.00
OCC. BDRY RD - K0093 + 939
K0094 + 169
23GL0127 -
REPAIR/REHABILITATION OF
SCHOOL BUILDING IN NEGROS Compeitive
300200100009000 |ISABELA SENIOR HIGH OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 1/16/2024 2/5/2024 2/13/2024| 2222024
SCHOOL, 2 STOREY - 8 2ND DEO
CLASSROOMS, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
23GL0128 -
REPAIR/REHABILITATION OF
SCHOOL BUILDING IN HEGROS
GUINPANA-AN NATIONAL Competitive
3002001000000 | %' <001 1 STOREY - 2 (z)ﬁchggTAL No Bidding 1/16/2024 2/5/2024 213/2024|  2/22/2024
CLASSROOMS, MOISES
PADILLA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
236L0129 -
REPAIR/REHABILITATION OF
SCHOOL BUILDING IN NEGROS Competitive
300200100009000 |CANMOROS ELEMENTARY  |OCCIDENTAL No i dl’r"g 1/16/2024 2/5/2024 2/13/2024|  2/22/2024
SCHOOL (1 STOREY - 3 2ND DEO
CLASSROOM) BINALBAGAN,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
23GL0130 -
REPAIR/REHABILITATION OF
SCHOOL BUILDING OIN NEGROS
BINALBAGAN NATIONAL Competitive
3002001000900 4’ Sorio0r (4 STOREY - g)ﬁgg);gm_ No Bidding 1/16/2024 2/5/2024 2/13/2024|  2/22/2024
20 CLASSROOMS)
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0062 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS Competitive
300226114264000 |BUILDING AT MUNICIPALITY [OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 1/26/2024 2/14/2024 2/21/2024|  2/29/2024
OF BINALBAGAN, NEGROS  [2ND DEO
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0063 - ROAD WIDENING {, o - 0o
JCT BAGONAWA-LA Competitive
310202101550000 |+ NAISABELA RD - gﬁggggTAL No Bidding 1/26/2024 2/14/2024 212112024 2/29/2024 51,992,270.00

K0069 + 000 - KOO70 + 290

CONSTRUCTION OF TWO
(2) STOREY BUILDING W/
ROOF DECK

51,992,270.00

ROAD WIDENING OF
1,345.00 LN.M. PORTLAND
CEMENT CONCRETE
PAVEMENT WITH A
WIDTH OF 3.65M ON
BOTH LANES AND A
THICKNESS OF 280MM,
WITH BIKE LANE AND
SLOPE PROTECTION ON
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SELECTED AREAS




24GL0064 - PREVENTIVE
MAINTENANCE OF ROAD:

ASPHALT OVERLAY WITH
CORRECTION OF 1876.00
LINEAR METER, 50 MM
THICK WITH ANTI -
RUTTING ADDITIVE AND
ROAD SAFETY DEVICES

Concreting of 476.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, drainage and slope
protection on selected areas

Concreting of 391.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, drainage and slope
protection on selected areas

Concreting of 480.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, drainage and slope
protection on selected areas

Concreting of 461.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, drainage and slope
protection on selected areas

Concreting of 520.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, drainage and slope
protection on selected areas

NEGROS »
310102101589000 |ASPHALT OVERLAY - OCCIDENTAL No Compettive 1/26/2024 2/14/2024 2121/2024|  2/29/2024|GoP 51,874,540.00 51,874,540.00
HINIGARAN - ISABELARD - |7\ 0 Bidding
KO060 + 150 - KO061 + 573,
KO0062 + 654 - KO063 + 100
24GL00B5 - CONSTRUCTION |\ o o
OF ROAD, BARANGAY Competitive
300221106320000 ROBLES, LA CASTELLANA, g:gg)ggTAL No Bidding 2/1/2024 2/20/2024 2/27/2024 3/7/2024|GoP 7,920,000.00 7,920,000.00
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0066 - CONCRETING OF
ROAD IN SITIO LUNOY, NEGROS Compeiliive
300221106319000 |BARANGAY CARABALAN, OCCIDENTAL No Bid d.ﬁe 2/1/2024 2/20/2024 2/27/2024 3/7/2024|GoP 7,920,000.00 7,920,000.00
HIMAMAYLAN CITY, NEGROS |2ND DEO g
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0067 - CONSTRUCTION NEGROS
OF ROAD, BRGY. BANOG- Competitive
300221106317000 | ANOG, ISABELA, NEGROS g:gga:gTAL No Bidding 2/1/2024 2/20/2024 2/27/2024 3/7/2024|GoP 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0068 - CONSTRUCTION |0
OF ROAD, BRGY. TALABAN, Competitive
300221106318000 HIMAMAYLAN CITY, NEGROS gﬁgg):gm. No Bidding 2/1/2024 2/20/2024 2/27/2024 3/7/2024|GoP 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0069 - CONSTRUCTION NEGROS
OF ROAD, BARANGAY Competitive
300221106321000 |0 v\ ') AN, HIMAMAYLAN, gsggggm. No Bidding 2/1/2024 2/20/2024 2/27/2024 3/7/2024|GoP 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0070 - CONSTRUCTION
OF ROAD, BRGY NEGRDS Competitive
300221106328000 |, oo ALAN, HIMAMAYLAN, 2:§g>§gTAL No Bidding 2/1/2024 2/20/2024 2/27/2024 3/7/2024|GoP 29,700,000.00 29,700,000.00

NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

Page 10 of 24

Concreting of 1,468.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, drainage and slope|
protection on selected areas




24GL0071 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE

NEGROS

Construction of One(1)
Storey Building w/ finishing
works on adjacent building.

103,390,000.00

Asphalt Overlay with
correction of 1,648.00 In.m
(thickness = 50mm)
including Paved Shoulder
with ARA, Warning Signs,
Regulatory Signs,
Reflectorized Thermoplastic
Pavement Markings (w/
Glass Beads) and Solar LED
Roadway Lighting
(120Watts)

Concreting of 440.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
3.05m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, and slope
protection on selected areas

19,800,000.00

Concreting of 801.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, and drainage on
selected areas

Concreting of 545.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, and slope
protection on selected areas

99,000,000.00

300226109909000 [BUILDING IN MUNICIPALITY |OCCIDENTAL No g%’;f‘e‘““’e 2/1/2024 2/20/2024 2/27/2024 3/7/2024|GoP
OF ISABELA, NEGROS 2ND DEO iaaing
OCCIDENTAL PHASE 1
24GL0072 - PREVENTIVE
MAINTENANCE OF ROAD:
ASPHALT OVERLAY OF NEGROS —
310101101528000 [ROAD WITH CORRECTION  |OCCIDENTAL No o d_z . 2/6/2024 2/26/2024 3/5/2024|  3/14/2024|GoP 103,390,000.00
ALONG BACOLOD SOUTH RD|2ND DEO g
K0058+739 -K0060+389 (WITH
EXCEPTION)
24GLO073 - CONSTRUCTION | e oo
300221106326000 |OF ROAD, BRGY. OCCIDENTAL No Competiive 2/6/2024 2/26/2024 3/5/2024|  3/14/2024|GoP
RUMIRANG, ISABELA, ND BED Bidding
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0074 - CONSTRUCTION | 0o oo
OF ROAD, BRGY. QUINTIN Competitive
3002210632700 |0 S PADILLA. gﬁgg}ggr& No Bidding 2/6/2024 2/26/2024 3/5/2024|  3/14/2024|GoP 19,800,000.00
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GLO075 - CONSTRUCTION |\ e oo o
300221106323000 |OF ROAD. BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Comgetiive 2/6/2024 2/26/2024 3/5/2024|  3/14/2024|GoP
PILLAR, HINIGARAN, NOBED Bidding
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0076 - CONSTRUCTION
OF TINONGAN RIVER BANK
SLOPE PROTECTION
UPSTREAM (RIGHT BANK) | oo oo
OF TINONGAN BRIDGE Competitive
300225101661000 ALONG JCT. BAGONAWA - gﬁgl{)o:gTAL No Bidding 2/6/2024 2/26/2024 3/5/2024 3/14/2024|GoP 99,000,000.00
LA CASTELLANA - ISABELA
ROAD, BARANGAY
TINONGAN, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0077 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS P
300226114241000 |BUILDING, BARANGAY 1,  |OCCIDENTAL No o d,ﬁe itve 2/8/2024 2/27/2024 3/7/2024|  3/14/2024|GoP
HIMAMAYLAN, NEGROS 2ND DEO L

OCCIDENTAL

CONSTRUCTION OF
REINFORCED CONCRETE
SLOPE PROTECTION
WITH STEEL SHEET PILES]
AND GEOTEXILE TUBE.

Page 11 of 24

CONSTRUCTION OF ONE
(1) STOREY BUILDING




300228100594000

24GL0078 - CONSTRUCTION

OF HEMODIALYSIS CENTER,

IGNACIO L. ARROYO
MEMORIAL DISTRICT
HOSPITAL, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
(PHASE 3)

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

2/8/2024

2/27/2024 3/7/12024

3/14/2024

GoP

20,950,000.00

300226114243000

24GL0079 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING, FASTRAC
COMPOUND, BRGY.
ROBLES, LA CASTELLANA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

2/8/2024

2/27/12024 3/7/12024

3/14/2024

GoP

6,930,000.00

20,950,000.00

EXPANSION OF SECOND
TO THHIRD FLOOR OF
HEMODIALYSIS

300225101663000

24GLO080 - CONSTRUCTION
OF PASANGHILAN RIVER
BANK SLOPE PROTECTION
DOWNSTREAM OF
PASANGHILAN BRIDGE
ALONG JCT. BAGONAWA -
LA CASTELLANA - ISABELA
ROAD, BARANGAY
TINONGAN, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

2/8/2024

2/27/2024 3/7/2024

3/14/2024

GoP

99,000,000.00

6,930,000.00

CONSTRUCTION OF ONE
(1) STOREY BUILDING

300225101662000

24GL0081 - CONSTRUCTION
OF PASANGHILAN RIVER
BANK SLOPE PROTECTION
UPSTREAM OF
PASANGHILAN BRIDGE
ALONG JCT. BAGONAWA -
LA CASTELLANA - ISABELA
ROAD, BARANGAY
TINONGAN, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

2/8/2024

2/27/2024 3/7/2024

3/14/2024

GoP

99,000,000.00

99,000,000.00

CONSTRUCTION OF
REINFORCED CONCRETE
SLOPE PROTECTION
WITH STEEL SHEET PILES]
AND GEOTEXILE TUBE.

320101111152000

24GL0082 (RE-BID) -
REHABILITATION OF FLOOD
CONTROL STRUCTURE
ALONG BINALBAGAN RIVER
AT BRGY. 1 AND BRGY. 3,
MUN. OF MOISES PADILLA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

3/19/2024

4/8/2024 4/18/2024

4/25/2024

GoP

50,180,000.00

99,000,000.00

CONSTRUCTION OF
REINFORCED CONCRETE
SLOPE PROTECTION
WITH STEEL SHEET PILES]
AND GEOTEXILE TUBE.

300228100595000

24GL0083 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI PURPOSE
BUILDING (HEALTH
CENTER), BRGY. QUINTIN
REMO, MOISES PADILLA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

2/8/2024

2/27/2024 3/7/2024

3/14/2024

GoP

14,850,000.00

50,180,000.00

Construction of Flood
Mitigation Structure with
Gabions and Mattresses.
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14,850,000.00

CONSTRUCTION OF ONE
(1) STOREY HEALTH
CENTER




300214101208000

24GL0084 - INSTALTATION
OF ROAD SAFETY DEVICES
ALONG JCT. BAGONAWA -
LA CASTELLANA - ISABELA
RD - K0064 + 000 - K0064 +
718 AND JCT PONTEVEDRA -
LA CASTELLANA RD - K0062
+038 - KOO62 + 443, LA
CASTELLANA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAI

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

2/8/2024

2/27/2024

3/7/2024

3/14/2024

GoP

24,500,000.00

300226114244000

24GL008S5 - REHABILITATION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING (ISABELA SOCIO-
CULTURAL CENTER), BRGY.
POBLACION, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

2/8/2024

2/27/2024

3/25/2024

4/5/2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

24,500,000.00

Installation of road safety
devices: solar street lights
including road signages,
pavement markings, and
asphalt overlay with
corrections at specific
locations.

310101101527000

24GL0O086 - PREVENTIVE
MAINTENANCE OF ROAD:
ASPHALT OVERLAY OF
ROAD WITH CORRECTION
ALONG BACOLOD SOUTH RD
AT K0054+804 -K0055+174,
K0060+494 - K0060+900,
K0061+763 - K00682+497
(WITH EXCEPTION)

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

2/8/2024

2/27/2024

3/7/2024

3/14/2024

GoP

68,600,000.00

4,950,000.00

Rehabilitation of Isabela
Socio-Cultural Center

300214101210000

24GLO087 (RE-BID) -
INSTALLATION OF
ROADWAY LIGHTING
STRUCTURES ALONG
BINALBAGAN-ISABELA ROAD
(S00419NR), NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

3/19/2024

4/8/2024

4/18/2024

4/25/2024

GoP

98,000,000.00

68,600,000.00

Asphalt Overlay with
correction of 1520.00 In.m
(thickness = 50mm) with
ARA, Warning Signs,
Regulatory Signs and
Reflectorized Thermoplastic
Pavement Markings (w/
Glass Beads)

300214101210000

24GL0088 - INSTALLATION
OF ROADWAY LIGHTING
STRUCTURES ALONG
HINIGARAN-ISABELA RD.,
ISABELA-LIBAS NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL BDRY RD AND
ISABELA POBLACION,
ISABELA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

2/9/2024

2/28/2024

3/11/2024

3/20/2024

GoP

49,000,000.00

98,000,000.00

Installation of roadway solar
lighting structures, including
miscellaneous
activities/structures such as
roadway traffic
management, pedestal,
backfill, andother
embankment at selected
areas

230101112081000

24GLO0089 (RE-BID) -
REHABILITATION AND
IMPROVEMENT OF
SPILLWAY AND SLOPE
PROTECTION AT BRG.
MACAGAHAY AND BRGY.
MONTILLA, MUN. OF MOISES
PADILLA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

3/19/2024

4/8/2024

4/18/2024

4/25/2024

GoP

47,040,000.00

49,000,000.00

Installation of roadway
lighting structures
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47,040,000.00

Rehabilitation and
Improvement of Spillway and
Construction of Flood
Mitigation Structure with
Gabions and Mattresses.




9,800,000.00

74,760,480.00

Construction of water supply|
facility with water tank,
drilling of water source,
provision of pump,and
filtration system driven by
solar panels with batteries
and inverters, and perimeter

ifence for the facility |
RECONSTRUCTION/UPGR

ADING OF DAMAGED
PAVED ROADS - 2777.00
In.m with Macro Synthetic
Fibers, Drainage Structures
(w/ Cross

Drain), Thermoplastic
Pavement Markings(w/
Glass Beads), Solar LED
Roadway Lighting and
Correction of Bridge
Approach

9,900,000.00

Concreting of 445.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with varying width
of 2.00m and 2.50m in both
lanes and a thickness of 230
mm, with shoulder, and
slope protection on selected
areas

49,500,000.00

Reconstruction of 1950.00
L.M. pavement to Portland
Cement Concrete Pavement
with a width of 3.05m in both
lanes and a thickness of 230
mm, and solar roadway
lighting on selected areas.

24GL0090 - CONSTRUCTION
OF WATER SYSTEMLEVEL |NEGROS Conipétitive
300205101307000 |Il, BARANGAY SAN JUAN, OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 2/9/2024 2/28/2024 3/11/2024 3/20/2024 | GoP 9,800,000.00
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS 2ND DEO
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0091 -
REHABILITATION/RECONSTR
UCTION/UPGRADING OF
DAMAGED PAVED ROADS
ALONG BACOLOD SOUTH RD| o o
- KO0B2 + 522 - KO0B2 + 546, Competitive
300214100773000 |L e a1 ko083 + 580, ;)SSI&EESITAL No i 2/9/2024 2/28/2024 6/10/2024|  6/19/2024|GoP 74,760,480.00
KOOB3 + 747 - K0OG4 +
538,K0068 + 760 - KOOBY +
121, KOO71 + 832 - KOO71 +
847, K0O72 + 283 - K0OO72 +
892
24GL0092 - CONSTRUCTION |\ oo o
300221106322000 ?:gg:%ﬁ%?&i’w OCCIDENTAL No Competitive 2/9/2024 2/28/2024 3/11/2024|  3/20/2024|GoP 9,900,000.00
' ' 2ND DEO Bidding
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0093 - CONSTRUCTION
OF ROAD ALONG CROSSING |NEGROS ool
300221108325000 |MAGALLON - BRGY. BI-AK NA|OCCIDENTAL No B dl:g 2/0/2024 2/28/2024 3/11/2024|  3/20/2024|GoP 49,500,000.00
BATO RD., MOISES PADILLA, [2ND DEO
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0094 - CONSTRUCTION
OF ROAD, SITIO ARUM, NEGROS Compeiiive
300221106324000 |BRGY. MACAGAHAY, MOISES|OCCIDENTAL No Sk 2/0/2024 2/28/2024 3/11/2024|  3/20/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
PADILLA, NEGROS 2ND DEO 9
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0095 - CONSTRUCTION |\ o o
310204102849000 g': BINALBAGAN DIVERSION |00 minenTalL No Coipetitiye 2/9/2024 2/28/2024 3/11/2024|  3/20/2024|GoP 19,600,000.00
OAD, BINALBAGAN, IND DEO Bidding 100
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

4,950,000.00

Concreting of 234.50 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, drainage and slope!
protection on selected areas
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19,600,000.00

Concreting of 690.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement compose of three
sections with varying lane
width of 3.05m and 2.50m,
and a thickness of 200mm,
with shoulder and slope
protection on selected areas




24GL0096 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE

NEGROS

5,197,500.00

COMPLETION OF TWO (2)
STOREY BUILDING (2ND
FLOOR LABORATORY
BUILDING)

5,692,500.00

17M x 24M COVERED
COURT INCLUDING
CLADDING WITH
CONCRETE FLOORING

5,692,500.00

17M x 24M COVERED
COURT INCLUDING
CLADDING WITH
CONCRETE FLOORING

5,567,760.00

17M x 24M COVERED
COURT INCLUDING
CLADDING WITH
CONCRETE FLOORING

5,692,500.00

17M x 24M COVERED
COURT INCLUDING
CLADDING WITH
CONCRETE FLOORING

5,445,000.00

17M x 24M COVERED
COURT INCLUDING
CLADDING WITH
CONCRETE FLOORING

5,692,500.00

17M x 24M COVERED
COURT INCLUDING
CLADDING WITH
CONCRETE FLOORING &
ROFF STAGE

300226109919000 |BUILDING IN MUNICIPALITY |OCCIDENTAL No g;’;‘iﬁ?‘""e 2/9/2024 2/28/2024 3/11/2024|  3/20/2024|GoP 5,197,500.00
OF LA CASTELLANA, 2ND DEO
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0097 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS Compeitive
300226114233000 |BUILDING, BARANGAY SAN |OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 2/13/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024|  3/21/2024|GoP 5,692,500.00
AGUSTIN, ISABELA, NEGROS |2ND DEO
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0098 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS —
300226114235000 |BUILDING, BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 2/13/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024|  3/21/2024|GoP 5,692,500.00
AMONTAY, BINALBAGAN,  |2ND DEO
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0099 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING (COVERED NEGROS Competitve
300226114261000 |COURT), CANDUMARAO OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 2/13/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024|  3/21/2024|GoP 5,567,760.00
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, 2ND DEO
HINIGARAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0100 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS —
300226114240000 [BUILDING, BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 2/13/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024|  3/21/2024|GoP 5,692,500.00
SANTOL, BINALBAGAN, 2ND DEO
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0101 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS e
300226114237000 |BUILDING, BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No e d;g 2/13/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024|  3/21/2024|GoP 5,445,000.00
CAMANG CAMANG, ISABELA, |2ND DEO
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0102 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSéE EGHOS
BUILDING, BARANGAY Competitive
3002261423000 | o " N (CULBAN), gbc‘:chJggTAL No i 2/13/2024 3/412024 3/13/2024|  3/21/2024|GoP 5,692,500.00
HIMAMAYLAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0103 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE -
BUILDING (BARANGAY HALL) Competitive
300226114260000 _BARANGAY ANAHAW. gﬁgg)ggm. No Bidding 2/13/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
HINIGARAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0104 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS S
300226109947000 [BUILDING IN BRGY. 3 - OCCIDENTAL No - dif‘g 2/13/2024 3/4/2024 3/20/2024|  3/26/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
POBLACION, HIMAMAYLAN, |2ND DEO

NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

4,950,000.00

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)
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4,850,000.00

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)




4,950,000.00

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(12.0m X 12.0m)

4,950,000.00

ONE STOREY BUILDING
(11.0m X 7.0m)

4,950,000.00

17M x 18M COVERED
COURT INCLUDING
CLADDING WITH
CONCRETE FLOORING

4,950,000.00

17M x 18M COVERED
COURT INCLUDING
CLADDING WITH
CONCRETE FLOORING

5,445,000.00

17M x 24M COVERED
COURT WITH CLADDING,
CONCRETE FLOORING
AND CANOPY

5,692,500.00

17M x 18M COVERED
COURT WITH CLADDING
AND CONCRETE
FLOORING

24GL0105 - CONSTRUCTION

OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS

300226114268000 3%'_'10""(3 (BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Competitive 2/13/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024|  3/21/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00

), BARANGAY 2ND DEO Bidding !

SIKATUNA, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0106 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING (BRGY. HALL), Competitive

300226114270000 |0\ o oory CAMBUGSA. g:é::g);gTAL No Bidding 2/13/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
HINIGARAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0107 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE
BUILDING (COVERED NEGROS Competiive

300226114259000 |COURT), BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Bid di':e 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
BUENAVISTA (SAISI), 2ND DEO 9
HIMAMAYLAN CITY, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GLO108 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING (COVERED Competitive

300226114272000 COURT), BARANGAY g:gg):gm. No Bidding 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
CANMOROS, BINALBAGAN,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0109 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS Compatiive

300226114234000 |BUILDING, BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Bid m: 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 5,445,000.00
LIBACAO, HIMAMAYLAN, 2ND DEO 9
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0110 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING, BARANGAY Competitive

300226114238000 | o roa"AN (CUNALOM), ?:é:g::gm. No Bidding 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 5,692,500.00
HIMAMAYLAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0111 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING (COVERED Competitive

300226114258000 COURT), BARANGAY gﬁggnggTAL No Bidding 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
AGUISAN, HIMAMAYLAN
CITY, NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0112 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS VT —

300226114242000 |BUILDING, BARANGAY OCCIDENTAL No Bid daz 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 5,445,000.00
ENCLARO, BINALBAGAN,  |2ND DEO 9
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

4,950,000.00

COVERED COURT
INCLUDING WITH
FLOORING, STAGE AND
CLADDING
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5,445,000.00

17M x 24M COVERED
COURT INCLUDING
CLADDING WITH
CONCRETE FLOORING




24GL0113 - CONSTRUCTION

5,445,000.00

17M x 24M COVERED
COURT INCLUDING
CLADDING WITH
CONCRETE FLOORING

4,950,000.00

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

4,950,000.00

CONSTRUCTION OF TWO
STOREY (2) BUILDING
(9.0m x 7.0 m)

4,950,000.00

One Storey Building (12.0m
x 12.0m)

OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS ——
300226114232000 |BUILDING, BARANGAY BATO,|OCCIDENTAL No B3 diﬁe 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 5,445,000.00
HINIGARAN, NEGROS 2ND DEO 9
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0114 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS Competitive
300226114255000 |BUILDING, BARANGAY 7, OCCIDENTAL No Bid dig 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
ISABELA, NEGROS 2ND DEO 9
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0115 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING (BARANGAY HALL) Competitive
300226114251000 _ BARANGAY GUINTUBHAN, SSDCI[I)DEESJTAL No Bidding 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
ISABELA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0116 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS Coirbatie
300226114256000 |BUILDING AT MUNICIPALITY [OCCIDENTAL No Bid diz 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 4,950,000.00
OF MOISES PADILLA, 2ND DEO 9
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0117 - CONSTRUCTION
OF MULTI-PURPOSE NEGROS
BUILDING, BARANGAY Competitive
300226114236000 CROSSING MAGALLON, ZOSSgJEEgTAL No Bidding 2/14/2024 3/4/2024 3/13/2024 3/21/2024|GoP 5,445,000.00
MOISES PADILLA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
24GL0118 - CONSTRUCTION
OF 1-STOREY 2 CLASSROOM
SCHOOL BUILDING IN NEGROS
CANSALONGON Competitive
300101200001000 ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, ?SSIDDEESJTAL No Bidding 4/8/2024 4/29/2024 5/8/2024 5/16/2024|GoP 4,975,000.00
BARANGAY CANSALONGON,
ISABELA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

5,445,000.00

17m x 24m Covered Court
including Cladding w/
Concrete Flooring

Page 17 of 24

4,975,000.00

Construction of 1 Storey-2
Classrooms (7m X 18m)
with Toilets




24GL0119 - CONSTRUCTION
OF 1-STOREY 2 CLASSROOM
SCHOOL BUILDING IN

4,975,000.00

NEGROS »

300101200001000 |CONGRESSMAN ELISEO |00 e rar No Gompatitiveg 4/8/2024 4/29/2024 5/8/2024|  5/16/2024|GoP 4,975,000.00

MEMORIAL SCHOOL, IND DEO Bidding 9,

BARANGAY SUAY,

HIMAMAYLAN CITY, NEGROS

OCCIDENTAL

23GLO131 - REHABILITATION

OF DISASTER - RELATED

INFRASTRUCTURE AND

OTHER FACILITIES - NEGROS T—
300200100009000 |RELEASE OF FUNDS FOR  |OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 3/8/2024 3/27/2024 4/15/2024|  4124/2024|GoP 12,080,000.00

REPAIRREHABILITATION  |2ND DEO

SCHOOL BUILDINGS WHICH

WERE DAMAGED BY

TYPHOON "PAENG"

12,080,000.00
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Construction of 1 Storey-2
Classrooms (7m X 18m)
with Toilets

REHABILITATION OF
SCHOOL BUILDINGS IN :
PART A. ISABELA SENIOR
HIGH SCHOOL, 3 STOREY
9 CLASSROOMS,
ISABELA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

PART B. ISABELA SENIOR
HIGH SCHOOL, 3 STOREY
9 CLASSROOMS,
ISABELA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

PART C. JOSE L. YULO
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL,
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

PART D. ISABELA SENIOR
HIGH SCHOOL (2-STOREY
4 CLASSROOM), ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
PART E. ISABELA SENIOR
HIGH SCHOOL (2-STOREY
4 CLASSROOM), ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
PART F. ISABELA SENIOR
HIGH SCHOOL (2-STOREY
4 CLASSROOM), ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
PART G. SCHOOL
BUILDING IN ISABELA
SENIOR HIGH SCHOOL (2-
STOREY 4 CLASSROOM),
ISABELA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

PART H . TINONGAN
NATIONAL HIGH SCHOOL,
BRGY. TINONGAN,




300101200001000

24GL0120 - CONSTRUCTION
OF 1-STOREY 2 CLASSROOM
SCHOOL BUILDING IN DON
ANGEL LOCSIN
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL,
BARANGAY ENCLARO,
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

4/8/2024

4/29/2024

5/8/2024

5/16/2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101200001000

24GL0121 - CONSTRUCTION
OF 1-STOREY 2 CLASSROOM
SCHOOL BUILDING IN DONA
JESUSA ARROYO
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL,
BARANGAY PAYAO,
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

4/8/2024

4/29/2024

5/8/2024

5/16/2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

4,975,000.00

Construction of 1 Storey-2
Classrooms (7m X 18m)
with Toilets

300101200001000

24GL0122 - CONSTRUCTION
OF 1-STOREY 2 CLASSROOM
SCHOOL BUILDING IN
GUINPANAAN NATIONAL
HIGH SCHOOL POBLACION-
EXTENSION, BARANGAY 1,
MOISES PADILLA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

4/8/2024

4/29/2024

6/8/2024

5/16/2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

4,975,000.00

Construction of 1 Storey-2
Classrooms (7m X 18m)
with Toilets

300101200001000

24GL0123 - CONSTRUCTION
OF 1-STOREY 2 CLASSROOM
SCHOOL BUILDING IN LIBAS
NATIONAL HIGH SCHOOL,
BARANGAY LIBAS, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

4/8/2024

4/29/2024

5/8/2024

5/16/2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

4,975,000.00

Construction of 1 Storey-2
Classrooms (7m X 18m)
with Toilets

300101200001000

24GL0124 - CONSTRUCTION
OF 1-STOREY 2 CLASSROOM
SCHOOL BUILDING IN
PEDRO Y. DITCHING, SR.
BAGROY ELEMENTARY
SCHOOL, BARANGAY
BAGROY, BINALBAGAN,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

4/8/2024

4/29/2024

5/8/2024

5/16/2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

4,975,000.00

Construction of 1 Storey-2
Classrooms (7m X 18m)
with Toilets

300101200001000

24GL0125 - CONSTRUCTION
OF 1-STOREY 2 CLASSROOM
SCHOOL BUILDING IN
SPECIAL EDUCATION
CENTER MOISES PADILLA
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL,
BARANGAY 5, MOISES
PADILLA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL
2ND DEO

No

Competitive
Bidding

4/8/2024

4/20/2024

5/8/2024

5/16/2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

4,975,000.00

Construction of 1 Storey-2
Classrooms (7m X 18m)
with Toilets
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4,975,000.00

Construction of 1 Storey-2
Classrooms (7m X 18m)
with Toilets




24GL0126 -
REPAIRMAINTENANCE OF | - o o g
MAYTUBIG RIVER ompetitive
200000100020000 (om0t ( RIGHT BANK), ;):[():lg:gTAL No Bidding 4/25/2024 5/14/2024 5/22/2024 5/30/2024|GoP 3,671,000.00
BRGY. MAYTUBIG, ISABELA,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0127 -
CONSTRUCTION/REHABILIT
;;TION gF WATI;R v?/u;:i.GYl EEROE . .
EPTAGE AND SEWERAGE / ompetitive
300205100010000 |23\ wate e o0LLECTOR gﬁgg;:gn\n. No Bidding 4/25/2024 5/14/2024 5/22/2024 5/30/2024|GoP 2,895,000.00
SYSTEM - RAINWATER
COLLECTORS IN PUBLIC
FACILITIES
24GL0128 - CONCRETING OF
BRGY. CALAPI TO SITIO NEGROS Competive
310203210721000 |TALAPTAP FMR, BRGY. OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 5/7/2024 5/27/2024 6/5/2024 6/10/2024|GoP 49,750,000.00
CALAPI, HINIGARAN, 2ND DEO
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
24GL0129 - CONCRETING OF
BRGY. CANDUMARAO FMR, [NEGROS Competiive
310203210701000 |BRGY. CANDUMARAO, OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 5/7/2024 5/27/2024 6/5/2024 6/10/2024|GoP 14,925,000.00
HINIGARAN, NEGROS 2ND DEO
OCCIDENTAL
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3,671,000.00

2,895,000.00

49,750,000.00

Repair and Maintenance of
Damaged Slope Protection /
Construction of Stone
Masonry along Maytubig
River, Abut. B of Maytubig
Bridge Upstream Right Side

Construction of 6 units
Reinforced Concrete Ground
Storage Tank with a total of
144 lineal meter gutter:

A. CANMOROS
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL,
BRGY. CANMOROS,
BINALBAGAN, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

B. CARLOS HILADO
MEMORIAL STATE
UNIVERSITY, BRGY.
ENCLARO, BINALBAGAN,
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL
C. MAYTUBIG
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL,
BRGY. MAYTUBIG,
ISABELA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

D. CABAGNA-AN
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL,
BRGY. CABAGNA-AN, LA
CASTELLANA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

E. MANSALANAO
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL,
BRGY. MANSALANAO, LA
CASTELLANA, NEGROS
OCCIDENTAL

F. BRGY. LIBAS, ISABELA,
INEGROS OCCIDENTAL |
Concreting of 2,444.00 L. M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
3.05m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, and drainage on
selected areas

14,925,000.00

Concreting of 727.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete
Pavement with a width of
2.50m in both lanes and a
thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, and slope

protection on selected areas




24GL0130 - CONCRETING OF

Concreting of 1,185.00 L.M.
Portland Cement Concrete

NEGROS - Pavement with a width of
310203210739000 |BRCY: QUINTIN REMO FMR, 0 henrar No Gompetiiva 5/7/2024 5/27/2024 6/5/2024|  6/10/2024|GoP 24,875,000.00 24,875,000.00 |2.50m in both lanes and a
MOISES PADILLA, NEGROS Bidding d St ) )
OCCIDENTAL 2ND DEO thickness of 230 mm, with
shoulder, and drainage on
selected areas
Concreting of 565.00 L.M.
24GL0131 - CONCRETING OF Portland Cement Concrete
BRGY. SAN AGUSTIN FMR  |[NEGROS Compeiiive Pavement with a width of
310203210702000 |PHASE II, BRGY. SAN OCCIDENTAL No Bidding 5/7/2024 5/27/2024 6/5/2024 6/10/2024|GoP 14,925,000.00 14,925,000.00 |2.50m in both lanes and a
AGUSTIN, ISABELA, NEGROS |2ND DEO thickness of 230 mm, with
OCCIDENTAL shoulder, and slope
protection on selected areas
GL0132 -
REPAIR/MAINTENANCE OF
PUBLIC BUILDINGS:
A. REPAIR/MAINTENANCE OF
DILG BUILDING PHILIPPINE
NATIONAL POLICE Repairs of roofing, partition
HINIGARAN walls and toilet of Barracks
HEADQUARTERS, 1z
BARRACKS 1, BRGY. Repairs/Replace of roof
GARGATO, HINIGARAN, framing and roofing , with
NEGROS OCC. NEGROS plastering and paintings of
B. REPAIR/MAINTENANCE OF Competitive selected structure.
200000100019000 |\ "0 1 NS BHILIPPINE gﬁg:?:omAL No Bidding 5/9/2024 5/28/2024 6/5/2024 6/10/2024|GoP 3,300,000.00 | 3,300,000.00 Celling works, installation of
NATIONAL POLICE electrical lightings and
HINIGARAN covenience, footwalk and
HEADQUARTERS, concrete canopy, doors and
BARRACKS 2, BRGY. windows and painting works
GARGATO, HINIGARAN, of DPWH warehouse
NEGROS OCC.
C. REPAIR/MAINTENANCE
OF DPWH BUILDING
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL 2ND
DEO WAREHOUSE
BUIDING CARMEN ST
TOTAL 2,657,696,820.00 19,051,000.00 | 2,638,645,820.00

Submitted py:

BAC Chairman
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Approved by:

MARIVI(Q

M| ROLDAN, ASEAN Eng

Dlstrict Engineer
Head of Procuring Entity




ODS AND SERVICES

E SUPPLIES AND CONSUMABLES 2,656,263.00 2,656,263.00
PROCUREMENT OF
1st and 2nd Quarter FY 2024 NO Competitive | 1! 02“:,‘;;9’ FY | st Q;g;f’ Y | st 02“:;:" Y 1§‘YQ2”:2"4‘“ GoP 2,008,388.00 2,008,388.00  |OFFICE SUPPLIES AND
Negros Bidding/ Small CONSUMABLES
Occidental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/ PROCUREMENT OF
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO Shopping | 31 QZ”:ZT' Py jond Q;:;‘" Fy | ord Qz“:z'fr FY 3':Y°2“:2“4°' GoP 647,875.00 647,875.00 OFFICE SUPPLIES AND
CONSUMABLES
*E EQUIPMENT SUPPLIES AND CONSUMABLES 3,249,534.50 3,249,534.50
PROCUREMENT OF
1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter OFFICE EQUIPMENT
1stand 2nd Quarter FY 2024 NO Competitive 2024 2024 2024 Fy 2024 |°°F 236747742 236747742 | )pPLIES AND
Negros Bidding/ Small CONSUMABLES
Occidental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/ PROCUREMENT OF
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO Shepping] [ Q;:z’;’r FY'j am 02“;2’;‘" Py Q;:;‘” A 3?&“;;‘" GoP 882,057.08 882,057.08 gSE;’SEESQm';MENT
CONSUMABLES
RTS, ACCESSORIES AND PERIPHERALS 2,243,720.00 2,243,720.00
PROCUREMENT OF IT
1stand 2nd Quarter FY 2024 NO Competitive | ' Q;;x’ FY |1t Q,“,’:x' FY | st Q;;Z’f' F¥ 1;‘Y°;;,?4°’ GoP 953,008.33 953,098.33 PARTS, ACCESSORIES
Negros Bidding/ Small AND PERIPHERALS
Occidental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/ PROCUREMENT OF IT
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO Shopping | 3 °2“;2"4°' il e~ b QZ“:Z’:“ i 3':Y°2”:;" GoP 1,290,621.67 120062167  |PARTS, ACCESSORIES
AND PERIPHERALS
UIPMENT 2,245,900.00 2,245,900.00
Competitive | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter PROCUREMENT OF IT
toandided Quader EY 2034 pinores he Bidding/ Small | 2024 2024 2024 Fy 2024 |CF 4006,900.00 200590000 |gqypMENT
Occidental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/ | 3rd Quarter FY | 3rd Quarter FY | 3rd Quarter FY | 3rd Quarter PROCUREMENT OF IT
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO Shopping P ey e ey lor 150,000.00 150,000.00 ER0IPHENT
rORIAL SUPPLIES 1,098,073.00 1,098,073.00
Competitive | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter PROCUREMENT OF
fstand 2nd Quarter FY 2024 NO e poly o sk e o034 |GoP 432,553.00 432,553.00 ANROHIKL BUPPLIES
Occidental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/ | 3rq Quarter FY | 3rd Quarter FY | 3rd Quarter FY | 3rd Quarter PROCUREMENT OF
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO Shopping el o o v o0s |GoP 665,520.00 665,520.00 SRl EIPRIER
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COMMON MEDICAL SUPPLIES 172,636.00
Competitive | 18t Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter
1st and 2nd Quarter FY 2024 Negros NO Bldding7 B 2024 2024 2024 FY 2024 GoP 70,664.67
Occidental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO Shopping | 0 pere Y | Srd Quarier FY | 3rd Quarter Fy | 3rq Quarter | Gop 101,071.33
OCCUPATIONAL SUPPLIES 418,875.00
1st and 2nd Quarter FY 2024 NO Competitive et Q;oa;er BY | 1n Q::;: FEY | Q;::: rey 1$YQ;::: " |Gor 418,875.00
Negros Bidding/ Small
Occidental 2nd Value
DRQ Frooumneny 3rd Quarter FY | 3rd FY |3 FY | 3rd
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO Shopping e | Q;;z'f’ Y | o Qz“g';"’ ’FYQZ“;;” GoP 279,135.00
|OFFICE FURNITURE AND FIXTURES 1,167,350.00
Competitive | 18t Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter
1st and 2nd Quarter FY 2024 Negros NO Biddan?Small 2024 2024 2024 FY 2024 GoP 1,044,750.00
Occidental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO Shopping | o1 Gy FY | 3rd Gusrier FY | Srd Quarter FY | 31 Quarter | gop 122,600.00
|FUEL/OIL/LUBRICANTS AND OTHERS 12,637,010.00
18t and 2nd Quarter FY 2024 NO Compettve | Q;;;f P | e Q;;z“:' Y| e Q;;,‘[:" e 1‘,’:‘Y°2“§;°' GoP 7,193,205.00
Negros Bidding/ Small
Occldental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO Shopping | Il QB FY | Srd Qubrier FY | Srd Quariar F | 3ra Querer 1agp 5,443,805.00
|ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES 169,395.00
1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter
1st and 2nd Quarter FY 2024 NO Gompelilie 2024 2024 2024 FY 2024 GoP 169,395.00
Negros Bidding/ Small
Occidental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/
Shopping
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO 54 Q;:;"’ F¥ | 3nd QZ“:Z“:' Fy | 3nd Q;;;“' 44 3:§’Y°2“;2’:°' GoP 71,035.00

172,636.00
PROCUREMENT OF
70,664.67 COMMON MEDICAL
SUPPLIES
PROCUREMENT OF
101,971.33 COMMON MEDICAL
SUPPLIES
418,875.00
PROCUREMENT OF
418,875.00 OCCUPATIONAL
SUPPLIES
PROCUREMENT OF
279,135.00 OCCUPATIONAL
SUPPLIES
1,167,350.00
PROCUREMENT OF
1,044,750.00 OFFICE FURNITURE AND
FIXTURES
PROCUREMENT OF
122,600.00 OFFICE FURNITURE AND
FIXTURES
12,637,010.00
PROCUREMENT OF
7,193,205.00 FUEL/OIL/LUBRICANTS
AND OTHERS
PROCUREMENT OF
5,443,805.00 FUEL/OIL/LUBRICANTS
AND OTHERS
169,395.00
PROCUREMENT OF
199206.00 ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES
71,035.00 PROCUREMENT OF

ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES




IMAINTENANCEICONSTRUCTION MATERIALS & SUPPLIES 19,729,619.83 19,729,619.83
PROCUREMENT OF
1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter MAINTENANCE/CONSTRU
1st and 2nd Quarter FY 2024 NO Compelive S024 2004 2024 Fy 2024 |G°P 19,729,619.83 10,720619.83 |\ MATERIALS &
Negros Bidding/ Small SUPPLIES
Occidental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/ PROCUREMENT OF
Shopping
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO and 02”:;"' e {1 02“:2"4‘” FY] o 02”:;” B 3fY°;‘:;°r GoP 398,800.00 398,800.00 "é‘.ﬁ'g;mf&i‘igismu
SUPPLIES
AIR CONDITIONING & AIR CONDITIONING SYSTEM 150,000.00 150,000.00
Competitive
Negros Bidding/ Small PROCUREMENT OF AIR
1st and 2nd Quarter FY 2024| Occidental 2nd NO vae | ' Q;:::r B 1. Q;gz'ff' FYj 1 Qz“;;"' F¥ 1;'Y°;:2“4°' GoP 150,000.00 150,000.00 CONDITIONING & AIR
DEO Procurement/ CONDITIONING SYSTEM
Shopping
TIRES, BATTERIES, SPARE PARTS AND OTHER ACCESSORIES 157,700.00 167,700.00
PROCUREMENT OF
1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter TIRES, BATTERIES,
1st and 2nd Quarter FY 2024 NO Competitve 2024 2024 2024 Fy2oz4 |G°P 157,700.00 157,700.00 SPARE PARTS AND
Negros Bidding/ Small OTHER ACCESSORIES
Occidental 2nd Value
DEO Procurement/ PROCUREMENT OF
Shoppin
3rd and 4th Quarter FY 2024 NO 0 | Qz“:;"’ FY | Sra Quarter FY | ord Qz";;"' ad 3fY°;;2"4°' GoP 506,600.00 506,600.00 ;';f:é ‘:‘;;TTESRAEN%
OTHER ACCESSORIES
ISECURITY SERVICES 640,704.00 640,704.00
Negros
Competitive | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter FY | 1st Quarter PROCUREMENT OF
18t and 2nd Quarter FY 2024 Occld;éltgl 2nd NO Bidding 2024 2024 2024 Fyzoze |O°P 840,704.00 640,704.00 SECURITY SERVICES
Total (Goods and Services) 45,788,376.33 45,788,376.33
Submittedfpy: -;.- ended by Approved by;
{]
RUDERICK D. TURINGAN, ASEAN Eng MARIVIC M. ROLDAN, ASEAN Eng
District Engineer \ D‘;strlct Engineer

BAC Chairman
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Head of Procuring Entity




Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS
NEGROS OCCIDENTAL 2N° DISTRICT
ENGINEERING OFFICE

Binalbagan, Negros Occidental BAGONG PILIPINAS

July 09, 2024

CERTIFICATION

This is to certify that the DPWH NEGROS OCCIDENTAL 2ND DISTRICT ENGINEERING
OFFICE has no procurement activity for Consulting Services Funding Year 2024.

This certification is being issued in compliance to submission of FY 2024 Final Annual
Procurement Plan (APP) Non-CSE for FY 2024.

MARIVIC M. ROLDAN, ASEAN Eng.
Head of Pfocuring ERtjty

RO6.21 SMCA/GITM/RDT/MMR

| 150 9001

& Website: www.dpwh.gov.ph | ¢ -
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