DPWH BATANGAS 1ST FINAL ANNUAL PROCUREMENT PLAN NON-COMMON-USE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
(FAPP NON-CSE) FOR FY2024

Permanent Bridges-Balibago Br. (B03180LZ)
along Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan Rd

Bridge

Code Procurement PMO/ | Is this an Early Mode of Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Source of Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
(PAP) Project End- Pr:z:::lm:m Procurement Advertisement/ | Submission/O Notice of Contract Funds Total w cO (brief des.cription of
User (Yes/Nyo.) Posting of  |pening of Bids Award Signing 8 Project)
IB/REI =
8
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
8 and Reliable National Road System-Asset Competitive Maintenance of
S |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- cs YES Bid‘;ing 10/14/2023| 11/03/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024 GoP 14,700,000.00 14,700,000.00 Road: Asphalt
§ Secondary Roads - Diokno Highway - K0074 + O\}erlay
S |406 - K0074 + 528, K0077 + 500 - KO078 + 267
™
8
S  |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
E and Reliable National Road System-Asset Competii Maintenance of
S |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- | CS YES Bomng | 10/14/2023| 11/03/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024|  GoP | 19,600,000.00 19,600,000.00 | o cphalt
§ Secondary Roads - Palico-Balayan-Batangas Rd - O\./erlay
S |K0103 + 258 - K0103 + 852
o
8
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
E and Reliable National Road System-Asset Competiive Maintenance of
S |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- cs YES Bidding 10/27/2023| 11/15/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024 GoP 40,844,440.00 40,844,440.00 Road: Asphalt
S |Secondary Roads - Tagaytay-Nasugbu Rd - O\}erlay
§ K0075 + 000 - K0076 + 237
™
8
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
E and Reliable National Road System-Asset Competiive Maintenance of
S  |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- Cs YES Bld':jmg 10/14/2023| 11/03/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024 GoP 16,001,440.00 16,001,440.00 Road: Asphalt
§ Secondary Roads - Tagaytay-Nasugbu Rd - O\./erlay
S |K0102 + 860 - K0103 + 682
o™
8
3 |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
E and Reliable National Road System-Asset Gompetitve Maintenance of
S |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- | MS YES Bidding 11/30/2023| 12/19/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024 GoP 41,258,000.00 41,258,000.00 Road: Asphalt
S |Secondary Roads - Ternate-Nasugbu Rd O\}erlay
§ (S01859LZ) - K0086+000-K0088 + 500
™
§ ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
",’:'-" and Reliable National Road System-Asset Preventive
—  |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- Competitive Maintenance of
E Secondary Roads - Ternate-Nasugbu Rd MS YES Bidding 11/23/2023| 12/12/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024 GoP 41,538,280.00 41,538,280.00 Road: Asphalt
S [(S01859LZ) - K0O88 + 500 - KO090 +000, Overlay
% K0091 +683 - K0092 + 700
=1 ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
S |and Reliable National Road System-Asset
§ Preservation Program-Rehabilitation/ Gompetitve February February February February Construction of
S |Reconstruction of Roads with Slips, Slope (S NO Bidding 2024 2024 2024 2024 GoP 49,000,000.00 49,000,000.00 Road Slope
& |Collapse, and Landslide - Secondary Roads - Protection Structure
§ Ternate-Nasugbu Rd - K0075 + (-240) - K0075
™ [+ (-190)
§ ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
R |and Reliable National Road System-Asset Construction of
§ Preservation Program-Construction/ Upgrading/ cs NO Competitive 01/12/2024| 01/31/2024| 02/08/2024| 02/14/2024 Gop 16,660,000.00 16,660,000.00 | Drainage Structure
= |Rehabilitation of Drainage along National Roads Bidding AR AR | 9 R ud u
o |- Secondary Roads - Palico-Balayan-Batangas along Roa
g Rd - K0110 + 920 - KO111 + 553
8
S |CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
g PROGRAM- Special Road Fund - Motor Vehicle Compeie Installation of
S |User's Charge (MVUC) as per R.A. 11239- MS NO Bidding 02/01/2024| 02/20/2024| 02/28/2024 | 03/05/2024 GoP 44,100,000.00 44,100,000.00 Roadway Lighting
¥ |Installation of Roadway Lighting - Ternate-
S |Nasugbu Rd - K0O75 + (-378) - K0078 + 150
™
§ ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
§ and Reliable National Road System- Asset Construction of
S  |Preservation Program- Construction/ Upgrading/ Competitive February February February February X
S |Rehabilitation of Drainage along National Roads | <> NO Bidding 2024 2024 2024 2024 GoP | 17,640,000.00 17,640,000.00 | Drainage Structure
o |- Secondary Roads- Tagaytay-Nasugbu Rd - along Road
E K0073 + 400 - K0073 + 958
8
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
§ and Reliable National Road System-Network Comptiive
S |Development Program-Road Widening - cs YES Bld':jmg 11/09/2023| 11/28/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024 GoP 19,600,000.00 19,600,000.00 Road Widening
S |Secondary Roads-Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan Rd -
§ K0108 + 500 - K0109 + 000
™
8
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
@ and Reliable National Road System-Bridge c it Rehabilitation/
8 |Program-Rehabilitation/ Major Repair of cs NO Sdng | 01/12/2024| 01/31/2024| 02/08/2024 | 02/14/2024| ~ GoP | 4,900,000.00 4,900,000.00 | Major Repair of
S
g
=2
™




ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
and Reliable National Road System-Bridge

Rehabilitation/

Batangas

o

i=3

o

2

8

S |Program-Rehabilitation/ Major Repair of cs YES et | 11/22/2023 12/11/2023( 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024| ~ GoP | 10,780,000.00 10,780,000.00 |  Major Repair of

& |Permanent Bridges-Colong Colong Br. Bridge

o

g (B00005LZ) along Palico-Balayan-Batangas Rd

™

8

S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe

@ and Reliable National Road System-Bridge c n Rehabilitation/

S |Program-Rehabilitation/ Major Repair of cs YES ‘;fgz?;';”e 10/31/2023| 11/20/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024|  GoP 4,900,000.00 4,900,000.00 Major Repair of

& |Permanent Bridges-Matingain Br. (B00048LZ) Bridge

§ along Palico-Balayan-Batangas Rd

o

8

S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe

@ and Reliable National Road System-Bridge c it Rehabilitation/

8 |Program -Rehabilitation/ Major Repair of cs YES Sdng | 11/29/2023| 12/18/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024|  GoP | 9,800,000.00 9,800,000.00 | Major Repair of

& [Permanent Bridges-Obispo Br. (BO0036LZ) Bridge

o

g along Palico-Balayan-Batangas Rd

™

8

S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe

@ and Reliable National Road System-Bridge c " Februar Februa Februan Februan Rehabilitation/

S |Program-Rehabilitation/ Major Repair of cs NO ompetive Y i Y Y| eop | 9,800,000.00 9,800,000.00 | Major Repair of

& [Permanent Bridges-Sinisian Br. (B00012LZ) 9 2024 2024 2024 2024 Bridge

§ along Palico-Balayan-Batangas Rd

o™

o

8

% |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe

o |and Reliable National Road System-Bridge Competitive Construction of

g Program-Construction of New Bridges-Tanggoy &) YES Bidding 11/23/2023| 12/12/2023| 01/29/2024| 02/02/2024 GoP 49,000,000.00 49,000,000.00 Concrete Bridge

& |Bridge 2 along Balayan-Balibago Road

g

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

& |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program -

& |Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Competitive Construction of
o G . .

g Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public &) YES Bidding 10/31/2023| 11/20/2023| 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024 oP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Concrete Road

N |Buildings/ Facilities-Construction of Road,

S |Lemery, Batangas

oM

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

§ PROGRAM (CSSP) -Basic Infrastructure Program

1 [(BIP) - Access Roads and/or Bridges from the Competitive Construction of

g National Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic &) YES Bidding 11/04/2023| 11/23/2023| 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Concrete Road

& |Public Buildings/ Facilities-Construction of Road,

S |Nasugbu, Batangas

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

$ |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- .

g |Flood Miigation Structures protecting cs NO Competive | 1/12/15024| 01/31/2024| 02/08/2024| 02/14/2024| 0P | 4,950,000.00 495000000 | Fioa Mitgaton

= |Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities- Bidding A A Structt?re

S |Construction of Flood Mitigation Structure,

§ Barangay Tubuan, Lemery, Batangas

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

n |PROGRAM (CSSP)-Basic Infrastructure Program Construction of

£ |(BIP)- Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Competitive

E Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities- CS YES Bidding 11/09/2023| 11/28/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024 oP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 FIO(;C::r:IglEI'aetlon

N |Construction of Flood Mitigation Structure,

8 Calaca, Batangas

™M

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

& |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- .

< |Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Competitive Construction of

=] . N R L I cs NO P 01/19/2024| 02/07/2024| 02/15/2024 | 02/21/2024 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Flood Mitigation

@ |Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities- Bidding Structure

& |Construction of Flood Mitigation Structure, Taal, uctu

S |Batangas Phase 2

S ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 2 : Protect Lives

L |and Properties Against Major Floods- Flood

g Management Program-Construction/ " Construction of

= |Maintenance of Flood Mitigation Structures and | CS YES C‘g;'jjﬂ;’”e 11/09/2023| 11/28/2023| 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024| GoP | 49,117,535.00 49,117,535.00 | Flood Mitigation

S |Drainage Systems-Construction of Flood Control Structure

§ Structure at Calaca Bridge, Calaca River, City of

™ |Calaca, Batangas

o ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 2 : Protect Lives

S |and Properties Against Major Floods-Flood

=4 g )

£ Veintenance ofFood Miigaton Siuctures and . Construction of

= . gat : cs YES Competiive | 10/27/2023| 11/15/2023| 02/01/2024 02/08/2024| GoP | 86,850,000.00 86,850,000.00 | Flood Mitigation

—  |Drainage Systems-Construction of Riverbank Bidding Structure

S |Protection along Binambang River, Sta. 0 + 536

& - Sta. 0 + 854.80 (Upstream R/S) at Balayan,




ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 2 : Protect Lives

Purpose Building (Covered Court), Barangay
Dayap, Nasugbu, Batangas

Building

§ and Properties Against Major Floods-Flood
g Management Program-Construction/ Construction of
S |Paintenance of Flood Miigation Strucures and | ¢s | ves Competie | 10/28/2023| 11/16/2023( 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024|  Gop | 86,850,000.00 || 86,850,000.00 | Fiood Mitigation
a 9€ SV . . Structure
= |Protection along Binambang River, Sta. 0 +
a 854.80 - Sta. 1 + 173.60 (Upstream R/S) at
Balayan, Batangas
o ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 2 : Protect Lives
8 |and Properties Against Major Floods-Flood
5 Management Program-Construction/ Construction of
S |laintenance of Flood Miigation Strucures and | ¢s | ves Competiie | 10/31/2023| 11/20/2023| 02/01/2024 | 02/08/2024| GoP | 86,850,000.00 || 86,850,000.00 | Flood Mitigation
a 9€ SV . . Structure
= |Protection along Binambang River, Sta. 1 +
a 072.00 - Sta. 1 + 390.80 (Upstream L/S) at
Balayan, Batangas
. ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 2 : Protect Lives
S |and Properties Against Major Floods-Flood
g Management Program-Construction/ Construction of
= gf‘:::;:”signf's°gﬂn'!'é'3§ttg’: :f";hc:gfasni”d cs YES C"B"i;'f;}r‘:‘g”e 10/27/2023| 11/15/2023| 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024| GoP | 86,850,000.00 86,850,000.00 | Flood Mitigation
=
S |Protection along Binambang River, Sta. 1 + Structure
& [173.60 - Sta. 1 + 492.40 (Upstream R/S) at
Balayan, Batangas
. ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 2 : Protect Lives
S |and Properties Against Major Floods-Flood
g Management Program-Construction/ Construction of
= gf‘;?::;:r‘signf's°gﬂn'2'tt'3§tt";’: :f";hc:gfasni”d cs YES C"B"i;'f;}r‘:‘g”e 11/04/2023| 11/23/2023| 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024| GoP | 86,850,000.00 86,850,000.00 | Flood Mitigation
=
S |Protection along Binambang River, Sta. 1 + Structure
§ 390.80 - Sta. 1 + 709.60 (Upstream L/S) at
Balayan, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
¢ |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
@ Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support s NO Competitive February February March 2024 | March 2024 Gop 1.980,000.00 1.980,000.00 Multi-P
G |Social Services-Construction (Completion) of Bidding 2024 2024 arc arc © A e u;:":irnpose
S |Multi-Purpose Building (Barangay Hall), 9
§ Barangay 1, Calatagan, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
% |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program - Multi- Construction of
& Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Social Competitive oy
o Services-Construction (Completion) of Multi- cs YES Bidding 11/11/2023| 11/30/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024 GoP 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Multi-Purpose
b o
N |Purpose Building (Barangay Hall), Barangay 5, Building
S |Balayan, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
th  |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
@ Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support s NO Competitive February February March 2024 | March 2024 Gop 1.980,000.00 1.980,000.00 Multi-P
G |Social Services-Construction (Completion) of Bidding 2024 2024 arc arc © e e u;:":irnpose
S |Multi-Purpose Building (Barangay Hall), 9
§ Barangay Bagong Silang, Calatagan, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
8 |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction
Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to rt it Completion) of
S [ty Faies oot | s | o | g | ouranons] sy ooanons| onaanss| o | 1smamoco | amoomoan | (ot
je]
S |Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Lumbangan, Building
§ Nasugbu, Batangas
=1 CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
S |PROGRAM (CSSP)-Basic Infrastructure Program
E (BIP)- Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to c - Construction of
S |support Social Services-Construction cs YES ompetitive 11/25/2023| 12/14/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024|  GoP 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Multi-Purpose
— Bidding
£ |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose Building Building
§ (Barangay Hall), Barangay Malalay, Balayan,
©  |Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
& |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program - Multi- Construction of
B Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Social cs YES Competitive 10/27/2023| 11/15/2023| 01/26/2024 | 02/02/2024 GoP 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Multi-Purpose
T |Services-Construction (Completion) of Multi- Bidding A e Buil dinp
S |Purpose Building (Covered Court), Barangay 9
§ Ayao-lyao, Lemery, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
3 |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program - Multi- Construction of
& |Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Social Competitive X
= Services-Construction (Completion) of Multi- cs YES Bidding 10/27/2023| 11/15/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024 GoP 2,970,000.00 2,970,000.00 Multi-Purpose
b L
& |Purpose Building (Covered Court), Barangay Building
§ Cumba, Lian, Batangasc
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
B |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program - Multi- Construction of
& [Purpose Buidings/ Facilties to support Social | o | ygg Competie | 10/57/2023| 11/15/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024| GoP | 2,970,000.00 2,970,000.00 |  Multi-pi
Z |Services-Construction (Completion) of Multi- Bidding /27] /15/ 126/ 102/ © e e ulti-Purpose
g
i=3
o
™




Secondary Roads - Diokno Highway -
K0086+520-K0087+900

Overlay

S CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

S |PROGRAM (CSSP)-Basic Infrastructure Program

ﬁ (BIP)- Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to c Construction of

= |support Social Services-Construction cs YES ompetitive 10/28/2023| 11/16/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024|  GoP 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Multi-Purpose

— Bidding

2 |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose Building Building

§ (Covered Court), Barangay Dita, Lemery,

©™  |Batangas

S CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

2 |PROGRAM (CSSP) -Basic Infrastructure Program

ﬁ (BIP) - Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to c Construction of

= |support Social Services-Construction cs YES ompetitive 11/09/2023| 11/28/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024|  GoP 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Multi-Purpose

— Bidding

2 |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose Building Building

§ (Covered Court), Barangay San Rafael, Calaca,

©™  |Batangas

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

8 |PROGRAM (CSSP) -Basic Infrastructure Program .

2 |(BIP)- Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilties to c Construction of

= “Purpose 95/ Fa cs YES ompetiive 11/30/2023| 12/19/2023| 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024|  GoP 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Multi-Purpose

© [support Social Services-Construction Bidding Buildin

S |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose Building in 9

§ Lucban National High School, Balayan, Batangas

g |CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

3 |PROGRAM (CSSP)-Basic Infrastructure Program

ﬁ (BIP)- Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to c Construction of

= |support Social Services-Construction cs YES "E;’};Z’}r‘:‘g”e 11/29/2023| 12/18/2023| 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024|  GoP 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Multi-Purpose

& |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose Building of Gov. Building

§ Feliciano Leviste Memorial High School, Lemery,

©™  |Batangas

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

% |PROGRAM (CSSP)-Basic Infrastructure Program .

2 |(BIP)- Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilties to c Construction of

= “Purpose 95/ Fa cs YES ompetiive 11/11/2023| 11/30/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024|  GoP 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Multi-Purpose

© [support Social Services-Construction Bidding Buildin

S |(Completion) of Multi-Purpose Building, 9

§ Barangay Maigsing Dahilig, Lemery, Batangas

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

L |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- .

& Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Competitive Construction of
P G i-|

= Social Services-Construction of Multi-Purpose &) NO Bidding 01/20/2024| 02/08/2023| 02/16/2024 | 02/23/2024 oP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Multi .Pu_rpose

3 Buildin

S |Buidling (Barangay Hall), Barangay Calan, 9

S |Balayan, Batangas

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

~ |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program - Multi- .

8 Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Social Competitive Construction of
P G i-|

\:D Services-Construction of Multi-Purpose Building &) YES Bidding 10/27/2023| 11/15/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024 oP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Mu:atLiI;’;:‘pose

S |(Barangay Hall), Barangay Dalima, Tuy, 9

S [Batangas

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

N |PROGRAM (CSSP) -Basic Infrastructure Program .

& (BIP)- Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to Competitive Construction of
B GoP . . i-

5 support Social Services-Construction of Multi- &) YES Bidding 11/11/2023| 11/30/2023| 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024 0 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Mu:atLiI;’;:‘pose

S |Purpose Building (Barangay Hall), Barangay 9

S [Real, Calatagan, Batangas

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

R |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program - Multi- .

& Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Social Competitive Construction of
o G . . i-|

5 Services-Construction of Multi-Purpose Building CS YES Bidding 10/14/2023| 11/03/2023| 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024 oP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Mug:lili’;rnpose

S |(Covered Court), Barangay Bunducan, Nasugbu, 9

8 Batangas

™M

o

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

E PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program - Multi- c - Construction of

S [Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Social cs YES "E,';j'j;n';”e 10/14/2023| 11/03/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024|  GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Multi-Purpose

& |Services-Construction of Multi-Purpose Building Building

§ (Covered Court), Barangay Rillo, Tuy, Batangas

™

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

{2 |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program - Multi- .

& |Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Social Competitive 01/26/2024 | 02/02/202: 950,000.00 950,000.00 ConsFructlon of

5 Services-Construction of Multi-Purpose Building cs YES Bidding 10/14/2023| 11/03/2023| 01/26/2024 02/02/2024 GoP 4,950,000 4,950,000 Mug:i};’;rnpose

S |(Covered Court), Barangay Sabang, Tuy, 9

8 Batangas

™

§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT

2 |PROGRAM (CSSP)-Basic Infrastructure Program .

< |(BIP)- Mult-Purpose Buildings/ Facilties to cs YES Competitve |14 555023 12/14/2023| 01/26/2024 | 02/02/2024| GoP | 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Cbsl)ﬂlst?-rgﬁtrwgsgf

T |support Social Services-Construction of Multi- Bidding PR PR Buil dinp

N |Purpose Building (Day Care Center), Barangay 9

§ Bihis, Taal, Batangas

o

é ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive

§ and Reliable National Road System-Asset Competitive February February February February Maintenance of

g Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- | MS NO Bid%ing 2024 2024 2024 2024 GoP 22,785,000.00 22,785,000.00 Road: Asphalt

S

o

=

™




CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-

Construction of

(S05012L7) - K0113 + 600 - K0114 + 000,
K0115 + 000 - K0116 + 400

Overlay

o
i=3
o
o
8
8 |public Water Supply System - Construction of | CS NO Competitve | February | February | February | February | o5 | 4950 000.00 4,950,000.00 Water Supply
é Public Water System, Barangay Lumbang na Buding 2024 2024 2024 2024 System
S |calzada, Calaca, Batangas
o
™M
8
S |CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
§ PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- " Februar Februa Februar Februar Construction of
8 |public Water Supply System-Construction of cs NO Competitive Y ry Y Y| cop | 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Water Supply
b= " . Bidding 2024 2024 2024 2024
S |Public Water System, Barangay Sinisian, Calaca, System
S |Batangas
o
™M
CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Competitive Construction of
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public cs NO Bidding 01/19/2024| 02/07/2024| March 2024 | March 2024 GoP 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00 Concrete Road
Buildings/ Facilities-Construction of Road,
Barangay Luntal, Tuy, Batangas
8
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
'g» and Reliable National Road System-Bridge c Februar Februa Replacement of
8 |Program-Replacement of Permanent Weak cs NO Eﬁ:;we 2024 Y 2024ry March 2024 | March 2024  GoP | 70,445,000.00 70,445,000.00 P Bridge
S |Bridges-Binambang Br. (B03048LZ) along
o
§ Balayan-Balibago Rd
o™
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
2 |and Reliable National Road System-Asset X
o ) : . Preventive
A Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- Competitive Maintenance of
S  |Secondary Roads -Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan Rd cs NO B,J:,.ng 01/19/2024| 02/07/2024| 02/15/2024| 02/19/2024 GoP 144,750,000.00 144,750,000.00 Road: Asphalt
S |(S05012LZ) - KO106 + 000 - K0106 + 500, '
o "
S |K0107 + 000 - K0108 + 000, KO112 + 000 - Overlay
™ [K0112 + 340, K0112 + 923 - K0113 + 600
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
% |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- .
E Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support cs NO Competitive 01/12/2024| 01/31/2024 02/08/2024| 02/14/2024 GoP 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Cﬁaﬁ_r:ﬁ?ogsgf
T |Social Services-Construction (Completion) of Bidding e e Purp
< : - Building
N |Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay 9, Balayan,
§ Batangas
8
3 |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
"D"" and Reliable National Road System-Asset c - Maintenance of
& |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- | CS YES e | 10/14/2023| 11/03/2023| 01/29/2024 02/02/2024| ~ GoP | 13,235,880.00 13,235,880.00 X
§ Secondary Roads - Balayan-Balibago Rd - KO111 aane Roag\;eltls:halt
S |+000- K111 + 401 Y
-
8
S ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
E and Reliable National Road System-Asset c " Maintenance of
S |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- | CS YES Ompertve | 11/09/2023| 11/28/2023( 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024|  GoP | 96,500,000.00 96,500,000.00
— Biddint .
S |Secondary Roads - Diokno Highway - K0079 + 9 Roag:l‘.I:rls;halt
S {000 - K008O + 600 Y
-
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
E and Reliable National Road System-Asset Preventive
— |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- Competitive Maintenance of
g Secondary Roads - Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan Rd - MS NO Bidding March 2024 | March 2024 | March 2024 | March 2024 GoP 14,700,000.00 14,700,000.00 Road: Asphalt
S |K0100 + 000 - K0100 + 500, KO101 + 269 - Overlay
= |ko101 + 562
™
8
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
‘§ and Reliable National Road System-Asset Compeit Maintenance of
S |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- | CS YES ompetitive 10/14/2023| 11/03/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024| GoP | 28,271,040.00 28,271,040.00 °
= N | Bidding Road: Asphalt
S Secondary Roads - Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan Rd -| Overlay
S K0100 + 500 - K0101 + 244
™
8
Q2 |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
E and Reliable National Road System-Asset c B Maintenance of
S |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- | MS YES ompetitve 11/22/2023| 12/11/2023| 02/01/2024| 02/08/2024| GoP | 144,750,000.00 144,750,000.00
I Secondary Roads - Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan Rd | Buading Road: Asphalt
o
S |K0102 + 000 - K0103 + 200 Overlay
-
8
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
E and Reliable National Road System-Asset c Maintenance of
S |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- | MS YES ompetitive 10/14/2023| 11/03/2023| 01/26/2024 | 02/02/2024|  GoP 14,347,200.00 14,347,200.00
8 Secondary Roads - Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan Rd | Buding Road: Asphalt
o
S |K0124 + 000 - K0124 + 746 Overlay
-
§ ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
é and Reliable National Road System-Asset Preventive
— |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- Competitive GoP Maintenance of
% Secondary Roads -Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan Rd cs NO Bidding 01/20/2024| 02/08/2023| 02/20/2024 | 02/23/2024 of 144,750,000.00 144,750,000.00 Road: Asphalt
g
=
™




§ ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
12 |and Reliable National Road System-Asset .
8 |Preservation Program-Construction/ Upgrading/ Competitive Construction of
% Rehabilitation of Drainage along National Roads Cs NO Bidding 01/20/2024| 02/08/2023| 02/16/2024| 02/23/2024|  GoP 43,120,000.00 43,120,000.00 Dral;?)ie it;:zture
o |- Secondary Roads - Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan 9
E Rd - K0106 + 200 - K0107 + 621
S ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 2 : Protect Lives
3 |and Properties Against Major Floods-Flood
§ Management Program-Construction/ c " Construction of
= |Maintenance of Flood Mitigation Structures and | CS YES Sdng | 11/30/2023| 12/19/2023| 01/26/2024| 02/02/2024|  GoP | 19,600,000.00 19,600,000.00 | Flood Mitigation
S |Drainage Systems-Construction of Palico RIS Structure
é’ Water Management Flood Control Project of
©  [Palico River, Lian, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
@ |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
in ) - -
N [Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support C tit Februar Februal Februal Februal X
= [social Senvices-Constraction (Completiom of | € NO Biddng 004 | 2004 | 2004 | 2004 | ©° | 1980000.00 1,980,000.00 | Multi-Purpose
b : - Building
N |Multi-Purpose Building (Barangay Hall),
§ Barangay Palanas, Lemery, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
B |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP) - .
& |Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support s NO Competitive February February March 2024 | March 2024 2970,000.00 2970,000.00 C;/)Inlstr;ctlon of
— N 3 N N I arc| arcl GoP . . ulti-Purpose
~ Bidd /970, /970,
§ Socnz_al Services: an_structlon (Compl_etlon) of idding 2024 2024 Building
A |Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay , Lian,
S [Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
3 |PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
in ) - -
= |sota Senices Consiacton o mu-ppose | € | N0 | Cude” | Toe) | “aums | aeel |z | F | 495000000 [ 485000000 | Muli-Purpose
bed L
& |Building (Covered Court), Barangay 7, Balayan, Building
S [Batangas
CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Rehabilitation/
Socil SenveesRenabitaton o s purpose | 5 | N0 | T | "oma’ | ope [Merch2024|March 2024 con | 580000000 [ sso000000 | ELEEELC
Building, Barangay Poblacion 2, Nasugbu, Building
Batangas
8
S |LOCAL PROGRAM-National Building Program-
§ Buildings And Other Structures-Multipurpose / c - Februar Februa Construction of
& |Facilities-Construction (Completion) of DPWH | CS NO g Y "V | March 2024 | March 2024|  GoP | 49,500,000.00 49,500,000.00 ol
& |Batangas 1st DEO Office Building, Balayan, 9 2024 2024 Other Building
S |Batangas
o
oM
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
L |and Reliable National Road System-Asset "
> ) N . Preventive
A Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- Competitive Maintenance of
S |Secondary Roads -Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan Rd | CS NO Bid’;ing 01/23/2024| 02/13/2023| 02/21/2024| 02/26/2024| GoP | 144,750,000.00 144,750,000.00 Road: Asphalt
S |(S05012LZ) - KO116 + 400 - K0117 + 000, :
o "
S |KOL19 + 574 - K019 + 644, K0120 + 066 - Overlay
™ [K0122 + 000, K0123 + 000 - K0123 + 500
8
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
§ and Reliable National Road System-Asset c B Maintenance of
S |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- | CS NO ‘;’ﬂj‘;?:‘g"e 02/07/2024| 02/27/2024| 03/05/2024| 03/08/2024| GoP | 144,750,000.00 144,750,000.00 | "2 R
S |Secondary Roads -Palico-Balayan Batangas Rd O\IIerIap
S |(S01854L7) - K0116 + 000 - K0117 + 900 Y
™
S ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
S |and Reliable National Road System-Asset X
> ) : h Preventive
5} Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- Competiive Maintenance of
S [Secondary Roads -Palico-Balayan-Batangas Rd | CS NO Bid'jﬂng 01/25/2024| 02/14/2024| 02/22/2024| 02/27/2024| GoP | 144,750,000.00 144,750,000.00 | "o - Asphalt
= :
S |(S01854LZ) - K0102 + 000 - K0103 + 000,
S |KO111 + 000 - KO111 + 583, K114 + 468 - Overlay
™ [K0114 + 820
S ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
S |and Reliable National Road System-Asset ]
oS ) : h Preventive
5} Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- Competiive Maintenance of
S [Secondary Roads -Palico-Balayan-Batangas Rd | CS NO Bid'jﬂng 01/12/2024| 01/31/2024| 02/13/2024| 02/19/2024|  GoP | 144,750,000.00 [ 144,750,000.00 | 27" Asphalt
= :
S |(S01854LZ) - KO117 + 900 - K0118 + 603,
S |K0120 + 137 - KO121 + 096, K121 + 119 - Overlay
™ [K0121 + 234
S ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
S |and Reliable National Road System-Asset P .
3 - - . reventive
o Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- Competitive Maintenance of
S |Secondary Roads -Palico-Balayan-Batangas Rd | CS NO Bid%ing 02/03/2024| 02/22/2024| 03/05/2024| 03/08/2024| GoP | 144,750,000.00 144,750,000.00 | "~ Asphalt
= :
S |(S01854LZ) - KO121 + 479 - K0121 + 566,
S [K0122 +000 - KO122 + 500, K0126 + 000 - Overlay
™ [K0126 + 720, K0127 + 633 - K0128 + 100
8
S |ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe Preventive
g and Reliable National Road System-Asset " Maintenance of
S |Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance- | CS NO Competitve | 2/02/2024| 02/21/2024| 02/28/2024| 03/04/2024| GoP | 144,750,000.00 || 144,750,000.00 :
s Secondary Roads -Ternate-Nasugbu Rd Buding Road: Asphalt
I R -
S [(501859L7) - K0078 + 200 - K0OBL + 700 Overlay
™




310102101532000

ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
and Reliable National Road System-Asset
Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance-
Secondary Roads -Diokno Highway — K0077 +
780 — K0078 + 829, K0085 + 000 — K0086 +
520

MS

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

144,750,000.00

144,750,000.00

Preventive
Maintenance of
Road: Asphalt
Overlay

310102101535000

ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
and Reliable National Road System-Asset
Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance-
Secondary Roads -Nasugbu-Lian-Calatagan Rd -
K0106 + 500 - K0107 + 000, K0110 + 000 -
K0111 + 491

MS

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

144,750,000.00

144,750,000.00

Preventive
Maintenance of
Road: Asphalt
Overlay

310102101544000

ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
and Reliable National Road System-Asset
Preservation Program-Preventive Maintenance-
Secondary Roads -Asphalt Overlay Along Diokno
Highway, Batangas (505796Lz) K0083+000-
K0085+000

MS

NO

Competitive
Bidding

01/27/2024

02/16/2024

02/27/2024

03/01/2024

77,200,000.00

77,200,000.00

Preventive
Maintenance of
Road: Asphalt
Overlay

310305102171000

ORGANIZATIONAL OUTCOME 1 : Ensure Safe
and Reliable National Road System-Bridge
Program-Widening of Permanent Bridges-Wawa
Br. 2 (B04377LZ) along Ternate-Nasugbu Rd

&)

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

16,415,000.00

16,415,000.00

Widening of
Permanent Bridges

300214101060000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM- Special Road Fund - Motor Vehicle
User's Charge (MVUC) as per R.A. 11239 -
Installation of Roadway Lighting Structures
along Ilustre Avenue, Lemery, Batangas

Cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

14,700,000.00

14,700,000.00

Installation of
Roadway Lighting

300214101061000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM- Special Road Fund - Motor Vehicle
User's Charge (MVUC) as per R.A. 11239 -
Installation of Roadway Lighting Structures
along Brgy. Natipuan, Nasugbu, Batangas

&)

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

12,205,900.00

12,205,900.00

Installation of
Roadway Lighting

300221104705000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities -Rehabilitation of Talisay-
Biga Road, Calatagan, Batangas

Cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

79,200,000.00

79,200,000.00

Rehabilitation of
Road

300221105687000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities- Construction of Road,
Barangay Luyahan, Lian, Batangas

&)

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

4,950,000.00

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Road

300221105688000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities- Construction of Road,
Barangay Cahil, Calaca, Batangas

Cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

01/23/2024

02/13/2024

02/21/2024

02/27/2024

4,950,000.00

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Road

300221105689000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities- Construction of Road in
Barangay Gimalas, Balayan, Batangas

Cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

02/01/2024

02/20/2024

02/28/2024

03/05/2024

4,950,000.00

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Road

300221105691000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities-Construction of Duhatan-
Tanggoy Bridge including Approaches, Balayan,
Batangas

cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

24,750,000.00

24,750,000.00

Construction of
Bridge including
Approaches

300221105692000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities-Construction of Road,
Barangay Cultihan, Taal, Batangas

Cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

01/27/2024

02/16/2024

02/24/2024

03/01/2024

4,950,000.00

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Road

300221105693000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities-Rehabilitation of Road,
Barangay Lanatan, Balayan, Batangas

cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

4,950,000.00

4,950,000.00

Rehabilitation of
Road

300221105694000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities-Construction of Road with
Slope Protection, Taal, Batangas

cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

9,900,000.00

9,900,000.00

Construction of
Road with Slope
Protection




300221105695000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities-Construction (Completion)
of Road, Barangay Maugat, Nasugbu Batangas

(&3

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

1,980,000.00

1,980,000.00

Construction
(Completion) of
Road

300221105696000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities-Construction of Road, Brgy.
San Isidro Itaas, Lemery, Batangas

Cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

14,850,000.00

14,850,000.00

Construction of
Road

300221105697000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities-Improvement of
Intersection Road, Balayan Rotonda, Balayan,
Batangas

&)

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

21,780,000.00

21,780,000.00

Improvement of
Intersection Road

300221105698000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities- Construction (Completion)
of Road, Brgy. Paraiso-Luya, Calatagan,
Batangas

&)

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

19,800,000.00

19,800,000.00

Construction
(Completion) of
Road

300221105699000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities-Construction of Road, Brgy.
Caloocan, Balayan, Batangas

&)

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

9,900,000.00

9,900,000.00

Construction of
Road

300221105700000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities-Rehabilitation of Road
(Asphalt Overlay) along Vizconde and Rodriguez
St., Calaca, Batangas

cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

9,900,000.00

9,900,000.00

Rehabilitation of
Road

300221105701000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities- Concreting of Road, Brgy.
1, 2, 3 and 4, Calatagan, Batangas

cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

February
2024

14,850,000.00

14,850,000.00

Concreting of Road

300221105702000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities -Construction of Road, Brgy.
Butucan, Nasugbu, Batangas

cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

9,900,000.00

9,900,000.00

Construction of
Road

300221105703000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities- Rehabilitation of Tuy
Circumferential Road (Putol-Malibu Road
Section), Tuy, Batangas

&)

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

14,850,000.00

14,850,000.00

Rehabilitation of
Road

300221105704000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities- Construction of Road, Brgy.
2, Calatagan, Batangas

Cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

4,950,000.00

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Road

300221105705000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities- Construction of R.C.
Bridge, Damiana River, Brgy. Calantas, Calaca,
Batangas (Phase 2)

Cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

19,800,000.00

19,800,000.00

Construction of
Bridge

300221105706000

CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM-Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National
Road/s leading to Major/ Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities -Construction of Road,
Barangay Calzada, Balayan, Batangas

cs

NO

Competitive
Bidding

February
2024

February
2024

March 2024

March 2024

4,950,000.00

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Road




CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Flood Mitigation Structures protecting

Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilties- cs NO Competiive | February | February |\, p 5004 | March 2024| cop | 148,500,000.00 | | 148,500,000.00 | Renabilitation of
I ! Bidding 2024 2024 Slope Protection
Rehabilitation of Slope Protection Structure
along Lian River, Lian Side (Downstream), Lian,
Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
§ PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
— |Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Competitive February February GoP
E Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities- e NO Bidding 2024 2024 March 2024 | March 2024 © #950,000.00 #950,000.00 FIOS(;SUE& r:terol
S [Construction of Flood Control Structure, Taal,
& |Batangas Phase 1
o
S CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
S |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
i o N
o |Flood Mitigation Structures protecting - .
S | Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities- cs NO Compettive | - February | February |y o 5024 | March 2024| Gop | 19,800,000.00 || 19,800,000.00 | COnstruction of
by N . Bidding 2024 2024 Drainage System
&Q [Construction of Drainage System, Government
S |Center Site, Barangay Caloocan, Balayan,
o
™ |Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
§ PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
— |Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Competitive February February GoP
2 [Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities- © No Bidding 2024 2004 | March 2024 March 2024) G0 14,850,000.00 |58} 14,850,000.00 F";‘zfugt%r:tem'
& [Construction of Flood Control Structure,
§ Barangay Balanga, Lemery, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
§ PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
— |Flood Mitigation Structures protecting Competitive February February GoP Construction of
E Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities- e NO Bidding 2024 2024 March 2024 March 2024 © 14,850,000.00 14,850,000.00 Drainage System
& |Construction of Drainage System, Brgy. Iba,
§ Taal, Batangas
8
S |CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
§ PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- c " Februar Februa Construction of
S |Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Ccs NO %E’;?:‘g"e 2024 Y 2024ry March 2024 | March 2024 GoP 99,000,000.00 99,000,000.00 Multi-Purpose
& |Social Services- Construction of Multi-Purpose Building
g Building, Nasugbu, Batangas
™
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
& |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- .
& Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Competitive February February Construction of
o GoP . . i-|
= |Sodial Services- Construction of the Multi- Cs NO Bidding 2024 2024 March 2024 | March 2024 ol 19,800,000.00 19,800,000.00 Multi lP\{rpose
2 " Building
N |Purpose Building, Barangay 4, Calatagan,
§ Batangas
g |CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
L |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
E Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support " Februar Februa Construction of
S [Social Services- Completion of the Multi- cs NO Ry ooa | 209q | March 2024 | March 2024|  cop | 19,800,000.00 | 19,800,000.00 |  Multi-Purpose
& |Purpose Building (Municipal Building North Building
g Wing), Barangay Carsuche, Taal, Batangas
©  [(Phase 2)
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
& |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- .
& Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Competitive February February Construction of
o GoP . . i-|
g Social Services- Construction of Multi-Purpose cs NO Bidding 2024 2024 March 2024 | March 2024 0 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00 Mu:st:]i}l):;ill—'\pose
& |Building (Nasugbu Sports Center), Nasugbu, 9
§ Batangas (Phase 2)
8
S |CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
™M : .
in |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- - Construction of
S [Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support cs NO Competitive February | February |y, 2024  March 2024|  Gop 29,700,000.00 29,700,000.00 Multi-Purpose
= 3 3 . ; Bidding 2024 2024 -
£ |Social Services- Construction of Multi-Purpose Building
§ Building, Brgy. Lucsuhin, Calatagan, Batangas
™
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
@ |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Completion of the
< Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Competitive February February N
o GoP . . -
= Sodial Services- Completion of the Multi- cs NO Bidding 2024 2024 March 2024 | March 2024 o 14,850,000.00 14,850,000.00 Multi .Pu_rpose
2 L Building
N |Purpose Building, Barangay Carsuche, Taal,
§ Batangas, Phase 2
8
S |CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
< 9 .
in |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
S Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support CS NO c‘gi"d%ei:;"e Fezbl;;‘a‘w Fe;;;:ry March 2024 | March 2024 GoP 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00 Multi-Purpose
2 |Social Services- Construction of Multi Purpose Building
§ Building, Brgy. Rillo, Tuy, Batangas
™
8
Q  |CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
<+ 9 .
in |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
S Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support CS NO c‘gi"d%ei:;"e Fezbl;;‘a‘w Fe;;;:ry March 2024 | March 2024 GoP 19,800,000.00 19,800,000.00 Multi-Purpose
2 |Social Services- Construction of Multi Purpose Building
§ Building, Brgy. Rillo, Tuy, Batangas (Phase 2)
™
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CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support

Competitive

February

February

Construction of

Maintenance

GoP . . i-|
Social Services- Construction of Multi-Purpose e NO Bidding 2024 2024 March 2024 March 2024 © 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00 Mug:”};’;;pose
Building (Nasugbu Sports Complex), Nasugbu, 9
Batangas (Phase 1)
o
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
E PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- - Februar Februa Rehabilitation of
= |Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support cs NO Compeitive ¥ ™| March 2024| March 2024|  GoP | 19,800,000.00 19,800,000.00 |  Multi-Purpose
beed N . P . Bidding 2024 2024 o
& |Social Services- Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Building
g Building, Tuy, Batangas
™M
o
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
E PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- " Februar Februa Construction of
= |Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support cs NO Compeitive ¥ "' | March 2024| March 2024|  GoP | 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00 Multi-Purpose
beed N . N N Bidding 2024 2024 o
& |Social Services- Construction of Multi-Purpose Building
g Hall, Brgy. Humayingan, Lian, Batangas
™M
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
¥ |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- .
@ Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support cs NO Competitive February February March 2024 | March 2024 GoP 19.800,000.00 19.800,000.00 Cﬁgif_r:udrlogsgf
T |Social Services- Construction of Multi-Purpose Bidding 2024 2024 A A Buil dinp
N |Building (Nasugbu Sports Complex), Nasugbu, 9
§ Batangas (Phase 3)
8
KL |CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
E PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- c - Februar Februa Construction of
—  |Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support CS NO ompetiive Y "Y' | March 2024 | March 2024 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Multi-Purpose
bl ) 3 . ) . Bidding 2024 2024 -
& |Social Services- Construction of Multipurpose in Building
g Brgy. Baclaran, Balayan, Batangas
™M
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
§ PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
~  [Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Competitive February February February February GoP Completion of Multi-
g Social Services- Completion of Multi-Purpose e NO Bidding 2024 2024 2024 2024 © 2,970,000.00 2,970,000.00 Purpose Building
& |Building (Barangay Hall), Barangay Gulod,
§ Lemery, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
§ PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
~  [Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Competitive February February February February GoP iy
2 |Social Services- Construction of Multi-Purpose | *> NO Bidding 2024 2024 2024 2024 © 4950,000.00 4950,000.00 M“gtif;rnp‘)se
& |Building (Covered Court), Barangay Putat, 9
§ Nasugbu, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
E PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
~  [Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Competitive February February February February GoP iy
2 |Social Services- Construction of Multi-Purpose | *> NO Bidding 2024 2024 2024 2024 © 4950,000.00 4950,000.00 M“gtif;rnp‘)se
& |Building (Covered Court), Barangay Seiran, 9
§ Taal, Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
n |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)-
< Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support Competitive February February Completion of Multi-
o GoP . .
E, Social Services- Completion of Multi-Purpose e NO Bidding 2024 2024 March 2024 | March 2024 © 1,980,000.00 1,980,000.00 Purpose Building
§ Building (Covered Court), Barangay Guinhawa,
S  [Tuy, Batangas
™
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
& |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
& Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support cs NO Competitive February February March 2024 | March 2024 GoP 21.780.000.00 21.780.000.00 Multi Purpose
T |Social Services- Construction of Multi Purpose Bidding 2024 2024 e e Buil dinp
& |Building, Brgy. Lumbang Calzada, Calaca City, 9
§ Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
3 |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
& Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to support cs NO Competitive February February March 2024 | March 2024 GoP 9.900,000.00 9.900,000.00 Multi Purpose
T |Social Services- Construction of Multi-Purpose Bidding 2024 2024 A A Buil dinp
& |Building in Barangay Humayingan, Lian, 9
§ Batangas
§ CONVERGENCE AND SPECIAL SUPPORT
in |PROGRAM -Basic Infrastructure Program (BIP)- Construction of
o |Major/Strategic Public Buildings/Facilities Competitive February February s X
g Structural and Resilience Program- Construction s NO Bidding 2024 2024 March 2024 | March 2024 P #950,000.00 #950,000.00 Muglljil:;i:‘pose
S |of Multi-Purpose Building (Evacuation Center), 9
§ Brgy. Humayingan, Lian, Batangas
o
i=3
o
~
= X
o . . _ Supply of Materials
§  |Supply of Materials for Road Maintenance Ms NO Competive | - /01/2024| 02/20/2024| 02/27/2024| 02/20/2024|  GoP 2,669,354.10 2,669,354.10|for Road
S |Premix Patching Bituminous Pavements Bidding Maintenance
[=]
i=3
o
o
~N
8
o
R
=] X . Supply of Materials
©  [Supply of Materials for Road Maintenance - Competitive
g Penetrating Patching Bituminious Pavements MS NO Bidding 02/01/2024| 02/20/2024| 02/27/2024| 02/29/2024|  GoP 504,000.00 504,000.00|for Road
8
i=3
o
o~




o
o
o
2 Supply of Material
o . . a upply of Materials
g |Supply of Materials for Road Maintenance Ms| N Competiive | 0/01/2024| 02/20/2024| 02/27/2024| 02/29/2024| ~ GoP 819,000.00 819,000.00 for Road
S |Sealing Bituminous Pavement idding Mai
S aintenance
o
o
o
o~
o
o
o
2 Supply of Material
= . . } " upply of Materials
g [Supply of Materials for Road Maintenance MS NO Competiive | 02/01/2024| 02/20/2024| 02/27/2024| 02/29/2024|  GoP 1,002,036.00 1,002,036.00|for Road
Z  |Centerline and Lane Line Repainting idding .
S Maintenance
8
o
o~
o
o
o
2 Supply of Material
o . . a upply of Materials
g |Supply of Materials for Road Maintenance Ms| N Competiive | 0/01/2024| 02/20/2024| 02/27/2024| 02/29/2024| ~ GoP 470,836.80 470,836.80| for Road
& |Resurfacing of Unpaved Shoulder idding Mai
=3 aintenance
o
o
o
o~
o
o
o
~
3
©  |Supply of Materials for Road Maintenance - Bridge Competitive Supply of Materials
S |Repainting MS NO i 02/01/2024| 02/20/2024| 02/27/2024| 02/29/2024|  GoP 414,225.00 414,225.00| E T Repainting
IS]
o
o
o~
o
o
o
2 Supply of Material
=] . . . upply of Materials
g [Supply of Materials for Road Maintenance Ms NO Competive | 50112024 02/20/2024| 02/27/2024] 02/29/2024|  Gop 472,500.00 472,500.00for Vegetation
& |Vegetation Control Bidding
S Control
o
o
o
o~
o
o
o
~
3 ) ) ! " ’
8 f,l‘;‘i’rft':n‘;fn"é':te”a's for Road Maintenance - Sign | g NO mg | 02/01/2024 02/20/2024( 02/27/2024| 02/29/2024|  GoP 499,611.00 499,611.00 f;pgi'y of Materials
z ignages
IS]
o
o
o~
o
o
o
= Supply of Material
= . . : - upply of Materials
g |Supply of Materials for Road Maintenance Ms NO Compettive | 02/01/2024| 02/20/2024| 02/27/2024| 02/29/2024|  GoP 455,280.00 455,280.00for Road
& |Guardrail Maintenance idding Mai
g aintenance
o
o
o
o~
Submitted by: Recommending Approval: Approved by:
- o
- c s |

Lo
MISHA( LWYN D. CASTILLO
Head, Procurément Unit

ARDO D. CALALO
BAC Chairperson

BEN“CIO A. AGUZAI

Officer-in-Charge

Office of the District Engineer




Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS

BATANGAS 15t DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE
Brgy. Lanatan, Balayan, Batangas, Region IV-A
BAGONG PILIPINAS

CERTIFICATION

This is to certify that no Consulting Services project is to be procured by this Office due to un-

availability of funds.

This certification is issued this 9" day of January 2024, for whatever purpose it may serve.

Prepared by:

MISHAB?ZTM D. CASTILLO
d

Head, BAC Secretariat

Noted:

._\ \
BENCIO A. AGUZAR
Officer-in-Charge
Office of the District Engineer

‘*«ﬁ" Al’l();q‘

G 1SO 2001

SOCOTEC

+,

CERTFICAr

(®Website: https://www.dpwh.gov.ph
&Tel. No.: +43 703 0004




