(DPWH South Cotabato 1st District Engineering Office, General Santos City) Final Annual Procurement Plan Updated for FY 2024

for Civil Works, Goods and Services (APP Non-CSE)

(June 30, 2024)

Remarks
(brief description of
Project)

Retrofitting/
Strengthening of
Bridges

Construction of
Concrete Revetment

Construction of
Concrete Slope
Protection

Construction of Road
with Drainage System

Construction of Road
with Drainage System

Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Early Source
Code Procurement PMO/ Procurement Mode of of
(PAP) Project End-User Activity? Procurement | xqyerti o
Y7 vertisement/P | Submission/Op ) Contract Funds
(Yes/No) osting of IB/REI | ening of Bids Notice of Award Signing Total MOOE co
CIVIL
24MB0001-Retrofitting/
310303|Strengthening of Permanent Construction Competitive
101825|Bridges-London Br. Section YES Biddi':l 01-12-2023 | 21-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 9,800,000.00 9,800,000.00
000 |[(B01026MN) along Makar- 9
Kiamba Rd.
24MB0002-Construction of
320102|Concrete Revetment, Upper Construction Competitive
106706 |Silway Bridge, Silway River, - YES omp 01-12-2023 | 21-12-2023 | 20-02-2024 | 29-02-2024 | GoP 69,962,500.00 69,962,500.00
Section Bidding
000 [Barangay Apopong, General
Santos City
24MB0003-Construction of San
820101 Jose CIS Protection Works Construction Competitive
112256 - ' . YES omp 29-11-2023 | 18-12-2023 | 19-02-2024 | 29-02-2024 | GoP 14,700,000.00 14,700,000.00
General Santos City, South Section Bidding
000
Cotabato
24MB0004-Construction of
800221 Road with Drainage System Construction Competitive
106947 g€ Sy ’ - YES omp 10-11-2023 | 29-11-2023 | 31-01-2024 | 12-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00
000 Barangay Conel, General Section Bidding
Santos City, South Cotabato
24MB0005-Construction of
800221 Road with Drainage System Construction Competitive
104492 ge Sy ' - NO omp 07-02-2024 | 26-02-2024 | 20-03-2024 | 02-04-2024 | GoP 14,850,000.00 14,850,000.00
000 Barangay Labangal, General Section Bidding
Santos City, South Cotabato
24MB0006-Construction of
800221 Road with Drainage System Construction Competitive
104492 1ge Sy ’ - YES omp 10-11-2023 | 29-11-2023 | 31-01-2024 | 12-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00
000 Barangay San Isidro, General Section Bidding

Santos City, South Cotabato

Construction of Road
with Drainage System




4,950,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

300221|24MB0007-Construction of Construction Competitive
106961 |Road, Barangay Cannery Site, - YES ) .p 10-11-2023 | 31-01-2024 | 12-02-2024 |Feb 12, 2024| GoP 4,950,000.00
S Section Bidding
000 [Municipality of Polomolok
, 24MB0008-Construction of
30022 Road, Purok Yungco, Barangay| Construction Competitive
110695 - ngco, gay - YES omp 23-11-2023 | 12-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
9000 Poblacion, Municipality of Section Bidding
Polomolok, South Cotabato
24MB0009-Construction of
300221 Road, Purok Norcos, Barangay | Construction Competitive
106958 - S gay - YES omp 10-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 Poblacion, Municipality of Section Bidding
Polomolok, South Cotabato
24MB0010-Construction of
800221 Road, Purok Kalayaan Construction Competitive
106957 ' tyaan, - YES omp 10-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 Barangay Poblacion, Section Bidding
Polomolok, South Cotabato
24MB0011-Construction of
300221 |Road, Purok Hechanova, Construction Competitive
106956 |Barangay Poblacion, - YES omp 10-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
Lo Section Bidding
000 [Municipality of Polomolok,
South Cotabato
24MB0012-Construction of
800221 Road, Purok 4, Baranga Construction Competitive
106955 ' ! gay - YES omp 23-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 Koronadal Proper, Municipality Section Bidding
of Polomolok, South Cotabato
24MB0013-Construction of
800221 Road, Barangay Polonulin Construction Competitive
106954 | 0a¢: Barangay 7o 9 : YES [ZoMP 23-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
Municipality of Tupi, South Section Bidding
000
Cotabato
24MB0014-Construction of
800221 Road, Barangay Pagalungan Construction Competitive
106953/ 0a¢, Barangay Fagaungan, : YES [Z°MP 10-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 Municipality of Polomolok, Section Bidding
South Cotabato
24MB0015-Construction of
300221 |Road Block 0 and 1 of Purok Construction Competitive
106941 |Bagtindon, Barangay - YES omp 10-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
27 Section Bidding
000 [Magsaysay, Municipality of

Polomolok, South Cotabato

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

4,950,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road




300226
115966
000

24MB0016-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building
(Covered Court), Palian
Elementary School, Barangay
Palian, Tupi, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

23-11-2023

05-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

300226
115968
000

24MB0017-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building
(Covered Court), Purok
Eustaquio Salada, Barangay
Poblacion, Municipality of
Polomolok, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

23-11-2023

12-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

Construction of Multi-

300226
115969
000

24MB0018-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building
(Covered Court), Purok
Moninio, Barangay Glamang,
Municipality of Polomolok,
South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

01-12-2023

21-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

300226
115960
000

24MB0019-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building
(Covered Court), Barangay
Bula, General Santos City

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

23-11-2023

21-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

300226
115961
000

24MB0020-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building
(Covered Court), Barangay
Dadiangas South, General
Santos City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2023

05-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

300204
101635
000

24MB0021-Construction/
Improvement of Access Roads
leading to Trades, Industries
and Economic Zones (Roads
Leveraging Linkages for
Industry and Trade
Infrastructure Program - ROLL-
IT), Jainal Abedin St., Brgy
Buayan Road in support to in
support to Milkfish, Salt,
Coconut, and Banana
Industries, General Santos
City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

29-11-2023

18-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

22,050,000.00

4,950,000.00 Purpose Building

4.950,000.00 Constructlop qf Multi-
Purpose Building

4.950,000.00 Constructlor_} qf Multi-
Purpose Building

4,950,000.00 Constructlor_} Qf Multi-
Purpose Building

4.950,000.00 Construction of Multi-

Purpose Building

300226
115964
000

24MB0022-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building
(Covered Court), Barangay
Tinagacan, General Santos
City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2023

05-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

22,050,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

4,950,000.00

Construction of Multi-
Purpose Building




24MB0023-Construction of

Construction of Multi-

300226 |Multi-Purpose Building Construction Competitive
115963 |(Covered Court), Barangay - YES . .p 10-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
- . Section Bidding
000 |Sinawal, General Santos City,
South Cotabato
24MB0024-Construction of
300226 |Multi-Purpose Building Construction Competitive
115962 |(Covered Court), Barangay - YES omp 10-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
- : Section Bidding
000 [Ligaya, General Santos City,
South Cotabato
24MB0025-Construction of
300226 |Multi-Purpose Building Construction Competitive
109112((Covered Court), Barangay Section YES Bid di[rJ1 10-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 [Mabuhay, General Santos City, 9
South Cotabato
24MB0026-Construction of
800221 Access Road, Barangay San Construction Competitive
106943|, ' gay . - NO omp 06-03-2024 | 25-03-2024 | 22-04-2024 | 02-05-2024 | GoP 9,900,000.00
Isidro, General Santos City, Section Bidding
000
South Cotabato
24MB0027-Construction of
800221 Road with Drainage System Construction Competitive
106950 Hnage Sy ’ - NO omp 06-03-2024 | 25-03-2024 | 22-04-2024 | 02-05-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 Barangay Fatima, General Section Bidding
Santos City, South Cotabato
24MB0028-Construction of
800221 Road with Drainage System Construction Competitive
106949 ge Sy ’ u YES omp 10-11-2023 | 29-11-2023 | 31-01-2024 | 12-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 Barangay San Jose, General Section Bidding
Santos City, South Cotabato
24MB0029-Construction of
300221 |Road with Drainage System, Construction Competitive
106950(|Barangay Upper Labay, Section YES Bid di?l 23-11-2023 | 12-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 [General Santos City, South 9
Cotabato
24MBO0030-Construction of
800225 Drainage System, Baranga Construction Competitive
102245 ge >y . gay - YES omp 10-11-2023 | 29-11-2023 | 31-01-2024 | 12-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
Baluan, General Santos City, Section Bidding
000
South Cotabato
24MB0031-Construction of
800225 Drainage System, Baranga Construction Competitive
102247|2rainage system, gay ) vyEs |ZOMP 10-11-2023 | 29-11-2023 | 31-01-2024 | 12-02-2024 | GoP 9,900,000.00
000 Dadiangas East, General Section Bidding

Santos City, South Cotabato

4,950,000.00 Purpose Building
4,950,000.00 Constructlop qf Multi-
Purpose Building
4,950,000.00 Construct|or_1 qf Multi-
Purpose Building
Construction of
9,900,000.00 Concrete Road
Construction of
4,950,000.00 Concrete Road with
drainage
Construction of Road
4,950,000.00 with Drainage System
Construction of Road
4,950,000.00 with Drainage System
4.950,000.00 Coqstructlon of
Drainage System
9,900,000.00 Construction of

Drainage System




300225
102248
000

24MB0032-Construction of
Drainage System, Barangay
Dadiangas North, General
Santos City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2023

29-11-2023

31-01-2024

12-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

300221
106951
000

24MB0033-Construction of
Road, Barangay Batomelong,
General Santos City, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2023

29-11-2023

31-01-2024

12-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

Construction of

300221
106952
000

24MB0034-Construction of
Road, Barangay City Heights,
General Santos City, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2023

29-11-2023

31-01-2024

12-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

300226
115945
000

24MB0035-Construction of
Road, Barangay Labangal,
General Santos City, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-07-2024

05-08-2024

20-08-2024

02-09-2024

GoP

19,800,000.00

4,950,000.00 Drainage System
Construction of

4,950,000.00 Concrete Road

4.950,000.00 Construction of Multi-

Purpose Building

300221
106960
000

24MB0036-Improvement of
Road, Barangay Dadiangas
West, General Santos City,
South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

23-11-2023

18-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

19,800,000.00

Construction of Multi-
Purpose Building

300226
115975
000

24MB0037-Construction
(Completion) of School Multi-
Purpose Building
(Gymnasium), Palkan
Elementary School, Barangay
Palkan, Polomolok, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

23-11-2023

18-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

1,980,000.00

Construction of

300226
115976
000

24MB0038-Construction
(Completion) of Multi-Purpose
Building (Covered Court),
Kalyong, Barangay Landan,
Municipality of Polomolok,
South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

23-11-2023

18-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

1,980,000.00

300226
115952
000

24MB0039-Construction
(Completion) of Multi-Purpose
Building (Covered Court),
Barangay Buayan, General
Santos City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

23-11-2023

18-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

2,970,000.00

300226
115953
000

24MB0040-Construction
(Completion) of Multi-Purpose
Building (Covered Court),
Barangay Lagao, General
Santos City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2023

05-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

4,950,000.00 Concrete Road
1,980,000.00 Constructlop qf Multi-
Purpose Building
1,980,000.00 Constructlor_} Qf Multi-
Purpose Building
2.970,000.00 Constructlop qf Multi-
Purpose Building
4,950,000.00 Construction of Multi-

Purpose Building




300226
115955
000

24MB0041-Construction
(Completion) of Multi-Purpose
Building (Covered Court),
Barangay Olympog, General
Santos City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

23-11-2023

05-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

2,970,000.00

300226
115956
000

24MB0042-Construction
(Completion) of Multi-Purpose
Building (Covered Court),
Barangay Siguel, General
Santos City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

23-11-2023

12-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

2,970,000.00

Construction of Multi-

300226
115957
000

24MB0043-Construction
(Completion) of Multi-Purpose
Building, Barangay Fatima,
General Santos City, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

23-11-2023

12-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

2,970,000.00

300215
105127
000

24MB0044-Construction of
Buayan RIS MC-1 Service
Road, (KATUBIGAN- Kalsada
Tungo sa Patubigan), General
Santos City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

29-11-2024

18-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

9,800,000.00

300215
105128
000

24MB0045-Construction of
Siluay RIS MC-1 Service Road,
(KATUBIGAN- Kalsada Tungo
sa Patubigan) General Santos
City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

29-11-2024

18-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

9,800,000.00

300226
115965
000

24MB0046-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building
(Covered Court), Lunen
Elementary School, Lunen,
Tupi, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2024

05-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

300226
115967
000

24MB0047-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building
(Covered Court), Purok 7,
Barangay Sulit, Municipality of
Polomolok, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2024

05-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

300226
115971
000

24MB0048-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building,
Barangay Apopong, General
Santos City, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2024

05-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

2,970,000.00 Purpose Building
2.970,000.00 Constructlor_l qf Multi-
Purpose Building
2.970,000.00 Constructlop qf Multi-
Purpose Building
Construction of
9,800,000.00 Concrete Road
Construction of
9,800,000.00 Concrete Road
4.950,000.00 Constructlop qf Multi-
Purpose Building
4.950,000.00 Constructlor_l qf Multi-
Purpose Building
4.950,000.00 Construction of Multi-

Purpose Building




24MB0049-Construction of

4,950,000.00

Construction of Multi-
Purpose Building

47,520,000.00

Construction of Multi-
Purpose Building

Construction of Multi-

800226 Multi-Purpose Buildin Construction Competitive
115972 P 9: ) YES | oMP 23-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 Barangay Calumpang, General Section Bidding
Santos City, South Cotabato
24MB0050-Construction of
300225 Multi-Purpose Building, Construction Competitive
102247 |Barangay Dadiangas East, Section NO Bid di’; 01-02-2024 | 26-02-2024 | 02-04-2024 | 12-04-2024 | GoP 47,520,000.00
000 [General Santos City, South 9
Cotabato
24MB0051-Construction of
800226 Multi-Purpose Buildin Construction Competitive
115973 P 9 - YES omp 10-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 Barangay Tambler, General Section Bidding
Santos City, South Cotabato
24MB0052-Rehabilitation of
300226 |Multi-Purpose Building Construction Competitive
115974 |(Covered Court), Barangay - YES omp 10-11-2023 | 05-12-2023 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
- Section Bidding
000 [Bula, General Santos City,
South Cotabato
24MB0053-Construction of
800221 Road with Drainage System Construction Competitive
106945 . g€ Sy ’ - NO omp 06-03-2024 | 25-03-2024 | 22-04-2024 | 02-05-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 Barangay Siguel, General Section Bidding
Santos City, South Cotabato
24MB0054-Construction of
300226 Multipurpose Buildin Construction Competitive
115943 purp 9 - NO omp 30-04-2024 | 21-05-2024 | 13-06-2024 | 24-06-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
Barangay Mabuhay, General Section Bidding
000 .
Santos City
24MBO0055-Construction of
300226 |Multipurpose Building (Covered Construction Competitive
115949 Court), Barangay Calumpang, Section NO Bid di[; 01-02-2024 | 26-02-2024 | 20-03-2024 | 02-04-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
000 [General Santos City, South 9
Cotabato
24MBO0056-Construction of
300226 |Multi-Purpose Building Construction Competitive
115959 (Cooperative Training Center), - NO omp 06-03-2024 | 25-03-2024 | 17-04-2024 | 26-04-2024 | GoP 9,900,000.00
’ Section Bidding
000 |[Barangay Cannery Site,
Polomolok, South Cotabato
300226|24MB0057-Construction
115942|(completion) of Multi-Purpose
Building (Barangay Hall), Construction |y | COMPEULVE | 5 11 5053 | 18.12.0022 | 05-02-2024 | 15-02-2024 | GoP | 2,970,000.00
Barangay Lampitak, Section Bidding

Municipality of Tampakan,
South Cotabato

4,950,000.00 Purpose Building
4.950,000.00 Constructlor_} Qf Multi-
Purpose Building
Construction of
4,950,000.00 Concrete Road with
drainage
4,950,000.00 Constructlor_} Qf Multi-
Purpose Building
4,950,000.00 Constructlop qf Multi-
Purpose Building
9.900,000.00 Constructlop qf Multi-
Purpose Building
2.970,000.00 Construction of Multi-

Purpose Building




300226
115954
000

24MB0058-Construction
(Completion) of Multi-Purpose
Building (Covered Court),
Barangay Lambayong,
Municipality of Tampakan,
South Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

06-03-2024

25-03-2024

22-04-2024

02-05-2024

GoP

2,970,000.00

300226
115970
000

24MB0059-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building (Senior
Citizens and Women's),
Barangay Kipalbig, Municipality
of Tampakan, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

29-11-2023

18-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

4,950,000.00

2,970,000.00

Construction of Multi-
Purpose Building

310102
101659
000

24MB0060-Preventive
Maintenance - Secondary
Roads- Albert Morrow Blvd -
K1659 + (-600) - K1659 + 280,
K1659+280-K1659+345

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2023

29-11-2023

22-03-2024

01-04-2024

GoP

83,479,255.00

4,950,000.00

Construction of Multi-
Purpose Building

310102
101932
000

24MB0061-Preventive
Maintenance - Secondary
Roads- Makar-Kiamba Rd -
K1667 + 243 - K1667 + 254,
K1667 + 254 - K1667 + 393

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2023

29-11-2023

22-03-2024

31-03-2024

GoP

14,843,080.00

83,479,255.00

Asphalt Overlay

310111
100768
000

24MB0062-Construction/
Upgrading/ Rehabilitation of
Drainage along National Roads
- Secondary Roads-Makar-
Kiamba Rd - K1660 + 066 -
K1660 + 646

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

01-12-2023

21-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

24,931,200.00

14,843,080.00

Asphalt Overlay

310202
101784
000

24MB0063-Road Widening -
Secondary Roads-Albert
Morrow Blvd - K1650+878-
K1651+501

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

10-11-2023

29-11-2023

21-03-2024

31-03-2024

GoP

11,040,680.00

24,931,200.00

Construction of
Drainage

300204
101283
000

24MB0064-Construction/
Improvement of Access Roads
leading to Trades, Industries
and Economic Zones (Roads
Leveraging Linkages for
Industry and Trade
Infrastructure Program - ROLL-
IT)-Blagan-Datal Laguh San
Jose-Pao Pao Sinawal Road
connecting to Gensan
Diversion Road in support of
the Agribusiness industry,
General Santos City, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

YES

Competitive
Bidding

28-11-2023

12-12-2023

05-02-2024

15-02-2024

GoP

14,700,000.00

11,040,680.00

Road Widening

14,700,000.00

Construction of Road
Slip Protection




300226

24MB0065-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building,

14,850,000.00

Construction of Multi-
Purpose Building

96,500,000.00

Construction of Multi-
Purpose Building

9,900,000.00 Construction of Road
Construction of
9,900,000.00 Concrete Road
4,950,000.00 Constructlor_1 qf Multi-
Purpose Building
4.950,000.00 Constructlop qf Multi-
Purpose Building
3.960,000.00 Construction of Multi-

Purpose Building

115058 |Barangay Dadiangas West, | COnSTUCtion | g |COMPELVE | 1 55 2004 | 26-02-2024 | 03-03-2024 | 02-04-2024 | GoP |  14,850,000.00
- Section Bidding
000 [General Santos City, South
Cotabato
300105 24MB0066-Construction of
201227|PPWH South Cotabato 1st Construction No  |ComPetitive |, 080024 | 03-09-2024 | 17-09-2024 | 30-09-2024 | GoP 96,500,000.00
DEO Building, Tupi, South Section Bidding
000
Cotabato
24MB0067-Concreting of
300221 |Barangay Poblacion to DOLE Construction Competitive
106942 |Agri Area Barangay Cannery - NO . .p 30-04-2024 | 21-05-2024 | 05-06-2024 | 30-09-2024 | GoP 9,900,000.00
Section Bidding
000 [Road, Polomolok, South
Cotabato
24MB0068-Concreting of Road
300221 |from Barangay Crossing Construction Competitive
106946 |Rubber to Barangay Palian, Section NO Bid dipn 13-06-2024 | 02-07-2024 | 23-07-2024 | 03-08-2024 | GoP 9,900,000.00
000 [Tupi, South Cotabato, Sta. 9
0+000 - 0+760
300226 24MB0069-Construction of
11504g|Multi-Purpose Building (Tupi | Construction |\ |COMPettVe | 15 46 5054 | 02072024 | 23-07-2024 | 03-08-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
Mallengke), Tupi, South Section Bidding
000
Cotabato
300226 24MB0070-Construction of
115050 | Multi-Purpose Bullding (Kasfala | Construction |, - |COmpetitive | 45 o6 5094 | 02.07-2024 | 23-07-2024 | 03-08-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
Hall), Barangay Poblacion, Section Bidding
000
South Cotabato
24MB0071-Completion of Multi-
800226 Purpose Building in Bri Construction Competitive
115951 | UrPos g in Bray. ) NO omp 01-02-2024 | 26-02-2024 | 20-03-2024 | 02-04-2024 | GoP 3,960,000.00
Poblacion, Polomolok, South Section Bidding
000
Cotabato
24MB0072-Retrofitting/
310303|Strengthening of Permanent Construction Competitive
101826 |Bridges-Buayan Br. 2 Section NO Bid di'r)1 01-02-2024 | 26-02-2024 | 02-04-2024 | 12-04-2024 | GoP 29,400,000.00
000 |(B0O1887MN) along Buayan- 9
Glan Rd..
24MB0073-Construction of
300105|Multi-Purpose Building, PNP Construction Competitive
201486 |PRO 12, APOLE Building, . NO . 'p 30-04-2024 | 21-05-2024 | 20-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 GoP 9,800,000.00
Section Bidding
000 [Barangay Tambler, General

Santos City

29,400,000.00

Retrofitting/
Strengthening of
Bridge

9,800,000.00

Construction of Multi-
Purpose




24MB0074-Construction of
Multi-Purpose Building,

9,800,000.00

Construction of Multi-
Purpose

36,670,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road with
Drainage

11,580,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

24,750,000.00

Rehavilitation of
Water Supply

24,750,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Revetment

Construction of Multi-

800105 National Commission of Senior | Construction Competitive
201487 ... - NO omp 01-02-2024 | 26-02-2024 | 19-03-2024 | 02-04-2024 | GoP 9,800,000.00
Citizens, Barangay South Section Bidding
000 )
Dadiangas, General Santos
City
24MB0075-Concreting of Road
with Drainage including
800215 Facilities from junction Albert Construction Competitive
104118 ) - NO omp 13-06-2024 | 02-07-2024 | 23-07-2024 | 03-08-2024 | GoP 36,670,000.00
000 Morrow Blvd. to South Section Bidding
Cotabato San Isidro-Mabuhay
Bridge, Gneral Santos City
300215|24MB0076-Construction of Construction Competitive
104119|Roads in Prk. Balakayo, Brgy. - NO omp 13-06-2024 | 02-07-2024 | 23-07-2024 | 03-08-2024 | GoP 11,580,000.00
; Section Bidding
000 |Olympog, General Santos City
24MB0077-Rehabilitation of
800230\ Water Supply, Barangay Construction Competitive
100201 |Palkan —Barangay Lamcaliaf, - NO omp 17-07-2024 | 05-08-2024 | 20-08-2024 | 02-09-2024 | GoP 24,750,000.00
S Section Bidding
000 [Municipality of Polomolok,
South Cotabato
24MB0078-Construction of
300230|Flood Control Structure, Construction Competitive
100201 |(Concrete Revetment), Sinawal - NO omp 13-06-2024 | 02-07-2024 | 23-07-2024 | 03-08-2024 | GoP 24,750,000.00
. Section Bidding
000 [River, Barangay Labangal,
General Santos City
24MB0079-Construction of
300105|Multi-Purpose Building, PNP Construction Competitive
201488|Traffic Enforcement Unit - NO omp 30-04-2024 | 21-05-2024 | 13-06-2024 | 24-06-2024 | GoP 9,800,000.00
. Section Bidding
000 [Pendatun Avenue, Dadiangas
West, General Santos City
300230(24MB0080-Construction of Construction Competitive
100202 |Water System, Brgy. San Jose, - NO omp 14-08-2024 | 03-09-2024 | 17-09-2024 | 30-09-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
: Section Bidding
000 [General Santos City
300230(24MB0081-Construction of Construction Competitive
100203 |Water System, Brgy. Bawing, - NO omp 13-06-2024 | 02-07-2024 | 23-07-2024 | 03-08-2024 | GoP 4,950,000.00
: Section Bidding
000 [General Santos City

RAINWATER COLLECTOR
SYSTEM:

9,800,000.00
Purpose
4,950,000.00 Construction of Water
System
4,950,000.00 Construction of Water

System




24MB0088 - Construction of
Rainwater Collector System
(RWCS)

Construction
Section

a) Klolang Elementary School,
Barangay San Jose , General
Santos City

b)Almatac Elementary School,
Barangay Upper Labay,
General Santos City

c)Creek Integrated School,
Barangay Magsaysay,
Polomolok, South Cotabato

d)Lamcaliaf Elementary
School, Barangay Lamcaliaf,
Polomolok, South Cotabato

e)Miasong Elementary School,-
Emilio B. Escobillo Sr.
Elementary School, Barangay
Miasong, Tupi, South Cotabato

f)Juan Loreto Tamayo
Integrated School, Barangay
Miasong, Tupi, South Cotabato

g)Josol Elementary School,
Barangay Palo 19, Tampakan,
South Cotabato

h)Claudio-Delos Reyes
Elementary School, Barangay
Kipalbig, Tampakan, South
Cotabato

FARM TO MARKET ROAD:

Competitive
Bidding

13-06-2024

02-07-2024

23-07-2024

03-08-2024

2,895,000.00

230,473.66
393,553.30

576,924.37

413,763.26

2,895,000.00

2,895,000.00

230,473.66
393,553.30

576,924.37
413,763.26

2,895,000.00

Construction of Rain
Water Collector
System




14,925,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

9,950,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

29,850,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

14,925,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

24MB0082-Concreting of Brgy.
810203 Batomelong FMR, Br Construction Competitive
211084 g PV, Brgy. : NO omp 06-03-2024 | 25-03-2024 | 09-04-2024 | 02-05-2024 | GoP 14,925,000.00
000 Batomelong, General Santos Section Bidding
City
24MB0083-Concreting of Purok
310203 |1 B'Ov. Katangawan FMR, = Construction |y |ComPetitive | o6 o3 5024 | 25.03-2024 | 17-04-2024 | 26-04-2024 | GoP 9,950,000.00
211005 Brgy. Katangawan, General Section Bidding
Santos Cit
000 y
310203|24MB0084-Concreting of Brgy. Construction Competitive
211083|San Jose FMR Phase lIl, Brgy. . NO . _p 06-03-2024 | 25-03-2024 | 22-04-2024 | 02-05-2024 GoP 29,850,000.00
f Section Bidding
000 [San Jose, General Santos City
310203|24MB0085-Concreting of Brgy. Construction Competitive
211100|Upper Labay FMR, Brgy. Upper . NO . _p 06-03-2024 | 25-03-2024 | 22-04-2024 | 02-05-2024 GoP 14,925,000.00
. Section Bidding
000 [Labay, General Santos City
310203|24MB0086-Concreting of Brgy. Construction Competitive
211086 |Kablon FMR, Brgy. Kablon, . NO . .p 06-03-2024 | 25-03-2024 | 22-04-2024 | 02-05-2024 GoP 14,925,000.00
. Section Bidding
000 |Tupi, South Cotabato
24MB0087 - Concreting of Sitio
300204 Basak, Brgy. Polonuling FMR Construction Competitive
101542 » Broy. ¢ ng FIVIR, ) NO omp 30-04-2024 | 21-05-2024 | 13-06-2024 | 24-06-2024 | GoP 51,876,000.00
Brgy. Polonuling, Tupi, South Section Bidding
000
Cotabato
136,451,000.00
MAINTENANCE PROJECTS:
24MB0089-Repair/
Maintenance of OP Building
200000 |National Commission on Maintenance Competitive
100019 |Muslim Filipinos Provincial Section NO Biddi?lg 11-04-2024 | 30-04-2024 | 14-06-2024 | 01-07-2024 GoP 1,500,000.00

000

Office 12 - Main Building, Brgy.
Dadiangas East, General
Santos City

14,925,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Road

1500000

51,876,000.00

136,451,000.00

Construction of
Concrete Revetment

Repair/Maintenance
of Building




200000
100019
000

24MB0090-Repair/
Maintenance of Makar River
Revetment 1, General Santos
City, South Cotabato

Maintenance
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

11-04-2024

30-04-2024

23-05-2024

11-06-2024

GoP

7,000,000.00

7000000

200000
100020
000

24MB0091-Repair/
Maintenance of SC Building
Hall of Justice, Building Brgy.
Lagao, General Santos City

Maintenance
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

11-04-2024

30-04-2024

23-05-2024

11-06-2024

GoP

1,800,000.00

1800000

Repair/Maintenance
of Flood Control
Structure

200000
100019
000

24MB0112-Repair/
Maintenance of DILG Building
Traffic Enforcement Unit Office
Building Brgy. Dadiangas East,
General Santos City

Maintenance
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

11-04-2024

30-04-2024

23-05-2024

11-06-2024

GoP

1,500,000.00

1500000

Repair/Maintenance
of Building

200000
100019
000

24MB0113-Repair/
Maintenance of DILG Building
Bureau of Fire Protection
Archieve Building Brgy.
Dadiangas East, General
Santos City

Maintenance
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

11-04-2024

30-04-2024

23-05-2024

11-06-2024

GoP

1,500,000.00

1500000

Repair/Maintenance
of Building

200000
100019
000

24MB0114-Repair/
Maintenance of DILG Building
NBI Building (SARDO) Lagao,
General Santos City

Maintenance
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

11-04-2024

30-04-2024

23-05-2024

11-06-2024

GoP

700,000.00

700000

Repair/Maintenance
of Building

200000
100018
000

24MB0115-Cluster 1 - Work
Category 10-Pavement
Maintenance and Work
Category 12 Bridge
Maintenance

200000
100018
000

a) Cat. 10 - Act. 41X
(Emergency Project)
Replacement of Bituminous
Pavement along Marbel-Makar
Road - K1677+736-K1677+792

200000
100018
000

b) Cat. 12 - Act. 41X
(Emergency Project)/Act. 71X
(Special Project) - Act. 153 -
Repair to Concrete Bridge -
Act. 152 Patching Cocrete
Deck along Marbel-Makar
Road (Matin-ao Bridge) -
K1663+772.5-K1663+807.5

Maintenance
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

21-06-2024

10-07-2024

25-07-2024

04-08-2024

GoP

5,897,015.70

5897015.7

Repair/Maintenance
of Building

1,743,000.00

1743000

1,123,363.00

1123363

Asphalt Overlay




c) Cat. 10 - Act. 41X
(Emergency Project)/Act. 114 -
Replacement of Bituminous
Pavement along Makar-Marbel
Road (To Makar) S00243MN) -
k1657+725-k1657+755, Makar-
200000 |Kiamba Road (S00246mn) -
100018|k1658+-235) - k1658+(-35) &

000 |k1662+800 - k1662+880,
Filipino-American Friendship
Ave., (S01441MN) -
K1663+000-K1663+062.90 and
Digos-Makar Road
(S00229MN) - K1651+(-046) -
K1651+(-037)

.SCHOOL BUILDINGS:

24MB0092-Construction of 1-
Storey, 2-Classroom School
Building in Lambayong
Integrated School, Brgy.
Lambayong, Tampakan, South
Cotabato

300101
200001
000

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

09-07-2024

03-08-2024

GoP

3,030,651.80

4,975,000.00

24MB0093-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Batomelong
Elementary School, Barangay
Batomelong, General Santos
City, South Cotabato

300101
200001
000

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

26-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

24MB0094-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Florence Santos
High School, Barangay
Tinagacan, General Santos
City, South Cotabato

300101
200001
000

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

25-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

24MB0095-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Blagan Elementary
School, Barangay San Jose,
General Santos City, South
Cotabato

300101
200001
000

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

25-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

24MB0096-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Banwalan
Elementary School, Barangay
San Jose, General Santos City,
South Cotabato

300101
200001
000

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

25-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

3030651.8

Construction of 1-

4975000 Storey, 2 Classrooms
4975000 Stg?er;t;ugiggs?;c;s
4TS000 | Clssrooms
4975000 Stﬁfe”j trzugisgs?(f)olr-ns
4975000 Construction of 1-

Storey, 2 Classrooms




300101
200001
000

24MB0097-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Maligaya High
School, Barangay San Jose,
General Santos City, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

26-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

24MB0098-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Balnabo Elementary
School, Barangay San Jose,
General Santos City, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

26-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

Construction of 1-

300101
200001
000

24MB0099-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Datal Salvan High
School, Barangay San Jose,
General Santos City, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

26-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

24MB0100-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Lozano High
School, Barangay Sinawal,
General Santos City, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

27-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

24MB0101-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Tampakan SPED
Center, Barangay Poblacion,
Tampakan, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

25-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

24MB0102-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Sulit Elementary
School, Barangay Sulit,
Polomolok, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

25-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

24MB0103-Construction of 1-
Storey 2-Classroom School
Building in Cebuano
Elementary School-
Mambusong Extension,
Barangay Cebuano, Tupi,
South Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

13-06-2024

02-07-2024

23-07-2024

03-08-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

24MB0104-Construction of 1-
Storey, 2-Classroom School
Building in Polo Integrated
School, Brgy. Polo, Polomolok,
South Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

26-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

4975000 Storey, 2 Classrooms
TS0 |0 Ciaserooms
4975000 Stg:)en; trzug;tliggs?;:%S
4975000 Stﬁfe”j trzugizgs?;olrhs
aorsopo | Consieton of -
TS0 |10y 2 Ciassrooms
TS0 |1y 3 Classroons
4975000 Construction of 1-

Storey, 2 Classrooms




300101
200001
000

24MB0105-Construction of 1-
Storey, 2-Classroom School
Building in Polomolok Central
Elementary School, Brgy.
Poblacion, Polomolok, South
Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

25-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

24MB0106-Construction of 1-
Storey, 2-Classroom School
Building in Klinan Integrated,
Brgy. Klinan 6, Polomolok,
South Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

27-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

24MB0107-Construction of 1-
Storey, 2-Classroom School
Building in Crossing Palkan
Elementary School, Brgy.
Crossing Palkan, Polomolok,
South Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

26-06-2024

05-07-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

24MB0108-Construction of 1-
Storey, 2-Classroom School
Building in Lumakil Integrated
School, Brgy. Lumakil,
Polomolok, South Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

05-06-2024

08-07-2024

03-08-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

24MB0109-Construction of 1-
Storey, 2-Classroom School
Building in Kalyong Integrated
School - Amguo Extension,
Brgy. Landan, Polomolok,
South Cotabato

Construction
Section

NO

Competitive
Bidding

17-05-2024

02-07-2024

23-07-2024

03-08-2024

GoP

4,975,000.00

300101
200001
000

COM

300203
102539
000

24MB0110-Construction of 1-
Storey, 2-Classroom School
Building in Lunen Elementary
School - Saboy-Extension,
Brgy. Lunen, Tupi, South
Cotabato

23GMB0030-Supply of DPWH
Security Services requirements
for 5 Security Personnel for
deployment to DPWH South
Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City (January 1, 2024 to
March 31, 2024).

Construction
Section

Administrative
Section

NO

No

Competitive
Bidding

Competitive
Bidding

14-08-2024

03-09-2024

17-09-2024

30-09-2024

12-09-2023

18-12-2023

28-12-2023

29-12-2023

GoP

GoP

4,975,000.00

387,030.00

Construction of 1-

387030

4975000 Storey, 2 Classrooms
75000 | eerooms
4975000 St(;?en; t;“éﬁisgsféir}ns
475000 | eerooms
4975000 Stﬁf’e”j 2 Classrooms
4975000 Construction of 1-

Storey, 2 Classrooms




200000
100017
000

24GMBO0001- Equipment Lease
for use in the Maintenance
Section for 1st Quarter of CY
2024 from period of March 15-
May 2, 2024.

Maintenance
Section

No

Competitive
Bidding

21/02/2024

29/02/2024

03-12-2024

14-03-2024

GoP

187,920.00

187920

200000
100017
000

24GMBO0002 - Supply and
Delivery of Signages for use in
the Maintenance Activity for 1st
Quarter of CY 2024.

Maintenance
Section

No

Competitive
Bidding

23-02-2024

19-03-2024

04-02-2024

04-11-2024

GoP

1,057,318.00

1057318

,31010
110090
8000

24GMBO0003-Supply and
Delivery of Laboratory
Apparatus, Equipment and
Supplies for use in the Office of
Quality Assurance Section of
DPWH South Cotabato 1st
District Engineering Office,
General Santos City.

Quality

Asurance
Section

No

Competitive
Bidding

03-06-2024

25-03-2024

04-11-2024

25-04-2024

GoP

3,110,400.00

3110400

24GMBO0004-Supply and
Delivery of Fuel, Oil &
Lubricants for use in the
Mintenance Activity for 2nd
Quarter of CY 2024.

lintenance Sect

No

Competitive
Bidding

03-06-2024

25-03-2024

GoP

1,288,197.05

1288197.05

FAILURE OF
BIDDING

310110
100363
000

24GMBO0005 - Supply of DPWH
Security Services requirements
for 6 Security PERSONNEL for
deployment to DPWH South
Cotabato 1st DEO, GSC (Apr 1-
June 30, 2024)

ninistrative Sec|

No

Competitive
Bidding

15-03-2024

22-03-2024

27-03-2024

04-05-2024

GoP

391,020.00

391020

200000
100827
000

24GMBO0006-Rental of (1-unit)
4x4 Pick -up Truck Service
Vehicle, 3.0L Diesel , 4-Door. 5
Seater for Project
Inspection/Supervision/PDE of
Various Infra Projectsa (April
17-30, 2024)

Planning and
Design
Section

No

Competitive
Bidding

21-03-2024

04-02-2024

04-12-2024

15-04-2024

GoP

98,758.00

98758

200000
100827
000

24GMBO0007-Rental of (1-unit)
4x4 Pick -up Truck Service
Vehicle, 3.0L Diesel , 4-Door. 5
Seater for Project
Inspection/Supervision/PDE of
Various Infra Projectsa (May 1-
15, 2024)

Planning and
Design
Section

No

Competitive
Bidding

21-03-2024

04-02-2024

04-12-2024

15-04-2024

GoP

98,758.00

98758




200000
100827
000

24GMBO008-Rental of (1-unit)
4x4 Pick -up Truck Service
Vehicle, 3.0L Diesel , 4-Door. 5
Seater for Project
Inspection/Supervision/PDE of
Various Infra Projectsa (June 1-
15, 2024)

Planning and
Design
Section

No

Competitive
Bidding

21-03-2024

04-02-2024

04-12-2024

15-04-2024

GoP

24GMBO0009-Supply and
Delivery of fuel, oil and
lubricants for use in the
Maintenance Activity for 2nd
Quarter of CY 2024.

Maintenance
Section

No

Competitive
Bidding

21-03-2024

04-02-2024

GoP

310204
102269
00

24GMBO0010-Supply and
delivery of (Lot A) fuel and (Lot
B) oil and lubricants for use in
the service vehicle of District
Engineer, Assistant District
Engineer and Construction
Section of DPWH South
Cotabato 1st DEO, GSC.

ninistrative Sec|

No

Competitive
Bidding

04-10-2024

30-04-2024

22-05-2024

23-05-2024

GoP

310204
102269
00

24GMBO0011-Supply and
Delivery of IT Consumables for
use the Office of the District
Engineer, Planning & Design
Section, Procurement Unit,
Construction Section and
Quality Assurance Section of
DPWH South Cotabato 1st
DEO, GSC.

ninistrative Sec|

No

Competitive
Bidding

23-04-2024

30-04-2024

14-05-2024

15-05-2024

GoP

98,758.00

98758

Cancellation of
Invitation to Bid

443,292.50

443292.5

200000
100827
000

24GMB0012-Supply and
Delivery of Common Office
Supplies, Common Janitorial
Supplies and Common
Electrical Supplies for the 2nd
Quarter of CY 2024 of DPWH
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City.

inistrative Sec|

No

Competitive
Bidding

30-04-2024

21-05-2024

06-05-2024

06-10-2024

GoP

799,688.00

799688

300022
214000

RFQ No. 2024-01-012-001 -
Supply and Delivery of Spare
Parts for use in the operation of
Construction Section of DPWH
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City

nstruction Sect]

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

02-06-2024

02-12-2024

15-02-2024

19-02-2024

GoP

81,908.75

81908.75




RFQ No. 2024-02-017-002 -
Supply and Delivery of Asphalt
Materials for Work Category 10
(Patching and Sealing of

200000 Pavements) for use in the NP-53.9 -
100017 . . lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-02-2024 | 29-02-2024 | 03-12-2024 | 03-12-2024 | GoP 462,000.00 462000
000 opergtlon of Maintenance Procurement
Section for 1st Quarter of CY
2024 of DPWH South Cotabato
1st District Engineering Office,
General Santos City
RFQ No. 2024-02-020-003 -
Supply and Delivery of Minor
200000]Tools use in the Maintenance NP-53.9 -
100017 |Activity for 1st Quarter of CY  lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-02-2024 | 29-02-2024 | 03-12-2024 | 03-12-2024 | GoP 221,500.00 221500
000 [2024 of DPWH South Cotabato Procurement
1st District Engineering Office,
General Santos City
RFQ No. 2024-02-015-004 -
Supply and Delivery of
200000 intonance. Aciviy NP-53.9 -
100017 lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-02-2024 | 29-02-2024 | 03-12-2024 | 03-12-2024 | GoP 60,000.00 60000
000 for 1st Quarter of CY 2024 of Procurement
DPWH South Cotabato 1st
District Engineering Office,
General Santos City.
RFQ No. 2024-02-014-005 -
Supply and Delivery of Non IT
200000|Consumables for use in the NP-53.9 -
100017 [Maintenance Section of CY lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-02-2024 | 29-02-2024 | 03-12-2024 | 03-12-2024 GoP 95,400.00 95400
000 [2024 of DPWH South Cotabato Procurement
1st District Engineering Office,
General Santos City
RFQ No. 2024-02-018-006 —
Repair and Maintenance of
z00000| e P (1o
100017 : - lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-02-2024 | 29-02-2024 | 03-12-2024 | 03-12-2024 | GoP 21,000.00 21000
000 Maintenance Section for CY Procurement

2024 of DPWH South Cotabato
1st District Engineering Office,
General Santos City




310101
100908
000

RFQ No. 2024-02-021-007 —
Supply and Delivery of Printing
Services (Lumpsum) of
Quarter/Semi/Annual
Publication of the Public
Information Unit in the Office of
DPWH South Cotabato 1st
District Engineering Office,
General Santos City

Office of the
District
Engineer

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

03-05-2024

13-03-2024

25-03-2024

26-03-2024

GoP

150,000.00

150000

200000
100491
000

RFQ No. 2024-02-027-008 -
Supply and Delivery of Spare
Parts for use in the service
vehicle of Maintenance Section
for 1st Quarter of CY 2024

lintenance Sect

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

03-07-2024

13-03-2024

25-03-2024

27-03-2024

GoP

673,472.00

673472

310110
100063
000

RFQ No. 2024-03-041-0009 -
Supply and Delivery of Other
Machineries for use in the
Administrative and Quality
Assurance Section of DPWH
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City

inistrative Sec|

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

19-03-2024

25-03-2024

04-11-2024

15-04-2024

GoP

36,480.00

36480

310110
100063
000

RFQ No. 2024-03-044-010 -
Supply and Delivery of
Construction Materials for use
in the Office of District
Engineer and Quality
Assurance Section of DPWH
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City

inistrative Sec|

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

19-03-2024

25-03-2024

04-11-2024

15-04-2024

GoP

19,455.00

19455

310110
100063
000

RFQ No. 2024-03-042-011 -
Supply and Delivery of Office
Equipment for use in the Office
of District Engineer,
Administrative Section, Finance
Section, Quality Assurance
Section, Procurement Unit and
Construction Section of DPWH
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City

inistrative Sec|

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

21-03-2024

25-03-2024

04-11-2024

16-04-2024

GoP

219,367.00

219367




200000
100827
000

RFQ 2024-03-061-012 - Supply
and Delivery of Surveying
Equipment Calibration and
Registration Services for the
use in the operation of
Planning and Design Section
for 2nd Quarter of DPWH
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City

Planning and
Design
Section

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

23-03-2024

04-02-2024

04-12-2024

15-04-2024

GoP

135,000.00

135000

200000
100018
000

RFQ 2024-03-062-013 - Supply
and Delivery of Minor Tools for
use in the operation of
Maintenance Section of DPWH
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City.

lintenance Sect

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

04-03-2024

04-08-2024

04-11-2024

17-04-2024

GoP

206,000.00

206000

200000
100827
000

RFQ No. 2024-03-063-014 -
Supply and Delivery of
Thermoplastic Paint Powder
and Glass Beads for Work
Category 18-Traffic Services
Maintenance (Repainting of
Centerline and Laneline) for
use in the operation of
Maintenance Section of DPWH
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City

lintenance Sect

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

04-02-2024

04-08-2024

04-11-2024

04-12-2024

GoP

499,195.00

499195

200000
100017
000

RFQ No. 2024-03-064-015 -
Supply and Delivery of
Common Office Supplies,
Janitorial & Electrical Supplies
for use in the operation of
Maintenance Section of
DPWH South Cotabato 1st
District Engineering Office,
General Santos City

lintenance Sect

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

04-03-2024

04-08-2024

04-11-2024

04-12-2024

GoP

87,395.25

87395.25

200000
100017
000

RFQ No. 2024-03-066-016 -
Supply and Delivery of Asphalt
Materials for Work Category 10
(Patching and Sealing of
Pavements) for use in the
Maintenance Activity of DPWH
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City

lintenance Sect

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

04-03-2024

04-08-2024

04-11-2024

04-12-2024

GoP

438,000.00

438000




RFQ No. 2024-03-067-017 -
Supply and Delivery of Painting

200000 |Materials for Category 12- NP-53.9 -
100018 |Bridge Maintenance for use in }intenance Sect No Small Value | 04-03-2024 | 04-08-2024( 04-11-2024 | 04-12-2024 | GoP 499,050.00 499050
000 [the Maintenance Activity of Procurement
DPWH South Cotabato 1st
DEO, GSC.
RFQ No. 2024-03-068-018-
Supply and Delivery of IT
200000|Consumables for use in the NP-53.9 -
100017 |Maintenance Section of lintenance Sect No Small Value | 04-03-2024 04-08-2024| 04-11-2024 | 04-12-2024 | GoP 97,600.00 97600
000 |DPWH South Cotabato 1st Procurement
District Engineering Office,
General Santos City
RFQ 2024-03-069-019 - Supply
200000 and .Delivery of Maintenance NP-53.9 -
100017|EauiPment for use in the intenance Secf ~ No  [Small Value | 04-03-2024 | 04-08-2024| 04-11-2024 | 04-12-2024 | GoP 242,000.00 242000
000 oper_atlon of Maintenance Procurement
Section of DPWH South
Cotabato 1st DEO, GSC.
RFQ 2024-04-075-020 - Supply
200000]|and Delivery of Fuel for use in NP-53.9 -
100491 [the operation of Maintenance fintenance Sect No Small Value | 04-03-2024 04-08-2024| 04-11-2024 | 04-11-2024 | GoP 999,980.00 999980
000 [Section of DPWH South Procurement
Cotabato 1st DEO, GSC.
RFQ No. 2024-04-076-021-
Supply and Delivery of Qil and
200000 |Lubricants for use in the NP-53.9 -
100017 |Maintenance Activity of DPWH lintenance Sect No Small Value | 04-03-2024 04-08-2024| 04-11-2024 | 04-11-2024 | GoP 376,824.05 376824.05
000 [South Cotabato 1st District Procurement
Engineering Office, General
Santos City
RFQ No. 2024-03-065-022
200000 igazlt)r/u?:?ignljlsﬂ“eﬁ?i/ag for use NP-53.9 -
100018]. ) . lintenance Sect No Small Value | 04-04-2024 | 04-08-2024 | 04-11-2024 | 04-11-2024 | GoP 938,944.75 938944.75
000 in the operation of Maintenance Procurement

Section of th DPWH South
Cotabato 1st DEO, GSC.




RFQ No. 2024-04-005-023 -
Supply and Delivery of

200000 Signages for use in the NP-53.9 -
100018 ; . lintenance Sect No Small Value | 04-05-2024 | 04-08-2024 | 04-11-2024 | 04-11-2024 | GoP 904,870.08 904870.08
000 opergtlon of Maintenance Procurement
Section of the DPWH South
Cotabato 1st DEO, GSC.
RFQ No. 2024-04-086-024 -
100017 . . . lintenance Sect No Small Value | 04-05-2024 | 04-08-2024 | 04-11-2024 | 04-11-2024 | GoP 318,530.00 318530
000 vehicle of Maintenance Section Procurement
of DPWH South Cotabato 1st
DEO, GSC.
RFQ 2024-04-087-025 - Supply
and Delivery of Lot A -
100018 h : h lintenance Sect No Small Value | 04-05-2024 | 04-08-2024 | 04-11-2024 | 04-11-2024 | GoP 131,797.46 131797.46
000 Repair of Datal Dalvan Bridge | Procurement
Approach B (SO2240MN) of
DPWH South Cotabato 1st
DEO, GSC.
RFQ 2024-04-087-025 - Supply
and Delivery of Lot B- Materilas
200000 |for use in Act 41X Emergency NP-53.9 -
100018 |Project: Emergency Repair of lintenance Sect No Small Value | 04-05-2024 | 04-08-2024 | 04-11-2024 | 04-11-2024 | GoP 193,339.93 193339.93
000 [Datal Dalvan Bridge | Approach Procurement
B (SO2240MN) of DPWH
South Cotabato 1st DEO, GSC.
RFQ 2024-04-088-026 - Supply
and Delivery of (Lot A-Pakyaw
100018|,, . : lintenance Sect No Small Value | 04-05-2024 | 04-08-2024 | 04-11-2024 | 04-11-2024 | GoP 129,958.69 129958.69
Maintenance — Replacement of
000 Procurement
Concrete Pavement along
Marbel-Makar Road,
K1695+564.5-K1695+596
RFQ 2024-04-088-026 - Supply
and Delivery of (Lot B-
100018(,, . : lintenance Sect No Small Value | 04-05-2024 | 04-08-2024 | 04-11-2024 | 04-11-2024 | GoP 255,617.26 255617.26
000 Maintenance — Replacement of Procurement

Concrete Pavement along
Marbel-Makar Road,
K1695+564.5-K1695+596




200000
100018
000

RFQ 2024-04-089-027 - Supply
and Delivery of (Lot A-
Materials) for Work CAT 10
Act 41X Emergency Project -
Repair of Damaged PCCP with
Center Island along Makar-
Kiamba Road (S00246MN)
K1661 + 280-K1661+327 and
Albert Morrow Blvd. (Western
Section (S00729MN),
K1661+278-K1661+281).

lintenance Sect

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

04-05-2024

04-08-2024

04-11-2024

04-11-2024

GoP

560,148.40

560148.4

200000
100018
000

RFQ 2024-04-089-027 - Supply
and Delivery of (Lot B-Pakyaw
Labor) for Work CAT 10 Act
41X Emergency Project -
Repair of Damaged PCCP with
Center Island along Makar-
Kiamba Road (S00246MN)
K1661 + 280-K1661+327 and
Albert Morrow Blvd. (Western
Section (S00729MN),
K1661+278-K1661+281).

lintenance Sect

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

04-05-2024

04-08-2024

04-11-2024

04-11-2024

GoP

259,851.60

259851.6

200000
100827
000

RFQ No. 2024-03-040-028-
Supply and Delivery of
Furnitures and Fixtures for use
in the Office of Administrative
Section, Construction Section
and Planning and Design
Section of DPWH South
Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City

ninistrative Sec|

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

22-04-2024

30-04-2024

13-05-2024

13-05-2024

GoP

260,000.00

260000

200000
100018
000

RFQ 2024-06-128-030 - Supply
and Delivery of Fuel for use in
the operation of Maintenance
Section of DPWH South
Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City

lintenance Sect

No

NP-53.9 -
Small Value
Procurement

21-06-2024

25-06-2024

27-06-2024

28-06-2024

GoP

798,327.50

798327.5




RFQ 2024-06-129-031 - Supply
& Delivery of Maintenance
Equipment for use in the

200000 operation of Maintenance NP-53.9 -
100018 . lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 63,300.00 63300
000 Section of DPWH lSouth Procurement
Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City
2000001 Garments fo uee. P53
100018]. . . lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 627,900.00 627900
000 | Maintenance Section for the Procurement
3rd Quarter of CY 2024
RFQ 2024-06-131-033 - Supply
and Delivery of Asphalt
Materials for Work Category 10
200000 |(Patching and Sealing of NP-53.9 -
100018 |pavements) for use in the lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 999,300.00 999300
000 [Maintenance Activity of DPWH Procurement
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City
RFQ 2024-06-133-034 - Supply
& Delivery of IT Consumables
100018 . lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 225,000.00 225000
000 Section of DPWH lSouth Procurement
Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City
RFQ 2024-06-134-035 - Supply
& Delivery of Oil & Lubricants
200000{for use in the Maintenance NP-53.9 -
100018 |Activity of DPWH South lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 500,000.00 500000
000 |Cotabato 1st District Procurement
Engineering Office, General
Santos City
RFQ 2024-06-135-036 - Supply
and Delivery of Construction
100018|2P¢" lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 429,500.00 429500
000 Section of DPWH South Procurement

Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City




RFQ No. 2024-06-136-037 -
Supply and Delivery of
Guardrail Parts for use in the

200000 operation of Maintenance NP-53.9 -
100018 . lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 257,500.00 257500
000 Section of DPWH _South Procurement
Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City
RFQ No. 2024-06-141-038 -
Supply and Delivery of Tires for
200000|use in the service vehicle and NP-53.9 -
100018 |heavy equipment of lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 960,620.00 960620
000 [Maintenance Section of DPWH Procurement
South Cotabato 1st DEO,
General Santos City
RFQ No. 2024-06-142-0309 -
Supply and Delivery of General
200000|Merchandise of Maintenance NP-53.9 -
100018 |Section of DPWH South lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 255,000.00 255000
000 [Cotabato 1st District Procurement
Engineering Office, General
Santos City
RFQ No. 2024-06-143-040 -
Supply and Delivery of Heavy
100018 . . lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 70,000.00 70000
000 Maintenance Section pf pPWH Procurement
South Cotabato 1st District
Engineering Office, General
Santos City
RFQ No. 2024-06-145-041 -
100018 ) - lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 798,327.50 798327.5
000 Maintenance Section of DPWH Procurement
South Cotabato 1st DEO,
General Santos City
RFQ No. 2024-06-149-042 -
Supply & Delivery of Chemical
Products for use in the
Implementation of Routine
e A
100018 - ! lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 138,300.00 138300
000 Thermoplastic Pavement Procurement

Markings for 1st Quarter of CY
2024 of Maintenance Section
of DPWH South Cotabato 1st
District Engineering Office,
General Santos City




RFQ 2024-06-150-043 - Supply
and Delivery of Minor Tools for

200000 |use in the operation of NP-53.9 -
100018 |Maintenance Section of DPWH lintenance Sect No Small Value | 21-06-2024 | 25-06-2024 | 27-06-2024 | 28-06-2024 | GoP 731,850.00 731850
000 |South Cotabato 1st District Procurement
Engineering Office, General
Santos City
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