(Department of Public Works and Highways Capiz 1st District Engineering Office) Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2025

. Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early ! Source : :
! Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ - (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procurement | , ;curement Posting of Sub.mlssmn_/ Notice of Award |Contract Signing = Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? IB/REI Opening of Bids Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
CIVIL WORKS
Construction/
Construction of Flood Mitigation DPWH, Capiz Rehabilitation of
Structure - Construction of River 1st DEO, Competitive Flood Mitigation
320102107526000 Control along Panay River, Barangay _|Construction Yes Bidding Oct. 18, 2024 | Nov. 07, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 144,750,000.00 144,750,000.00 Facilities within Major
Cogon, Panay, Capiz Section River Basins and
Principal Rivers
Construction of Flood Mitigation DPWH, Capiz Copstructnon/ £l
Structure - Construction of Cadio  |1st DEO, v Competitive 18 2024 07,2 p— 202 : - 500,600 0.00 Maintenance of fioad
320101113124000 Flood Control along Panay River, Construction es Bidding Oct. 18, Nov. 07, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 ar, 06, 2025 Go 57,900,000.00 57,900,000. aMf:gg;:::aSgt;uctures
Barangay Cadio, Panitan, Capiz Section Systems
Construction of Flood Mitigation DPWH, Capiz Copstructuon/
320101113125000 |Facilties along Panay/Mambusao | 1st DEO, Yes  |Competitive | 4 18 2024 | Nov. 07,2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06,2025 | GoP 57,409,780.00 57,409,780.00 mniféinéiﬂitﬁ?éf
River Basin, Talasa River Control, Construction Bidding T e T e et e gatio
Brgy. Talasa, Panay, Capiz Section and Drainage
! ! Systems
il)ftvl\gl-;,ocaplz Competitive Construction of By-
310204103058000 |Panitan By-Pass Road, Capiz Constru (I:tion Yes Bid dil:l g Oct. 18, 2024 | Nov. 07, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 77,200,000.00 77,200,000.00 |Pass and Diversion
Section Roads
Construction of Flood Mitigation DPWH, Capiz Cor"nstructuon/
320101114115000 |Sucture - Construction of River  |1st DEO, ves  [Competitve | 48 2024 | Nov. 07,2024 | Feb. 25,2025 | Mar. 06,2025 | GoP 49,000,000.00 49,000,000.00 ﬂil“ﬁfnnéiﬁgl?é’f
Control, Zibala River, Barangay Construction Bidding T i i e At [AANihbaS gatio
i N i X and Drainage
Poblacion, Pilar, Capiz Section
Systems
Rehabilitation/
Reconstruction to Concrete Pavement 1 ?;Vé:bcap'z Competitive Secc::s?rr‘ucg? v
310105101466000 |Ioilo East Coast-Capiz Rd - K0135 + -~ Yes Bid dP Oct. 25, 2024 | Nov. 14, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 8,575,980.00 8,575,980.00 P9 dgp d
778 - KO136 + 302 Construction idding Damaged Pave
Section Roads - Secondary
Roads
Access Roads and/or
Construction of Concrete Road - IID:thl;,oCaplz Competitive :gggzs;lfggdt/ze
300221108560000 |Construction of Road, Barangay Const - Yes Bid d'p Oct. 25, 2024 | Nov. 14, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 teading to M
Balatucan, Panitan, Capiz onstruction idding eading to ajpr/
4 ! Section Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities
Access Roads and/or
Corscon o Contrad (070,
300221108562000 |Construction of Road, Barangay ‘ Yes P Oct. 25, 2024 | Nov. 14, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 !
Blasco, Pilar, Capiz Construction Bidding leading to Major/
» Fiar, Lap Section Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities
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. Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early . Source N e
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ - (brief description
Codei(PAF) Program/Project End-User | Procurement | p o urement Posting of Submission/ | ysice of Award |Contract Signing of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? 18/REI Opening of Bids Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
Access Roads andfor
. R DPWH, Capiz Bridges from the
Construct!on ofi Goncrete Road 1st DEO, Competitive National Road/s
300221108561000 |Construction of Road, Barangay Construction Yes Bidding Oct. 25, 2024 | Nov. 14,2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 leading to Major/
Cabangahan, Panitan, Capiz Section Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities
Access Roads and/or
. R DPWH, Capiz Bridges from the
Construct!on of Concrete Road 1st DEO, Competitive National Road/s
300221108556000 |Construction of Road, Barangay Construction Yes Biddin Oct. 25, 2024 | Nov. 14, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 leading to Major/
Culilang President Roxas, Capiz Section 9 Strategic Puleic
Buildings/ Facilities
Access Roads and/or
Construction of Concrete Road - DPWH, Capiz Bridges from the
N 1st DEO, Competitive National Road/s
300221106239000 |Construction of Road, Barangay San Construction Yes Bidding Oct. 25, 2024 | Nov. 14, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 leading to Major/
Blas, Pilar, Capiz Section Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities
Access Roads and/or
Construction of Concrete Road - DPWH, Capiz Bridges from the
i 1st DEO, Competitive National Road/s
300221108559000 |Construction of Road, Barangay Construction Yes Bidding Oct. 25, 2024 | Nov. 14, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 7,425,000.00 7,425,000.00 leading to Major/
jrinigban, Pamitan, Capiz Section Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities
Access Roads and/or
i R DPWH, Capiz Bridges from the
Construct!on of Concrete Road 1st DEO, Competitive National Road/s
300221108557000 |Construction of Road, Barangay Construction Yes Biddin Oct. 25, 2024 | Nov. 14, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 7,425,000.00 7,425,000.00 leading to Major/
Viscaya, President Roxas, Capiz Section 9 Strategi c Puleic
Buildings/ Facilities
Access Roads and/or
. ; DPWH, Capiz Bridges from the
Construction of Concrete Road 1t DEO, Competitive National Road/s
300221108558000 |Construction of Road, Barangay Construction Yes Bidding Oct. 31, 2024 | Nov, 21, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 leading to Major/
Jofongahog, Pontevedra, Capiz Section Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities
. . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
0022612140600 |oomacion of Multi-Purpose 1st DEO, Competitive Buildings/ Facilities to
Building, Bar_angay Fernandez, Construction Yes Bidding Oct. 31,2024 | Nov. 21, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Support Social
Magyon, Caplz Section Services
I al DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
30022612 1403000 gop s_tructlon of Multi-Purpose 1st DEO, Competitive Buildings/ Facilities to
uilding, B§rangay Tanza Norte, Construction Yes Bidding Oct. 31, 2024 | Nov. 21, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000,00 4,950,000.00 Support Social
panay, Capiz Section Services
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Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early . Source s
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ - (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procurt?ment Procurement Posting of 5ub.m|ssson'/ Notice of Award |Contract Signing of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? 18/REI Opening of Bids Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No) j
Widening of Bridge - Lajab Br. ?sivg‘;b?amz Competitive Widening of
310305102465000 (BOQZSGPN) along Iloilo East Coast- Construction Yes Bidding Nov. 08, 2024 | Nov. 28, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 26,460,000.00 26,460,000.00 Permanent Bridges
Capiz Rd i
Section
Access Roads and/or
Construction of Concrete Road - ?;Mégbcap'z Competitive ﬁ:ggﬁ;r':;g;;‘:
300221108555000 |Construction of Road, Barangay C ét Yes Bid d_p Nov. 08, 2024 | Nov. 28, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 eadi Mai
Jebaca, Maayon, Capiz on;tru ion idding eading to Major/
! ! Section Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities
Construction (Completion) of Mult- Il):thl;bCaplz Competitive g::g;: usr7 (l)::ziilities to
300226121413000 |Purpose Building, Barangay Cayus, " Yes Oomp Nov. 08, 2024 | Nov. 28, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 2,475,000.00 2,475,000.00 g8/ e
: ! Construction Bidding Support Social
Pilar, Capiz N 1
Section Services
0235121412000 { acss BTG, Eofaron Hontetr ID;Mg;b?aplz Yes  |Competitive |\ 08,2024 | Nov.28, 2024 | Feb. 25,2025 | Mar. 06,2025 | GoP 2,475,000.00 2,475,000.00 g‘zj’:g'::;? Focitis t
Pila;r)OCa 2 9 gay ! |Construction Bidding i gl - 29 - 06, /475,000, 147500000 g, oot Social
»-ap Section Services
Construction of Road Slope Protection
Structure - Maayon - Jct Bailan Rd - Rehabilitation/
K0124+462 - K0124+529, DPWH, Capiz Reconstruction of
K0124+559 - K0124+600, 1st DEO, Competitive National Roads with
310108102146000 K0125+494 - K0125+559, Construction Yes Bidding Nov. 20, 2024 | Dec. 10, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 7,350,000.00 7,350,000.00 Slips, Slope Collapse,
K0126+4050 - K0126+093, Section and Landslide -
K0126+187 - K0126+253, Secondary Roads
K0126+681 - K0126+719
. . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose - o -
A ) 1st DEO, Competitive Buildings/ Facilities to
300226121402000 g::lgng, Barangay Lat-asan, Panay, Construction Yes Bidding Nov. 20, 2024 | Dec. 10, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 7,425,000.00 7,425,000.00 Support Social
P Section Services
e gl T ?:tmé:bcapiz Competitive g::ﬂ.: o Fatiities t
300226121411000 |Building, Barangay Manoling, - Yes omp Nov. 20, 2024 | Dec. 10, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 S 9 Social
President Roxas, Capiz Construction Bidding upport Socia
! Section Services
Widening of Bridge - Balatucan Br. If;vgrébCapiz Competitive Widening of
310305102466000 |(B00277PN) along Jct Nat! Rd-Mi-anay: - Yes P Nov. 20, 2024 | Dec. 23, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 15,680,000.00 15,680,000.00 gor
4 Construction Bidding Permanent Bridges
Duyoc-Calaan-Panitan Rd
Section
Road Widening - Lioilo East Coast- ?;\Ag;bCaplz Competitive Road Widening -
310202101992000 gglplz Rd - K0146 + 781 - K0147 + Construction No Bidding Nov, 20, 2024 | Dec, 23, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 8,281,000.00 8,281,000.00 Secondary Roads
Section
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Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
1s this an Remarks
Early . Source . N
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ o (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procu_re_ment Procurement Posting of Suanssnon_/ Notice of Award |Contract Signing of Total MOOE Cco of Program/
Activity? 1B/RET Opening of Bids Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
. . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose Y " N -
300226121409000 |Building, Barangay Poblacion Iiawod, |-t DEO" No [ComPettVe | Nov.20,2024 | Dec. 23,2024 | Feb.25,2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 | GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 g“"d'”gsé:‘.’c"""es i
Pontevedra, Capiz Construction idding upport Socia
! Section Services
Construction of Multi-Purpose ?;Vggbcamz Competitive ?fu”.:ﬂ.ﬁ o Faciites to
300226121410000 |Building, Barangay Santo Nifio, - No omp Nov. 20, 2024 | Dec. 23, 2024 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 08/ e
! . Construction Bidding Support Social
President Roxas, Capiz X X
Section Services
Preventive Maintenance of Road: lf;vg;,oCapiz Competitive Preventive
310101101914000 |Asphalt Qverlay - Iloilo-Capiz Rd (New Constru ¢':tion No Bid dize Dec. 24, 2024 | Jan. 14, 2025 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 25,879,840.00 25,879,840.00 |Maintenance -
Route) - K0114 + 830 - KO115 + 303 |on 9 Primary Roads
Section
DPWH, Capiz Preventive
Roxas City Bdry.-Panitan-Bailan Rd -  |1st DEO, Competitive ’ ;
310103102099000 KO118 + 000 - KO118 + 402 Construction No Bidding Dec. 24, 2024 | Jan. 14,2025 | Feb. 25, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 GoP 21,805,000.00 21,805,000.00 Malr.:tenance
i Tertiary Roads
Section
Construction of Flood Mitigation DPWH, Capiz Copstructlon/
Facilities (Sea Wall) along Visayan 1st DEQ Competitive - Maintenance of Flood
320101114113000 9 Visay . No omp Jan. 17, 2025 | Feb. 06, 2025 | Feb. 26, 2025 | Mar. 07, 2025 GoP 49,000,000.00 49,000,000.00 |Mitigation Structures
Sea, Barangay Punta Cogon, Roxas  |Construction Bidding !
City, Capiz Section and Drainage
» Lap Systems
Construction of Flood Mitigation DPWH, Capiz Copstructmn/
Structure - Construction of River 1st DEO, Competitive Maintenance of flood
320101113123000 h ue - No omp Jan. 17, 2025 | Feb. 06, 2025 | Feb. 26, 2025 | Mar. 07, 2025 GoP 96,500,000.00 96,500,000.00 |Mitigation Structures
Control, Balisong River, Barangay San |Construction Bidding and Drainage
Ramon, Pilar, Capiz Section Systems
i . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose - e B
S 1st DEO, Competitive Buildings/ Facilities to
300226121414000 g:ul?zmg, Barangay Bagacay, Panay, Construction No Bidding Jan. 17, 2025 | Feb. 06, 2025 | Feb. 26, 2025 | Mar. 07, 2025 GoP 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00 Support Social
P Section Services
Construction of Flood Mitigation DPWH, Capiz Constetion/
320101114114000 | 2ciities along Panay/Mambusao  |1st DEC, No  |Competitive | 5. 42 2025 | Feb. 06, 2025 | Feb. 26,2025 | Mar. 07, 2025 | GoP 29,400,000.00 29,400,000.00 ml"i‘iﬂi"éfrﬂit'ﬂ'ﬁ’;d
River Basin, Tico River Control, Panay, |Construction Bidding te T i i I ke an ngrainage
Capiz Section Systems
Rehabilitation/
DPWH, Capiz Reconstruction/
Iloilo-Capiz Rd (New Route) - K0106  |1st DEO, Competitive Upgrading of
310104100898000 + 905 - K0107 + 570 Construction No Bidding Jan. 17, 2025 | Feb. 06, 2025 | Feb. 26, 2025 | Mar. 07, 2025 GoP 10,700,000.00 10,700,000.00 Damaged Paved
Section Roads - Primary
Roads
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) Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early N Source A g
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ - (brief description
Code (PAF) Program/Project End-ser |Procurement | o o urement Posting of SUbMIsSion/ | yytice of Award |Contract Signing of Total MOOE Co of Program/
Activity? 1B/REI Opening of Bids Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
Rehabilitation/
Reconstruction to Concrete Pavement {DPWH, Capiz Reconstruction/
Maayon-]ct Bailan Rd - K0124 + 471 - |1st DEO, Competitive Upgrading of
310105101467000 K0124 + 997, K0125 + 743 - K126 + |Construction No Bidding Jan. 28, 2025 | Feb. 18,2025 | Mar. 10, 2025 | Mar. 21, 2025 GoP 16,085,520.00 16,085,520.00 Damaged Paved
117 Section Roads - Secondary
Roads
Pouruction of MUt EUIpose ?sftvl\;:bcaplz Competitive Qilﬂ.ﬁ o) Faciltes to
300226121408000 |Building, Barangay Yatingan, - No id P Jan. 28, 2025 | Feb. 18,2025 | Mar. 10, 2025 | Mar. 21, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 S g Social
Pontevedra, Capiz Construction Bidding upgort cia
4 Section Services
Construction of Multi-Purpose leP;\v'\[l)I;bCapiz Competitive g;:g.:;? ‘;saecilities to
e B ’
300226121404000 (B:Igmg, Barangay Salocon, Panitan, Construction No Bidding Jan. 28, 2025 | Feb. 18, 2025 | Mar. 10, 2025 | Mar. 21, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Support Social
piz . !
Section Services
jeanscHion OF MUL - PRTIoSe ?sivuva'ébca”" Competitive ;4;:3'::;7 Fatiites to
300226121397000 glanlgng, Barangay Binantu-an, Panay, Construction No Bidding Jan. 28, 2025 | Feb. 18, 2025 | Mar. 10, 2025 | Mar. 21, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Support Social
P Section Services
on=Echon of ML PurpesS ?;V;l;b(lapiz Competitive g:::g;: u;;) (I,::ilities to
300226121407000 |Building, Barangay Poblacion, -~ No omp Feb. 14, 2025 | Mar. 06, 2025 | Mar. 28, 2025 | Apr. 08, 2025 GoP 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 r%So ial
Maayon, Capiz Construction Bidding Suppo Cia
! Section Services
Rehabilitation/
DPWH, Capiz Reconstruction/
Roxas City Bdry.-Panitan-Bailan Rd - |1st DEO, Competitive Upgrading of
310106101367000 KO113 + 470- KO114 + 994 Construction No Bidding Feb. 26, 2025 | Mar. 18,2025 | Apr. 07, 2025 | Apr. 18, 2025 GoP 35,715,120.00 35,715,120.00 Damaged Paved
Section Roads - Tertiary
Roads
Construction of Multi-Purpose IDSF;VgFébCaplz Competitive gll:jlllglrfg;f ?iziilities to
300226121400000 |Building, Barangay Jamulawon, - No Biddi Feb. 26, 2025 | Mar. 18, 2025 | Apr. 07, 2025 | Apr. 18, 2025 GoP 7,425,000.00 7,425,000.00 S t Social
Panay, Capiz Construction idding upqo Cia
! Section Services
DPWH, Capiz
Adlawan Br. (BO0494PN) along Lanot- |1st DEO, Competitive Widening of
310305102467000 Loctugan-Panitan Bdry Rd Construction No Bidding Mar. 04, 2025 | Mar. 25, 2025 | Apr. 14, 2025 | Apr. 24, 2025 GoP 7,840,000.00 7,840,000.00 Permanent Bridges
Section
jrEnSbiliatianiof MUIEFQMmee ?;Vgl;bcapiz Competitive g;:ﬂ?ﬁ;? ?:Saiilities to
300226121401000 (B::IIglng, Barangay Bonga, Panay, Construction No Bidding Mar. 04, 2025 | Mar, 25, 2025 | Apr. 14, 2025 | Apr. 24, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 | 4,950,000.00 Support Social
P Section Services
?sivg’;bcapiz Competitive Constiuetonor 87
310204103299000 [Maayon By-Pass Road, Capiz Constru <I:tion No Bid dlzeg Mar. 04, 2025 | Mar. 25, 2025 | Apr. 14, 2025 | Apr. 24, 2025 GoP 4,900,000.00 4,900,000.00 |Pass and Diversion
Roads
Section
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. Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early . Source . -
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ L (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procurement | p, ocurement Posting of Sub.mlsswn./ Notice of Award|Contract Signing of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? 1B/REI Opening of Bids Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
DPWH, Capiz Buildings And Other
Construction of DPWH Capiz 1st DEO |1st DEO, Competitive Structures
300105201699000 Office Building, Roxas City, Capiz Construction No Bidding Mar. 04, 2025 | Mar. 25, 2025 | Apr, 14, 2025 | Apr. 24, 2025 GoP 39,600,000.00 39,600,000.00 Multipurpose /
Section Facilities
i . DPWH, Capiz Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose - e s
300226121405000 |Building, Barangay Indayagan, (1:(5: DEO, No C%";Pem“’e Mar. 04, 2025 | Mar. 25,2025 | Apr. 14,2025 | Apr. 24,2025 | GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 g“"d'"g‘z F?cl'"t'es to
Maayon, Capiz nstruction Bidding upport Socia
! Section Services
?:tmézbcaplz Competitive Construction of By-
310204103059000 |Pontevedra By-Pass Road, Capiz Constru <,:tion No Bid di‘:l g Mar. 07, 2025 | Mar. 27,2025 | Apr. 16, 2025 | Apr. 25, 2025 GoP 8,299,000.00 8,299,000,00 |Pass and Diversion
Section REse
DPWH, Capiz
Anhawon Br. (B00244PN) along Tloilo |1st DEO, Competitive Widening of
310305102464000 East Coast-Capiz Rd (Phase 1) Construction No Bidding Mar, 07, 2025 | Mar. 27, 2025 | Apr. 16, 2025 | Apr. 25, 2025 GoP 41,160,000.00 41,160,000.00 Permanent Bridges
Sedtion
DPWH, Capiz Preventive
310102102179000 | 10110 East Coast-Capiz Rd - KO163 + |1t DEO, No |Competitive |y oy 2025 | Mar. 27, 2025 | Apr. 16,2025 | Apr.25,2025 | GoP |  100,360,000.00 100,360,000.00 |Maintenance -
760 - K0171 + 781 Construction Bidding
. Secondary Roads
Section
DPWH, Capiz Preventive
310102102188000 |Maayon-Jct Bailan Rd - K0125 + 743 - ist DEO, No  |ComPpetitive | v 67,2005 | Mar. 27,2025 | Apr. 16,2025 | Apr. 25,2025 | GoP 68,032,500.00 68,032,500.00 | Maintenance -
K0131 + 062 Construction Bidding
; Secondary Roads
Section
Tioilo-Capiz Rd (New Route) - K0116 ID:QI;:I)HE’OCBDIZ Competitive Preventive
310102102455000 |+ (-173) - K0116 + 100, KO116 + 400 Constru (I:tion No Bid di[|’1 Mar. 12, 2025 | Apr. 01,2025 | Apr. 21,2025 | Apr. 30, 2025 GoP 35,770,000.00 35,770,000.00 |Maintenance -
- K0118 + 100 - 9 Secondary Roads
Section
Roxas City Bdry-Panitan-Bailan Rd - |DPWH, Capiz preventive
KO0112 + (-268) - K0113 + 434, 1st DEO, Competitive R R
310103101857000 KO115 + 110 - KO118 + 000, K0118 +|Construction No Bidding Mar. 12, 2025 | Apr. 01,2025 | Apr. 21,2025 | Apr. 30, 2025 GoP 141,855,000.00 141,855,000.00 r::g;ena;oc:ds
402 - K0120 + 850 Section 4
BIP - Access Roads
Construction of Concrete Road, [l)gt\l\[/)l;bCaplz Competitive ?:: /r\(l)z:tiEc;Jrrlg?fogﬁsm
300221107283000 g:r?;gay Mongpong, City of Roxas, Construction No Bidding Mar. 12, 2025 | Apr. 01,2025 | Apr. 21,2025 | Apr. 30, 2025 GoP 8,910,000.00 8,910,000.00 leading to Major/
P Section Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities
BIP - Access Roads
DPWH, Capiz and/or Bridges from
Construction of Concrete Road, 1st DEO, Comipetitive the National Roads
3002211.07284000 Barangay Cabugao, Panitan, Capiz Construction No Bidding Mar. 12, 2025 | Apr. 01, 2025 | Apr. 21,2025 | Apr. 30, 2025 GoP 5,940,000.00 5,940,000.00 leading to Major/
Section Strategic Public
Buildings/ Facilities
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. Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early . Source . -
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ . (brief description
Code (PAP) Program/Project End-User Procurement | p, o\ rement Posting of Submiss 0/ | Notice of Award [ Contract Signing of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? 18/REI Opening of Bids Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
. BIP - Flood Mitigation
Construction of Flood Mitigation Il)sPt\All)l;bCaplz Competitive Structures protecting
300237100245000 |Structure, Barangay Punta Cogon, e No ; P Mar. 12, 2025 | Apr. 01, 2025 | Apr. 21,2025 | Apr. 30, 2025 GoP 123,750,000.00 123,750,000.00 |Major/ Strategic
. . Construction Bidding g
City of Roxas, Capiz Secti Public Buildings/
ion o
Facilities
. BIP - Flood Mitigation
Construction of Flood Mitigation ?;Mégbcaplz Competitive Structures protecting
300237100246000 |Structure along Magubilan River, = No omp Mar. 14, 2025 | Apr. 03, 2025 | Apr. 23,2025 | May 02, 2025 GoP 123,750,000.00 123,750,000.00 [Major/ Strategic
. Construction Bidding oy
Pontevedra, Capiz . Public Buildings/
Section s—
Facilities
Construction of Multi-Purpose ID;VIVJ?O(:apiZ Competitive gfj:(;lf':l lg/t I;l::rl‘:t?:: to
300226117073000 (Building, Barangay Balijuagan, City of - No omp Mar. 14, 2025 | Apr. 03, 2025 | Apr. 23,2025 | May 02, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 95/
. Construction Bidding Support Social
Roxas, Capiz X !
Section Services
DPWH, Capiz | BIP - Multi-Purpose
Completion of Multi-Purpose Building, |1st DEO, Competitive Buildings/ Facilities to
300226117074000 Barangay Pifia, Maayon, Capiz Construction No Bidding Mar. 14, 2025 | Apr. 03, 2025 | Apr. 23,2025 | May 02, 2025 GoP 3,960,000.00 3,960,000.00 Support Social
Section Services
Construction of Multi-Purpose Il):;vgl;bCaplz Competitive gfxlljldlrﬁg/t ';:Zlé;ﬁg:: to
300226117075000 g:uqlng, Barangay Agojo, Panay, Construction No Bidding Mar. 14, 2025 | Apr. 03,2025 | Apr. 23,2025 | May 02, 2025 GoP 7,920,000.00 7,920,000.00 Support Social
piz - ;
- Section Services
DPWH, Capiz BIP - Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose 1st DEQ, Competitive Buildings/ Facilities to
300226117076000 Building, Barangay Bato, Panay, Capiz |Construction No Bidding Mar. 14, 2025 | Apr. 03, 2025 | Apr. 23, 2025 | May 02, 2025 GoP 7,920,000.00 7,920,000.00 Support Social
Section Services
DPWH, Capiz BIP - Multi-Purpose
Construction of Multi-Purpose 1st DEO, Competitive Buildings/ Facilities to
300226117077000 Building, Barangay Tico, Panay, Capiz |Construction No Bidding Mar. 14, 2025 | Apr. 03, 2025 | Apr. 23,2025 | May 02, 2025 GoP 6,930,000.00 6,930,000.00 Support Social
Section Services
Construction of Mulli-Purpose IIDSF;VI\;l;,OCaplz Competitive gllji’ldu'gg/t I::Jl::li-lli)t?:se to
300226117078000 g::l?zmg, Barangay Dayhagan, Pilar, Construction No Bidding Mar. 19, 2025 | Apr. 08, 2025 | Apr. 28, 2025 | May 07, 2025 GoP 6,930,000.00 6,930,000.00 Support Social
p Section Services
Construction of Multl-Purpose lePtvg:Elocap’Z Competitive gfj':ldlr?gl;lg/t I;::lgﬁg:: to
300226117079000 g:nl?zmg, Barangay Santa Fe, Pilar, Construction No Bidding Mar. 19, 2025 | Apr. 08, 2025 | Apr. 28, 2025 | May 07, 2025 GoP 4,950,000.00 4,950,000.00 Support Social
P Section Services
D ToRMEG Filigose ?ﬂHEbcaplz Competitive gﬂf’ad.r L:/UF?:TI?S: to
3002261 17080000 |Building, Barangay Tacas, - No ompe Mar. 19, 2025 | Apr. 08, 2025 | Apr. 28, 2025 | May 07, 2025 GoP 6,930,000.00 6,930,000.00 g
Pontevedra, Capiz Construction Bidding Support Social
- -ap Section Services
Construction of Multipurpose Building |DPWH, Capiz BIP - Multi-Purpose
Phase 1 in Roxas Memorial Provincial |1st DEO, Competitive Buildings/ Facilities to
300226121398000 Hospital, Brgy. Lanot, Roxas City, Construction No Bidding Mar. 19, 2025 | Apr. 08, 2025 | Apr. 28, 2025 | May 07, 2025 GoP 9,900,000.00 9,900,000.00 Support Social
Capiz Section Services
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; Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Is this an Remarks
Early . Source - S
Procurement PMO/ Mode of Advertisement/ e (brief description
Code (PAF) Program/Project End-User Procu_re.ment Procurement Posting of Sub.mlssnon_/ Notice of Award | Contract Signing of Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? 1B/REI Opening of Bids Funds Activity/ Project)
(Yes/No)
S e
300226121399000 |including Transport Terminal (Phase - No Bid dP Mar. 19, 2025 | Apr. 08, 2025 | Apr. 28, 2025 | May 07, 2025 GoP 14,850,000.00 14,850,000.00 9/ e |
1), Brgy Rosario, Pilar, Capiz Construction idding Support Social
4 4 . Section Services
Construction of Crisis Center for ?;Vl\;fébCaplz Competitive gf;:ldlr':’I lfs'/t l;:’:glri’g:: to
300226121415000 |Abused Women and Children, Pob. [ rr No b di‘r’] o Mar. 19, 2025 | Apr. 08, 2025 | Apr. 28, 2025 | May 07,2025 | GoP 14,850,000.00 14,850,000.00 Suppoft’ o
Tlaya, Panay, Capiz Section Services
DPWH, Capiz BIP - Multi-Purpose
Construction of Provincial Capitol, 1st DEO, Competitive Buildings/ Facilities to
300226121416000 |2 T Costtion No Bidding Mar. 19, 2025 | Apr. 08,2025 | Apr. 28, 2025 | May 07,2025 | GoP 29,700,000.00 29,700,000.00 | 8 ocil
Section Services
GOODS AND SERVICES
Procurement of General Services PPWH Competitive General Services
- ' Capiz 1st < GoP 357,191.00 357,191.00
Supplies DEO Bidding Supplies
1st Quarter No g;’g{:ﬁ'ﬁ"e Jan. 03, 2025 | Jan. 23,2025 | Feb. 07,2025 | Feb. 21,2025 | -do- 89,297.75 89,297.75 -do-
2nd Quarter No gi‘:j’gi‘r’;t'“"e Mar. 04, 2025 | Mar. 25, 2025 | Apr. 08, 2025 | Apr. 22,2025 | -do- 89,297.75 89,297.75 - do-
3rd Quarter No g;zrgi‘;zﬁt“’e Jun. 03,2025 | Jun. 24,2025 | Jul. 08,2025 | Jul. 22,2025 | -do- 89,297.75 89,297.75 - do -
4th Quarter No g%’;i’:;ﬁt"'e Sept. 02, 2025 | Sept. 23, 2025 | Oct. 03,2025 | Oct. 21,2025 | -do- 89,297.75 89,297.75 - do -
DPWH i
- Procurement of Office Equipment |Capiz 1st :;;::’et't“’e GoP 897,000.00 897,000.00 | Office Equipment
DEO ng
1st Quarter No g%’gi’r’;t'“"e Jan. 03, 2025 | Jan. 23,2025 | Feb. 07,2025 | Feb. 21,2025 | -do- 224,250.00 224,250.00 -do-
Competitive
2nd Quarter No Bidding Mar. 04, 2025 | Mar. 25, 2025 | Apr. 08, 2025 | Apr. 22, 2025 -do - 224,250,00 224,250.00 -do -
3rd Quarter No gi‘;’;'i‘;zt't"’e Jun. 03,2025 | Jun. 24,2025 | Jul. 08,2025 | Jut. 22,2025 | -do- 224,250.00 224,250.00 -do-
Competitive
4th Quarter No idding Sept, 02, 2025 | Sept. 23, 2025 | Oct. 03,2025 | Oct. 21, 2025 | -do- 224,250.00 224,250.00 -do-
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Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Code (PAP) Procurement PMO/ P rochar;'ant Mode of Advertisement/ Subrnission So:frce (brie?’f'!l:sa::;sption
Program/Project End-User s Procurement Posting of f ' | Notice of Award |Contract Signing Total MOOE co of Program/
Activity? IB/RET Opening of Bids Funds 3 ;
(Yes/No) Ji Activity/ Project)
. Procurement of IT Peripherals 2:";’1"1 st Competitive GoP 380,790.90 380,790.90 IT Peripherals and
and Accessories DE% Bidding e 17T | Accessories
1st Quarter No g&'g{:‘?t“’e Jan. 03,2025 | Jan. 23, 2025 | Feb. 07, 2025 | Feb. 21,2025 | -do- 95,197.73 95,197.73 -do-
2nd Quarter No g%'gi';‘;t't“’e Mar. 04, 2025 | Mar. 25, 2025 | Apr. 08, 2025 | Apr. 22,2025 | -do- 95,197.73 95,197.73 -do-
3rd Quarter No gi‘(’j’gifg't've Jun. 03,2025 | Jun. 24,2025 | Jul. 08,2025 | Jul. 22,2025 | -do- 95,197.73 95,197.73 -do-
4th Quarter No g:,“;ﬁ“;""’e Sept. 02, 2025 | Sept. 23, 2025 | Oct. 03,2025 | Oct. 21,2025 | -do- 95,197.73 | 95,197.73 - do -

Submitted by:

Recommending Approval:
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/8. SAMSON
it District Engineer
airperson

Approved by:

M. CRUZ

Head of Procuring Entity




