Is this an

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Earl Remarks
Code Procurement PMO/ Procurgme Mode of Advertisement/ |Submission Source of (brief
(PAP) Project End-User < = Procurement X nis Notice of | Contract | Funds description of
nt Activity? Posting of |/Opening of Award Signin Total MOOE co Project)
(Yes/No) IB/REI Bids aning 4
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program Roads:
(BIP) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to| DPWH- Competitive 5 o
Maijor / Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Road, Barangay| GCDEO Yes Bidding Va2 | s21e0 GaP | 4,890,000.00 CO":g‘gg,"’"
Talamban, Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program Roads:
(BIP) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to| DPWH- Competitive o5 P
Major / Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Road, Barangay] CCDEO Yo Bidding L 121192023 P 4,990,000.00 Con;igggon
Apas, Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program Roads:
(BIP) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to| DPWH- Competitive - i
Maijor / Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Road, Barangay] CCDEO Yes Bidding Uireteuta Lot S0P 4,850,000.00 Con;tgg:gon
Hipodromo, Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program = ER RO
(BIP) - Multi-Purpose Buildings / Facilities to Support Social Services - gg\éVE"g Yes C°BTd‘;ei:""e 11/30/2023 | 12/20/2023 GoP | 4,950,000.00 B;:':”;igrs'
Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Sawang Calero, Cebu City 9 P
. . Buildings:
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program - :
(BIP) - Multi-Purpose Buildings / Facilities fo Support Social Services - gg‘éVE"g Yes C‘;pod‘?:“"e 11/30/2023 | 12/20/2023 GoP 4,950,000.00 Cigﬁ';f;‘:"
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Sudlon |, Cebu City 9
Concrete
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program DPWH- Competitive Coilg:?l::,gfm )
(BIP) - Multi-Purpose Buildings / Facilities to Support Social Services - CCDEO Yes ;’d%in 11/30/2023 12/20/2023 GoP 4,950,000.00 Low Rise -
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Bulacao, Cebu City ! 9
Concrete
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program Roads:
(BIP) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to| DPWH- Competitive 5 P
Major / Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Road, Barangay| CCDEO Yes Bidding R0Rms | 1212002023 Sk 4.850,000.00 Rehibc"'ctzf,“‘m
Ermita, Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program Roid:
(BIP) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to| DPWH- Competitive - g
Major / Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Road, Barangay| CCDEQ Yes Bidding Floza TRE0E0E3 e 4,950,000.00 Reh?bcllgiflon
Poblacion Pardo, Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program Roads:
(BIP) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to| DPWH- Competitive o e
Major / Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Road, Barangay|] CCDEO Yes Bidding nienems 12/20/2023 GoP 4350,000.00 Con;tcr;lg:;’lon

Pulangbato, Cebu City
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Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
Code Procurement PMO/ ProEcEllJrrIy & Mode of Advertisement/ |Submission Source of (brief
(PAP) Project End-User irem Procurement " ubmi Notice of | Contract| Funds description of
nt Activity? Posting of |/Opening of Award Signin Total MOOE CcO Project)
(Yes/No) IB/REI Bids gning
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program Roads:
(BIP) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to| DPWH- Competitive 5 A
Major / Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Road, Barangay| CCDEO You Bidding Hiahi2020 Lo s A 900,00000 CGonsiruction
; pPCCP
Zapatera, Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program Roads:
(BIP) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to| DPWH- Competitive 5 s
Major / Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Road, Barangay| CCDEO Yes Bidding WiERNeOsD 22 el 4,950,000.00 Con:tcr:lgson
Lorega, Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program Roads:
(BIP) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to| DPWH- Competitive A
Major / Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Road with| CCDEO | Y©S Bidding Voo | 16202028 GoP | %250,000.00 Canstmchon
: \ . PCCP
Drainage System, Barangay Sambag I, Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program Roads:
(BIP) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to| DPWH- Competitive A
Major / Strategic Public Buildings / Faciliies - Construction of Road with| CCDEO Yes Bidding WRo2023 | 1212072023 GoP 4.880,900.00 C°“;’(':”C°;'°"
Drainage System, Barangay T. Padilla, Cebu City
0O02: Protect Lives and Properties Against Major Floods - Flood Management Flood Control -
Program - Construction / Rehabilitation of Flood Mitigation Facilities within| DPWH- Competitive P Construction -
Major River Basins and Principal Rivers - Construction of Flood Mitigation| CCDEO Yo Bidding L Faihates GoP PO, 0000 Slope
Structure along Mananga River, Barangay Buot-Taup, Cebu City Protection
0OO02: Protect Lives and Properties Against Major Floods - Flood Management Flood Control -
Program - Construction / Rehabilitation of Flood Mitigation Facilities within| DPWH- Competitive " kol
Major River Basins and Principal Rivers - Construction of Flood Mitigation| CCDEO Yes Bidding TR0 Lo el 97,808,540.00 Co[gf;ﬁ:hzn
Structure along A. Gabuya St. and N. Bacalso Ave., Cebu City 9
Convergence and Special Support Program - Sustainable Infrastructure Bridge:
Projects Alleviating Gaps (SIPAG) - Access Roads and / Or Bridges from the| DPWH- Competitive " e
National Road/s leading to Major / Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities -| CCDEO . Bidding 12/29/2023 | 1/18/2023 i G/560/000.00 C"gz‘r:;‘f:f;"
Construction of Concrete Bridge, Barangay Buhisan, Cebu City, Cebu
0OO01: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road Systerm - Asset Preserbation DPWH- Competitive Roads:
Program - Preventive Maintenance - Tertiary Roads -AS Fortuna St - Chainage CCDEO No Bidpd?n 12/29/2023 1/18/2023 GoP 16,179,800.00 Rehabilitation -
0 - Chainage 129, Chainage 0 - Chainage 129, Cebu City 9 Asphalt
0OO1: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road Systerm - Asset Preserbation DPWH- Competitive Roads:
Program - Preventive Maintenance - Tertiary Roads - B Rodriguez St - CCDEO No BidF:ﬁn 12/29/2023 1/18/2023 GoP 42,630,000.00 Rehabilitation -
Chainage 0 - Chainage 496, Cebu City 9 Asphalt
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Is this an

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Earl Remarks
Code Procurement PMO/ Procuere Mode of Advertisement/ |Submission Source of! (brief
(PAP) Project End-User e Procurement " 2 Notice of | Contract| Funds description of
nt Activity? Posting of |/Opening of Award Signin Total MOOE co Project)
(Yes/No) IB/REI Bids gning )
OO1: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road Systerm - Asset Preserbation DPWH- Competitive Roads:
Program - Preventive Maintenance - Tertiary Roads - Gorordo Ave - CCDEO No Bid%in 12/29/2023 1/18/2023 GoP 65,627,720.00 Rehabilitation -
K0003+757 - KO004+567, Cebu City 9 Asphalt
OO1: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road Systerm - Asset Preserbation DPWH- Competitive Roads:
Program - Praventive Maintenance - Tertiary Roads - Imus Rd - Chainage 0 - CCDEO No Bid‘::ﬁn 12/29/2023 1/18/2023 GoP 103,734,605.00 Rehabilitation -
Chainage 1076, Chainage 0 - Chainage 1070 9 Asphalt
Local Program - National Building Program - Buildings and other Structures - Bulidings:
Multipurpose / Facilities - Construction (Completion) of Professional DR No Cor.npe?mlve 12/29/2023 1/18/2023 GoP 29,400,000.00 Construs:tlon )
; i s CCDEO Bidding Low Rise -
Regulation Commission, Sudlon, Barangay Lahug, Cebu City c
oncrete
Local Program - National Building Program - Buildings and other Structures - Seicige
Multipurpose / Facilities - Construction (Completion) of Vicente Sotto Memorial| 2F WH- No Competilive 12/20/2023 | 1/18/2023 GoP | 67,550,000.00 Consdstiotion -
Y . CCDEO Bidding High Rise -
Hospital, Cebu City c
oncrete
QO1: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road System - Asset Preservation
Program - Rehabilitation/ Reconstruction/ Upgrading of Damaged Paved DPWH- Competitive
Roads - Tertiary Roads - F Sotto Drive - Chainage 0 - Chainage 118, Chainage| CCDEO bio Bidding Wamoes Rl2A2023 el H,664,000.00 ROAD
127 - Chainage 460
OO1: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road System - Asset Preservation DPWH- Competitive
Program - Rehabilitation/ Reconstruction/ Upgrading of Damaged Paved CCDEO No Bid%in 1/12/2024 2/2/2024 GoP 8,879,000.00 ROAD
Roads - Tertiary Roads - Mabini-Lopez Jaena St - Chainage 0 - Chainage 442 9
OO1: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road System - Asset Preservation
Program - Rehabilitation/ Reconstruction of Roads with Slips, Slope Collapse, | DPWH- Competitive
and Landslide - Secondary Roads - Cebu-Balamban Transcentral Highway - CCDEO Ho Bidding WiaZea delaled i FEULNGD READ
K0011 + 274 - KOO11 + 405
OO1: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road System - Asset Preservation
Program - Rehabilitation/ Reconstruction of Roads with Slips, Slope Collapse, | DPWH- Competitive
and Landslide - Secondary Roads - Cebu-Balamban Transcentral Highway - CCDEO No Bidding 11272024 B GoP 44,000,000.00 ROAD
K0015 + 683 - KO015 + 727
OO1: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road System - Asset Preservation
Program - Rehabilitation/ Reconstruction of Roads with Slips, Slope Collapse, | DPWH- Competitive
and Landslide - Secondary Roads - Cebu-Balamban Transcentral Highway - CCDEO o Bidding 122028 21212024 S0P 14,000,000,00 R

K0016 + 165 - K0016 + 201
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Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
Code Procurement PMO/ PmECZ’r'Zme Mode of ratttamm Sdmiaion Source of (brief
j - i d d ipti f
(PAP) Project End-User nt Activity? Procurement Posting of |/Opening of NZ::,ZerdOf (;?n;z:d Funds Total MOOE co es;:rr:)pj:e::otr)l of
(Yes/No) IB/REI Bids gning

OO1: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road System - Asset Preservation

Program - Rehabilitation/ Reconstruction of Roads with Slips, Slope Collapse, | DPWH- Competitive 000 ROAD

and Landslide - Secondary Roads - Cebu-Balamban Transcentral Highway - CCDEO W Bidding 1/12/2024 2/2/2024 i 15,109.000.00

K0026 + 834 - K0026 + 879

OO1: Ensure Safe and Reliable National Road System - Network Development DPWH- Competitive

Program - Construction of By-Pass and Diversion Roads - Constructon of CCDEO No Bid%in 1/12/2024 2/2/2024 GoP 100,000,000.00 ROAD

Mambaling South Boulevard, Cebu City o

0O02: Protect lives and Properties Against Major Floods - Flood Management

Program - Construction/ Rehabilitation of Flood Mitigation Facilities within DPWH- Competitive

] ) ) . . : Skl Y ,000,000. C

Major River Basins and Principal Rivers - Construction of Flood Mitigation CCDEO o Bidding V2ia0e4 2eR0A e s e FCD

Structure along Butuanon River, Barangay Talamban, Cebu City

Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program

(BIP) - Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to DPWH- Competitive 00.000 ROAD

Major/ Strategic Public Buildings/ Facilities - Construction of Road, Barangay | CCDEO He Bidding Widlaon #anse GoP $,000,000.00 “

Tejero, Cebu City

Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program

(BIP) - Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Road/s Leading to DPWH- Competitive 00.000 AD

Major/ Strategic Public Buildings/ Facilities - Construction of Road, Barangay | CCDEO No Bidding 0 2/9/2024 BaF 5,000,000.00 RO

Mabolo, Cebu City

Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program

(BIP) - Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to DPWH- Competitive 000 ROAD

Major/ Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Road Concreting with Slope CCDEO Ko Bidding V204 2hiz024 Gop 5,000,000.00

Protection, Brgy. Adlaon, Cebu City

Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program

(BIP) - Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to DPWH- Competitive p 5 ROAD

Major/ Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Road Concreting, Brgy. Lusaran, | CCDEO o Bidding Viaaoad 22024 o 00,0504

Cebu City

Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program

(BIP) - Flood Mitigation Structures Protecting Major / Strategic Public Buildings | DPWH- Competitive 5.000.000 FCD

/ Facilities - Construction of Flood Mitigation Structure, Barangay Kamagayan, | CCDEO No Bidding V12024 etz GoP 000,000.00

Cebu City

Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program

(BIP) - Flood Mitigation Structures Protecting Major / Strategic Public Buildings | DPWH- Competitive 000 FcD

/ Facilities - Construction of Flood Mitigation Structure, Barangay Cogon CCDEO Na Bidding s e GoP B H0aR0000

Ramos, Cebu City
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. Is this an Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
Code Procurement PMO/ ProEc‘:r::me Mode of Advertisement/ |Submission Source of (brief
j - i d descripti f
(PAP) Project End-User nt Activity? Procurement Posting of |/Opening of Nz\t,:,(:::f (;cimrt‘;:ct Funds Total MOOE co ;:rr:j)e;? of
(Yes/No) IB/REI Bids gning
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program
(BIP) - Flood Mitigation Structures Protecting Major / Strategic Public Buildings | DPWH- Competitive
/ Facilities - Construction of Flood Mitigation Structure, Barangay Day-as, Cebu| CCDEO Ne Bidding LU 2802024 . GoP $1906.000.00 Fol
City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program
(BIP) - Flood Mitigation Structures Protecting Major / Strategic Public Buildings | DPWH- Competitive F
' CD
/ Facilities - Construction of Flood Mitigation Structure, Barangay Camputhaw, | CCDEO Mo Bidding 1192024 anizes Gof il08R00.00
Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program
(BIP) - Flood Mitigation Structures Protecting Major / Strategic Public Buildings | DPWH- Competitive
. . o o1t ,000,000. CD
/ Facilities - Gonstruction of Flood Mitigation Structure, Barangay Kasambagan,| CCDEQ No Bidding 111672024 RIS GoP 5,000,000.00 F
Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program
(BIP) - Access Roads and/or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to DPWH- Competitive cD
Major/ Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Slope Protection | CCDEO No Bidding Taaea024 20R8 anp B 200,000.00 F
Structure, Brgy. San Jose, Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program
(BIP) - Accesss Roads and/or Bridges from the National Road/s leading to DPWH- Competitive
i . y i g, 5 : osa ,000,000. CcD
Major/ Strategic Public Buildings / Facilities - Construction of Slope Protection | CCDEO Ne Bidding 124 ARGz GoP %000,000,00 P
Structure, Brgy. Budla-an, Cebu City
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program DPWH- Competitive
(BIP) - Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to Support Social Services - CCDEO No BidF:iin 2/2/2024 2/23/2024 GoP 5,000,000.00 MBP
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Budlaan, Cebu City g
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program DPWH- Competitive
(BIP) - Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to Support Social Services - CCDEO No Bidpdin 2/2/2024 2/23/2024 GoP 5,000,000.00 MBP
Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Pahina Central, Cebu City 9
Convergence and Special Support Program - Basic Infrastructure Program DPWH- Combetitive
(BIP) - Multi-Purpose Buildings/ Facilities to Support Social Services - CCDEO No BidF:iin 2/2/2024 2/23/2024 GoP 5,000,000.00 MBP
Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Busay, Cebu City 9
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