DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an
Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CcoO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
300117208997000 Cpnstructlon of roads, Barangay Looc, Calamba Laguna Yes Compgtltlve Wednesday, November 18, 2020 Monday, December 07, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 GAA 2021 3,000,000.00 3,000,000.00 Construction of roads
City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
300104221656000 |Construction of Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay | Laguna Yes Competitve |y o dnesday, November 18, 2020 Monday, December 07, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 | GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000,00 | Construction of Multi
Camaligan, Calamba City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
Construction/Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Laguna Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation
300104221666000 |Building, Barangay Chrysanthemum, San Pedro, 9 Yes . p_ Wednesday, November 18, 2020 Monday, December 07, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 ) .
Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding of Multi-Purpose Building
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (covered Laguna Competitive Construction of Multi-
300104221640000 |court with stage) at Pulo NHS, Barangay Pulo, 9 Yes . p_ Wednesday, November 18, 2020 Monday, December 07, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 GAA 2021 8,000,000.00 8,000,000.00 .
: 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
Cabuyao City, Laguna
300117208998000 |COnstruction/Rehabilitation of roads, Barangay San |- Laguna Yes Competitive Friday, November 20, 2020 Wednesday, December 09, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 | GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000,00 | Construction/Rehabilitation
Antonio, Bay, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding of roads
300109200941000 |'MProvement of Drainage in Barangay Canlalay, Laguna Yes Competitive Friday, November 20, 2020 Wednesday, December 09, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 | GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 | Improvement of Drainage
Bifian City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (covered Laguna Competitive Construction of Multi-
300104221642000 |court), Lawa Integrated High School, Barangay g Yes npe Friday, November 20, 2020 Wednesday, December 09, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 GAA 2021 8,000,000.00 8,000,000.00 o
. 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
Lawa, Calamba City, Laguna
300108200358000 |COnstuction/improvement of Drainage in Barangay|  Laguna Yes Competitive Friday, November 20, 2020 Wednesday, December 09, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 | GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 |CONStruction/mprovement of
Canlalay, Bifian City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Drainage
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an
Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CcoO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
300107201169000 |COnstruction/Rehabilitation of Drainage System at | Laguna Yes Competitive Friday, November 20, 2020 Wednesday, December 09, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 | GAA 2021 12,000,000.00 12,000,000.00 | COnstruction/Rehabilitation
Barangay Mayondon, Los Bafios, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding of Drainage System
Construction of Revetment along Sta. Rosa River Laguna Competitive , , :
320101106102000 o ) Yes i Friday, November 27, 2020 Wednesday, December 16, 2020 Friday, February 19, 2021 Monday, February 22, 2021 GAA 2021 80,058,000.00 80,058,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
at Brgy. Loma, Bifian City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Half- Laguna Competitive Construction of Multi-
300104221646000 |Covered Court), Barangay Langgam, San Pedro 9 Yes . P . Friday, December 04, 2020 Wednesday, December 23, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 GAA 2021 3,000,000.00 3,000,000.00 .
. 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
City, Laguna
. Laguna Competitive . . .
300117208988000 |Concreting of Road at Barangay Calo, Bay, Laguna ond DEO Yes Bidding Friday, December 04, 2020 Wednesday, December 23, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Concreting of Road
Construction/Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Laguna Competitive Construction/ Rehabilitation
300104221668000 |Building, Barangay Sampaguita Village, San Pedro, 9 Yes . P . Friday, December 04, 2020 Wednesday, December 23, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 ) o
Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding of Multi-Purpose Building
320101106723000 |COnstruction of Revetment at Brgy. Bungahan, Laguna Yes Competitive Friday, December 04, 2020 Wednesday, December 23, 2020 Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 | GAA 2021 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Bifian City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Laguna Competitive . . Construction of Multi-
300104221654000 Bagong Kalsada, Calamba City, Laguna ond DEO Yes Bidding Friday, December 18, 2020 Tuesday, January 19, 2021 Friday, January 29, 2021 Monday, February 08, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Purpose Building,
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building at Laguna Laguna Competitive Construction of Multi-
300104221652000 |State Polytechnic University - Los Bafios 2nngEO Yes Bid%ling Friday, December 18, 2020 Tuesday, January 19, 2021 Friday, January 29, 2021 Monday, February 08, 2021 GAA 2021 9,000,000.00 9,000,000.00 Purpose Building

Campus, Barangay Malinta, Los Bafios, Laguna
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an
Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
Rehabilitation/ Reconstruction of Roads with Slips, Laguna Compaetitive Rehabilitation/
310109100646000 |Slope Collapse and Landslide - Tertiary Roads - g Yes npe Friday, December 18, 2020 Tuesday, January 19, 2021 Friday, January 29, 2021 Monday, February 08, 2021 GAA 2021 35,000,000.00 35,000,000.00 Reconstruction of Roads
o 2nd DEO Bidding
Makiling Park Rd. - KO066+400 - KO067+150
320101106718000 |COnstruction of Flood Control at Brgy. San Laguna Yes Competitive Friday, December 18, 2020 Tuesday, January 19, 2021 Friday, January 29, 2021 Monday, February 08, 2021 GAA 2021 40,000,000.00 40,000,000.00 | Construction of Flood
Francisco, Bifian City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Control
Construction of Revetment along Tabon Laguna Competitive
320101106722000 |Waterways, (near Tabon Bridge), Los Banos, 2nngEO Yes Bid%ing Friday, December 18, 2020 Tuesday, January 19, 2021 Friday, January 29, 2021 Monday, February 08, 2021 GAA 2021 50,000,000.00 50,000,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Laguna
320101106724000 |COnstruction of Revetment at Brgy. Sto.Domingo, | Laguna Yes Competitive Friday, December 18, 2020 Tuesday, January 19, 2021 Friday, January 29, 2021 Monday, February 08, 2021 GAA 2021 50,000,000.00 50,000,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Bay, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
Construction of Revetment along Tabon Laguna Competitive
320101106103000 |Waterways, (near Sto.Domingo Road), Brgy. Sto. 2nngEO Yes Bid%in Friday, December 18, 2020 Tuesday, January 19, 2021 Friday, February 19, 2021 Monday, February 22, 2021 GAA 2021 100,000,000.00 100,000,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Domingo, Bay, Laguna 9
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Senior Laguna Competitive ‘Construction of Multi-
300104221650000 |Citizen Building), Barangay San Francisco, Binan, 9 Yes . P ; Friday, December 25, 2020 Monday, January 18, 2021 Tuesday, January 26, 2021 Friday, February 05, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 ..
Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay Laguna Competitive . : '‘Construction of Multi-
300104221655000 Bunggo, Calamba City, Laguna ond DEO Yes Bidding Friday, December 25, 2020 Monday, January 18, 2021 Tuesday, January 26, 2021 Friday, February 05, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Purpose Building
Construction of River Control, Barangay Ganado, Laguna Competitive . : . .
300107201165000 Bifian, Laguna ond DEO Yes Bidding Friday, December 25, 2020 Monday, January 18, 2021 Tuesday, January 26, 2021 Friday, February 05, 2021 GAA 2021 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 [Construction of River Control
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an
Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User . Procurement . . . . . . _— Funds o .
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CcoO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
Construction of Lined Canal, Barangay Sto Tomas, | Laguna Competitive . : . .
300107201163000 | .. Yes i Friday, December 25, 2020 Monday, January 18, 2021 Tuesday, January 26, 2021 Friday, February 05, 2021 GAA 2021 40,000,000.00 40,000,000.00 | Construction of Lined Canal
Bifian, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
Construction of Revetment along Maitim Laguna Competitive
320101106721000 |(Waterways, (near F.T. San Luis Road, Puypuy 2nngEO Yes Bidr()jin Friday, December 25, 2020 Monday, January 18, 2021 Tuesday, January 26, 2021 Friday, February 05, 2021 GAA 2021 50,000,000.00 50,000,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Side), Bay, Laguna 9
Construction of Flood Mitigation Structure, Laguna Competitive , , ‘Construction of Flood
300107201156000 Langkiwa, Bifian, Laguna ond DEO Yes Bidding Friday, December 25, 2020 Monday, January 18, 2021 Tuesday, January 26, 2021 Friday, February 05, 2021 GAA 2021 50,000,000.00 50,000,000.00 Mitigation Structure
Construction of River Control along San Isidro Laguna Competitive
320101106726000 |River, (near Land Fill Area) San Antonio, San 2nngEO Yes Bid%lin Friday, December 25, 2020 Monday, January 18, 2021 Tuesday, January 26, 2021 Friday, February 05, 2021 GAA 2021 50,000,000.00 50,000,000.00 [Construction of River Control
Pedro City, Laguna 9
Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Building, Brgy. San Laguna Competitive : 'Rehabilitation of Multi-
300104221673000 Antonio, Bifian City, Laguna ond DEO es Bidding Friday, January 08, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 Wednesday, February 17, 2021 Monday, February 22, 2021 GAA 2021 3,000,000.00 3,000,000.00 Purpose Building
Rehabilitation of NIA Road Phase 2 (San Isidro- Laguna Competitive
300117208999000 |Banaybanay-Pulo-Niugan section), Cabuyao City, 2nngEO Yes Bid%ing Friday, January 08, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 Wednesday, February 17, 2021 Monday, February 22, 2021 GAA 2021 24,000,000.00 24,000,000.00 | Rehabilitation of NIA Road
Laguna
Construction of Revetment along Maitim Laguna Competitive
320101106720000 |Waterways, (near F.T. San Luis Road, Maitim 2nngEO Yes Bid%lin Friday, January 08, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 Wednesday, February 17, 2021 Monday, February 22, 2021 GAA 2021 29,034,000.00 29,034,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Side), Bay, Laguna 9
Construction of River Control along San Isidro Laguna Competitive
320101106727000 |River, Brgy. United Bayanihan and Brgy. 2nngEO Yes Bid%ling Friday, January 08, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 Wednesday, February 17, 2021 Monday, February 22, 2021 GAA 2021 32,165,000.00 32,165,000.00 [Construction of River Control

Magsaysay, San Pedro City, Laguna
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)
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Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
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(Yes / No)
Construction (Completion) of Revetment, Bifian Laguna Competitive , Construction (Completion) of
320101106717000 River, Bifian City, Laguna ond DEO Yes Bidding Friday, January 08, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 39,000,000.00 39,000,000.00 Revetment
Construction of River Control near Bayanbayan Laguna Competitive
320101106728000 (Bridge, Brgy. San Antonio and Brgy. San Vicente, 2nngEO Yes Bidr()jin Friday, January 08, 2021 Wednesday, January 27, 2021 Wednesday, February 17, 2021 Monday, February 22, 2021 GAA 2021 50,000,000.00 50,000,000.00 [Construction of River Control
San Pedro City, Laguna 9
Construction of Revetment along Cabuyao River, Laguna Competitive
320101106719000 |(near Bigaa-Caingin Bridge), Brgy. Bigaa, Cabuyao 2nngEO No Bid%lin Thursday, January 14, 2021 Tuesday, February 02, 2021 Tuesday, February 23, 2021 Sunday, February 28, 2021 GAA 2021 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
City, Laguna 9
Construction of Revetment along Mapagong Laguna Competitive
320101106101000 |Waterways, (near SLEX Bridge km 46+200), 2nngEO No Bid%lin Thursday, January 14, 2021 Tuesday, February 02, 2021 Tuesday, February 23, 2021 Sunday, February 28, 2021 GAA 2021 57,042,000.00 57,042,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Calamba City, Laguna 9
Asset Preservation Program - Preventive
Maintenance - Primary Roads - Calamba - Sta. Laguna Competitive Asset Preservation Program -
310101100399000 |Cruz - Famy Jct Rd - KO0O66 + 000 - KO066 + 370, 2nngEO No Bid%in Thursday, January 14, 2021 Tuesday, February 02, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 75,000,000.00 75,000,000.00 Preventive Maintenance -
K0066 + 635 - KO067 + 000, KOO67 + 000 - KOO67 g Primary Roads
+ 260
Construction of revetment along San Juan River, Laguna Competitive : .
300107201164000 Barangay Dos(Purok 6), Calamba City, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Friday, January 15, 2021 Wednesday, February 03, 2021 Wednesday, February 24, 2021 Monday, March 01, 2021 GAA 2021 2,000,000.00 2,000,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Covered Laguna Competitive . '‘Construction of Multi-
300104221674000 Court), Brgy. Batong Malake, Los Bafios, Laguna | 2nd DEO No Bidding Friday, January 15, 2021 Wednesday, February 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 7,000,000.00 7,000,000.00 Purpose Building
300117208990000 |SPhalt Overiay along Sitio Kapayapaan, Barangay | Laguna No Competiive Friday, January 15, 2021 Wednesday, February 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Asphalt Overla
Canlubang, Calamba City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Y Y Lo Y y P, Y, Uy 29, Y, Uy 25, R o P y
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)
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Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CcoO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
Repair/ Rehabilitation/ Improvement of NIA road Laguna Compaetitive Repair/ Rehabilitation/
300117208989000 [Phase 2, San Isidro-Banay-banay-Pulo-Niugan 9 No . P . Friday, January 15, 2021 Wednesday, February 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 25,000,000.00 25,000,000.00 P
. . 2nd DEO Bidding Improvement of NIA road
section, Cabuyao City, Laguna
Asset Preservation Program - Preventive Laguna Competitive Asset Preservation Program -
310103100685000 [Maintenance - Tertiary Roads - Bay Poblacion Rd- 9 No . P . Friday, January 15, 2021 Wednesday, February 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 27,000,000.00 27,000,000.00 Preventive Maintenance -
2nd DEO Bidding .
K0068+000 - KO068+608 Tertiary Roads
300104221675000 |Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Building, Brgy. Sto. | Laguna No Competitive Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, February 10, 2021 Thursday, March 04, 2021 Tuesday, March 09, 2021 GAA 2021 3,000,000.00 3,000,00000 | Renabiltation of Multi-
Domingo, Bay, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
Construction/Rehabilitation/Improvement of Laguna Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation/I
300107201167000 |Drainage Canal at Brgy. Marinig, Cabuyao City, 2nngEO No Bid%lin Friday, January 22, 2021 Wednesday, February 10, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 mprovement of Drainage
Laguna 9 Canal
300117209002000 |V//déning of Road (Sitio Silangan to Banatin), Laguna No Competitive Friday, January 29, 2021 Wednesday, February 17, 2021 Thursday, March 11, 2021 Tuesday, March 16, 2021 GAA 2021 2,500,000.00 2,500,000.00 Widening of Road
Barangay La Mesa, Calamba City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
Construction/Rehabilitation of Mult-Purpose Laguna Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation
300104221660000 |Building (Health Center/Day Care Center), Tubigan, 9 No . p_ Friday, January 29, 2021 Wednesday, February 17, 2021 Thursday, March 11, 2021 Tuesday, March 16, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 . .
o 2nd DEO Bidding of Multi-Purpose Building
Binan, Laguna
Off-Carriageway Improvement - Secondary Roads -| Laguna Competitive Off-Carriageway
310208100332000 Sta. Rosa - Ulat - Tagaytay Rd. - K0048+776 ond DEO No Bidding Friday, January 29, 2021 Wednesday, February 17, 2021 Thursday, March 11, 2021 Tuesday, March 16, 2021 GAA 2021 28,834,000.00 28,834,000.00 Improvemsr;;—dgecondary
Construction of Revetment along Narra Road, San Laguna Competitive . :
300107201158000 . No 1 Friday, January 29, 2021 Wednesday, February 17, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 30,000,000.00 30,000,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Pedro City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)
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(Yes / No)
Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Building (Covered Laguna Competitive Rehabilitation of Multi-
300104221671000 Court), Barangay Gulod, Cabuyao City, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Thursday, February 04, 2021 Tuesday, February 23, 2021 Monday, March 15, 2021 Monday, March 22, 2021 GAA 2021 3,000,000.00 3,000,000.00 Purpose Building
300104221651000 |COnstruction of Multi-Purpose Building at Barangay | - Laguna No Competitve |+ 1sday, February 04, 2021 Tuesday, February 23, 2021 Monday, March 15, 2021 Monday, March 22, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000,00 | Construction of Multi
Maahas, Los Bafios, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
Concreting/Improvement of Road (Phase 2), Laguna Competitive Concreting/ Improvement of
300117208992000 Barangay Santo Nifio, Bifian City, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Thursday, February 04, 2021 Tuesday, February 23, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Road
300107201162000 |Construction of Lined Canal, Barangay Loma, Laguna No Competitive Thursday, February 04, 2021 Tuesday, February 23, 2021 Monday, March 15, 2021 Monday, March 22, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 | Construction of Lined Canal
Bifian, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
Off-Carriageway Improvement - Primary Roads - Laguna Competitive Off-Carriageway
310207100143000 |Calamba - Sta. Cruz - Famy Jct. Rd. - KO0O61+593 - 2nngEO No Bid%in Thursday, February 04, 2021 Tuesday, February 23, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 11,691,000.00 11,691,000.00 Improvement - Primary
K001+860 g Roads
300104221672000 |Rehabiltation of Multi-Purpose Building, Barangay | Laguna No Competitive Friday, February 12, 2021 Wednesday, March 03, 2021 Monday, March 22, 2021 Monday, March 29, 2021 GAA 2021 3,000,000.00 3,000,00000 | Renabiltation of Multi
Halang, Calamba City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
300117208996000 |COnStruction/mprovement of Roads, Barangay Laguna No Competitive Friday, February 12, 2021 Wednesday, March 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 |CONStruction/Improvement of
Lecheria, Calamba City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Roads
Construction of Multipurpose Building ( Los Bafos Laguna Competitive . Construction of Multipurpose
300104221639000 Learning Center), Brgy.Anos, Los Bafios, Laguna | 2nd DEO No Bidding Friday, February 12, 2021 Wednesday, March 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Building
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an
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Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)

300107201166000 |SOnstruction of Slope Protection, Barangay Laguna No Competitive Friday, February 12, 2021 Wednesday, March 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 20,000,000.00 20,000,000,00 | Construction of Slope
Balibago, Santa Rosa, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Protection
Construction/Improvement of roads with drainage Laguna Competitive , Construction/Improvement of

300117208995000 . No - Friday, February 12, 2021 Wednesday, March 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 30,000,000.00 30,000,000.00
structures, Calamba City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding roads
Construction of Women and Children Crisis Center,| Laguna Competitive , Construction of Women and

300104221638000 Brgy. San Antonio, Bifian, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Friday, February 12, 2021 Wednesday, March 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 30,000,000.00 30,000,000.00 Children Crisis Center
Construction/ Upgrading/ Rehabilitation of Drainage Laguna Competitive ggﬁ;&ﬁg&?{;pg:;iggé

310112100252000 |along National Roads - Tertiary Roads - Makiling 9 No . P . Friday, February 12, 2021 Wednesday, March 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 33,000,000.00 33,000,000.00 ) 9

2nd DEO Bidding along National Roads -
Park Rd - KO063 + (-273) - KO063 + 985 .
Tertiary Roads
Construction of Revetment/Riverwall along Laguna Competitive

300107201157000 |Tunasan River, (near Narra Road), Brgy. San 2nngEO No Bid?jin Friday, February 12, 2021 Wednesday, March 03, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 40,000,000.00 40,000,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Antonio, San Pedro City, Laguna 9

300104221637000 |COnstruction of Mult-Purpose Building with Stage, | Laguna No Competitive Friday, February 19, 2021 Wednesday, March 10, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 |  Construction of Mult-
Brgy. Baybayin, Los Bafios, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building

300104221657000 |SOnstruction of Multi-Purpose Building, Brgy. Dela | Laguna No Competitive Friday, February 19, 2021 Wednesday, March 10, 2021 Tuesday, March 23, 2021 Sunday, March 28, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 |  Construction of Mult-
Paz, Bifian City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Covered Laguna Competitive Construction of Multi-

300104221641000 |Court), Don Pablo Subdivision, Canlalay, Bifian, 2nngEO No Bid%ling Friday, February 19, 2021 Wednesday, March 10, 2021 Tuesday, March 23, 2021 Sunday, March 28, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Purpose Building

Laguna
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an
Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CcoO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
300107201159000 |Renabiltation of drainage canal along Brgys. Sto | Laguna No Competitive Friday, February 19, 2021 Wednesday, March 10, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 | Rehabilitation of drainage
Nifno & San Vicente, Binan, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding canal
Off-Carriageway Improvement - Tertiary Roads - Laguna Competitive Off-Carriageway
310209100307000 Bay Poblacion Rd - KOO67 + 188 - KO067 + 570 ond DEO No Bidding Friday, February 19, 2021 Wednesday, March 10, 2021 Tuesday, March 23, 2021 Sunday, March 28, 2021 GAA 2021 14,293,000.00 14,293,000.00 Improvegg;tjé Tertiary
320101106725000 |SONstruction of Revetment along San Juan River, | Laguna No Competitive Friday, February 19, 2021 Wednesday, March 10, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 30,000,000.00 30,000,000.00 | Construction of Revetment
Barangay San Juan, Calamba City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Y y L9 Y, ’ Y, Uy L9, Y, Uy 26, ' ’ ' o
Construction of Ulango Bridge along Barangay Laguna Competitive
300119200494000 |Ulango and Barangay Kay-anlog (Phase 2), 2nngEO No Bid%lin Friday, February 26, 2021 Wednesday, March 17, 2021 Thursday, April 08, 2021 Tuesday, April 13, 2021 GAA 2021 4,000,000.00 4,000,000.00 Construction of Bridge
Calamba City, Laguna 9
Construction of Ulango Bridge along Barangay Laguna Competitive
300119200493000 |Ulango and Barangay Kay-anlog (Phase 1), 2nngEO No Bid%in Friday, February 26, 2021 Wednesday, March 17, 2021 Thursday, April 08, 2021 Tuesday, April 13, 2021 GAA 2021 11,000,000.00 11,000,000.00 Construction of Bridge
Calamba City, Laguna 9
Asset Preservation Program - Rehabilitation/ .
. ) . . Asset Preservation Program -
Reconstruction of National Roads with Slips, Slope o
) . Rehabilitation/
Collapse, and Landslide - Tertiary Roads - Mt Laguna Competitive Reconstruction of National
310109100551000 |Makiling Eco Garden Rd - KO064 + 080 - KO064 + 9 No . P . Friday, February 26, 2021 Wednesday, March 17, 2021 Thursday, April 08, 2021 Tuesday, April 13, 2021 GAA 2021 53,023,000.00 53,023,000.00 ) .
2nd DEO Bidding Roads with Slips, Slope
300, KO064 + 330 - KO064 + 440, KO064 + 500 - Collanse. and Landslide -
K0064 + 664, KO065 + 195 - KO065 + 483, KO065 I?I'eriiar Roads
+ 805 - KO065 + 918, KO065 + 936 - KO066 + 020 y
Construction/improvement of Multi-Purpose Laguna Competitive Construction/Improvement of
300104221648000 |Building (Rizal Shrine) including other structures g No . P ; Friday, March 05, 2021 Tuesday, April 06, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 4,000,000.00 4,000,000.00 . P L
- . 2nd DEO Bidding Multi-Purpose Building
and facilities, Calamba City, Laguna
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building at Phase 3 Laguna Competitive Construction of Multi-
300104221653000 |Garden Villas Subdivision, Barangay Malusak, g No NpE Friday, March 05, 2021 Tuesday, April 06, 2021 Tuesday, April 27, 2021 Monday, May 03, 2021 GAA 2021 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 .
2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building

Santa Rosa, Laguna
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an
Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CcoO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
Construction/Rehabilitation of Mult-Purpose Laguna Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation
300104221659000 (Building (Covered Court) at Barangay Diezmo, g No Npe Friday, March 12, 2021 Monday, April 19, 2021 Tuesday, May 11, 2021 Monday, May 17, 2021 GAA 2021 3,000,000.00 3,000,000.00 . .
. 2nd DEO Bidding of Multi-Purpose Building
Cabuyao City, Laguna
Construction/Rehabilitation of Mult-Purpose Laguna Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation
300104221664000 |Building, Barangay Bagong Silang, San Pedro, g No npe Friday, March 12, 2021 Monday, April 19, 2021 Tuesday, May 11, 2021 Monday, May 17, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 . o
Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding of Multi-Purpose Building
300117208994000 | Construction of Foot Bridge at National Highway, |- Laguna No Competitive Friday, March 12, 2021 Monday, April 19, 2021 Tuesday, May 11, 2021 Monday, May 17, 2021 GAA 2021 12,000,000.00 12,000,000.00 | Construction of Foot Bridge
Barangay Sala, Cabuyao City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Y ' Y. AP ’ y, May 1L, y, May L1, ' ’ ' o 9
300117208993000 |SOnstruction of Foot Bridge at National Highway, | Laguna No Competitive Friday, March 12, 2021 Monday, April 19, 2021 Tuesday, May 11, 2021 Monday, May 17, 2021 GAA 2021 12,000,000.00 12,000,000.00 | Construction of Foot Bridge
Barangay Maitim, Bay, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
Construction/rehabilitation of multi-purpose building | Laguna Competitive . Construction/rehabilitation of
300103203385000 in Barangay San Antonio (Phase 2), Bifian, Laguna| 2nd DEO No Bidding Wednesday, March 31, 2021 Tuesday, April 20, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 3,000,000.00 3,000,000.00 multi-purpose building
Construction / Upgrading / Rehabilitation of
Drainage along National Roads - Primary Roads -
Manila South Rd - KO037+1020 - KO037+1040, .
K0038+313 - K0038+333, K0038+920 - Laguna Competitive . Off - Carriageway
310110100222000 K0039+160, KO039+452 - KOO39+472, ond DEO No Bidding Wednesday, March 31, 2021 Tuesday, April 20, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 40,000,000.00 40,000,000.00 Improvegsg;; Primary
K0039+660 - KO039+680, KO039+830 -
K0039+850, K0O040+145 - KO040+165,
K0040+300- K0040+320
Construction/Improvement of Road with Drainage, Laguna Competitive . Construction/Improvement of
300116204086000 Bray. Bambang Los Bafios, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Wednesday, March 31, 2021 Tuesday, April 20, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 40,000,000.00 40,000,000.00 Road with Drainage
Construction/Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Laguna Competitive . . : Construction/Rehabilitation
300104221665000 Building, Barangay Calendola, San Pedro, Laguna | 2nd DEO No Bidding Friday, April 23, 2021 Tuesday, May 18, 2021 Friday, May 28, 2021 Thursday, June 03, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 of Multi-Purpose Building
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Is this an Schedule of Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CcoO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Senior Laguna Competitive Construction of Multipurpose
300104221649000 [Citizen Building), Barangay Rosario Complex, San 2nngEO No Bid%lin Friday, April 23, 2021 Tuesday, May 18, 2021 Friday, May 28, 2021 Thursday, June 03, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Buildin purp
Pedro Laguna 9 g
Construction of Kabaritan Bridge, Brgy. San Laguna Competitive . : Construction of Kabaritan
300118200375000 Antonio, Bay, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Friday, April 23, 2021 Tuesday, May 18, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 15,000,000.00 15,000,000.00 Bridge
Construction of Mult-Purpose Building (Daycare Laguna Competitive Construction of Multipurpose
300104221643000 |Center), Barangay Macabling, Sta. Rosa City, 2nngEO No Bid%ing Friday, May 14, 2021 Wednesday, June 02, 2021 Thursday, June 24, 2021 Thursday, July 01, 2021 GAA 2021 2,500,000.00 2,500,000.00 Building purp
Laguna
Construction of Calamba City Hospital, Barangay Laguna Competitive : Construction of Calamba
300105200337000 Canlubang, Calamba City, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Friday, May 14, 2021 Wednesday, June 02, 2021 Thursday, June 24, 2021 Thursday, July 01, 2021 GAA 2021 15,000,000.00 15,000,000.00 City Hospital
300107201160000 |COnstruction of flood mitigation structure, Bifian, Laguna No Competitive Friday, May 14, 2021 Wednesday, June 02, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 15,000,000.00 15,000,000.00 Construction of flood
Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding mitigation structure
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Prison Laguna Competitive : Construction of Multi-
300104221647000 Building). Barangay Dela Paz, Bifian, Laguna ond DEO Bidding Friday, May 14, 2021 Wednesday, June 02, 2021 Thursday, June 24, 2021 Thursday, July 01, 2021 GAA 2021 30,000,000.00 30,000,000.00 Purpose Building
300107201168000 |COnstruction of Shore Protection, Brgy. Dela Paz, | Laguna No Competitive Friday, May 14, 2021 Wednesday, June 02, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 50,000,000.00 50,000,000,00 | Construction of Shore
Bifian City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Protection
Laguna Competitive Off - Carriageway
310207100145000 |Manila South Rd - KO043 + 440 2nngEO No Bid%ling Friday, May 21, 2021 Wednesday, June 09, 2021 Wednesday, June 23, 2021 Monday, June 28, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Improvement - Primary
Roads
Prepared by: /// / // . Recommended by: ~ . Approved by: |
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Is this an Schedule of Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CcoO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
Construction/Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Laguna Competitive . Construction/ Improvement
300104221667000 Building, Barangay Landayan, San Pedro, Laguna | 2nd DEO No Bidding Friday, May 21, 2021 Wednesday, June 09, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 of Multi-Purpose Building
Construction/Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Laguna Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation
300104221661000 |[Building at Celina Subdivision, Barangay Labas, 9 No . P . Friday, May 21, 2021 Wednesday, June 09, 2021 Wednesday, June 23, 2021 Monday, June 28, 2021 GAA 2021 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 ) .
2nd DEO Bidding of Multi-Purpose Building
Santa Rosa, Laguna
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building including Laguna Competitive Construction of Multi-
300104221658000 |Facilities and other Structures, Calamba City, 9 No . P . Friday, June 04, 2021 Wednesday, June 23, 2021 Wednesday, July 07, 2021 Monday, July 12, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 .
Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
Concreting of Road, Barangay Santo Nifio, Bifian Laguna Competitive . .
300116204085000 | . No i Friday, June 04, 2021 Wednesday, June 23, 2021 Wednesday, July 07, 2021 Monday, July 12, 2021 GAA 2021 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 Concreting of Road
City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
300116204087000 |0ad Widening of Barangay Timbao to Boundary | Laguna Competitive Friday, June 04, 2021 Wednesday, June 23, 2021 Wednesday, July 07, 2021 Monday, July 12, 2021 GAA 2021 100,000,000.00 100,000,000.00 Road Widening
of Barangay Loma, Bifian City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
Repair/Maintenance of DPWH Building, Main Laguna Competitive Repair/ Maintenance of
1 Building, Bray. Bambang, Los Bafios, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Thursday, June 10, 2021 Thursday, July 01, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 MOOE 2021 1,500,000.00 1,500,000.00 Building
Repair/ Maintenance of Flood Control Structures - Laguna Competitive Repair/ Maintenance of
2 Bray. Canlalay, Bifian City, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Thursday, June 10, 2021 Thursday, July 01, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 MOOE 2021 2,000,000.00 2,000,000.00 Flood Control
Repair and Maintenance of Road Safety Facilities
along Manila South Road, Bifian-Cavite Road, Laguna Competitive Repair and Maintenance of
3 Daang Maharlika Road, Sta. Rosa-Ulat-Tagaytay g No NpE Thursday, June 10, 2021 Thursday, July 01, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 MOOE 2021 2,811,000.00 2,811,000.00 P o
; 2nd DEO Bidding Road Safety Facilities
Road, and Calamba-Sta. Cruz Famy-Junction
Road
Prepared by: /’/ 0 ) — / Recommended by: ~ . Approved by:
\ /X\ \\ ‘f‘
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an
Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CcoO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
Construction of Water Supply System, Barangay Laguna Competitive Construction of Water
300121201117000 Palo Alto, Calamba City, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Saturday, June 12, 2021 Monday, July 05, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Supply System
300107201161000 |COnstruction/Improvement of Drainage System, Laguna No Competitive Saturday, June 12, 2021 Monday, July 05, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 |COnstruction/mprovement of
Bifian City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Drainage System
300104221644000 |COnstruction of Mult-Purpose Buiding (Dialysis Laguna No Competitive Saturday, June 12, 2021 Monday, July 05, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 20,000,000.00 20,000,000,00 |  Construction of Muld-
Center), Bifian, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding Purpose Building
Construction/Improvement of Mult-Purpose Laguna Competitive Construction/ Improvement
300104221670000 |Building including other structures and facilities, 9 No . P . Saturday, June 12, 2021 Monday, July 05, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 . P .
. 2nd DEO Bidding of Multi-Purpose Building
Calamba City, Laguna
Construction of Multipurpose Building, Barangay Laguna Competitive Construction of Multipurpose
300103203069000 Sampiruhan, Calamba City, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Saturday, June 12, 2021 Monday, July 05, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 30,000,000.00 30,000,000.00 Building
Rehabilitation of Road and Drainages (KM 36+482,
KM 36+780, KM 38+210 & KM 38+530) and
Concrete Pavement/Road (KM 37+870 & KM Laguna Competitive : . . Rehabilitation of Road and
300117209000000 39+000 with exemptions) along J. P. Rizal Bivd., ond DEO Bidding Wednesday, July 07, 2021 Friday, July 30, 2021 Friday, August 13, 2021 Friday, August 20, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Drainages
Barangay Tagapo to Barangay Balibago, City of
Santa Rosa, Laguna
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Fire Laguna Competitive Construction of Multi-
300104221645000 Department), San Antofiio, Bifian, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Wednesday, June 30, 2021 Tuesday, July 20, 2021 Tuesday, August 03, 2021 Tuesday, August 10, 2021 GAA 2021 20,000,000.00 20,000,000.00 Purpose Building
Laguna Competitive Off - Carriageway
310207100144000 |Manila South Rd - KO040 + 650 2nngEO No Bid%ling Thursday, July 01, 2021 Wednesday, July 21, 2021 Wednesday, August 04, 2021 Wednesday, August 11, 2021 GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 Improvement - Primary

Roads
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Infrastructure Projects

Schedule of Each Procurement Activity

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Is this an
Early Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Program/ Project PMO/ End- Procureme Mode of Source of (Brief Description of
User o Procurement . . o . . . _ Funds - :
nt Activity? Advertisement/ Posting of IB/ REI Submission/ Opening of Bids Notice of Award Contract Signing Total MOOE CcoO Program/ Activity/ Project)
(Yes / No)
Construction/Rehabilitation of Mult-Purpose Laguna Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation
300104221669000 |[Building, Barangay United Better Living, San 9 No . p' FOR REVERSION GAA 2021 5,000,000.00 5,000,000.00 ) .
2nd DEO Bidding of Multi-Purpose Building
Pedro, Laguna
Construction/Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Laguna Competitive Construction/Rehabilitation
300104221662000 |[Building at St. Joseph 9 Phase 1, Barangay 9 No . P . Wednesday, July 07, 2021 Friday, July 30, 2021 Friday, August 13, 2021 Friday, August 20, 2021 GAA 2021 30,000,000.00 30,000,000.00 ) .
2nd DEO Bidding of Multi-Purpose Building
Langgam, San Pedro, Laguna
. . . . Completion/Expansion/Altera
300104221663000 |COMPletion/Expansion/Alteration of LPH-San Laguna No Competitive Wednesday, June 30, 2021 Sunday, July 25, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 40,000,000.00 40,000,000.00 | tion of LPH-San Pedro
Pedro District Hospital, San Pedro City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding o :
District Hospital
Construction of Road Widening at Brgy. Malitlit Laguna Competitive Construction of Road
300117208991000 Santa Rosa City, Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Wednesday, June 30, 2021 Sunday, July 25, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 10,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 Widening
300117209001000 |SOnstruction of Roads with Drainage, Brgy. Dela | Laguna No Competitive Wednesday, June 30, 2021 Sunday, July 25, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 50,000,000.00 50,000,000.00 | Construction of Roads
Paz, Bifian City, Laguna 2nd DEO Bidding
Construction of Access Road to University of the Laguna Competitive .
300116203498000 Philippines Los Bafios (UPLB), Laguna ond DEO No Bidding Wednesday, June 30, 2021 Sunday, July 25, 2021 Monday, July 19, 2021 Monday, July 26, 2021 GAA 2021 120,000,000.00 120,000,000.00 Construction of Roads
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Goods and Services

Is this an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
Code Procurement PMO / Procurement Mode of Advertisement | Submission / Notice of Contract Source of (Brief Description of
(PAP) Program / Project End-User Activity? Procurement [/ Posting of IB /| Opening of . Funds Total MOOE Cco Program / Activity /
. Award Signing .
(Yes / No) REI Bids Project)
Part | AVAILABLE AT PROCUREMENT SERVICE STORES
1 Common Office Supplies 9,325,759.14 | 9,325,759.14 0.00
First Quarter Lag;g’é)znd No PS ; - - ; GOP 4,335929.53 | 4,335,929.53 -
Second Quarter Laggg’(‘)znd No PS . i i . GOP 1,691,602.72 | 1,691,602.72 .
Third Quarter Lagggaoznd No PS ; - - - GOP 1,502,135.69 | 1,502,135.69 -
Fourth Quarter Laggr;f”d No PS . . . . GOP | 1,796,091.20 | 1,796,091.20 .
UIAER TTENIS NUT AVALABLE AT FOS DU
Part Il REGULARLY PURCHASED FROM OTHER
oSN IDCC S
Office Equipment and Accessories 356,187.00 356,187.00 0.00
. Laguna 2nd
First Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Second Quarter Lagggaoznd No Shopping ; - - ; GOP 356,187.00 | 356,187.00 ;
. Laguna 2nd
Third Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd
Fourth Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Office Supplies 1,310,096.00 1,310,096.00 0.00
. Laguna 2nd .
First Quarter DEO No Shopping Jan. 4-11, 2021 | Jan. 11, 2021 | Jan. 18, 2021 - GOP 778,250.00 778,250.00 -
Laguna 2nd . .
Second Quarter DEO No Shopping April 1-7, 2021 | Apr. 07, 2021 | Apr. 12, 2021 - GOP 342,846.00 342,846.00 -
Third Quarter Lagggzznd No Shopping | July 1-7, 2021 | Jul. 07, 2021 | Jul. 12, 2021 ; GOP 94,500.00 94,500.00 -
Laguna 2nd .
Fourth Quarter DEO No Shopping Oct. 1-7, 2021 | Oct. 07, 2021 | Oct. 12, 2021 - GOP 94,500.00 94,500.00 -
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Goods and Services

Is this an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
Code Procurement PMO / Procurement Mode of Advertisement | Submission / Notice of Contract Source of (Brief Description of
(PAP) Program / Project End-User Activity? Procurement [/ Posting of IB /| Opening of Award Sianin Funds Total MOOE Cco Program / Activity /
(Yes /No) REI Bids gning Project)
Audio and Visual Presentation and Composing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Equipment ' ' '
First Quarter Laggr;)an - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Second Quarter LaggréaOan - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Third Quarter Lagggz)z”d - . . . . . 0.00 0.00 .
Fourth Quarter Lagggaoznd - ; ; ; - - 0.00 0.00 -
Photographic or Filming or Video Equipment 231,660.00 231,660.00 0.00
First Quarter Laggr;)an - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd . .
Second Quarter DEO No Shopping April 1-7, 2021 | Apr. 07, 2021 | Apr. 12, 2021 - GOP 231,660.00 231,660.00 -
Third Quarter Lag;rl‘;z)z”d - . . . . . 0.00 0.00 .
Fourth Quarter Lagggaoznd - ; - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Cleaning Equipment and Supplies 372,164.00 372,164.00 0.00
First Quarter Laggr;)an - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd . .
Second Quarter DEO No Shopping April 1-7, 2021 | Apr. 07, 2021 | Apr. 12, 2021 - GOP 372,164.00 372,164.00 -
Third Quarter Lag;rl‘;z)z”d - . . . . . 0.00 0.00 .
Laguna 2nd
Fourth Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Prepared By: .~ /. - -/ ‘ Recommending Approval: . Approved By:
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Goods and Services

Is this an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
Code Procurement PMO / Procurement Mode of Advertisement | Submission / Notice of Contract Source of (Brief Description of
(PAP) Program / Project End-User Activity? Procurement [/ Posting of IB /| Opening of . Funds Total MOOE Cco Program / Activity /
. Award Signing .
(Yes /No) REI Bids Project)
Paper Materials and Products 0.00 0.00 0.00
. Laguna 2nd
First Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd
Second Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
. Laguna 2nd
Third Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd
Fourth Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Lighting and Fixtures and Accessories 109,000.00 109,000.00 0.00
. Laguna 2nd
First Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd
Second Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Third Quarter Laggrl‘;z)z”d No Shopping | July 1-7, 2021 | Jul. 07, 2021 | Jul. 12, 2021 GOP 74,950.00 74,950.00 -
Laguna 2nd .
Fourth Quarter DEO No Shopping Oct. 1-7, 2021 | Oct. 07, 2021 | Oct. 12, 2021 GOP 34,050.00 34,050.00 -
Electrical Equipment apd Components and 224.461.60 224.461.60 0.00
Supplies
i Laguna 2nd
First Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd . .
Second Quarter DEO No Shopping April 1-7, 2021 | Apr. 07, 2021 | Apr. 12, 2021 GOP 224,461.60 224,461.60 -
i Laguna 2nd
Third Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd
Fourth Quarter DEO - - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
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DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Goods and Services

Is this an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
Code Procurement PMO / Procurement Mode of Advertisement | Submission / Notice of Contract Source of (Brief Description of
(PAP) Program / Project End-User Activity? Procurement [/ Posting of IB /| Opening of . Funds Total MOOE Cco Program / Activity /
. Award Signing .
(Yes /No) REI Bids Project)
Computer Supplies 54,300.00 54,300.00 0.00
. Laguna 2nd
First Quarter DEO - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd
Second Quarter DEO - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Third Quarter Lagggac‘)znd No Shopping | July 1-7, 2021 | Jul. 07, 2021 | Jul. 12, 2021 GOP 27,150.00 27,150.00 ;
Laguna 2nd .
Fourth Quarter DEO No Shopping Oct. 1-7, 2021 | Oct. 07, 2021 | Oct. 12, 2021 GOP 27,150.00 27,150.00 -
Common ICT Equipment 5,365,000.00 5,365,000.00 0.00
. Laguna 2nd
First Quarter DEO - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd
Second Quarter DEO - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Third Quarter Laggrl‘%z”d No COBpo;::gve July 1-7, 2021 | Jul. 07, 2021 | Jul. 12, 2021 | Jul. 22,2021 | GoP 5,365,000.00 | 5,365,000.00 -
Fourth Quarter Laguna 2nd - ; - - - 0.00 0.00 -
DEO ' '
Consumables 3,409,198.00 3,409,198.00 0.00
i Laguna 2nd
First Quarter DEO - - - - - 0.00 0.00 -
Laguna 2nd Competitive April 30 - May
Second Quarter DEO No Bidding 06, 2021 May. 19, 2021 |May. 31, 2021| Jun. 01, 2021 GOP 1,799,998.00 1,799,998.00 -
. Laguna 2nd .
Third Quarter DEO No Shopping July 1-7, 2021 | Jul. 07,2021 | Jul. 12, 2021 GOP 804,600.00 804,600.00 -
Laguna 2nd .
Fourth Quarter DEO No Shopping Oct. 1-7, 2021 | Oct. 07, 2021 | Oct. 12, 2021 GOP 804,600.00 804,600.00 -

Prepared By: )\ 4

V! N\ i

JES MORRIS D, TOBIAS
Officer-In-Charge
Procurement Unit

Recommending Approval:

JEFFREY AEL C. JAMIAS

BAC Chairperson

~

.

Approved By:

DistricLZngineer




DPWH Laguna Il DEO Updated Final Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021 Goods and Services

Is this an Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP) Remarks
Code Procurement PMO / Procurement Mode of Advertisement | Submission / Notice of Contract Source of (Brief Description of
(PAP) Program / Project End-User Activity? Procurement [/ Posting of IB /| Opening of . Funds Total MOOE Cco Program / Activity /
. Award Signing .
(Yes /No) REI Bids Project)
Other Categories 4,584,703.02 | 4,584,703.02 0.00
. Laguna 2nd .
First Quarter DEO No Shopping Jan. 4-11, 2021 | Jan. 11, 2021 | Jan. 18, 2021 - GOP 251,297.00 251,297.00 -
Laguna 2nd . .
Second Quarter DEO No Shopping April 1-7, 2021 | Apr. 07, 2021 | Apr. 12, 2021 - GOP 2,582,906.02 2,582,906.02 -
Third Quarter Laguna 2nd No Competitve |\ 17 2021 | Jul. 07, 2021 | Jul. 12, 2021 GOP | 1,512,000.00 | 1,512,000.00 :
DEO Bidding
Laguna 2nd .
Fourth Quarter DEO No Shopping Oct. 1-7, 2021 | Oct. 07, 2021 | Oct. 12, 2021 GOP 238,500.00 238,500.00 -
TOTAL 25,342,528.76 | 25,342,528.76 0.00
Prepared By: - ”"\,I" T / Recommending Approval; - ~ X Approved By:
‘ /X N/
JES I\//IOR'RIS D. TOBIAS JEFFREY AEL C. JAMIAS JOVE® M. CALABIA
“Officer-In-Charge BAC Chairperson Distridt Engineer
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Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND HIGHWAYS
LAGUNA II
DISTRICT ENGINEERING OFFICE
REGIONAL OFFICE IV-A
Brgy. Bambang, Los Bafios, Laguna

CERTIFICATION

THIS IS TO CERTIFY that this office has no CONSULTANCY PROJECTS as to date.

Issued, this 29" day of June, 2021 for whatever legal purpose this may serve.

Jov ALABIA
District Bngineer

R4A.17.5 JN@/JI@J
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